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water plantings in the Great 
Lakes, including: Lake 
Michigan at Platte Bay, Big 
Sable Point and Portage Lake 
and Lake Huron at Hammond 
Bay. HarrisviUe. Port Hope, 
Port Sanilac and L-akeoort. 
About 825.000 coho and 
Chinook were planted in open 
water to provide a larger and 
longer salmon fishing season 
this fall on the Great Lakes. 

The Cass River , which 
empties into Saginaw Bay via 
the Saginaw River, received 
its first plantings last year. 
Although 450,000 salmon will 
be swimming through the 
Bay. only a few are expected 
to be hooked because of the 
Bay's warm water, generally 
higher than the 50-55 degree 
temperature preferred by 
both coho anij chinook for 
feeding. 

Sixteen streams have now 
been planted with chinook 
with the best catches ex­
pected from 1969 plantings 
since this king-sized partner 
of the coho usually takes three 
to four years to mature. This 
variety wi11 run 20 to 40 
pounds with 1970 plantings 
weighting from 15-25 pounds 
and '71 plantings between five 
and 12 pounds. 

A few giant chinook from 50 
to 65 pounds may be taken 
from Lake Michigan. These 
are from the l%7-68 plantings. 
Coho. which matures at three 
years, generally Will run eight 
to 18 pounds with a few four-
year-olds at 25 to 33 pounds. 

The state record for chinook 
is 42 pounds, eight ounces, 
caught last fall in the Pere 
Marquette River The largest 
coho is a 30-pound, eight-
ounce fish hooked last fall in 
the Eas t A r m of Grand 
Traverse Bay. A 33-pound, 
three ounce coho Was taken in 
the Little Manistee River Weir 
below the Six Mile Bridge in 
1970, but this Was not taken by 
hook and line. 

Although regular salmon 
runs are underway, the peak 
is expected to begin in mid-
September on the Great 
I,akes and continue through 
the first two weeks of October. 
Heaviest activity in streams 
w i l l be in October and 
November. 

Unl ike last year when 
salmon fishing in late Ju1y 
and early August Was 
booming due to early runs of 
the Alaskan strain, success 
has been spotty so far this 
season as only 75,000 Alaskan 
coho were planted in the 
Upper Peninsula streams of 
Thompson Creek and the 
Manistique RiVer. .Alaskans 
were not planted in Lower 
Michigan in 1971 because of 
added costs. 

A comeback by the once-
almost-extinct perch in L,ake 
Michigan and the popularity 
of lake trout throughout the 
Great Lakes is luring more 
fishermen onto state waters. 
Because of the added 
pressure, increased numbers 
of coho and chinook wil l be 
taken by perch and trout 
fishermen. 

Salmon catches on the 
Great Lakes Will come mosdy 
by trolling With plugs, flatfish, 
daredevils and flashflies 
ahead of lures to attract the 
fish. 
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pleasure mares. 
South Lyon: 
Mrs . Lina Roberts riding 

her Appaloosa stallion "D-R's 
Joker P l a y b o y " Won the 
western junior pleasure class. 

A blue ribbon Winner Was 
Cynthia Sessink's Morgan 
"Mar-Jo's Co-SUr". 

Brighton: 
Dick and Sylvia Measel Won 

blues With their Arabians "Hy 
Crest K a n d i m a n " and 
"Shorhaf. 

Novi: 
"Mad River Bell Bouy" 

owned by Basil E . Miner Was 
the blue Winner in the junior 
park class. 

Competition in a11 these 
classes was Very keen and 
these people have reason to be 
very proud of their Wins. 
Many of the aboVe classeshad 
as high as 35 entires. 

DaVid Earehart of Nor­
thville Was the Winner of the 
stock seat medal class. 
Second Was Pat Hennan, also 
of Northville. 

This class is open to junior 
members of thiB American 
Horse Show Association. 
Winning one blue ribbon in 

most states qualifies the rider 
for the final ride-off at a 
specified show at the end of 
the season. On qualifying, a 
rider receiVes a Silver Medal. 
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, 0.t. & Cott. Mich. 
lOi 

«»ITH THIS COUPON AND J5.00 PURCHASE OR MORE 
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A rezoning request Which 
would have a l lowed con­
struction of a proposed 824-
unit multiple complex on 80 
acres of land-south of 11 Mi l e 
Road was rejected by the 
Novi city council Monday. 

The action came at a public 
hearing called to consider the 
request of Phi l ip McCafferty 
to rezone 80 acres from its 
present R-1 (one fami ly 
res ident ia l ) to R-2-A 
(restricted multiple family 
residential). 

The property is located 
south of 11 Mi l e Road midway 
between Taft and NoVi Roads. 

Opposing the rezoning 
Monday were a group of 
approximately 40 residents of 
adjoining property. 

The council s action came 
by a 5-2 Vote after the city's 
planning commiss ion had 
unanimously recommended 
the request be denied. 

James Cherfoli, planning 
board secretary, noted that it 
Was only at the insistence of 
the petitioner, McCafferty, 
that the hearing had been 
granted. "We Were gainst 
allowing multiples in this area 
originally and had denied the 
request to hold a public 
hearing on the ma t t e r , " 
Cherfoli told the council. "It 
was only because the 
petitioner asked us for the 
opportunity to present his 
arguments to the council and 
the public that We consented 
to the hearing." 

McCafferty's presentation 
was based on the tax ad-
Vantages of multiple units 
OVer single family units. 

If the land is developed 
single-family residential, he 
projected, a population boost 
of 840 people-360 of them 
school-aged-could be ex­
pected. W i t h a mul t ip l e 
development, a populat ion 
increase of 1,714 could be 
expected, but only 115 of them 
would require schooling. 

The tax base of a R - l 
district would be $4.8 million, 
while the tax base of an R-2-A 
district Would be $15.5 million. 
Figured on the current mi-
llage rates, this would mean, 
McCafferty said, that the 
single family zoning Would 
bring in $240,000 annually in 
taxes, but i t would cost 
$360,000 to proVide 
educational facilities for the 
children-a deficit of $120,000. 

Under R-2-A development, 
$770,000 in taxes Would be 
generated With only $115,000 
required annually to provide 
for schooling. 

"There's room in every 
community for a tastefully 
done multiple development 
which would help support the 
rest of the c o m m u n i t y , " 
McCafferty concluded. 

The developer ' s presen­
tation did little to sway the 
planning board, the residents, 
or the council, however. 

E d w a r d Ve t t e l , N o v i ' s 
planning consultant f rom 
V i l i v a n - L e m a n , h a d 
recommended that -the 
rezoning request be denied on 
the grounds that the 
surrounding zoning is R - l , the 
R-2-A was not in keeping with 
the city's master plan for that 
general area, and that access 
roads were not sufficient to 
handle the increased 
vehicular load. 

The planning board by a 6-0 
'•ote recommended to the 
council that the request be 
rejected. 

"In our master plan for 
development," said Ronald 
B i r o u , " w e have made 
adequate a l lowances for 
sufficient tax base. I don't feel 

N o v i P o n d e r s 

R e p l a c e m e n t 
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Development of an outdoor 
education center on three 
acres of property south of the 
high school football field was 
given the go ahead Tuesday 
night by the Novi Board of 
Education. 

B y its action the board 
authorized the retention of 
James A. Lahde as a con­
sultant in development of the 
nature study center at an 
expense of $l,000. 

The money is to come from 

the district's 1970 building and 
site fund. 

Spec i f i ca l ly , Lahde , an 
ecologist. Will have charge of 
preparation of a master plan 
for the development of the 
property through the com­
bined efforts of teachers, 
students and citizens of the 
community. 

Development of the plan, as 
well as the actual physical 
work on the site, is seen as a 
learning process for students. 

G r u b b Q u i t s 

W i x o m P o s t 

Continued on Page 9-A 

The resignation of Coun­
c i l m a n ElWood J . Grubb 
Tuesday night came as a total 
surprise to Wixom Mayor 
Gilbert Wil l i s and the other 
members of the city coilncil. 

Grubb, who has not been 
present at the last two council 
meetings made known his 
plans to res ign, effect ive 
immediately, in a letter to the 
Mayor, the council and the 
citizens of Wixom. 

In the letter, Grubb said, 
" M y duties as postmaster (of 
Wixom) and personal 
obligation makes it necessary 
I take this action." 

Grubb has worked in 
Wixom city government for 
the last 14 years, serving on 
the Planning Commission, at 
one time its chairman, the 
Indus t r i .Hl D e v e l o p m e n t 
Commission, as Justice of the 
Peace in addition to his 
position on the council. He 
called his years of community 
service " a rewarding ex­
perience." 

Grubb thanked the Wixom 
people for the opportunity 
afforded him and said, " i t is 
my strongest hope that our 
c i ^ council w i l l continue to be 
made up of members Who are 
not afraid to stand up and be 

E L W O O D J . G R U B B 

counted regarding issues at 
hand. 

" T h e c i t izens elect the 
legislative body to represent 
them. They are entitled to 
know where their 
r e p r e s e n t a t i v e s t a n d s 
throughout his term in of­
fice." 

C o u n c i l m a n R o b e r t 
Dingeldey ca l l ed G r u b b ' s 
surpr ise res ignat ion " a 
personal tragedy" for the 
council and added that the 
council "Wi l l have to search 

Continued on Page 11-A 

Superintendent G e r a l d 
Kratz , in recommending the 
center, emphasized that it Will 
serve the entire district, from 
kindergarten through the 12th 
grade. Elementary children, 
for example. Will be bused to 
the site as part of in-district 
field trips. 

The site itself. Which has 
long been included in the 
board's plans for the district. 
Would entail relatively little 
const ruct ion, With major 
emphasis on preservation of 
the natural Wildlife, board 
members Were told. 

It Would consist of Wood 
chip trails, teaching stations 
or discussion circles and a 
self-guided tour stressing the 
center ' s most important-
ecological features. Dr . Kra tz 
said. 

Emphasizing the preser­
vation aspect of the proposal, 
the superintendent noted that 
While some of the fallen trees 
might be removed from the 
site, some of this timber could 
be kept on the site to permit 
young children to actually cut 
it up to determine the age of 
the tree and the reasons for its 
destruction. 

In other words, every effort 
wi l l be made to provide a 
l ea rn ing exper ience for 
students, he indicated. 

In his slide presentation to 
the board, Lahde proposed 
establishment of a committee 
of teachers, students and 
citizens to help in develop­
ment of the master plan. 

He proposed a first-step 
inventory of the natural and 
unnatural materials on the site, 
followed by a survey of the 
school curriculum to deter­
mine what educat ional 
programs can be developed to 
tie in with the nature center. 

W h i l e a l l f ive board 
members present voted for 
the proposal. Vice President 
Bruce Simmons noted the 
center could have an adverse 
effect on his adjoining or­
cha rd proper ty . He sa id 
currently he is losing hun­
dreds of dollars Worth of fruit 

taken f rom his trees by 
youngsters. 

But D r . Kratz took the 
position that involvement of 
youngsters i n the nature 
center site could reduce this 
kind of theft He likened the 
s i tua t ion to the recent ly 
publ ic ized reduct ion of 
v a n d a l i s m to F ruehauf ' s 
Detroit plant because of the 
firm's development of an 
adjacent children's play area. 

In other action Tuesday, the 
board adopted a free and 
reduced meals po l i cy for 
needy chi ldren . The 
guidel ines , part of the 
government's requirement 
before it w i l l provide funds for 
school hot lunch programs, 
were outlined in letters to 
parents and guardians this 
week. 

The letter points out that 
because some families may 
find it difficult to pay the full 
price of their children's meals 

(45-cents at the elementary 
schools and 50-cents at the 
middle and high schools), 
"this school provides meals at 
a reduced price or free to 
children who are unable to 
pay the full price." 

To qual i fy , parents or 
guardians are asked to f i l l out 
applications, listing income 
and expenses. 

In joining with other board 
members in accepting the 
guidelines, S immons em­
phasized, however, that a 
thorough confidential study of 
applying families should be 
made by administrators. 

The board also approved 
the addition of cross country 
to the d i s t r i c t ' s in-
terscholastic sports program, 
but Truste Robert Wilkins 
registered a strong complaint 
that the athletic department 

Continued on Page 11-A 

B u s i n e s s L e a d e r 

D i e s S u d d e n l y 

Funeral services Wil l be 
held today (Thursday) for a 
prominent Novi businessman, 
Cla rence (Johnny) H . 
Johnson, 58, Who died of a 
heart attack Sunday, Sep­
tember 10 at Bo t s fo rd 
Hospital in Farmington. 

The services Will begin at 10 
a.m. at the Harbin's Funera l 
Home, 43801 Grand River . 

A memorial service Was 
held Wednesday evening (7 
p.m.) at the funeral home 
under the auspices of the Novi 
Moose Lodge of which M r . 
Johnson Was a cha r t e r 
member. 

Owner of Wilkins Par ts & 
Equipment Company, 45900 
Grand River , M r . Johnson 
Was active in community 
civic affairs, serving at the 
time of his death as president 
of the Novi Rotary Club. 

He res ided at 23711 
Meadowbrook Road in Novi. 

He moved to this area 21 
years ago, becoming Well 
knoWn throughout the Novi-
Northville area. 

B o r n J u l y 21, 1914 in 
Saginaw, he was the son of 
George and Rosa Johnson. 
His Wife, Margaret, Whom he 
married on November 30, 
1940, survives him. 

Other survivors include a 
daughter, M r s . Rober t 
(Carol) Nickels of McRae , 
Georgia; a sister, Mrs . John 
(Evelyn) Curtis of Beloit, 
Wisconsin; and tWo grand­
children. A daughter, Sharon 
Ann, preceded h im in death. 

Bur ia l wi l l be in RoselaWn 
Cemetery in SaginaW. 

Memorials may be sent to 
the Novi Rotary Cluti for 
crippled children. 

City Manager George Athas 
submit ted his wr i t t en 
resignation to the Novi city 
counci l Monday . The 
regis t ra t ion becomes ef­
fective at the end of the 
Working day Fr iday , October 
13. 

Reading from a letter to 
Mayor Joseph Crupi and the 
member of the council Athas 
said, "I have recently been 
offered a position in private 
industry that in a l l fairness to 
myself and family I cannot 
turn down." 

"After two months of soul 
searching and probably the 
most difficult decision I have 
eVer had to face in my life, I 
have decided to accept this 
latest job offer." 

"It is, therefore. With a 
heavy heart that I submit to 
you my resignation as City 
Manager." 

The announcement Was 
received quie t ly by the 
council. Which, according to 
Mayor Joseph Crupi, had 
been appr i sed that the 
resignation Was forthcoming 
last Fr iday. 

" W e spent the ent ire 
Weekend trying to talk h im 
out of i t , " commented 
Councilman Raymond Evans 
after the meetings Was ad-

mr"-' - • • — 
The lone official comment 

Monday was made by Crupi. 
"It is with deep regret that 

we haVe to hear a letter of this 
sort," said the Mayor. " M r . 
Athas would be foolish not to 
accept the offer that was 
made to h im." Turning to 
Athas , the M a y o r sa id , 
"George, I don't know how to 
say it, but we wi l l miss you 
and Wish you Well in your new 
job." 

Athas i s N o V i ' s fourth 
manager and th i rd ci ty 
manager (FredOlson held the 
position of manager before 
NoVi was incorporated into a 
city). Athas Was proceeded in 
office by Harold Ackley and 
Dallas Zonkers. 

He Was appointed to the 
posit ion of ac t ing c i ty 
manager in A p r i l 1971 after 
Zonkers resigned under fire 
from the council and serVed 
on that basis for five months. 
He Was then appointed full-
time city manager. 

Pr io r to accepting the ac­
ting city managership, Athas 
had served for three years on 
the N o v i p lanning com­
mission, chairing that body at 
the time he Was tapped for the 
top executive's seaL 

Athas' l3-month term as 
city manager has been a quiet 
one in terms of internal 
dissension, as he has Won the 
praise of councilmen and 
employees a l i ke for his 
handling of the complex city's 
manager's responsibilities. 

During his term of office 
three major shopping centers-
Shopping Center Incorporated 
(Hudson 's) , Nov i -Ten , and 
North-Eight-have announced 
plans to locate in Novi and the 
city has embarked on a 
program to construct a new 
municipal complex. 

When asked by The Novi 
News about his resignation, 
Athas said a number of things 
had entered into his decision. 
" F o r one thing," he said, 
''there Was a little bit of that 
old show business adage 
about 'leaving them laughing' 
in my decision. I think people 
are pleased With the job I've 
done and it 's desirable to 
leave on those terms." 

" I think I've accomplished 
a lot in this job," he con­
tinued " A t least I 'm vain 
enough to believe I've ac­
complished a lot." 

"I feel every man owes his 
fellow man something and at 
the risk of sounding corny this 
is my Way of serving the 
community in which I live. 

What sounds even cornier is 
that I've got 60-75 people 
working for me and it's going 
to be difficult to say good bye 
to one's family. I know that 
sounds corny but it's true." 

Athas denied that health 
considerat ions entered his 
decis ion. Though only 38 
years old, he suffered two 
heart attacks in the past 12 
months and collapsed from 
exhaustion in his office on 
another occasion. 

He did not say Which f irm 
he has agreed to go with, but 
indica ted that it was a 
company not presently doing 
business With the city. 

In his letter of res ipa t ion 
he told the council, " I thank 
you for your support and for 
giving me the honor and 
privilege of serving our city. I 
have tried to the best of ability 
to perform these duties as you 
have Wanted them performed 
and state noW that I Will be at 
your service in any manner at 
any time you Wish in any 
service you may ask me to 
perform on behalf of our 
clty." 

Athas said he Would con­
tinue to reside in Novi . 

A c c o r d i n g to the c i ty 
charter , ac t ion on the 
res ignat ion W i l l come at 
Monday's council session. 

The task immediately at 
hand for the council Will be to 
find a replacement for Athas. 
There Was some discussion 
Monday of appointing Novi 
D.P.W. Head E d Kr iewa l l to 
the position of acting city 
manager . K r i e w a l l has 
served as A t h a s ' ad­
m i n i s t r a t i v e a s s i s t a n t 
recently in addition to han­
dling the D P W duties. 

The suggest ion of ap­
pointing Kr i ewa l l last Mon­
day was squelched by 
Councilmen Edwin Presnell 
and Wi l l i am O'Brien, who 
suggested that such action 
Was premature at this time. 

Also discussed Monday Was 
the process of advertising for 
a new ci ty manager in the 
Michigan Municipal League 
publ ica t ion . The N o v i 
manager's job is budgeted to 
pay a salary of approximately 
$20,000 annually. 

Z i e g l e r 

R e q u e s t s 

J u r y T r i a l 

Novi school board member 
William Ziegler stood mute to 
charges of larceny under 
$100 when a r r a igned 

Thursday before 52nd District 
Court Judge Mart in Boyle. 

A pre-trial hearing was set 
for November 2 at 2 p.m. in 
the W a l l e d L a k e D i s t r i c t 
Court. The case wi l l not go to 
t r i a l , a cco rd ing to Judge 
Boyle , u n t i l somet ime in 
December or January. 

Ziegler and another Novi 
resident, Richard Jensen are 
charged with the theft of some 
pipe from a Michigan Bel l 
construction site in NoVi June 
6. 

Representing Ziegler and 
Jensen in the proceedings is 
At torney Sander L e v i n , 
former candida te for the 
office of state governor. 

The two Novi men were 
slated to appear in court for 
arraignment Thursday. In­
stead Levin submitted a letter 
on their behalf, entering the 
informat ion that both 
defendants stand mute on the 
charges and requesting a jury 
trial . 

When questioned about the 
length of time between the 

Continued on Page 11-A 
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C o m m u n i t y 

C a l e n d a r 

TOD.AY, S E P T E M B E R l4 
Novi Rotary, noon, Saratoga Trunk. 
NorthviUe Co-operative Pre-Schoo1 Orientation Meeting-

Group B , 8 p.m. 
ScoutTroop73l committee, 7:30 p.m., Methodist church. 
NorthviUe King's M i l l Civitan, 8 p.m., clubhouse. 
Northville Commandery No. 39, 7:30 p.m.. Masonic 

Temple. 
NorthVille Weight Watchers, 7:30 p.m., Presbyterian 

church. 
Senior Citizens Horseshoes, 1 p.m., Ker r House. 

F R I D A Y , S E P T E M B E R 15 
Orient Chapter, OES, 7:30 p.m.. Masonic Temple. 
NorthVUle Weight Watchers, lO a.m., Presbyterian 

church. 
Dukes and Duchesses, 8 p.m., scout building. 

M O N D A Y , S E P T E M B E R 18 
NorthVille City CouncU, 8 p.m., council chambers. 
Novi City CouncU, 8 p.m., councU chambers. 
Blue LodgeNo. 186, F & A M , 7:30 p.m.. Masonic Temple. 
TOPS, 7:30 p.m., scout building. 
St. Paul 's Lutheran School Paper Drive, 6-8 p.m., 560 S. 

Main. 
NorthVUle Mothers' Club, 8 p.m., home of Mrs . Robert 

Boshoven. 
T U E S D A Y , S E P T E M B E R 19 

NorthViUe City Planners, 8 p.m., councU chambers. 
NorthVUle Rotary, noon, Presbyterian church. 
V F W Post 4012, 8 p.m., V F W haU. 
NorthVUle Explorer Scouts, 7 p.m.. Legion haU. 
King 's MiU TOPS, 7 p.m., clubhouse. 

W E D N E S D A Y , S E P T E M B E R 20 
NorthViUe Area Economic DeVelopment Corp., 8 p.m.. 

Manufacturers Bank. 
Orient Chapter Past Matrons, 12:30 p.m., home of Els ie 

Woodruff. 
NorthVUle Lions, 7 p.m.. Hillside I n a 

SilVer Springs Questers, 12:30 p.m. , home of Mrs. Mil ton 
Holstein. 

V F W AuxiUary, Post 4012, 8 p.m., V F W haU. 
We-Way-CoSWeet Adelines, 8-10 p.m., Plymouth Central 

high. 
Senior Citizens, 1-5 p.m., Ker r House. 

T H U R S D A Y , S E P T E M B E R 21 
Novi Planners, 8 p.m., councU chambers. 
NorthVille Chamber of Commerce, 8 p.m., NorthViUe 

Downs. 
Novi Rotary, noon, Saratoga Trunk. 
NorthVUle Commandery No. 39, 7:30 p.m.. Masonic 

Temple. 
NorthVUle Republicans, 8 >.m., township offices. 
V F W Junior Girls , 7 p.m., V F W haU. 
NorthVille Weight Watchers, 7:30 p.m., Presbyterian 

church. 
NorthVUle King's M U l CiVitan, 8 p.m., clubhouse. 
Senior Citizens Horseshoes, 1 p.m., K e r r House. 

S e n i o r s t o S e e C i r c u s 

T h e y S a y V o w s 

B y C a n d l e l i g h t 

N o r t h v i l l e R e d CrOss V o l u n t e e r s G a t h e r to Hear A b o u t N e w C h a p t e r PrOcedures 

The Nor thv iUe Senior 
Citizens Will attend the circus 
and ice show at Olympia 

S tad ium on Wednesday 
September 20. The bus Will 
leave K e r r House at 6 p.m. 

k Y o u r 

S u i t o n 

D i s p l a y ? 

Big Dusiness deal? Big date? You'll want to look 
your best. We're experts at dry cleaning and 
pressing. That's our Dig deal. 

A L L C L E A N I N G D O N E 

O N T H E P R E M I S E S 

l 12 E . M A I N , N O R T H V I L L E 

JJJJJJJJIJII I I i l l l l l l l lU 
3 4 9 - 0 7 7 7 \ 

R e d C r o s s 

V e e d s 

H e l p e r s 

Members of the NorthviUe 
Unit of the American Red 
Cross were guests at a tea in 
the Northville home of M r s . 
Beat r ice Car l son recent ly. 

Regional Red Cross Manager 
Henry M a u r e r and M r s . 
Bernard LeBoe, chairman of 
the blood program of the 
Detroi t chapter expla ined 
neŵ  procedures concerning 
all Red Cross chapters in 
Southeastern Michigan to the 
group. 

Mrs. Carlson, Who has been 
the loca l R e d Cross 
representative for 20 years, 
says she can Vouch for a 
pleasant association With the 
Northville Unit and invites 
NorthviUe Women who have 
spare t ime to become 
volunteers for the Northville 
Unit . • 

The Northwest office, which 
^ serves Northville, Plymouth, 

* ^ Livonia. Redford and Garden 
City, is now located at 29236 
Ford Road, Garden City. A 
Mini Blood Band wiU be in 
operation there .<;ix days a 

^ Week. 

NorthViUe volunteers serve 
one day a week there and are 
also available to serve in 
other Blood Banks in the 
NorthvUle area. 

Mrs . Eldon Biery, Nor-
thville Blood Bank chairman, 

^ is in need of addi t iona l 
assistance to staff B lood 
Banks and can be reached at 
349-2665 for information. 

N o f g e t o w n ' s n e w o w n e r s 0 f f e f y o u 

N E W H O U R S f o r y o u r c o n v e n i e n c e 

N O W 

O P E N 7 1 1 A . I U . t o I I P . l l / l . 

7 D A Y S A W E E K 

N D R G E T O W N 

C O I N L A U N D R Y A N D D R Y C L E A N I N G 

1067 Novi Rd. . Northville 349-9816 A T T E N D A N T O N D U T Y A T A L L TIMES 

O R T H V I L L E 

C A M E R A S H O P N 

P H O T O G R A P H I C E Q U I P M E N T 

A N D S U P P L I E S 

E A S T M A N K O D A K P R O C E S S I N G 

W e b b e r P h o t o g r a p h i c S t u d i o 

W E D D I N G S 

I N D U S T R I A L 

C O M M E R C I A L 

P O R T R A I T S 

P A S S P O R T P H O T O S 

T A L L C O R N — S w e e t c o m i n t h e g a r d e n o f t h e G l e n n D e i b e r t s o n N a p i e r 
R o a d w a s m o r e t h a n " k n e e h i g h b y t h e F o u r t h o f J u l y " a n d n o w i s o v e r 
s e v e n a n d o n e - h a l f fee t t a l l . M r s . D e i b e r t c h e c k s t h e r i p e n e s s o f a n e a r 
b e f o r e p i c k i n g , s a y i n g i t ' s g o o d a n d s w e e t . 

F o r T o w n H a l l 

T i c k e t s A r e A v a i l a b l e 

2 0 0 S. M A I N N O R T H V I L L E 349-OIQf i 

A c c o r d i n g to Nor thv i l l e 
Town HaU Chairman Mrs. Jack 
Doheny, ticket sales for the 
1972-73 Town Hal l series are 
"going quite w e l l - but not as 
weU as expected. She reminds 
individuals that there is still 
time to purchase tickets. 

The series wiU begin Oc­
tober 12 with weU known 
television, and radio star and 
author Ar t Linkletler. 

P R E S ^ P t l O N S 

PRESCRIPTION 

EMERGENCY 

SER VICE 

D A Y 3 4 9 - 0 8 5 0 

NIGHT 3 4 9 - 0 8 1 2 
)(ilir Hiiillll /\ Our lUiylik-ss 

N O R T H V I L L E 

D R U G 

134 E. Main Noftlivilie 

Other speakers wiU be 
George M i c h a e l , antique 
expert, on November 9; Dr . 
H. M a i v i n Pollard, professor 
at the UniVersity of Michigan 
Medical School on March 8: 
and the "Amaz ing" Kreskin 
on Apr i l 12 

Each of the lectures wi l l be 
in the Northville High School 
A u d i t o r i u m at 11 a .m. 
Following each one, there wi l l 
be a celebrity luncheon at the 
Holiday Inn in Farmington. 

T icke t s for the lecture 

. . . ; i u t h«amtiful 
tkingM for your home 

RAYINTERiORS 

FanUUmgtfor DUtUtcttrt Horn-

33300 tLOCUM Plwne 
FARIMINaTON 470-7272 

imxttSnklSnmiUm 

series may be ordered by 
sending a check or money 
order for $12 to T i c k e t 
C h a i r m a n , P . O . Box 93, 
NorthviUe. 

Luncheon prices are $4 per 
person and may be purchased 
for the season by sending a 
check for $16 to Luncheon 
C h a i r m a n . P . O . Box 93, 
NorthviUe. 

D A R M e e t s 

The Sarah Ann Cochrane 
Chapter of the Daughters of 
the American Revolution WUI 
meet at noon on Monday, 
September 18 at the Livonia 
home of M r s . Theodore 
Benson. 38620 Morningside. 

K A W J D R i T i 

S T U D I O 
O T ' O ' O R A ^ H Y . 
10 W«t Am Arkar T n l 
'AtllH00i»t0fll>tHlk" 

DOWNTOWN PLYMOUTH 
GL 3-4181 

Robin Roann Fox and Br ian 
Clay Jones first met while 
both were attending Nor­
thviUe High School. At 7 p.m. 
on August 12, the couple was 
m a r r i e d at the F i r s t 
P r e sby t e r i an Church of 
NorthviUe by the Reverend 
PhiUip Seymour. 

F o r the candelight 
ceremony, the bride and bride 
groom memorized their Vows 
and faced each other as they 
recited them. Richard Shank 
sang "The Wedding Song" by 
Pe te r Y a r r o w and " T h e 
Lord's Prayer ." 

The bride's parents are M r . 
and Mrs . WiUiam Fox of 24380 
Glenda . M r . and M r s . 
F r a n c i s Jones, 46930 
Chigwidden, are parents of 
the bridegroom. 

The bride was given in 
marriage by her parents. She 
handmade her own Wedding 
gown from imported Italian 
lace and slipper satin. It Was 
designed With a fitted bodice, 
a satin cumiilerbund and fuU 
bishop sleeves. 

She made her chapel length 
Veil of tuUe and trimmed it 
With lace. It Was secured to a 
headpiece of seed pearis and 
aurora borealis. Her bouquet 
Was made of White sweetheart 
roses, carnat ions and 
snowdrift mums. 

Maid of honor Lisa A r m -
strong Wore a long gown of 
turquoise flowered b r i d a l 
chiffon and a turquoise pic­
ture hat t r i m m e d With 
matching ribbon and Veiling. 

She carried a nosegay of 
white snowdrift mums, blue 
carnations and turquoise 
streamers. 

The bride's sisters, Mrs . 
Ronald Pastor, Mrs . Richard 
E l i e and Lor i Fox aU were 
bridesmaids and wore dresses 
made by their mother. 

The gowns were l ime green 
and made identical to the 
maid of honor's. They wore 
matching picture hats and 
carried nosegays with Ume 
green accents. 

James Penrod was best 
man and the ushers were E d 
Zywiec and Howard and Jeff 
Jones. 

Attending the reception at 
Roma HaU Were guests from 
Arizona, Florida, California, 
Georgia and Tennessee as 
weU as Michigan. 

After a wedding trip to Cape 
Cod and Niagara Falls, M r . 
and Mrs . Br ian Clay Jones 
returned to Ypsilanti Where 
both are studying at Eastern 
Michigan University. 

S a l e S l a t e d 

Plymouth Grange No. 389 is 
sponsoring a rummage sale 
Saturday, September 16, at 
Grange Hal l , 273 South Union 
in Plymouth. Hours of the sale 
are 9:30 a.m. to 5 p .m. 

F o r co l lec t ion of sale 
donations caU Claude Eckles 
at 453-6377 or Lloyd Fi l lmore 
at 453-2493. 

V o v i W o m e n G e t 

S c o u t i n g P o s t s 

Four NoVi women haVe 
been selected to serVe as 
learning consultants in the 
Southern Oakland G i r i Scouts' 
neW program for teaching 
adult leaders. 

Mrs . Robert Brooks, Mrs . 
DaVid F o l s o m and M r s . 
George Gray WiU be Working 
in the Traveliilg Learning 
Center for the organization 
M r s . Rober t ( M a y ) 
Skellenger WiU be § special 

• consultant and WiU teach arfs" 
and crafts to leaders on Oc­
tober 19. 

For Novi Leaders and Troop 
Services Di rec to r s , ine" 
Learning Center WiU be at 
Our L a d y of Sorrows in 
Farmington for three con­
secutive Thursdays, October 
12,19 and 26 from 9:30 a.m. to 
noon each day. 

As the six Week training 

requirement for Southern 
Oakland Leaders has been 
discontinued, the TraVeling 
Center is open classroom 
style and leaders are free to 
come and go as they please. 

The center is divided into 
seVeral learning areas each 
equipped With self-teaching 
materials so that adults may 
choose their subject matter 
and stlidy alone or in groups., 

Leadersr- may tkke small 
children With them, either 
keeping them in the center or 
taking advantage of a free 
babysitting service available. 

Anyone Working With youth 
groups is invited to Visit the 
center and learn With the 
materials. F o r further in­
formation about the Traveling 
L e a r n i n g Center, the 
Southern Oakland G i r l Scouts 
can be contacted at 548-2244. 

S c h o o l c r a f t S l a t e s 

F r e e F i l m s f o r K i d s 

Schoolcraf t Col lege WiU 
once aga in sponsor free 
moVies for ch i ld ren one 
Saturday a month during 
September, October and 
NoVember. 

Saturday, September 16, the 
first of the series WUI be 
presented. It is titled "Review 
of Summer" and WUI feature 
"Mag ic of Disneyland", " I ' m 
no fool as a Pedestrian" With 
J iminy Cricket, and three 
other children's pictures. 

The moVies Will be shown at 
II a.m., 1 p.m. and 3 p.m. in 
the Liberal Arts BuUding 
Theatre on the Schoolcraft 
College campus. 

During the moVie hour, 
there is a coffee hour for 
parents and a separate room 
for pre-schoolers. 

A c c o r d i n g to p rogram 
coordinator, Mrs . Ralph W. 
Atch ley , the chUdren a re 
supervised in the theatre by 

five teenage ushers. 
Other movies WUI be shown 

at the same times and place 
on October 21 and November 
18. 

H o s p i t a l S e t s 

V u r s e Q a s s 

As a community service, St. 
Mary Hospital in Livonia WUI 
once again offer a refresher 
course for inactive registered 
nurses interested in returning 
to work. 

The course WiU begin on 
October 19, and end on 
December 2. 

Nurses interested in taking 
the course are asked to make 
an appointment for an in­
terview by contacting M r s . 
Kline at 427-4800, ex t 318, 
Monday through F r i d a y 
before the October 6, 
deadline. 

O p e n f o r o u r 9 9 t h S e a s o n , 

7 days 
a week 

7 1 4 O l d B a s e l i n e R o a d 
l bik. S. of 8 M Jlo Rd. 6 blks. E. of Sheldon 

3 4 9 - 3 1 8 1 
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^ A t E p i p h a n y L u t h e r a n 

M e m b e r s P l a n Y e a r 

O R I E N T A L A C C E N T — G u e s t s a t t h e ffighland 
L a k e s E s t a t e s h o m e o f M r . a n d M r s . E d w a r d 
O l a h a r e o f t e n t a k e n o n a v i s i t t o J a p a n w h e n 
t h e y c o m e t o c a l l . T h i s y e a r t h e O l a h s c o m -

j n i s s i o n e d a l o c a l n u r s e r y to c r e a t e a b i t o f J a p a n 
i n t h e i r o w n b a c k y a r d . A b o v e , M r s . O l a h ( r i g h t ) 

G r e a t B o o k s 

C l u b O p e n s 

s h a r e s h e r J a p a n e s e g a r d e n w i t h a n e i g h b o r , 
M r s . H a r v e y W i n s t o n . E a r l i e r t h i s m o n t h , t o 
c e l e b r a t e t h e c o m p l e t i o n o f t h e g a r d e n , M r . a n d 
M r s . O l a h e n t e r t a i n e d s e v e r a l f r i e n d s a t a 
J a p a n e s e s a k i p a r t y . 

When it comes to deciding 
what Ep iphany Lutheran 
Church in NorthviUe Town­
ship is going to do to carry out 
a project, there's one thing 
they don't do. 

"We never vote. We work 
strictly on a consensus and we 
d i scuss , " sa id E p i p h a n y ' s 

M a d r i g a l C l u b 

S e t s A u d i t i o n s 

Auditions for the Madrigal 
Club of Detroit wU be held at 7 
p.m. Monday, September 18, 
in the rehears?! roonl of 
Covenant Baptist Church on 
James Couzens in Detroit. 

The group is composed of 
women and is open to those 
interested in singing. A l l 
voices are needed, according 
to M r s . K e n t Mathes , a 
member of the group from 
NorthvUle. 

Rehearsals are held in the 
church on Monday evenings 
under the direction of August 
Maekelberghe. The group 
W i l l perform concerts in 
December and A p r i l . 

Fo r furher information on 
audit ions, contact M r s . 
Mathes at 349-7334 or Mrs . 
N e i l M c C a l l u m , audit ions 
cha i rman , at 476-0126 in 
Farmington. 

Q u e s t e r s t o S e e 

B u t t o n D i s p l a y 

The SUVer Springs Questers 
Win meet at 12:30 p.m. on 
Wednesday, September 20 at 
the home of Mrs . MUton 
Holstein. 

The featured speaker WiU 
be Mrs . Lyman Joslin, Who 
Will have on display the 
buttons she has coUected over 
the last 15 years. M r s . JosUn 
is a member of the National 
Button Society and estimates 
she has more than 50,000 
buttons in her coUection. 

R e v e r a n d F r e d e r i c k 
Prezioso. 
• This way of operating has 

been going on for the last two 
years at Epiphany ever since, 
at R e v e r a n d Prez ioso ' s 
suggestion, the Church 
Council decided to dissolve a l l 
church committees and form 
others only when needed ad 
hoc style. 

When those committees are 
formed, anyone who is a 
member and wishes to have a 
say in the planning is invited 
to express his wishes. 

"To determine the direction 
of our ministry at Epiphany," 
said Reverand Prezioso, "we 
plan the whole year in ad­
vance." 

Although the year for them 
begins on Easter Sunday and 
ends the next year on P a l m 
Sunday, i n i t i a l p lanning 
begins in February When 
interested members meet to 
decide the basic thrusts of the 
year. 

Those present decide on the 
operating image of the church 
year and form task forces. 
This year there are three. 
One is communi ty in­
volvement for the 
congregation, another is 
ca l l ed sp r i t ua l and in­
tellectual life and the third is 
evangelism and stewardship. 

Each force has a leader and 
members may participate in 
any of the forces as they 
please to work on projects. 

Each of the task forces then 
meets to decide what the 
projects wiU be and how they 
wUl be carried out. These 
meetings are Very carefully 
planned. 

"The planning meetings are 
planned" ReVerand Prezioso 
said. He explained that the 
meetings are structured so 
the members attending have 
only a certain amount of t ime 
to disscuss a certain matter 
and then must go on to 
another. 

"This forces them to taUc 
until they come to a con­
clusion because there is no 

voting. E v e r y o n e must 
agree," he said. 

"The most difficult thing to 
do is get people to realize the 
opportunity they haVe. If you 
want to change something or 
disagree, aU you have to do 
is come to one of the meetings 
and shout out your ideas. We 
work at that. Too many 
people don't believe they can 
have an effect." 

ReVerand P rez ioso sa id 
people baUc at the structure of 
the way of doing things and at 
first he had to push the 
members of his congregation 
to moVe in that direction. 

" A l l 1 asked was that they 
try it for a year. I wanted to 
prove it could be done. At the 
end of the first year the 

members decided they 
wanted to try it again and it is 
working very Well ." 

The members in this way of 
doing things, he said, see how 
they fit into the structure. "It 
has a unifying function. 

The basic idea was first 
introduced to R e v e r a n d 
Prezioso at a course he took in 
Detroit offered by the E c -
cumenical Institute. " I don't 
know of any other church 
operating this way," he said, 
and added that it can Work for 
anything, not just churches. 

It is more work for himself, 
but Reverand Prezioso said 

'he can't see operating dif­
ferently right now. "The key 
is getting everyone involved. 
That is Where the sucess i s . " 

V o v i W e l c o m e s 

\ e w M i n i s t e r 

The celebration of the in-
staUation of the Reverend 
J i m Liefeld took place Sun­
day, September 10 at the 
L i v i n g L o r d i Commun i ty , 
40700 Ten Mi le Road. 

The rite of instaUation Was 
performed by the Reverend 
Norm Beck of King of Kings 
Lu the ran Church i n A n n 
Arbor. 

Living Lord is a relatively 
new community under the 
auspices of the Board of 
American Missions of the 
American Lutheran Church. 

The use of the term com­
munity instead of church is a 
new Venture in the American 
Lutheran Church. Rather 
than mere ly worsh ip ing 
together, one of the goals of 
the community is to work 
together in the exploration of 
different ways of ministering 

N e w s A r o u n d N o r t h v i l l e 

A n inv i t a t ion has been 
extended N o r t h V i l l e area 
residents to join the Great 

3oks program at the Car l 
Sandburg Library in Livonia. 

V a l Kas tne r , Nor thv iUe 
spokesman for the group, 
announced the fourth year 
readings are scheduled to 
begin Thursday, September 
21 at 8:15 p.m. ' 

The group meets for two 
-Ijpurs the first and third 
Thursday of each month. 

Fi rs t reading WUI be two 
Chekhov plays—The Three 
Sisters and The Cherry Or­
chard . 

"These people represent 
every age and walk of l i fe ," 
explains Kastner, who may be 
reached at 3494757 for ad­
ditional informatioa 

According to Kastner, the 
Great Books program rests on 
four basic ideas: first, that 
liberal education is necessary 
for aU men; second , that 
liberal education is life-long 

ucation; third, that some 
great books. Wri t ten in 
today's age as WeU as in other 
ages, provide the basis for 
l ibe ra l educat ion; and, 
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f ina l ly , that people Who 
respect the power to reason, 
in themselves and in other 
men, can help one another 
learn from the Great Books. 

"People in Great Books 
groups reap many benefits 
from the p r o g r a m , " ex-
plained Kastner. "They learn 
to read more perceptively and 
to evaluate con temporary 
writing against the best that 
has been written in fiction, 
pol i t ics , h i s to ry , science, 
phUosophy and reUgion. 

"They learn to think in­
dependently because they 
become accus tomed to 
supporting What they say With 
eviijence and judgment. They 
learn to express themselves 
more clearly because they 
taUc regularly about serious 
ideas. They learn to listen 
more intently - because they 
discover how much they can 
learn from others. 

"Above aU, people in Great 
Books groups value the i r 
associat ion With other 
thoughtful adul ts i n the 
rewarding activity of putting 
to Work in their own lives the 
accumulated wisdom of the 
human race." 

S e e k N a m e s 

F o r G u i d e 

A n y N o r t h v i l l e 
organizations who have not as 
yet been contacted by the 
NorthViUe Jaycettes and wish 
to be included in the group's 
guide to c lubs and 
organizations are asked to 
caU Mrs . Russell Anger at 349-
0068 as soon as possible. 

The booklet, according to 
Mrs . Anger, WUI be ready for 
publ ica t ion in "about a 
mon th" and w i l l be 
dis t r ibuted m a i n l y among 
newcomers to the NorthvUle 
area. 

M r . a h d M r s . James Cutler, 
of Cutler Realty in NorthvUle, 
recently attended the Wedding 
in Grand Rapids of Geraldine 
Soule, formerly of NorthvUle, 
and Robert Hale of Clinton, 
Iowa. 

Last month, the Cutlers 
held a reception for the couple 
at their Farmington home. 

M r . and M r s . Hale are now 
making their home in Clinton. 

The N o r t h v i l l e M o t h e r s ' 
Club wUl hold its first meeting 
of the school year at 8 p.m. on 
Monday, September 18 at the 
home of M r s . Rober t 
Boshovea 

Hostesses for the evening 
WiU be M r s . Walter Carter, 
Mrs . Robert Bogart and M r s . 
Ka l in Johnson 

The NorthvUle Dukes and 
Duchesses, a group for single, 
divorced and Wiciowed men 
and Women over 30, WUl hold 
the first meeting of the faU at 
8 p.m. on Fr iday, September 
l5 in the Scout Recreation 
Building. 

The group WiU begin its 
boWUng league an September 
30. Anyone in teres ted, in 
bowling or other activities of 
the Dukes and Duchesses is 
invited to attend the Sep­
tember 15 meeting or contact 
L o i s Turne r , 349-9969, o r 
Vivian McKeever , 349-5059. 

Two former NorthVUle High 
School graduates have been 
named to the Michigan State 

U n i V e r s i t y Honors Col lege 
which is comprised of the top 
five per cent of the student 
body. 

N a m e d was C a r o l J . 
Rathert, daughter of M r . and 
M r s . Kenne th R a t h e r t of 
Map lewood , who i s a 
sophomore majoring in chUd 
development 

Also on the honors list was 
James H . Penrod, the son of 
M r . and M r s . Gregory P . 
Penrod, 45265 Mayo DriVe. 
Pen rod is a psychology 
major. 

Or ient Chapte r No . 77, 
Order of the Eastern Star wUl 
sponsor a bazaar, card party 
and luncheon in the NorthViUe 
Mason ic T e m p l e at noon 
Friday, September 22. A U 
officers of the Chapter have 
t ickets , or they WiU be 

a'^ailaible at 'the door: 

Sandra J . CasWeU of North­
vUle is one of 340 members of 
A l m a Col lege ' s f reshman 
class Who WUl begin a five-day 
orientat ion p r o g r a m on 
Saturday, September 16,. 
preceding the beginning of the 
coUege's faU term on Thur­
sday, September 2 l . 

Miss CasWeU, a graduate of 
NorthviUe High School, is the 
daughter of M r . and Mrs . 
John A . CasWeU of 41845 W. 
Eight MUe. 

Cub Scout Pack 721 wUl 
meet for the first time this faU 
on Thursday, September 28, 
at 7 p .m. at the V F W haU in 
NorthVUle. 

Regular meetings for the 
pack w i U be the f o u r t h 

Thursday of the month at the 
V F W h a U . 

Orient Chapter ' s P a s t 
Matrons' Club wiU meet at 
12:30 p.m. on Wednesday, 
September 20, at the Livonia 
home of M i s s E l s i e 

'Woodroffe. 
A business meeting and 

dessert luncheon are planned. 

Two NorthvUle residents 
were among the 1,892 Western 
Michigan University seniors 
to receive diplomas at 
summer commencement 
exercises i n K a l a m a z o o 
recently. ] 

Bache lo r degrees were | 
awarded to J u d i t h A n n 
Hallam, 21456 Summerside 
Lane, and Mark Joseph Esper 
of 19856 Meadowbroc^. 

R E V . J I M L I E F E L D 

F A U 

C L E A R A N C E 

S A L E 
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C A L L U S F O R A N 
A P P O I N T l V I E N T . . . Open Thunday Night'til 9 

% r - ^ U B E A U T Y S A L O N 

349-0838 Northville 

m N T E D 

In connection with good 
grooming and style con-
cious persons interested in 
having their clothes re-
styled or altered. Personal 
fittings on both men's and 
women's clothing in our 
modern t a i lo r ing shop. 
Phone 349-3677, Lapham's, 
120 E . Main-Downtown 
Northville. 

H O T K A P S 

P L A N T P R O T E C T O R S 

P r o t o d t ¥ » a r P l a i r i t F r o n 

F r i i t - - S l o r n ' - S i a -

l f i i i 4 - - B i r i i i - l t M e i i 

P a c k o f 2 0 

F L O W E R D R I 

114 L b . $ d | 2 5 
C a n ^ 

G A R D E H 

j i « N . c « , „ s t C E N T E R 
N o r t M e - P h o i K 3494211 

A E R O X O N 

0 M h « l i i n i 4 M l i u i M $ M i 

F L Y e A T C H E R 

4 f o r 6 9 ' 

Larry Weiner 

Why not make the man in 
your Ufe a beautiful robe? 
Perhaps there is nothing 
more satisfying to a man on 
a relaxing Weekend than to 
pad around in pajamas and 
robe. So Why not let h im do 
it in style? There are many 
patterns and materials to 
choose from aU the way 
from the very expensive, 
dry-cleanable fabrics to the 
inexpensive Washable type 
such as te r ry c loth . 
Monogram him a pocket; 
put his initials in the inside 
coUar, and he WUl think he 
is very special. And isn't 
he? 

A t S P I N N I N G W H E E L 
F A B R I C SHOP. 146 E . 
Main St, NorthvUle, 349-
19l0, you ' l l find a great 
selection of fashion fabric 
to choose from as WeU as 
al l the trimmings for an 
elegant and d i s t i nc t i ve 
finish. And you'U always 
receive courteous personal 
attention from our expert 
staff. Our prices are 
reasonable too. Hours: 
9:30-6, Mon-Sat;; tUS, F r i . 

H E L P F U L H I N T : 
Colored fabrics that may 
fade should a lways be 
dried out of the sun. 

to each other as well as to 
those who are not yet mem­
bers of the L i v i n g L o r d 
Community. 

Reverend L i e f e l d en­
courages anyone interested to 
contact him at the church, 
477-6296, to learn more about 
the religious lifestyle em­
ployed at Living Lord, or to 
attend services on Sunday 
mornings. 

A 1969 graduate of the 
E v a n g e l i c a l L u t h e r a n 
Seminary in Columbus, Ohio, 
Reverend Liefeld, 29, was 
pastor at Immanuel Lutheran 
Church in Ypsilanti for the 
last three years. 

He and his wife Diane and 
their year-old daughter 
Kimberly wi l l be l iv ing in the 
Meadowbrook G l e n n sub­
division. 

G O O D 

S E L E C T I O N 

o f B o y s ' ^ 

& M e n ' s 

W I N T E R 
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N E W S 

B R I E F S 

A T R I B U T E w a s p a i d f o r m e r C i t y 
C l e r k M a r y A l e x a n d e r last w e e k a s t h e 
c i t y c o u n c i l V o t e d to n a m e t h e a l l e y , 
r u n n i n g f r o m the P r e s b y t e r i a n C h u r c h 
eas t p a s t the S p i n n i n g W h e e l to C e n t e r 
S t r e e t , t h e M a r y A l e x a n d e r C o u r t . A 
fu tu r e c e r e m o n y i s p l a n n e d . 

T H E E I G H T H a n n u a l m e m b e r s h i p 
m e e t i n g o f t h e N o r t h v i l l e C o m m u n i t y 
C h a m b e r o f C o m m e r c e w i l l b e h e l d 
W e d n e s d a y n i g h t , S e p t e m b e r 20 a t t h e 
T h u n d e r b i r d - H i l t o n I n n . M e m b e r s a n d 
t h e i r g u e s t s a r e u r g e d to m a k e r e s e r ­
v a t i o n s b y M o n d a y b y c a l l i n g 349-7640. 
C h a m b e r S e c r e t a r y M a r g a r e t Z a y t i 
p r o m i s e s t ha t the d i n n e r w i l l b e " e x t r a 
s p e c i a l " a n d o n l y $4 p e r p e r s o n . " T h e 
C h a m b e r ' s p a r t i a l l y s u b s i d i z i n g t h e 
d i n n e r " , s h e e x p l a i n s . S o w h y n o t t a k e 
the w i f e ( o r h u s b a n d ) o u t f o r the b a r g a i n -
p r i c e d C h a m b e r d i n n e r a n d s o c i a l i z e w i t h 
s o m e o f y o u r f e l l o w N o r t h v i l l e 
b u s i n e s s m e n . 

L A N G F I E L D B a n d F u n d a t N o r ­
t h v i l l e H i g h w a s g i v e n a b o o s t M o n d a y 
n i g h t w h e n C o n r a d E . L a n g f i e l d d o n a t e d 
a n a d d i t i o n a l 1,000 s h a r e s o f s t o c k , w o r t h 
$18,000, to t h e f u n d . I n a l e t t e r to t h e 
s c h o o l b o a r d , L a n g f i e l d s a i d h e i s p l e a s e d 
w i t h t h e a p p e a r a n c e o f t h e b a n d a n d i t s 
m u s i c . T h e funds d o n a t e d w i l l b e u s e d f o r 
u n i f o r m s a n d m u s i c e d u c a t i o n , s c h o o l 
b o a r d m e m b e r s i n d i c a t e d . 

B U Z Z S A W S a n d v o l u n t e e r s a r e 
b e i n g s o u g h t b y t h e N o r t h v i l l e J a y c e e s 
f o r t h e i r a n n u a l " C l e a n t h e R o u g e R i v e r " 
c a m p a i g n s l a t e d f o r S a t u r d a y , S e p ­
t e m b e r 16. H e a v y e q u i p m e n t f r o m t h e 
C i t y a n d G r e e n R i d g e N u r s e r y w i l l b e 
u s e d to c l e a n t h e t w o a n d a h a l f m i l e s of 
t h e R o u g e t h a t f l o w t h r o u g h N o r t h v i l l e . 
P e o p l e i n t e r e s t e d i n h e l p i n g s h o u l d 
c o n t a c t A l P o t t s a t 349-0812. 

R E Q U E S T f o r r e z o n i n g o f t h e D u n 
R o v i n g o l f c o u r s e p r o p e r t y f r o m s i n g l e 
f a m i l y t o ^ a m u l t i p l e s c l a s s i f i c a t i o n w a s 
t a b l e d M o n d a y b y t h e T o w n s h i p P l a n n i n g 
C o m m i s s i o n , p e n d i n g c o m p l e t i o n o f t h e 
c o m m i s s i o n ' s p l a n n i n g u p d a t e s t u d y . 
T h a t s t u d y i s a b o u t s i x m o n t h s a w a y 
f r o m c o m p l e t i o n . A t M o n d a y ' s h e a r i n g , 
t h r e e c i t i z e n a r g u m e n t s a g a i n s t t h e 
r e z o n i n g w e r e o f f e r e d . P l a n s c a l l f o r 
d e v e l o p m e n t o f s o m e 900 m u l t i p l e ( e i t h e r 
a p a r t m e n t o r t o w n h o u s e ) u n i t s a r o u n d a 
n i n e - h o l e g o l f c o u r s e . 

A N O F F I C I A L p r o t e s t b y t h e N o r ­
t h v i l l e P l a n n i n g C o m m i s s i o n i s l i k e l y a t a 
N o v i p u b l i c h e a r i n g S e p t e m b e r 27 w h e n 
the N o v i c i t y c o u n c i l c o n s i d e r s a n a p p e a l 
to r e z o n e p r o p e r t y a t t h e n o r t h w e s t 
c o r n e r o f E i g h t M i l e a n d B e c k r o a d s to a n 
M - 2 ( l i g h t i n d u s t r i a l ) c l a s s i f i c a t i o n . 
P l a n s r e p o r t e d l y c a l l f o r e n l a r g e m e n t o f 
the t r u c k i n g o p e r a t i o n a t t h e c o r n e r a s 
w e l l a s c o n s t r u c t i o n of a n i n d o o r i c e -
s k a t i n g r i n k . N o v i p l a n n e r s e a r l i e r 
r e c o m m e n d e d a g a i n s t t h e r e z o n i n g . 
N o r t h v i l l e E s t a t e s s u b d i v i s i o n i s l o c a t e d 
o p p o s i t e t h e p r o p e r t y i n q u e s t i o n . 

E N R O L L M E N T i n N o r t h v i l l e P u b l i c 
S c h o o l s h a s e x c e e d e d p r o j e c t i o n s , w i t h a 
r e c o r d 3,828 s t u d e n t s e n r o l l e d a s o f 
F r i d a y . S c h o o l o f f i c i a l s h a d e s t i m a t e d 
3,750 s t u d e n t s w o u l d a t t e n d c l a s s e s t h i s 
f a l l . A b o u t 300 s t u d e n t s m o v e d i n t o t h e 
d i s t r i c t s i n c e J u n e . O f f i c i a l e n r o l l m e n t 
f i g u r e s w i l l b e t a b u l a t e d f o r s t a t e a i d 
p u r p o s e s o n S e p t e m b e r 29. 

D e m o l i t i o n D e r b y ? 

^ ^ r o u n d 

J S l g r t h v i l l e 
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T o w n s h i p O K s S a l a r y H i k e s 

F o r C l e r k y 

T r e a s u r e r y 

S u p e r v i s o r 

W A S H O U T ? N o t a t a l l . W o r k m e n h a v e m e r e l y r e m o v e d t h e 
o l d , d e c a y i n g b r i d g e , w h i c h c r o s s e d t h e s t r e a m o n t h e R u r a l 
H i l l C e m e t e r y d r i v e , i n p r e p a r a t i o n f o r c o n s t r u c t i o n o f a n e w 

b r i d g e o r d e r e d b y t h e c i t y c o u n c i l . W h i l e w o r k p r o g r e s s e s , 
p e r s o n s w i s h i n g to g a i n e n t r a n c e to t h e c e m e t e r y m u s t t e m ­
p o r a r i l y u s e a n e n t r a n c e of f S h e l d o n R o a d . 

B o a r d W o n D e l a y P a y m e n t 

A move to delay payment of 
money owed by the school 
district until tax payments 
are recived in January Was 
nixed Monday night by school 
board members. 

The idea to Withhold 
payment to creditors Was 
proposed by Bus iness 
Director E a r l Busard, Who 
said that if the proposal Was 
accepted by the board, the 
(iistrict Would not have to 
b o r r o w a p p r o x i m a t e l y 
$200,000 in tax anticipation 
monies. 

Trustee AndreW Orphan 
said that if the "district was 
operating on summer tax 

C h a s e T a k e s I t s T o l l 

It was a lmost l i ke 
something from a movie 
script, with police getting 
their man after a high speed 
auto chase which left a trail of 
dented and disabled squad 
cars behind. 

But it was no laughing 
matter for James H . Schmidt, 
34, of Livonia who, after 
leading police on a near half-
hour chase early Saturday, 
was charged with fleeing and 
eluding. 

Schmidt was arraigned the 
same day in district court, 
stood mute to the charges and 
is free on SlO,000 bond. He wi l l 
face examina t ion next 
Thursday. 

He and his passenger, 
Werner G. Hoffman, 31, of 
Westland, Were both treated 
at Wayne County General 
Hospital for facial lacerations 
sustained when they Were 

rammed by several police 
cars. 

The chase began about 2:30 
a.m. Saturday When Schmidt 
was observed by NorthVille 
Ci ty P a t r o l m a n Dona ld 
Lancas te r to be Weaving 
across lanes on eastbound 
Hines D r i v e near Center 
Street. 

When Lancaster attempted 
to stop the car, it sped away, 
driving down the center of the 
roadway south on Hines 
Drive. 

The chase continued 
through Hines Park, with Sch­
midt's vehicle running stop 
signs and red lights at speeds 
up to 70 mph. Schmidt forced 
the squad car off the road 
near Hines and Northville 
R o a d and continued onto 
Wi lcox Road , where 
Plymouth police joined the 
chase. 

Speeds were clocked at 105 
mph on Schoolcraft Road 
between Wilcox and Eckles. 
The chase continued south 
through P l y m o u t h wi th 
numerous stop lights and 
signs ignored and several 
oncoming cars forced off the 
road, police said. 

Schmidt drove into a field 
off P l y m o u t h Road , 
back t r ack ing his previous 
route at speeds up to 127 mph. 

When he reached Northville 
Road and Six Mile , he turned 
onto westbound Six Mi l e and 
as Lancaster attempted to 
force him to stop, slammed 
into the front end of the patrol 
car with the side of his car. 

Schmidt continued on Six to 
Sheldon, south on Sheldon to 
F ive Mi le Where he headed 
West to Curtis Road. 

Continued on Page 12-A 

collection, there Would be no 
need for this. 

"I find it difficult to ask the 
businessman to subsidize the 
a rcha ic Way schools a re 
financed," he commented. 

Trustee Stanley Johnston 
agreed With Orphan, ex­
plaining that $30,000 to $35,000 
in interest could be saved by 
collecting taxes in the sum­
mer, "bu t the taxpayers 
Would not go along With this. I 
do not see Why our creditors 
should suffer at the district's 
refusal to go to a summer tax 
collection." 

Board president Dr. Orlo 
Robinson said that businesses 
Who Want the bills paid, 
should be paicL 

Superintendent Raymond 
Spear said the move Would 
save the school district about 
$3,000 in interest. "This must 
be Weighed against the bad 
feelings it might create 
among some businesses." 

Orphan noted that the 
district Was " i n the same 
situation once before, but We 
Were then faced With a crisis. 
I do not feel We are in that 
position noW." 

Johnston commented that if 
the "people in the school 
system (employees) do not 
have to Wait for their money. 
Why should the businessman?" 

School board members also 
Went on record Monday 
support ing Wayne County 
I n t e r m e d i a t e S c h o o l 
District 's intent to continue to 
develop a program for testing 
students Which is fair and 
accurate. 

The intermediate district 
plans to Work with the state 
department of education in 
revising and improving the 

Michigan Assessment Test 
administered yearly to a l l 
fourth and seventh graders in 
the state. 

In other action, trustees 
— approved contracts for 

two half time teachers, Toni 
K . Bufe, 1969 graduate of 
Eastern Michigan University 
with a BS in English and 
business education, who wi l l 
teach high school typing; and 
CarleeStewner, 1971 graduate 

of- University of Michigan 
with a BS degree in earth 
science, w i l l teach earth 
science at the high school; 

— renewed the district's 
membersh ip in the Nor­
thwestern Guidance Cl inic for 
the 1972-73 school year; 

— authorized the Northville 
Junior Football Association to 
use the high school stadium 
for home games; 

— approved revised duties 
and responsibilities of the 
director of instruction and 
admin i s t r a t ive assis tant 
(formerly personnel director); 
and 

— authorized the 
superintendent to proceed 
with recruitment of an ad­
ministrative assistant with an 
effective employment date of 
November 1. 

R i c h a r d M a r t i n 

T r u s t e e R e s i g n s P o s t 

Richard Mart in resigned 
Monday night from the North­
ville School Board. 

A member of the board for 
nearly six years, Mart in said 

R I C H A R D M A R T I N 

his move from the Northville 
school district to Farmington 
has forced him to give up the 
post. 

His letter of resignation, 
which he presented to the 
board Monday, was accepted 
with regret. 

Trustees noted his service 
to the community and the 
school district wi l l be missed, 
and they adopted a resolution 
commending h im for his 
service. 

Board Presidnt Dr . Orlo 
Robinson stated the " l ikes of 
Richard Mar t in wil l be next to 
impossible to replace. His 
swift appraisal and shrewd 
judgements wi l l be missed by 
the board." 

Mart in was appointed in 
1967 to f i l l a vacancy on the 
board. He Was elected 
treasurer of the board for 
1967-68, served as v ice-
president from June, 1969, 
through January, 1970, and 
president from January to 
June, l970. 

By law, trustees have 20 

days in which to appoint 
someone to fill the vacancy 
created by the resignation. 
The appointee must face 
election in June, 1973. if he 
wishes to serve the remaining 
two years of Martin 's term 
which expires in 1975. 

No indication was given as 
to Whom the board wi l l select 
to f i l l the vacancy. Board 
members are expected to fi l l 
the post at their September 25 
meeting. 

With a m i n i m u m of 
discussion, township trustees 
approved raises for officials 
by a split vote. 

The action came shortly 
after midnight Tuesday in the 
board's more than five-hour 
meeting. 

' The raises, which were 
proposed by Supervisor 
Gunnar Stromberg Tuesday, 
include $12,500 for the 
supervisor and $10,000 each 
for the treasurer and for the 
clerk. 

Voting for the raises were 
Trustee L e o n a r d K l e i n , 
S t romberg and Treasu re r 
Joseph S t raub . Cas t ing 
dissenting votes were 
Trustees R i c h a r d M i t c h e l l 
and Charles Schaeffer. Ab­
staining were Clerk Eleanor 
Hammond and Trus tee 
Bernard Baldwin. 

The raises wi l l be effective 
at the start of the new terms 
in November. Of the three 
off icials , only T reasu re r 
Straub is seeking re-election. 

Cur ren t ly the s a l a ry 
schedule includes supervisor, 
$8,457; treasurer, $7,027; and 
clerk, $7,736. 

Schaeffer told board 
members he Would vote 
against the increases "since 
this could have been done 
before the p r i m a r y When 
people had a chance to run for 
office." 

S t r o m b e r g c o u n t e r e d , 
saying "most people knew 
there would be an increase." 

M i t c h e l l noted that the 
"people proposing this (new 
salaries) are the very people 
who have voted against it. It is 
improper to do it now." 

Clerk Hammond, who has 
long been a supporter for . 
higher salaries, said now was 

"an inappropr ia te t ime to 
approve the raises. 

The salary question has 
been before the board for 
several months, with Clerk 
Hammond in favor of placing 
raises of $12,000 for the 
supervisor and $10,000 for 
each the clerk and treasurer 
in the township's original 
budget discussed in March . 

However, Mitchel l at that 
t ime proposed fo l lowing 
cit izens study commit tee 
recommendations of salaries 
of $10,500 for supervisor , ^ 
$9,000 for clerk and $8,000 for 
treasurer. 

In May, raises for officials 
were again defeated, when 
Clerk Hammond asked they 
be boosted to $12,000 for 
supervisor, $10,000 for each 
the clerk and treasurer. She 
proposed they be retroactiVe 
to May 3, with Mitchel l and 
Straub supporting her. 

K l e i n , B a l d w i n and 
Schaeffer were opposed to the 
move and S t romberg ab­
stained. 

Another proposal made in 
May, to grant the salaries ^ 
effective December 1, was ' ' 
favored by only two trustees, 
Mitchell and Schaeffer. 

Continued on Page 12-A 

I t ^ s G r i d T i m e 

Anottier football season is upon us. . .and if you have any 
doubts check the special Football Preview in Section C of this 
edition. 

The previeW spotlights potentials in area conferences as 
high schools prepare for Friday's openers. Local ly, a l l 
eyes are focused on the battle between NorthVille and Novi 
here in a non-conference contest. 

Besides the Football Preview section. Page l2-A offers 
something special for grid fans. That's Where the annual 
Football Contest rules-entry forms is located. Once again, $l8 
in prizes are being offered Weekly to contestants Who pick the 
Winners of professional, college and local high school games. 

The contest, an annual N o r ^ v i i l e Record feature, is spon­
sored by l6 area business places. 

T h u r s d a y , S e p t e m b e r 1 4 , 1 9 7 2 
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I n H o u c k H o m e 

A r t i s t i c T o u c h e s A b o u n d 

M a y b u r y C h a i r s i n t h e K i t c h e n D i n i n g A r e a 

Items passed down to M r . 
and Mrs . David Houck from 
their f ami l i e s and M r s . 
Houck ' s o r ig ina l a r t i s t i c 
touches throughout, have 
given their home a certain 
uniqueness. 

Their Northville Township 
Cape Cod style home wi l l be 
one of the five opened to the 
public on September 28 for the 
s ix th annual N o r t h v i l l e 
P r e s b y t e r i a n C h u r c h ' s 
Homes Tour. 

Mrs . Houck has been doing 
decoupage for the past six 
years. " M r s . Hardee Betha 
gave decoupage classes in her 
home for her friends. I took it 
up then, and have been doing 
it eVer since," she said. 

Her Work is d isp layed 
throughout the house. Among 
the pieces is her f i r s t 
decoupage project, a wooden 
candleholder which sits on a 
counter in the kitchen. 

"I giVe most of my work 
away to friends. It takes me 
so long to do one piece that I 
couldn't possibly sell i t , " she 
said. F o r the Homes Tour she 
wil l haVe much of her finished 
pieces, on display in a room 
she calls the "fun room." 

At first glance, the smal l 
room off the kitchen might 
appear to be a utility room, 
but to brighten it, Mrs . Houck 
has painted brightly colored 
flowers on the walls with 
acrylic paint. She calls it the 
"fun room". 

Mrs. Houck holds an art 
degree f rom Indiana 
UniVersity in Indiana, Penn-
sylVania. More of her artwork 

is displayed in the kitchen. 
Above the spacious cooking 

area in the k i tchen , the 
Houcks have hung wallpaper 
with a design of various kinds 
of fruits. The design is carried 
through in a pastel picture 
which Mrs . Houck drew and 
hung in the kitchen dining 
area and again on the 
"Maybury chairs". 

The "Maybury chairs" are 
so called because they were 
purchased at a sale held after 
the sanitarium closed. "There 
were quite a few layers of 
paint on them, as they were 
painted every other year. I 
got most of it off, and then 
made a stencil for them," she 
said. The stencil was made to 
include the same basic pat­
tern as the wallpaper and Was 
used to paint the yelloW 
design on the backs of the six 
chairs. 

In the dining room are 
several of the f a m i l y 
possessions the Houcks 
received from their families. 
One is a large bureau Which 
belonged to his great-great­
grandfather. "When We asked 
for i t ," said Mrs. Houck, " m y 
husband's mother couldn ' t 
understand Why we wanted it. 
She kept it in her basement to 
store jellies." 

The cherry wood drop-leaf 
table in the dining room 
belonged to M r s . Houck's 
family. "This U b l e , " she 
said, "was in four pieces when 
we got it. We needed it, so my 
husband put it together. Now I 
Wouldn't part with i t " 

Mrs. Houck also has a 

B u d Dye 
F o r some Very marred 
pieces of furni ture , 
re f in i sh ing is the only 
answer. Al though 
refinishing sounds like a lot 
of Work, there is a knack to 
it that once acqu i red 
makes refinishing fairly 
easy. Y o u w i l l f ind 
yourself able to do much 
more than you thought! 
The first step is usually the 
Worst for this involves 
getting rid of the old finish. 
A finish remover, either for 
paint or for varnish, is 
usually the best answer to 
this p rob lem. S i m p l y 
follow the directions on the 
abel! 

The best answer to your 
homeowner problems is to 
m a k e N O R T H V I L L E 
L U M B E R C O , 6I5 E . 
Base l ine . 349-0220 your 
homeowner headquarters. 
Our very Wide selection of 
bu i ld ing ma te r i a l s and 
supplies includes A r m -
strong and Owens-Corning 
ceUing tOe; fiberglas in-
su la t ion ; Dex te r and 
KWikse t locks ; R a W l 
fasteners; and Amerock 
hardware. Delivery ser­
vice. Open: 8-6, M o n - F r i ; 
8-2. S a t 
H E L P F U L H I N T : 
A fine file is necessary to 
keep, y o u r scrapers i n 
working order. Always 
sharpen after use^ 

D a v i d ' s R o o m F e a t u r e s E c o l o g y F l a g a n d P a i n t e d W i n d o w S h a d e 

O P E N I N G S O O N 
i 

O u r N e w H o m e s . . . 

A t l 5 0 - l 5 4 M a i n S t r e e t - N e x t t o S p i n n i n g W h e e l F a b r i c S h o p 

F l m C o i / e f i i i g 

We'll be moving from our present 
location at 106 E . Dunlap this 
weekend. - . and while moving we 
apologize for any inconvenience to 
our customers. 

J o n a f h a n 

J o M f e l e r s 

We're new in Northville and look 
forward to meeting and serving 
this fine community. 
There is plenty of free parking 
nearby so plan now to come in 
and look us over. 

complete service for 12 of 
English flow blue china which 
has been in her family for 
some time. 

In the spacious l iving room, 
there a re more fami ly 
treasures. One is a set of 
white Wedgwood china from 
Mrs. Houck's family. It is 
kept in an antique cabinet. 

The cabinet, Mrs . Houck 
explained, was found in the 
garage of a house she and her 
husband once rented. It had 25 
to 30 coats of paint on it. After 
she stripped the paint from it 
she sent a picture of it to a 
home furnishing magazine to 
determine whether or not it 
was an antique. According to 
their estimate, the cabinet 
was made in the eariy 1800's. 

Also in the l iving room is a 
picture Mrs . Houck believes is 
a lithograph and is about 200 
years old. The title is "His 
First Pants." 

She explained that every 
time her mother would hang 
the painting she and her 
brother and sister "would 
make a fuss" until it was 
taken down. It is st i l l in the 
original frame and she says 
she wouldn't give it up. 

The Houcks have four 
children. David, 16, has his 
own room, which he, along 
wi th M r s . Houck ' s help, 
decorated. 

One wall is painted to 
resemble the green and 
yellow ecology flag. There is a 
plate over the light switch 
which is painted with the 
peace sign. David found a 
psychadelic painting he liked 
on the cover of a Sunday 
supplement magazine and 
Mrs . Houck reproduced it on 
the window shade in the 
bedroom. 

In contrast to David's room, 
the Houcks' daughter, Susan, 
has a very feminine blue and 
white room wi th F r e n c h 
Provincial furniture. 

Just outside the back door 
there once stood a large elm 
tree. Mrs . Houck said, like so 
many other ehns, they were 
forced to cut the tree down 
because of Dutch elm disease. 
Half of it was left so she 
painted it white and drew ivy 
and birds on the trunk and br­
anches. The tree is a favorite 
c l i m b i n g p lace for the 
Houcks' two sons B i l l y , 13, 
and Peter who is seven. 

S e v e n - y e a r - o l d P e t e r H o u c k i n t h e P a i n t e d E l m 

N o r t h v i l l e ' s 

" H O S P I T A L I T Y H O U S E " 

STOP IN SOON FOR SOME STEAK 'N EGGS 

3 3 3 EAST M A I N STREET 

3 4 9 - 6 0 7 0 

C O M I N G T O 

N O R T H V I U E 

I N T R O D U C T O R Y O F F E R 
G o o d O n l y S e p t . 1 4 t h i ^ S e p t . 2 3 . 

M E N ' S 

S H I R T S 

M i n i m u m 
o f 3 

L a u n d e r e d 2 9 * E A C H 

W I T H A N Y D R Y C L E A N I N G O R D E R 

A l s o o f f e r i n g a c o m p l e t e 

d r y c l e a n i n g a n d 

s h i r t l a u n d r y s e r v i c e 

c o m b i n i n g t h e n e w e s t c l e a n i n g m e t h o d s w i t h a n 

o l d - f a s h i o n e d i d e a o f s e r v i c e 

A l l o u r c l e a n i n g i s d o n e 

i n o u r o w n p l a n t . T h i s 

g i v e s u s c o m p l e t e 

c o n t r o l o v e r e v e r y 

o p e r a t i o n a n d a s s u r e s 

t h e c o n s i s t e n t h i g h 

q u a l i t y t o r w h i c h w e a r e 

k n o w n . W e d o n ' t q u i b b l e 

a b o u t m i n o r r e p a i r s 

e i t h e r ; w e s e w o n 

b u t t o n s , w e s t i t c h u p 

s e a m s , w e m e n d t e a r s . . . 

w i t h o u t m a k i n g a " b i g 

t h i n g " o u t o f i t a n d 

w i t h o u t c h a r g i n g y o u . 

T r y u s ; y o u ' l l b e m o r e 

t h a n s a t i s f i e d . 

A L L C L O T H E S F U L L Y I N S U R E D 

1 1 5 W E S T M A I N S T e - ^ N O R T H V i U E 

• H i g h - q u a l i t y c l e a n i n g of 
men's , women 's , and ch i ld ren ' s 
clothes 

• C u s t o m - c l e a n i n g of k n i t s , 
formal at t i re , and suede and 
leather garments 

• Finest c leaning of d rape r i e s , 
s l i p c o v e r s , b e d s p r e a d s , a n d 
blankets 

• Expe r t c l ean ing , g l a z i n g , and 
storage of furs 

Watch F o r O u r O f f i c i a l O p e n i n g s . ^ C o m i n g Soon! 
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N O \ I H I G H L I G H T S 

B y J E . \ . N \ E C L A R K E 
624-0173 

Laura Little, daughter of 
Mr . and Mrs . James Little of 
NoVi Road, is now a student at 
N o r t h e r n M i c h i g a n 
U n i V e r s l t y , M a r q u e t t e , 
Michigan. 

M r . and Mrs . Bruce Taylor 
(Kristie Killeen) celebrated 
their F i r s t Wedding A n ­
niversary by having dinner 
With M r . and Mrs . AlVin 
Kil leen of Beck Road. 

The Russ Button family has 
returned home after spending 
Labor Day Weekend at Lost 
L,ake Woods Club in the Upper 
Michigan. 

M r . and Mrs . Russell Race 
of TWelVe Mile Road attended 
the funeral of their l8-year-old 
nephew, Gergory Furgeson 
Milford, who was killed in car 
accident last Week. 

M r . and Mrs . E d Callan of 
MeadoWbrook Road haVe 
returned home after taking 
their son, Roy, to Marantha 
Bap t i s t B i b l e Col lege at 
WatertoWn, Wisconsin. Roy 
joins his tWo other brothers, 
Pat and Harold, Who also are 
students there. On the Way 
home M r . and Mrs . Callan 
toured the Upper Michigan. 

M r . K i r t Bailey of NoVi 
Road is now liVing With his 
daughter and her family, Mrs . 
Jackie SommerVille in Walled 
Lake. 

Mrs . Clark Race Was ad­
mitted to Pontiac General on 
Monday With a heart attack. 

Mr . and Mrs . AlVin Killeen 
of Beck Road entertained 
several members of their 
f ami ly from Wisconsin , 
Kansas, and Arkansas for a 
weekend and while here had a 
family reunion. 

Rose Button, daughter of 
M r . and Mrs . Russ Button, 
was home for the Weekend 
from John Wesley College. 

M r . and M r s . V i c t o r 
Thomas and son Randy 
Visited Eugene Choquet of 
South Lake Drive over the 
weekend. 

The Carnahan family of 
Maudlin has returned home 
from vacationing near Por-
togarde, Flor ida . 

M r s . M a e Atk inson of 
Fonda Street visited With old 
friends in Ypsl lant i recently— 
M r . and Mrs . Clyde Harmon 
vis i t ing l rom Denver, D r . and 
Mrs . iJyal-Carpenter, aind Dr . 
and Mrs ; Maurice Wilcox. 

M r . and Mrs . Courtney 
Stamper of Novi Road have 
moved to Walled Lake and 
Will be missed by their neigh­
bors. 

Mrs . Richard Patterson of 
Maudlin had a special bir­
thday party for her husband 
this WeekencL 

Leon Dochot of South Lake 
Drive attended the Oakland 
County LaW Enforcement 
Association meet ing on 
Wednesday at K a y Fal ls on 
HiUer Road. 

Word has been received 
that the former owners of 
Novi Hardware are now living 
in Tucson, Arizona. 

Mrs . Russ Button is en­
tertaining her mother, Mrs . 
Wirt Lee from Winterpark, 
Florida, this Week. 

M r . and Mrs . Joe Flotte of 
South I^ke Dr ive are en­
ter ta in ing re la t ives f rom 
Traverse City. 

M r . and Mrs . Roger Dallas 
visited M r . and Mrs . John 
French on L.abor Day on their 
Way to St. Paul , Minnesota to 
meike their home. 

Mrs . Hattie Garl ick has 
returned home from spending 
a feW days With M r . and Mrs . 
Archie Crumb near Pontiac. 

M r s . M a e Atk inson of 
Fonda Street had as visitors 
at her cabin near Lewiston 
her sister and her husband, 
M r . and Mrs . Hadley Bachert. 

Raymond L a Fond, former 
resident of Novi now living in 
Petoskey, entered University 
Hospital on Sunday morning 
for open heart surgery today 
(Thursday). 

Novi Goodfellows 
The Novi Goodfellows plan 

their first meeting <rf this 
season on September 21 at 
7:30 at the Rosewood 
Restaurant A t this time they 
Will be making plans for 
money making projects as 
Well as their annual Old 

.Newsboy P a p e r sa le . 
Proceeds ()f their projects go 
towards seeing that every 
chUd in NoVi has a Christmas. 

Chairman is Mrs . Joyce 
Brewer. 

U F P L A N N I N G — T h e s e N o v i w o I n e n a r e a m o n g 
t h e l e a d e r s i n t h e U n i t e d F o i l n d a t i o n T o r c h 
D r i v e i n t h i s a r e a . M e e t i n g f o r b r u n c h a n d a 
t r a i n i n g s e s s i o n r e c e n t l y w e r e ( lef t to r i g h t ) 
M r s . R u s s e l l F e r t i t t a , M r s . D o n a l d W a l l i n g , M r s . 

D o n T h o r p e a n d M r s . D a v i d S t r a t t o n . B e g i i m i n g 
O c t o b e r 17, t h e 1972 T o r c h D r i v e w i l l b e n e f i t 
m o r e t h a n 160 a g e n c i e s a n d s e r v i c e s i n W a y n e , 
O a k l a n d a n d M a c o m b c o i m t i e s . 

NoVi Rebekah Lodge 
The Independent Rebekah 

Club made plans for their 
annual Bazaar on October 7 at 
the N o V i C o m m u n i t y 
Building. Those in charge of 
the kitchen wi l l be Blanche 
Clutz and Kathryn BacherL 
There wi l l be a roast beef 
dinner at that t ime and tickets 
are ava i l ab le from any 
member. A l l members are 
asked to remember to bring in 
..the canned goods, etc for t h f 
food baskets at the next 
meeting. 

Thursday night Will be the 
first regular meeting of the 
season and on September 21 
the degree team is asked to 
remember practice at 8 p.m. 
sharp. Members also are 
asked to send cards to Mrs . 
Frances Denton at her home in 
Detroit as she has returned 

home from the convalescent tember 21, at 8 p.m. at the 
Home. home of J i m PietroWski at 

41111 Fenmore Dr ive . The 
success of this pack Will 
depend on the fact that there is 
a need for about four den 
mothers. Anyone Wishing to 
help i n this area is urged to 
contact M r . PietroWski. 

Blue Star MoU1ers 
The Blue Star mothers had 

their regular meeting at the 
home of Lucy Needham and 
at that time they made plans 
to attend a meeting on Sep­
tember 21 in Farmington of 
the Southeast R e g i o n a l 
Meeting for a School of In­
struction and an a l l day 
meeting. 

They a lso are l ook ing 
forWard to Veterans Day at 

Road to the church. Anyone 
along this route Wishing a ride 
is asked to contact Pastor 
Mi l l e r at 349-4406. Anyone not 
l iv ing on the route but Wishing 
a ride also is asked to contact 
M r . Mi l le r . 

This next Monday night the 
bus Will leave the church at 
6:30 p.m. to go to the A m ­
bassador R o l l e r R i n k in 
ClaWson and return about 
10:30 p.m. A l l young people 
are invited to go roller skating 
With the church group. 

Other actiVities include a 

SouUi Walled Lake 
Baptist Chapel 

The church has recently 
acquired a bus and has been 
calling on prospectiVe Sunday 
School members along the bus 

the Veterans Hospital in A n n , r o u t e . This route is as**-special pirograiri'cm Sunday 
Arbor on October 23. P r io r to folIoWs: leaVes the church at &'-'-night When the ladies of the 

a.m. and goes through the W M U S Wi l l present a 
following streets — De Gross, program 
Shawood, Austin, South Lake Missions. 
DriVe, Maudlin, Eubank, and 
back to South Lake Drive ; 
then to Henning, Buffington, 
and over to Highgate Sub-
diVision, down Eas t Lake 
DriVe, Herman, Paramount, 
Thirteen Mi l e and then NoVi 

that they wi l l be going to the 
hospital to do shopping on 
September 18. The date of 
their annual Bazaar Will be 
October 25. 

Cub Scout Pack 239 
Vil lage Oaks 

There Will be a committee 
meeting on Thursday Sep-

about the Home 

Novi School Menu 
Monday, September 18— 

Goulash bread butter. Carrot 
Strips cookies and milk. 

Tuesday, September 19 — 
C h i c k e n P i e or past ies . 

W i x o m N e w s b e a t 

B a p t i s t C h u r c h H o n o r s 1 8 W o m e n 

By N A N C Y D I N G E L D E Y 
E i g h t e e n l o n g - a c t i V e 

women of the Baptist Church 
were honored Tuesday 
evening by the Chr i s t i an 
Women's Fellowship group 
during the opening session of 
their fall program. 

Most of the Women, now in 
their 70's and 80's, have been 
active both in the church and 
the community since "way 
back When". They Were the 
ladies Who cooked, served and 
Washed dishes for just about 
every church function, bridal 
shoWer or reception. They 
Were the ones Who Were called 
on time and again in time of 
need or grief. The hours spent 
by these ladies are countless 
and sometimes unknown to 
the community. 

In later years, the duties 
Were passed on to the 
"youngsters" of the church 
and now in their golden hours 
these very same Women are 
active in their own Way of 
serving and helping others. 
Once each month they meet 
for fellowship and indulge in 
their project of making quilts. 
Most of their beautiful 
needlework goes to the 
Pontiac Rescue Mission or to 
an Indian mission in Maine. 
Sales of quilts Within the 
community help to buy more 
materials for more quilts. 

And so, these 18 lovely 

ladies Were honored for their 
Work: Mrs . Gina Monroe, 
Mrs . Lottie Proctor, Mrs . 
Edi th Porter, M r s . L i l l i an 
B y r d , M r s . K a t h e r i n e 
Bezaire, Mrs . M a r y Greenlee 
and M r s . L o u i s e Bowers . 
Also, Mrs . Al ice Hopkins, 
Mrs . Mildred Bogart, Mrs . 
Charlotte Banfield and M r s . 
Florence VanAmberg. Others 
receiving the gold crowns that 
signified those honored were 
Mrs . Pol ly Al len , Mrs . Alma 
WoodWorth, M r s . A l m a 
Johnston, Mrs . Olive Huith, 
M r s . E t h e l Hopp , M i s s 
Mar ian Nichols and Mrs . 
Caroline Rubritius. 

Wixom Elementary School 
kids — set -- ide Saturday, 
September ' jt the annual 
P a r k s ant. Rec rea t ion 
Decatha lon . L a s t year ' s 
" d a y " brought a good 
shoWing of both kids and 
parents and it is hoped that 
even more youngsters Will 
participate this year. 

Children are grouped by 
grades for the events Which 
include dashes of various 
lengths, bicycle races for boys 
and girls from the fourth 
through the sixth grades, 
footbal l k i c k s , basebal l 
throws, broad jumps and a 
host of other activities to 
complete an active day. 

Ribbons and medals are 
awarded to Winners in the 

events and after f i n a l 
tabulation, the boy and g i r l 
decathalon Winners are an­
nounced at school. 

After just passing through a 
rather hectic Week of the 
Olympic games in Munich, 
feeling should be rather high 
in the t rack and f ie ld 
categories. We can have our 
own Olympics right here in 
Wixom. 

It's a good fun day — why 
not join in? 

Last week I mentioned that 
the Hardes ty ' s took their 
annual Labor Day trek across 
the Mackinac Bridge. What I 
failed to tell you was that their 
youngest daughter, Lo r i , was 
honored at ceremonies after 
the completion of the walk as 
the youngest g i r l to ever walk 
the entire length of the bridge. 
Lor i is a Whole four years old 
and deserves a big star for her 
endurance. 

Elna and Pau l Salo of 
Nalone Street hosted a going 
away coffee last F r iday night 
for Hickory Hi l ls neighbors, 
Marie and R a y Lehto. Old 
friends and neighbors 
gathered to wish them good 

luck on Ray 's retirement 
from Bendix Research and a 
fond adieu as they head to 
their new home in Arizona. 

The Wixom Chamber of 
Commerce met on September 
6 at Calico Kitchens to resume 
their usual monthly meetings 
after the s u m m e r break. 
Pro jec ted projects to ac­
complish Were discussed with 
the Chamber by its president, 
Charies Smith. A t the same 
time, members Were ap­
pointed to the various com­
mittees of the chamber. 

Heading the Program and 
Planning segment is Chief 
George Von Behren of the 
Wixom Police Department 
along with George Woodhead 
and Cliff Cottrell. 

John Kurt t i of the Wixom 
Branch of the Community 
Bank wi l l head Activities, 
P romot ion and E n ­
ter tainment a long w i t h 
Wil l iam Travis and Nancy 
Liddle. 

Membership and Dues Will 
have as its chairman, V i rg i l 
Ciofu of the Walter Toebe 
Company and working with 
him Will be John Kurt t i and 
John Lut7.. 

L i l l i a n Spencer Wil l act as 
c h a i r m a n of C i t y Af fa i r s 
joined by Florence Coy. 

The Chamber meets once 
each month With programs 
and speakers planned for 
every third meeting. Citizens 
of Wixom and those having 
businesses in Wixom are most 
cordially invited to join the 
Chamber. 

Registration for the fall 
t e rm of C o m m u n i t y 
Education is in full swing this 
Week. It's not too late to sign up 
for any one of the multitude of 
programs being offered in 
Adult and Youth Recreation— 
sWimming, special interest, 
voca t iona l educat ion and 
adul t high school c red i t 
courses. 

Regis t ra t ions for any 
classes are being taken at 
C e n t r a l H i g h School ' s 
Cafeteria from 7 until 9 p.m. 
through tonight. (Thursday, 
September 14).^ 

mashed potatoes and gravy, 
bread and butter, fruit and 
milk. 

Wednesday, September 20 
— Scalloped potatoes and 
ham, hot corn, bread and 
butter, buttered vegetables, 
brownies and milk. 

Thursday, September 21 -
Sloppy Joe hamburger and 
potato chips, cabbage salad, 
fruited cookies and mi lk . 

Friday, September 22 — 
Submarine With hash brown 
potatoes, but tered green-
beans, jello and milk. 

Holy Cross Episcopal 
Church 

Services at Holy Cross for 
the Sunday of September 17 
only Will be at 7:30a.m. and 9 
a.m. Thei'e Will be a special 
meeting of a l l men Who are 
interested in being ushers 
following the 9 a.m. service on 
September 17. 

The Roaring 70's w i l l have 
their first meeting on Sep­
tember 17 at 6:30 p.m. at 
Par ish Ha l l . Sponsors of this 
group are Zora and B r i a n 
LaBarre . 

T h e E . C . W . Will need baked 
goods for September 28 and 
anyone Wish ing to donate 

earlier than that date may 
contact M r s . Letzring. 

LiVing Lord Lutheran 
Church Day School 

The date has been set as 
October 2 When there Will be 
an Open House to celebrate 
the anniversary of their first 
year. More details at a later 
date. 

NoViSenior Citizens 
A l l senior citizens are urged 

to remember and look for­
Ward to the meeting on the 
last Tuesday of the month, 
September 26, at the NoVi 
Community Bui lding. After a 
very short business meeting, 
everyone Will be privileged to 
hear Mrs . Donald (Barb) 
Nagy and she Will be shoWing 
everyone a fast Way to 
decorate a cake. Mrs . Nancy 

Liddle Will be her co-hostess 
for the evening. Those Who 
Wish to play cards, if time 

permits, may do so folloWing 
this program. 

A l l senior citizens Who do 
not yet attend are encouraged 
to come and bring a friend. If 
information is needed ca l l 
Mrs . Liddle at 349-2219 as she 
can furnish information of 
coming events, etc. 

Orchard Hills Baptist 
Church 

The ladies of the church 
visited the girls cottage at the 
Wayne County C h i l d 
Development Center where 
they take refreshments and 
birthday treats once a month. 
They are now Working With 
tWo cottages of girls. On 
F r i d a y night, the young 
people Will be presenting an 
evening of special music for 
the patients at the Whitehall 
Convalescent Home on Grand 
River. 

Other coming events in­
clude a special prayer service 
on Wednesday night for the 
Home M i s s i o n p r o g r a m . 
Also, there Will be a teachers 
and officers meeting of the 
Sunday School to s tar t 
preparation of the enlistment 
project to begin in October. 

CubScoutPack240 
Orchard Hil ls School 

There Will be a committee 
meeting at the DeBrule home 
on Wednesday, September 20 
at 8 p.m. for the purpose of 
f i n a l i z i n g plans for the 
initiation program on Sep­
tember 27. 

United Methodist Church 
Anthem Was " G o ForWard 

Christian Soldier". Ushers 
Were J i m Stine and Charles 
Howison. Acolyte Was M a r y 
HoWison. Sermon title Was 
"PloWshares and Swords." 
FloWers on the altar Were in 
memory of Duane B e l l s ' 
father, Ray Be l l . 

Announcements included a 
need :fof a volunteer pianist to 
take turns helping at the 
Whi teha l l serVices every 
other Week. The young people 
held their first meeting of the 
season at 6:30 and on Monday 
night. A l l Junior High (7 & 8 
grade) Will be meeting With 

- G i l .Henderson. . ..Weekly , 
meetings Will continue at the 
Waldemyer home at 40677 Ten 
Mi le Road. 

Next Monday night aU the 
Women are invited to the 
W.S.C.S. meeting Who Will 
have a panel discussion on 
"The role of women in the 
church" at 8 p.m. On Tuesday 
night the Nomination and 
Per sonne l commi t t ee Wi l l 
meet at 7:30. 

The A d u l t s a re look ing 
forWard to a one-hour study 
class beginning on Thursday, 
September 28 for the folloWing 
four Weeks With the minister 
at the parsonage 24575 Bor-
derhill, at 7:30 p.m.. Subject 

for first meeting is "Getting it 
all together." 

Novi Boy Scouts 
The B o y Scouts have 

rescheduled their canoe trip 
for September 29 and Will be 
l eav ing the communi ty 
building at 7 p.m. Any scout 
not at the meeting Who Wishes 
to go is asked to contact Dave 
Harrison before next Mon­
day's meeting to get the 
necessary troop. 

Next Monday evening there 
Will be a f i lm about the Scout 
Jamboree, presented through 
the courtesy of Duane Be l l . 
On September 25 at 7:30 p.m. 
there Will be a Court of Honor 

. and presentation of AWards 
at the MeadoWbrook Lake 
Subdivision Park. Every one 
is asked to come in uniform.' 
and to bring a chair. Also 
coming: October 21 there w i l l 
be a District Campout 

Novi G i r l Scouts 
There wi l l be a leaders^ 

meeting on Thursday, Sep-' 
tember 14 from 9:30 to 
11:30 a .m. under the 
leadership of Ginny Folsom at 
the United Methodist Church 
on Ten Mi le Road. 

F i r s t Baptist Church 
of NoVi 

Special music in the mor­
ning Worship service Was a 
solo by Karen Clarke. The 
benedict ion Was by the 
Reverend Roy GrindeU. 

In the evening service Sue 
Brough played the offertory. 
Mrs . Gerry Wallace sang 
"FolloW M e " and Miss Peggy 
SteWart sang " G o d is so 
Wonderful" 

The F a i t h Chorus has 
resumed its meetings under 
the direction of M r s . Bernice 
• Stewart. Rehearsals are on 
Wednesday evening at 8:30 
p.m. and Sunday evening at 6 
p.m. .All Women of the church 
are encouraged to attend. 

The Vera Vaughn starts the 
fall season With a meeting on 
Tuesday at the church. 

Several men of the church 
spent Labor Day Working 
the new residence for the 
Christ ian education director. 
Their thanks to M r . Davis and 
M r s . Cook Who provided 
lunch. 

The J u n i o r H i g h youth 
group, grades 6-8; - meet 
F r iday night 6' p.m. a t .the 
parsonage for a cookout. It 
Will end at 8:30 or 9 p.m. 
Juniors are asked to bring 
their friends. 

The annual Sunday School 
picnic and corn roast is 
scheduled for September 23 a 
the church. The men have a 
Work day planned and are 
asked to stay for the feast. 
This is alsd in conjunction 
With R a l l y Day to follow on 
the September 24. 

The annual Mid-America 
Sunday School Convention is 
scheduled for October 26-28th^ 
at Cobo H a l l . The group Will 
go to and from the convention 
in the bus. 
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C a s t e r l i n e 

F u n e r a l H o m e 

R A Y J . C A S T E R L I N E 
1893-1959 

F R E D A . C A S T E R L I N E 
R A Y J . C A S T E R L I N E II 

Serving the Northville Area for 3 Generations 

C . H A R O L D B L O O M 

AGENCY, iNCORPORATEO 
OVER 38 YEARS EXPERIENCE 

EYE EXAMINATiONS CONTACT LENSES 

DR. J E R O M E L. M C D O W E L L 
OPTOMETRIST 

U 3 E. DUNLAPST. 
NORTHVILLE. MICH. 48107 

OFFICK HOURS 
ey APPOINTMCNT 

TCLWHONg 
349-7820 

E A R L Y A M E R I C A N 

S O F A 

a n d C H A I R 
Coli spring Use. oak frames, 
Herculon covers. 

EASY TERMS 

H O M E O W N E R S I N S U R A N C E 
F O R A P A R T M E N T D W E L L E R S 

WE INSURE BY TELEPHONE 

CAI 
108 W. (VIAIN-NORTH 3 4 9 - 1 2 5 2 

L A U R E L 

F U R N I T U R E 

F R E E D E L I V E R Y 
584 W. A N N ARBOR TRAIL 
(bet. Ulley Rd. & Main St.) 

open daily 9:30-6 p.m. 
Thurs. - FrI. until 9 p.m. 

M c C A B E 

Conveniently located. Providing 
the saine thorough, thoughtful 
service Detroit-afea families 
have depended on for over three 
generations. 

EDWARD P. DEWAR. 
MANAGER 

BRIGHTON f u p e r a l b o i p e 
since 1893 

in Detroit 

18570 GRAND RIVER AVENUE DETROIT, MICHIGAN 836-3572 WIUIAM J. JOHNS, MANAGER 

T h u r s d a y , S e p t e m b e r 1 4 , 1 9 7 2 T H E N O R T H V I L L E R E C O R D - - N O V J N E W S Page 7 - A 

P o l i c e - C o u r t B l o t t e r 

I n N o r t h v i l l e 

Agents f rom the F B I 
received an assist from city 
po l ice this Week i n ap­
prehending a . man they 
Wanted. 

City police stopped a 30-
year-old man last Thursday 
afternoon for speeding. The 
man. Who stated he did not 
have his drivers license With 
him, identified himself With a 
passport as Israel Long. 

A routine check run by city 
police showed no person With 
that name on file but later it 
Was learned that an Israel 
Lang, Who closely matched 
his description. Was Wanted 
by the F B I . 

City police contacted the 
motel in Monroe Where Long 
said he Was staying, but the 
motel said they only had a 
Lerae Lung registered. His 
car and description matched 
that of Long. 

The F B I Was contacted. 
Went to the motel and found 
that Lung and Long were in 
fact the same Israel Lang 
Wanted by their agency. 

Under investigation by city 
police is a break-in of an 
apartment at 957 Novi Road. 
According to reports, the door 
(rf the apartment Was kicked 
i n sometime late Saturday. 
Noth ing Was repor ted 
missing. 

A 32-year-old Novi man Was 
taken to N o r t h v i l l e S ta te 
Hospital after he attempted to 
commit suicide Sunday night 
in the city j a i l . 

According to police, the 
man phoned his Wife, told her 
of his intentions, and she 
called police back. Pol ice 
found he had sli t his Wrist. 
F i v e stitches Were required to 
close the cut. 

Police recovered a stolen 
car at 2:44 a.m. Monday on 
West Ma in Street near Center. 
The car had been reported 

stolen September 5 f rom 
Dearborn. 

C O U R T N E W S 
A Detroit woman, Irene P . 

Herron, changed her plea to 
guilty on a charge of driving 
With a suspended license and 
Was fined $54. She also Was 

. sentenced to threedaysin j a i l 
With credit given . f o r t ime 
already served. 

Arrested by city police i n 
March , she appeared in 35th 
District Court for tr ial Sep­
tember 5. 

Daniel B . Es le r of F a r ­
mington pled guilty to an 
added count of d r i v i n g 
Without a license and Was 
fined $39. Es le r was arrested 
June 29 on a charge of driving 
With a suspended license, a 
charge Which Was disnlissed 
after he pled guilty to the 
added count. 

TWO persons t icketed 
fol loWing in jury accidents 
pled guilty to the charges and 
Were each fined $39. 

They are Peter Pletsch of 
21101 Cambridge Drive, Novi , 
ticketed August 20 for failing 
to stop i n assured c l e a r 
distance and Frank A . Wilson 
of Westland, ticketed August 
25 for faUing to yield at an 
intersection. 

In d i s t r i c t cou r t August 29, 
Nehemiah Glenns of Ypsi lant i 
pled guilty to failing to stop i n 
assured clear distance and 
Was fined $39. 

He Was ticketed August 16 
following an accident 

I n N o v i 

F o u r b reak ing and en-
terings of p r iva te N o v i 
residences occurred during 
the past two weeks. 

Items valued at $670 Were 

reportedly removed from the 
Sparks residence at 26470 
Novi Road during a breaking 
and entering Which occurred 
betWeen 12 noon and 10:30 
p.m. August 29. 

Stolen Were three diamond 
rings, a men's Watch, a 
portable television set, 25 
record albums and a gray tool 
box filled With ndscellaneous 
tools. 

A breaking and entering of 
the Cifaldi residence at 39515 
Burton netted theives ap­
proximately $800 Worth of 
goods. 

Among the missing items 
are a shotgun, portable color 
television, diamond ring, and 
$100 in cash. The theft oc­
cu r r ed somet ime betWeen 
6:30 p.m. September 9 and 
9:50 a.m. the following day, 
according to police. 

A 12 foot rubber boat, a 
radio, a quant i ty of 
cigarettes, and three cans of 
beer Were taken from the 
Luciano residence at 2500 
ShaWood Augus t 30. A l s o 
taken Was a carved chess set. 

Value of the stolen articles 
Was estimated at $300. 

The theft occur red 
sometime betWeen 9 a.m. 
August 30 and 6 p.m. that 
same evening. 

V'alue of items stolen from the 
Leonard Broquet residence at 
42100 Eight Mi le sometime 
August 10 has not yet been 
determined and is waiting a 
full accounting of the stolen 
items, police reported. 

Among the stolen goods are 
a color television, a black and 
White television, four shot 
guns, and a fur coat. 

Charges of driving With 
ability impaired Were brought 
against 44-year o ld J e a n 
Lorraine Chester of Walled 
Lake. 

The larceny of tools from a 
Well-digging truck owned by 
the J o h n Rober ts Wel l s 
Company was reported to 
police last week. 

The tools were taken from a 
locked tool box on the rear of 
the truck. The lock to the 
compartment had been pried 
open, police reported. 

The truck was located at a 
home under construction on 11 
Mi le Road when the theft 
occurred. Value of the tools 
Was estimated at $500. 

I n W i x o m 

A quantity of drugs Was 
stolen f rom the W i x o m 
M e d i c a l C l i n i c dur ing a 
breaking and entering last 
week. 

While on routine patrol 
Sunday, September 10 at 11:30 
p.m., officers noted that the 
clinic's front window was 
broken. Inves t iga t ion 
revealed that a cement block 
had been used to break the 
window and that the building 
had then been entered. 

With the aid of Dr . Arnold 
Kelz, owner of the clinic, 
police were able to determine 
the type of quantity of drugs 
which were taken. Value of 
the stolen goods was 
estimated at $500. 

It Was the second time that 
drugs have been stolen from 
the Wixom Clinic in the past 
two months. 

TWO breaking and enterings 
at the F i n n C a m p Were 
discovered September 8. 

Gary Noon, a Hazel P a r k 
man, told police that tWo 
cabins at the camp had been 
burglarized. A 22 caliber 
pellet gun and an air operated 
pump had been taken from 
one bu i ld ing . While a 
Panasonic television and an 
eight-track stero tape deck 
was taken from another. 

Officers feel the thefts were 
commi t t ed between 1:30-5 
p.m. Fr iday , September 8. 

TWO Detroit youths Were 
a r res ted on charges of 
possession of m a r i h u a n a 
September 8. 

Arrested Were Robert John 
Woodford, 18, and Gerald 
Marty Stark, 17. 

The arrests Were made 
after police questioned the 
pair While they Were at­
tempting to hitch hike on the 
east bound 1-96 entrance 
ramp. 

The tWo men told officers 
their car had broken down at 
the comer of Grand R i v e r and 
Beck Road and they were 
attempting to get back to 
Detroit. 

A police car was dispatched 
to the site and the car Was 
located by officers. While 
looking inside the vehicle of­
ficers noted some narcotics 
paraphernalia lying on the 
front f loor. F u r t h e r in-
vestigation uncovered a 
quantity of suspected nar-
cotics Which Were sub-
sequently determined to be 
marihuana. 

The youths Were tran-
sported to the Oakland County 
J a i l Where they were booked 
and released on $100 personal 
bond. 

Police are investigating the 
possibility of arson in con-
junction with a fire at the 
H o l l o W a y C o n s t r u c t i o n 
Company Sunday, September 
3. 

The owner of the company 
reported that it appeared as if 
a fire had been set on a tractor 
and trailer parked among 
other equipment i n the 
storage yard. 

The fire was extinguished 
by company employees. 

A 1969 pickup truck stolen 
from D e s i g n Degree on 
Wixom Road sometime before 
September 5 Was recovered 
by Milford Pol ice last Week. 

The truck, according to 
reports. Was found in a ditch 
on Old Plank Road near the 

Grand Trunk railroad tracks. 
The motor and radiator were 
missing and the vehicle had 
been set on fire With fuel oil . 

The truck's interior was 
destr<)yed, police reported. 

O l l i e J a m e s Cundiff , a 
Wal led L a k e man . Was 
arrested on charges of dr iving 
under the influence of liquor 
F r i d a y , September 8, at 
approximately 9 p.m. 

A pair of license plates, 
reportedly stolen f rom a 
Wayne man F r i d a y , Sep­
tember 8, Were turned into 
police by a Wixom resident 
the folloWing morning. 

Michael Shea, of Wayne told 
police the license plates Were 
stolen from his car While it 
Was parked at the Continental 
B a r from 1-1:25 a.m. F r iday . 

At 11 a.m. Saturday, the 
plates Were brought to the 
Wixom police station by a 
man Who said he had found 
them in the back of a truck he 
Was using. 

I n T o w n s h i p 

Township and state police 
had their hands full Sunday as 
about 40 people ignored "no 
t r e spass ing" signs at 
Maybury. 

According to police, many 
parents were also stopped for 
t respass ing along w i t h 
teenagers. One woman told 
police she had been a patient 
at the sanatorium several 
years ago. 

Many of the youths began 
harass ing the officers as 
police attempted to clear the 
area. No arrests were made. 

Under investigation is the 
theft of a vehicle from a gas. 
station at Seven M i l e and 
Beck roads. The 1962 
Volkswagon bus was reported 
stolen last Week. It had been 
parked at the station to be 
sold, oWners told police. 

C O U R T N E W S 
Robert T. Bockelman of 

Livonia, ticketed August 3 for 
failing to yield the right of 
Way causing an accident. Was 
fined $39 

Bockelman, Who pled guilty 
to the charge, appeared in 
35th D i s t r i c t Cour t las t 
Thursday. 
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Clearly, these are the most magnificent Cadillacs ever 
built. N o t of11y for What you can see—the bold new ex­
teriors and the plush new lnteriors--but as much for what 
you can't sec. 

Y o u see here the new Sedan deVil le , Eldorado Coupe 
and Eldorado ConVertible. Y o u don't see the six other 
new Cadillacs (more models than a l l other U . S . luxury 
cars haVe combined). 

Y o u see here the striking new styling outside—even more 

elegant for '73. Y o u don't see the hundreds of innovations 
and refinements inside. T o add new comfort and conve-
nience. 

A n d you don't see the many new niceties you may add. 
L i k e a lighted vanity mirror. A theft-deterrent system and 
steel-belted radial tires. 

Clearly, you never had so many good reasons to visit 
your authorized Cadillac dealer. Cadil lac M o t o r C a r D i v l -
sion. T h e leadership shows. 

Drinking drivers proved to 
be in abundance last Week as 
police made seven arrests on 
charges of driving under the 
influence of liquor. 

Arrested Were Raymond 
Joseph Geis inger , 55, of 
De t ro i t ; W i l l i a m F r a n k 
Cometto, J u n i o r , of F a r ­
mington; F r a n k B e r n a r d 
Landowski, 46, of Ypsi lant i ; 
W. K . Coffman of Taylor; 
Joseph IvanCrotehrs,, 49, of 
Walled Lake ; Wil l iam George 
Walker, 48, of Detroit; and 
Dan Adolph Siemenski, 19, of 
Inkster. 

FIRST PRESS YTERIAN 

CHURCH 

200 E. Main- Northville 

349-0911 

Classes for all ages 
at 9:30 and 11:00 

every Sunday. 

W o r s h i p at 9:30 and 11:00. 

C h o i r s for everyone. 

Y o u t h programs Sunday 

evening. Call us for infor­

mation. Stop in and get 

acquainted. 

Rev. Lloyd G. Erasure, 

Pastor 

Rev. Richard J. Henderson, 

Assistant Pastor 

O F F O N A L L N U R S E R Y 

C L E A R A N C E S A L E 

5 0 % 

C R I M S O N K I N G M A P L E S 
R E G . $23.88 8' to W 

N O W I V ^ 

L A - R G E V A R I E T Y O F 

F L O W E R I N G T R E E S A N D 

S H R U B S N O W A T F A N T A S T I C 

S A V I N G S - F I R S T C O M E . 

F I R S T S E R V E D 

C L U M P B I R C H 

6 ' t o 8 ' 

R E G . $18.15 " A n n 

N O W 9 

P E A T M O S S 4 c u . f t . B a l e 

M I A M I 

P A T I O S T O N E 

R E G . N O W 

1 6 X 1 6 9 9 ' I V 

1 6 R O U N D 9 9 * 7 7 * 

m X 2 2 H 99*^ 7 7 * 

2 2 % X 2 2 % 1 .99 

1 6 x 3 2 2 . 0 9 

2 4 " R O U N D 2 . 0 9 
$ ] 8 5 

A L L 5.T0NE S T E E L R E I N F O R C E D 

R E D - W O O D W E A V E F E N C I N G 

A L L R O S E S 

T I M B E R L A I V E 

4 2 7 8 0 W . I O M I L E R O A D - N O V I 

O P E N 7 D A Y S A W E E K 

P H O N E 3 4 9 - 2 3 0 0 

N O W 

L U M B E R 

i _ l O M t t E B 

H A V E T H E 
C U S T O M L O O K W I T H 

E A S Y - T O - E R E C T P R E - F A B 
S E C T I O N S O F H A N D S O M E 

C A L I F O R N I A R E D W O O D F E N C E 
P R I C E S 4 F T . 6 F T . 

P e r P a i l e l 1 1 . 9 5 1 3 . 9 5 
( A l l Panels 8 f t . long) 

ROAD 
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J o s e p h D a g h e r 

T e a c h e r W r i t e s B o o k 

A D I N T H E M A K I N G — N o r t h V i l l e m o t o r i s t s d i d a d o u b l e t a k e 
t h i s p a s t w e e k u p o n s e e i n g a n a r m y o f p e o p l e l i n e d u p i n f r o n t o f 
a M a i n S t r e e t h o u s e , o p p o s i t e t h e J u n i o r H i g h a n n e x , w a i t i n g 
f o r p h o t o g r a p h e r s to s t a r t s h o o t i n g . I t w a s a i l p a r t of a n a d ­
v e r t i s e m e n t i n the m a k i n g b y t h e C a m p b e l l - E w a l d a g e n c y f o r 
t h e U n i t e d F o u n d a t i o n . C o n t r a c t e d to h a n d l e t h e p h o t o g r a p h i c 
l a y o u t f o r t h e a d v e r t i s e m e n t s l a t e d f o r w i d e d i s t r i b u t i o n w a s 
the B o u l e v a r d P h o t o g r a p h i c C o r p o r a t i o n o f D e t r o i t . A p a r t n e r 

i n t h e c o r p o r a t i o n i s J o h n W i s n e r o f N o r t h v i l l e , w h o o f t e n p i c k s 
a N o r t h v i l l e s e t t i n g f o r h i s f i r m ' s w o r k . S o w h i l e B o u l e v a r d ' s 
p h o t o g r a p h e r a n d a r t d i r e c t o r . G l e n D a l e y a n d A r t O b r o s e y , 
sho t p i c t u r e s o f t h e p r o f e s s i o n a l m o d e l s a n d v o l u n t e e r r e s i d e n t s 
of N o r t h V i l l e , T h e R e c o r d ' s p h o t o g r a p h e r , J i m G a l b r a i t h , s h o t 
t h i s p i c t u r e o f t h e p i c t u r e t a k i n g . T h e m e o f t h e a d v e r t i s e m e n t i s , 
i t is be t t e r to g i v e o n c e to t h e U - F t h a n to e a c h of t h e n u m e r o u s 

o r g a n i z a t i o n s w h i c h b e n e f i t f r o m t h e a n n u a l U - F c a m p a i g n . 

C o l l e g e H o s t s R a l p h N a d e r 

: wi th Ralph Nader, the Don 
: E l l i s Orches t ra , B a r b a r a 
: Seaman, and J e r e m i a h 

Collins scheduled to appear in 
that order, the fall celebrity 

J^'Yenes at Schoolcraft College 
} offers interesting and exciting 
I fare for a Variety of en-
l tertainment tastes. 
I Firs t up on September 21, 
• Nader Will take a look at party 

platforms for the upcoming 
pres ident ia l election, and 
what they hold for consumers. 
He is speaking at 8 p.m. in 

Schoolcraf t ' s ma in gym­
nasium. 

This wi l l be Nader's second 
*• v is i t to the Schoolcraft 

Campus. His assignment is 
more specific than when he 
first spoke here two years 
ago. Then he discussed how 
the .American consumer was 
being shortchanged in 
general. This time he wi l l 
direct his remarks to the 1972 
presidential party platforms, 
and what they hold for con­
sumers. 

L e g a l 

N o t i c e s 

STATIiOKMlCHlGA.V 
PROBATE COURT 

I--ORTHE 
COUNTY OK WAYNE 

031.137 
ESTATE OK RUTH ANN NILES. 
deceased. 
IT IS ORDERED that on September 26, 
1972 at 10 a.m.. in the Proliate Court 
room. 1211 Detroit. Michigan, a hearing 
be held on the petition of Raymond F. 
Heynian for probate of a purported wiii.. 
and for granting of administration with 
the wiii annexed to Catherine Pope, or 
some ether suitable person: 
Publication and service shaii be made 
as provided by statute and Court ruie. 
Dated AugiBt 24. 1972 

KRANKS.SZYMANSKI 
Judge of Probate 

liaymond P Heyman 
Atlomey (or petitioner 
24202 Grand River Avenue 
Detroit. Michigan 48219 
A True Copy 
Herman McKinney 
Deputy Probate Register 
9-7 14-21. 72 

STATE OK MICHIGAN 
PROBATECOURT 

KORTHE 
COUNTY OF WAYNE 

613.536 
ESTATE OK ELLEN RUSSELL, 
deceased. 
IT is ORDERED that on September 25. 
1972. at 10 a.m.. in the Probate Court 
room. 1301 Detroit. Michigan, a hearing 
heid before JUDGE ERNEST C. 
BOEHM. JUDGEOK PROBATE on the 
petition of James Russeii. ad­
ministrator with wiii annexed of said 
estate, and on behaif of Sarah C. 
Muston. iate executrix of said estate, 
for aiiowance of his first and finai 
account as administrator with will 
annexed and on behaif of Sarah C. 
.Muston. for fees, and for assignment of-
residue: 
Publication and service shaii be made 
as provided by statute and Court ruie. 
Dated Augtut 16. 1972 

JOSEPH J. PERNICK 
Judge of Probate 

Joseph A. Pettit 
Attorney for estate 
18451 Joy Road 
Detroit. Michigan 48223 
A True Copy 
Herman McKinney 
Deputy Probate Register 
8-31- 9-?. 9-14 

Nader is p robably 
.America's most famous, and 
most effectiVe critic. His 
documented c r i t i c i s m s of 
goVernment and industry 
have had Wide-spread 
repercussions on pub l i c 
awareness and bureaucratic 
power. According to Time 
Magazine , he is " U . S . ' s 
toughest customer". 

Nader is 38. He graduated 
magna c u m laude f rom 
Pr ince ton U n i v e r s i t y and 
received his law degree from 
Harvard University in 1958. 
He first made headlines in 
1965 With his book Unsafe at 
Any Speed , a scathing in­
dictment of the automobile 
industry for producing under-
safe vehicles. 

The NeW York Times said of 
him, "What sets Nader apart 
is that he has moved beyond 
social cr i t ic ism to effectiVe 
political action." 

Hear ing Ra lph N a d e r 
lecture is an experience unto 
itself. Not just due to his 
oratory prof ic iency, but 
owing more to his obvious 
sincerity, the listener cannot 
help but be impressed by his 
facts and figures, motivated 
by his ideals. 

On October 7, the series 
shifts to Clarenceville's Sch­
midt Auditorium where the 
popular Don El l i s Orchestra 
wil l perform at 7:30 p.m. A 
second show has tentatively 
been set for 10:30 if ticket 
demands warrant. 

Women's Rights wil l be in 
the spotlight on October 24 
when B a r b a r a Seaman, 
author of Free and Female, 
visits the campus. Her earlier 
book. The Doctor ' s Case 
Against the P i l l , alerted the 
naUon to the dangers of the 

contraceptive pi l l . She wi l l 
speak in the W a t e r m a n 
Campus Center at 8 p.m. 

" J F K " , a crit ically ac­
claimed dramatic portrait of 
John F . Kennedy, Will be 
presented in Garden City on 
Novembers. A n original, one-
man d rama s t a r r i ng 
J e r e m i a h Col l ins , it is 
scheduled for an 8 p . m . 

curtain in the O'Leary Per­
forming Arts Center. 

The ce lebr i ty series is 
sponsored by Schoolcraft's 
Cultural and Publ ic Affairs 
Commi t tee . Gene ra l ad­
mission tickets range from $2 
- $3.50 for the var ious 
presentations, and are on sale 
i n the A d m i n i s t r a t i o n 
Building on campus. They 

may also be ordered by mai l 
and, when available. Will be 
sold at the door for each 
performance. 

Adver t i sements p r io r to 
each scheduled performance 
WUl have full price and ticket 
ordering details. F o r general 
information, call the com­
munity serVices office at 591-
6400. 

A Schoolcraft College in­
structor Who didn't speak the 
language until he Was nine 
years old, has added a neW 
dimension in his mastery of 
English with the publication 
of his first textbook on the 
subject. 

Joseph Dagher , E n g l i s h 
instructor at Schoolcraft since 
1967, is the author of Knowing 
•Why' Makes Writ ing Easier , 
just released by Kendall-Hunt 
Pub l i sh ing Company of 
Dubuque, Iowa. 

Its 450 pages haVe been 
designed as a practical book 
aimed at teaching practical 
writing. According to author 
Dagher, "Its objectiVe is to 
teach students how to write 
the k i n d of Wr i t i ng that 
everyone might be expected 
to Write at one time or 
another." 

The text has been Written 
for college freshmen, and 
includes manual or Workbook 
exercises as Well as textbook 
material. 

Dagher is very enthusiastic 
about his Work Which shifts 
traditional concern from the 
"hoW and what" of writing to 
the " w h y " for Writing. " M y 
concern is With the Writing 
students Will be expected to do 
when they get outof college," 
he said. 

Dagher admits that his 
early years tended to make 
him an unlikely candidate for 
being the first textbook author 
on the Schoolcraft faculty. He 
was bom to Lebanese parents 
in a Cleveland suburb, and the 
fami ly spoke A r a b i c ex­
clusively until Dagher Was 
nine ' years old. Once he 
became f a m i l i a r With 
English, howeVer, he found it 
a fascinating subject, and it 
has been his major interest 
both as a student and as a 
teacher. 

Dagher bel ieves that 
English cannot be taught by 
using master w r i t e r s as 
models to be imitated by 
students. Ra the r , t y p i c a l 
freshmen compositions are 
used as models of Writing in 
his text, and it contains efforts 
of many of his students at 
Schoolcraft College, by name. 

A graduate of Kent State 
UniVersity with a bachelor's 
and master ' s degree in 
English, Dagher has com­
pleted the r equ i red c lass 
hours toWard a doctorate at 

B o a r d R a t i f i e s 

I n t e r i m P a c t 

School board members 
ratified an interim agreement 
With the NorthVille Education 
Associa t ion coVer ing con­
ditions of employment for 
teachers. 

The action Was taken by the 
board in spec ia l session 
Friday night 

The agreement to Work 
under last year's contract 
may be terminated by either 
the teachers or school board 
with 24-hour notice. 

Meanwhile, both sides are 
awaiting the appointment of a 
factfinder, as requested by 
the N E A . 

Under the i n t e r im 
agreement, teachers wi l l be 
paid at the 1971-72 negotiated 
sa lary schedule, not that 

resulting from the freeze, 
wi th beginning teachers 
receiving the sala iy from the 
1970-71 contract. 

B i n d i n g a rb i t r a t ion on 
grievances has been removed 
from the interim agreement, 
making the superintendent's 
decision on grievances final 
until a new contract is settled. 
However, a grievance may be 
ca r r i ed before the school 
board once a settlement is 
reached, board members 
noted. 

The interim agreement was 
approved by a 5-0 vote of the 
board. Trustee Glenn Deibert 
was absent. 

N O R T H V I L L E 

L o d g e N o . 1 8 6 

F & A l i / I 
REGULAR IvlEETING 
SECOND fVIONDAY 

Herman A. Wedemeyer. W.IVI. 
349-0149 

Lawrence M. (Vliller, Sec'y 
EL 7-0450 

H A L L F O R 

R E N T 
N O R T H ­

V I U E 

P l i o n e 

3 4 9 - 5 3 5 0 

o f 

4 5 3 - 5 8 2 0 

N O T I C E 

O F 

P U B L I C H E A R I N G 

Sa l em T o w n s h i p B o a r d of A p p e a l s vifiil meet a t the 
Sa l em T o w n s h i p H a l l at 8 p . m . F r i d a y , Sep tember 
22,1972, to hear the request of the fo l lowing : 

A request by Robe r t E . Osborn for the con­
s t ruc t ion and opera t ion of a golf f ac i l i t y at 10943 J o y 
R d . ( Ingal l f a r m ) d e s c r i b e d as being par t of E V j of 
the SWV4 sec t ion 36 T l S - R 7 E . 

A request by A c c u r a t e Tool & M a c h i n e Corp . 
{ F r a n k A . C r a w f o r d , Pres ident ) to operate a l ight 
manufac tu r ing m a c h i n e shop at 7811 W . Six M i l e 
R d . , be ing pa r t of E V2 of S E Va of sect ion 9 T l S -
R 7 E . 

R. J . Knight 

Secre ta ry B o a r d of A p p e a l 

N O T I C E T O T A X P A Y E R S 

B E G I N N I N G O C T O B E R 1, 1972 A N A D D I T I O N A L P E N A L T Y O F $3.00 W I L L B E 
A D D E D T O E A C H 1970 A N D P R I O R Y E A R S D E L I N Q U E N T T A X T H A T A P ­
P E A R S U N P A I D O N T H E R E C O R D S O F T H E C O U N T Y T R E A S U R E R . 

T H I S A M O U N T IS A D D E D A C C O R D I N G T O T H E P R O V I S I O N S O F S E C T I O N 
211.59 C O M P I L E D L A W S O F M I C H I G A N F O R 1948 T O C O V E R T H E E X P E N S E 
O F S A L E O N T H O S E T A X E S A N D D E S C R I P T I O N S S U B J E C T T O S A L E A T 
T H E N E X T M A Y T A X S A L E . 

I M M E D I A T E P A Y M E N T W I L L S A V E Y O U T H I S A D D I T I O N A L P E N A L T Y 
A N D K E E P Y O U R P R O P E R T Y F R O M A P P E A R I N G IN T H E P U B L I C L I S T O F 
L A N D S T O B E O F F E R E D A T T A X S A L E . 

C e H U G H D O H A N Y 

O A K L A N D C O U N T Y T R E A S U R E R 
1200 N . T E L E G R A P H R O A D 
P O N T I A C , M I C H I G A N 480S3 

C I T Y O F N O V I 

N O T I C E 

O F E N A C T M E N T 

O r d i n a n c e 72-53 

T A K E N O T I C E that on the 5th day of September , 
1972, A . D . , at a R e g u l a r M e e t i n g , the Counc i l of the 
C i ty of N o v i , O a k l a n d County , M i c h i g a n , enacted an 
O r d i n a n c e to p rov ide regula t ions for sur face and 
g round d ra inage , s u m p pump d i scha rge and 
bu i ld ing or house downspouts , w i t h i n the C i t y of 
N o v i a n d to p rov ide penal t ies for v io la t ion thereof. 

The p rov i s ions of this Ord inance a re he reby 
dec la red to be i m m e d i a t e l y necessary for the 
p rese rva t ion of pub l i c peace, heal th and safety, a n d 
are hereby o rde red to t ake effect i m m e d i a t e l y upon 
publ ica t ion thereof in m a n n e r p resc r ibed by the 
C i ty C h a r t e r . 

Joseph C r u p i , AAayor 

M a b e l A s h , C l e r k 
Pub . 9-13-72 

Ohio State University. He has 
also done graduate work at 
the University of Michigan in 
Middle Eastern studies and 
has taught Middle Eastern 
His tory at Wit tenberg 
University. 

Before coming to 
Schoolcraft, Dagher taught at 
Toledo DeVilviss High School, 

at Toledo University and at 
Bowling Green University. He 
served four years in Europe 
as a captain in the U.S. A r m y . 

Dagher believes that there 
is a relationship between t-' 
language and earn ing t 
dollar. To demonstrate, he is 
the president of J . A . F . S . Inc., 
operators of Freddies Drive 
In Restaurant in Bucyrus, 
Ohio, and the Motel Lido in 
Toledo. 

A m o n g the 
acknowledgements for his 
text, Dagher extends grateful 
thanks to Larry Ordowski, 
Schoolcraf t ' s d i r ec to r of 
liberal arts, and to David 
Perkins, a fellow Engl ish 
teacher at the College who 
offered suggestions and 
assisted in read ing the 
manuscript. 

The book is dedicated to 
Dagher's wife, Jeanne, who, 
formerly taught in the Novi 
schools, and to his daughters, 
Jeanice and L a u r i , both 
English majors in college. 
The Daghers live at 18234 
Jamestown, Northville. 

T h e a t r e 
Plymoutn. MIcititn 
NOW SHOWING 

J O S E P H D A G H E R 

P & A T H E A T R E 
Northville 349-0210 

A l l Eves-Color-7 8i9 (PG) 
" T h e L a s t o f T h e 
R e d H o t L o v e r s " 

Alan Arkin 

IVIaL Sat 8t Sun. 3-5 Color (G) 
" C l a m B a k e " 

Elvis Presley 

Starts Wed. Sept. 20 
" W h a t ' s U p D o c " 

Ryan Barbra 
O'Neal Streisand 

TECHNICOLOR® • From Warner Bros.. 
A Warner Communcalrons Company 

Nightly Showings: 
7:00 and 9:00 
Sat & Sun Showings: 
3 - 5 - 7 - 9 

. N O T I C E 

O F I N T E N T 

T O 

I S S U E B O N D S 

P L E A S E T A K E N O T I C E that the C i t y Counc i l of 
the C i ty of N o v i , County of O a k l a n d , M i c h i g a n in-
tends to adopt a resolut ion au thor iz ing the issuance 
of spec ia l assessment bonds of the C i t y , in a n 
amount not exceed ing One H u n d r e d F i f t y Thousand 
($150,000.00) Do l l a r s , for the purpose of def ray ing 
the spec ia l assessment d i s t r i c t ' s sha re of the cost in 
connect ion w i t h ce r t a in street i m p r o v e m e n t s in the 
C i t y . 

Sa id spec ia l assessment bonds, in addi t ion to 
spec ia l assessments , sha l l pledge the fu l l fa i th a n d 
c red i t of the C i t y of N o v i . 

T H I S N O T I C E is g iven pursuant to the 
r equ i r emen t s of Section 5(g) of A c t 279, P u b l i c A c t s 
of M i c h i g a n , 1909, as a m e n d e d . 

AAabel A s h 

C i t y C l e r k 

9-14-72 

N O T I C E O F I N T E N T 

T O I S S U E B O N D S 

T A K E N O T I C E that the Ci ty Counc i l of the C i t y of 
N o v i , intends to adopt a resolut ion au thor iz ing the 
issuance and sa le of M o t o r V e h i c l e H i g h w a y F u n d 

Bonds of the C i t y , pursuant to A c t 175, P u b l i c A c t s of 
M i c h i g a n , 1952, as a m e n d e d , in an a m o u n t not 
exceeding T h r e e Hundred Thousand ($300,000.00) 
Do l l a r s , for the purpose of de f ray ing par t of the cost 
of a c q u i r i n g and cons t ruc t ing street i m p r o v e m e n t s 
in the C i ty of N o v i . 

Sa id bonds sha l l be payab le p r i m a r i l y f rom 
moneys r e c e i v e d by the C i t y f r om the M o t o r 
V e h i c l e H i g h w a y F u n d and sha l l also pledge the ful l 
fai th and c r ed i t of the C i t y of N o v i . 

Th i s Not ice is g iven pursuant to Sect ion 5(g) , A c t 
279 P u b l i c A c t s of M i c h i g a n , 1909, as amended . 

9-14-72 
M a b e l A s h 

C i t y C l e r k 

T h u r s d a y , S e p t e m b e r 1 4 , 1 9 7 2 T H E N O R T H V I L L E R E C O R D - N O V I N E W S 

O b i t u a r i e s 
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I n N o r t h v i l l e 

C h a r l e s F . C a r r i n g t o n D i e s R e v e n u e H i g h 

Funeral service for a long­
time Nor thv i l l e insurance 
businessman, Char l e s F . 
Carrington, 57, was conducted 
Saturday from the Casterline 
Funeral Home here. 

Officiating at the 11 a.m. 
se rv ice was M r . Carson 
Coonce. 

Mr . Carrington, who suf­
fered c r i pp l i ng i l lness in 
recent years, died suddenly 
Wednesday, September 6, at 
St. Mary Hospital. 

He lived at 145 East Ma in 
Street. 

A past president of the 
Northville Rotary Club, M r . 
Carrington was an insurance 
businessman here for 40 
years. 

His father, the late Thomas 
R a y m o n d C a r r i n g t o n , 
launched the Ca r r ing ton 
Agency in 1919. The agency 
occupied several locations in 

Northville before it moved to 
the present office in the "Nea l 
Bui ld ing" where the Nor­
thville Record office formerly 
Was located at 120 North 
Center Street 

M r . Carrington took over 
management of his father's 
agency in January, 1946. 
Lester BoWden became his 
partner in 1969. 

He was born in Northville 
on June 10, 1915. 

His wife, Oneida, Whom he 
married May 25, 1940, sur­
vives h i m as does his 
mother, Mrs . Rose Wilske 
Carrington. 

He Was a member of Mutual 
Agents Assoc ia t ion , the 
Jehovah's Witnesses, and the 
local Rotary Club (serving as 
president in 1951-52). 

He attended Michigan State 
University and received his 
bachelor of arts degree from 
the University of Michigan. 

Besides his Wife and 
mother, M r . Carrington is ' 
survived by a daughter. Miss 

C H A R L E S C A R R I N G T O N 

Ruth E l l e n C a r r i n g t o n of 
Northville, and a brother, 
Thomas R. Carrington. 

Buria l Was in Rura l H i l l 
Cemetery in NorthVille 

R O N A L D G . A N D E R S O N 

Ronald G. Anderson, 48, son 
of J . Ph i l ip Anderson of 
Nor thv i l l e , d ied suddenly 
September 8 in Lapeer. 

Funeral serVices Were held 
Monday, September 11, at the 
Baird-NeWton Funera l Home 
in Lapeer. 

SurviVing is his Widow, 
Sh i r ley , three ch i ld r en , 
Richard of Clifford, SylVia 
Cobb of Davison, Cynthia 
Lindsey of Lapeer and a 
sister, Jean L . Thremkey of 
Lapeer. 

L U C I L E H A M I L T O N 

Funeral serVices Were held 
Saturday, September 9, for 
Lucile Hamilton of 6350 F iVe 
Mile Road who died Sep­
tember 5 at Huron View 
Lodge in Ann Arbor. She was 
93. 

Born October 16, 1878, in 
Salem, she Was a life long 

resident of the area and a 
member of S a l e m B i b l e 
Church. 

Her husband preceded her 
in death. SurViVing are two 
sons, Curtis and E d w i n M . of 
Salem toWnship, a sister, Mrs . 
Edi th Gale of Ypsilanti , a 
brother, Glen Curtis of Little 
Rock, Arkansas, 16 grand­
ch i ld ren and one great­
grandchild. 

Services Were held at the 
Salem Bible Church Where the 
Reverend Ivan Speight of­
f ic ia ted . B u r i a l Was in 
W o r d e n C e m e t e r y , 
Washtenaw County. Funeral 
arrangements were made by 
Casteriine Funeral Home. 

E D W A R D W E L L S 

E d w a r d Wel l s of 4550 
Napier Road died Thursday, 
September 7, at Veterans 
Hospital in Ann Arbor at the 
age of 79. 

Funeral serVices were held 
Monday, September 11, at the 
Cas te r l ine F u n e r a l Home 
where the ReVerend Leslie 
H a r d i n g of H o l y Cross 
Episcopal Church officiated. 
Bur ia l was in Acac ia Park 
Cemetery, Southfield. 

M r . Wells was born Ju ly 18, 
1893, in Brighton, England, 
the son of M r . and Mrs. 
Thomas WeUs. 

He moVed to the NorthVille-
Plymouth area in 1920 and 
was a retired employee of the 
Cadillac Motor Company. M r . 
Wells Was a member of 
Loyalty Lodge 488 F & A M in 
Detroit, Veterans of Foreign 
Wars, Boy Scouts of America , 
A m e r i c a n L e g i o n Morgon 
M c D e r m o t l in Tuscon, 
A r i z o n a , and St. P a u l ' s 
Cathedral Episcopal Church 
in Detroit. 

SurViVing is a sister, Mrs . 
M . L . Wells in NeW Maiden 
Surrey, England. 

R O V A . S H U S T E R 

Services Were he ld 
Saturday, September 9, for 
Roy A . Shuster of 219 Hutton 
Street who died September 6 
at the age of 67. 

Born June 18, 1905, in 
Kittaning, Pennsylvania, he 
moved to N o r t h v i l l e four 
years ago. He was a retired 
employee of F o r d M o t o r 
Company in Highland Park . 
M r . Shuster Was a lso a 
memberof Eagles Lodge 2504. 

His Wife, Dorothy, preceded 
him in death. SurviVing are 
two daughters, Mrs . Donna 
JeanVirden of Phoen ix , 
Arizona, Mrs . Glenda Busard 
of NorthVille, two sisters, 
Mrs . Gisle Mar t in of Aldince, 
Ohio, Miss Ruth Shuster of 
Sebring, Ohio.seVen grand­
ch i ld ren and two great­
grandchildren. 

Funeral serVices were held 
at the Casteriine Funeral 
Home where the ReVerend 
Guenther C. Branstner of the 
F i r s t Un i t ed Methodis t 
Church officiated. Bur ia l was 
in Grand Lawn Cemetery, 
Detroit. 

ISAAC W A T K I N S 

Funeral serVices were held 
Tuesday, September 12, for 
Isaac Watkins of 43831 Grand 
RiVer who died September 9 
in St. Joseph hospital in 
Pontiac after an illness of 
eight months. He was 66. 

B o r n A p r i l 4, 1906, i n 
Kentucky, he Was the son of 
Green and K i s Watkins. He 
moved to Novi about 25 years 
ago and was employed as a 
grinder for the Ford Motor 
Company. 

Surviving are his widow, 
Surilda, five daughters, M r s . 
J e a n Jones, Judy A l l e n , 
Carr ie Wil l iams, Lena Bush, 
Sue King , two sons, Chester 
and Isaac Jr . , stepchildren 
R e v a Taulbee , B e u l a h 
Lakebold, F a y Cogar, Judy 
Oslin, L i l l i a n Kimbrough, tWo 

sisters, Mrs . E m m a Branson, 
Lauri McQueen, a brother, 
George Watkins, 26 grand­
children and 16 great­
grandchildren. 

Funeral services Were held 
at the Harbin Funeral Home 
in Novi where the Reverend 
Joseph Moore officiated. 
Bur i a l was Wednesday, 
September 13, in the family 
plot in Campton, Kentucky. 

F R E D W E N K E R 
F r e d Wenker of 46066 

Sunset died Saturday, Sep­
tember 9, at P l y m o u t h 
General Hospital in Detroit 
following an illness of two 
years. He Was 76. 

A resident of the area for 
the past 37 years, Mr . Wenker 
was born May 27, 1896, in 
Kettlersville, Ohio, the son of 
W i l l i a m and Ros ina M a y 
Wenker. He was a retired 
employee of the Ford Motor 
Company, member St. Pauls 
Lutheran Church, V F W Post 
4012 and a veteran of Worid 
War I. 
. Surviving are his widow, 

Edith, two daughters, Mrs . 
Nina Mil ler of FoWlerville, 
Mrs. Evy len Bergerson of 
Cassopolis, a son, Frederick 
of Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania, 
a sister, Mrs . Amel ia Howell 
of Ann Arbor, fourgrand-
chi ldren and one great­
grandchild. 

Funeral Services were held 
Tuesday, September 12. at S t 
Pauls Lutheran Church Where 
the Reverend Charles F . 
Boerger, pastor, officiated. 
Burial was in Glen Eden 
Cemetery. Ar rangemen t s 
were made by Casterline 
Funeral Home. 

T e a c h e r s M e e t 

The Alpha Nu Chapter of 
Del ta K a p p a G a m m a , 
h o n o r a r y p r o f e s s i o n a l 
teachers' sorority met Sep­
tember 11 at the Hillside Inn 
for the first time since the 
summer recess. 

Eighty-eight percent of the 
revenue operating Northville 
P u b l i c Schools is ra ised 
locally, according to figures 

recently released along with 
the M i c h i g a n State 
Assessment Test. The 
remaining 12 percent comes 
from state revenue. 

State equalized valuation 
behind each pupil is $23,062, or 
higher than 87 percent of the 
districts in the state. In­
structional expense is $661 per 
student, with total per pupil 
operating expense placed at 
$897. 

Teacher pupil ratio is 22.7 
and the average teacher has 
six years and two months 
experience in the classroom. 
Teachers With masters 
degrees make up 34.3 percent 
of the staff, five percent more 
than last year. 

R a c i a l ethnic minor i t i es 
compose .7 percent of the 
student population and the 
district is in the 99 percentile 
of social-economic status. 

The drop out rate is 2.9 

percent, a decrease from 4.2 
percent the previous year. 

Miss Florence Panattoni, 
curriculum coordiiiator, said 
the lower drop-out rate was 

based in part on new course 
offerings at the high school 
which recognized students 
with interests in occupational 
areas. 

D e n y R e q u e s t 

Continued from NoVi . I 

the tax advantages of a 
multiple complex should 
make us disregard our master 
plan for orderly develop­
ment." 

John Roethel , ac t ing 
planning board chairman in 
the absence of Robert Bretz, 
said he favored the location of 
multiples in the area and 
recommended the master 
plan in the southwest sector of 
the city be reviewed. 

The planning board also 
agreed With a resident Who 
suggested that to allow the 
request would be paramount 
to spot zoning. 

The request drew support 
from Councilmen Denis Berry 

and Edwin Presnell , however. 
Berry took exception to the 

Vilican-Leman argument that 
there was not suff icient 
vehicular accesss to the area. 
P r e s n e l l pointed out the 
existence of i ndus t r i a l 
property within 200 feet of the 
80-acre parcel and suggested 
that the mul t ip l e f a m i l y 
homes might provide a good 
buffer zoning. 

Nevertheless, the council 
followed the recommendation 
of the planning board afld 
rejected the request by a 5-2 
vote. Presnell and Berry cast 
the dissenting ballots. Louie 
Campbe l l , Joseph C r u p i , 
R a y m o n d E v a n s , W i l l i a m 
O'Brien, and Donald Young 
Voted in faVor of denying the 
request. 

E L E C T 

D E M O C R A T 

L A R R Y D . 

V A N D E R M O L E N 

S U P E R V I S O R O F 

N O R T H V I L L E T O W N S H I P 

* P H . D . M i c h i g a n S t a t e U f i i v e r s i t y , M . A . , B . A . Wes te rn IVIichigan U . 
• P o l i t i c a l S c i e n c e Professor - S c h o o l c r a f t Co l l ege s ince 1 9 6 5 . 
• M e m b e r - P i G a m m a M u , T h e N a t i o n a l S o c i a l S c i e n c e H o n o r S o c i e t y 
• P r e c i n c t Delegate , N o r t h v i l l e T o w n s h i p ( A u g u s t , 1970-Present ) 
• M a r r i e d 1 0 Y e a r s . F o u r C h i l d r e n 
• M e m b e r - N a t i o n a l F a c u l t y A s s o c i a t i o n , M E A , N E A . 

(Pd Poi. Adv.) 
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I n c r e a s e C o m f o r t - C u t H e a t i n g C o s t s 

i t ' s a f a c t t h a t i n s u l a t i o n a d d s t o y o u r c o m f o r t a n d s a v e s y o u 

h e a t i n g d o l l a r s . W h e n a h o m e i s n o t p r o p e r l y I n s u l a t e d , 

h e a t e d a i r e s c a p e s t h r o u g h t h e r o o f a n d t h r o u g h t h e w a l l s . 

I n s u l a t i o n a c t s a s a b a r r i e r t o s t o p t h i s h e a t l o s s . It k e e p s 

y o u r h o m e w a r m e r a n d r e d u c e s y o u r f u e l 

c o n s u m p t i o n ( i n m a n y c a s e s a s m u c h a s 

o n e - t h i r d ) . I t ' s e a s y t o i n s t a l l i n s u l a t i o n 

y o u r s e l f , o r h a v e It p n e u m a t i c a l l y 

b l o w n i n . 

C o n s u m e r s P o w e r C o m p a n y 

n e i t h e r s e l l s n o r i n s t a l l s i n s u l a t i o n 

b u t f o r a n u m b e r o f y e a r s h a s 

e n c o u r a g e d i t s c u s t o m e r s t o 

i n v e s t i g a t e t h e b e n e f i t s o f i n s u l a t i n g 

t h e i r h o m e s . 

c o n s u m e r s 

P o w e r 

SeOA-88 
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B y B I L L S L I G E R 

C h a r l e y C a r r i n g t o n d i e d l a s t 
w e e k . 

M a n y p e o p l e m a y no t h a v e b e e n 
a w a r e o f h i s d e a t h a n d S a t u r d a y 
f u n e r a l b e c a u s e C h a r l e y was s t r i cken 
s u d d e n l y W e d n e s d a y a n d w o r d w a s 
n o t p a s s e d a l o n g to t h e n e w s p a p e r 
u n t i l a f t e r p r e s s t i m e . 

N o w a d a y s , t h e r e m a y b e m a n y 
r e s i d e n t s o f r a p i d l y - g r o w i n g a n d 
c h a n g i n g N o r t h v i l l e w h o h a v e n e v e r 
h e a r d of C h a r l e y C a r r i n g t o n . 

B u t w h e n I c a m e to t o w n 16 
y e a r s a g o , C a r r i n g t o n w a s a n a m e 
k n o w n to a l l i n t h e c o m m u n i t y . 

T h o s e w e r e t h e d a y s w h e n T o m 
C a r r i n g t o n , C h a r l e y ' s f a t h e r , w a s 
" M r . R e p u b l i c a n " o f N o r t h v i l l e . 

A n d P o s t m a s t e r L e l a n d 
( S m i t t y ) S m i t h w a s " M r . 
D e m o c r a t " . 

. A n d P e t e E l y w a s t h e n e w l y -
i n c o r p o r a t e d c i t y ' s f i r s t m a y o r . 
J o h n R o b e r t s o n h a d not y e t b e e n 
h i r e d a s t h e c i t y ' s f i r s t m a n a g e r . 

M o l l i e L a w r e n c e w a s N o r t h v i l l e 
t o w n s h i p s u p e r v i s o r . Y o u h a d to b e 
q u i c k a n d a t t e n t i v e to c o v e r h e r 
m e e t i n g s . S h e s p o k e s o f t l y a n d 
a d j o u r n e d s w i f t l y . 

R o y T e r r i l l w a s t o w n s h i p 
t r e a s u r e r . H e a l w a y s h a d a s y m ­
p a t h e t i c w o r d f o r t a x p a y e r s a s h e 
m a d e c o l l e c t i o n s a t a t a b l e i n t h e 
b a n k l o b b y . 

M i k e A l l e n , n o w l o n g t i m e 
m a y o r , w a s a c i t y c o u n c i l m a n . 

J o e D e n t o n w a s p o l i c e c h i e f . 
A n d h e w a s f i n d i n g i t i n c r e a s i n g l y 
d i f f i c u l t to w a l k u p a n d d o w n tiie 
s t a i r s to h i s s e c o n d - f l o o r o f f i c e s i n 
the b e a u t i f u l , b i g o l d w h i t e h o u s e 
t h a t w a s t h e n c i t y h a l l . B a d k n e e s 
f i n a l l y f o r c e d h i s r e t i r e m e n t , b u t 
h e ' d s w e a r b y t h e t r e a t m e n t s h e ' d 
ge t f r o m D r . L . W . S n o w . " B y g o l l y , 
B i l l , I ' m f e e l i n g b e t t e r " , h e ' d a l w a y s 
s a y . 

B u d H a r t n e r w a s o n t h e j o b i n 
those d a y s , j u s t a s h e i s t o d a y a s 
D P W d i r e c t o r a n d n o w f i r e c h i e f , 
too . 

O u t i n N o v i , w h i c h s e e m e d m u c h 
c l o s e r to N o r t h v i l l e i n t hose d a y s , 
F r a z e r S t a m a n w a s t h e p o w e r a s 
s u p e r v i s o r . L e e B e G o l e w a s 
e v e r y t h i n g i n t h e p u b l i c s a f e t y 
d e p a r t m e n t o f N o v i , j u s t a s h e i s 
t o d a y . ( A n d , i r o n i c a l l y , J o h n n y 
J o h n s o n w a s a N o v i n e w c o m e r i n 
t hose d a y s . H i s o b i t u a r y a p p e a r s i n 
t h i s e d i t i o n ) . 

T h e " m o v e r s " o f M a i n s t r e e t i n 
those d a y s w e r e R o y S t o n e , N . C . 

R e a d e r s S p e a k 

S c h r a d e r , E s s i e N i r i d e r , t h e 
C a r r i n g t o n s , H a r o l d B l o o m , L e v i 
E a t o n , G e o r g e Q a r k , S m i t t y , F r e d 
K e s t e r , F r e d C a s t e r l i n e , C h u c k 
A l t m a n , t h e F r e y d l s — N e l l i e , 
V e l m a , C h a r l e s , S r . a n d J r . , B e t h 
a n d C h u c k L a p h a m , t h e G u n s e l l s , 
t h e M a i n v i l l e s , H a r r y . H i m m e l s t e i b , 
K e n R a t h b u r n , G e o r g e M i l l e r , L i l a 
C o l l i n s , B r u c e T u r n b u l l , C a r l 
J o h n s o n , M o n t e E l l i s , H a r r y S e d a n , 
O r s o n A t c h i n s o n , C a l C r o s s , C h u c k 
a n d I v a n E l y , A . R . C l a r k e , t h e 
S p a g n u o l o s , t h e R i t c h i e s , O t i s 
T e w k s b u r y , A n g l e G a d i o l i , H o w a r d 
a n d A g n e s M i t c h e l l , E d B a r n e s a n d 
m a n y o t h e r s . 

T h e p o l i t i c a l a c t i v i s t s w e r e J o h n 
C a n t e r b u r y , E a r l R e e d , D r . S n o w , 
P e t e E l y , M i k e A l l e n , A l e x 
L a w r e n c e , B e a C a r l s o n , D . J . S t a r k 
a n d R i t a N o r t h u p . 

A n d t h e s c h o o l s w e r e r u n b y 
R u s s e l l A m e r m a n w i t h a s s i s t a n t s 
l i k e E l r o y E l l i s o n , H a r r y S m i t h , 
D n ' i c K a y a n d K e n M c L e o d . T h e 
s c h o o l b o a r d h a d s u c h n a m e s a s N . 
C . S c h r a d e r , B o b S h a f e r , E u r a l 
Q a r k a n d B o b C o o l m a n . 

S t a n J o h n s t o n w a s c o a c h i n g 
b a s k e t b a l l a n d R o n S c h i p p e r w a s t h e 
f o o t b a l l c o a c h . 

A n d w h e n y o u m e n t i o n e d N o r t h ­
v i l l e , s o m e o n e w o u l d a l w a y s a s k i f 
y o u k n e w O r l o O w e n , J o h n C a r l o , 
C o n L a n g f i e l d , D r . H o l c o m b , D r . 
A t c h i s o n , E d Y e r k e s , D o n Y e r k e s , 
E d B o g a r t , G l e n n C u m m i n g s , 
L o u e s e C a n s f i e l d , C l i f f H i l l , S m i t t y 
o r D r . S n o w . 

A n d , o f c o u r s e , t h e C a r r i n g t o n s . 

L i k e h i s f a t h e r , C h a r l e y w a s 
a c t i v e i n l o c a l o r g a n i z a t i o n s , 
e s p e c i a l l y t h e M a s o n s a n d R o t a r y 
Q u b . 

B u t h e w a s l e s s f l a m b o y a n t 
t h a n T o m . H e w a s t h e s i l e n t p a r t n e r 
i n t h e s u c c e s s f u l i n s u r a n c e b u s i n e s s . 
H e ' d r e a l l y r a t h e r f i s h t h a n a t t e n d 
t h e s t a t e R e p u b l i c a n c o n v e n t i o n . 

A n d , s a d l y , C h a r l e y w a s 
p l a g u e d b y p o o r h e a l t h i n h i s l a t e r 
y e a r s . S t i l l a y o u n g m a n , y o u m a y 
h a v e s e e n h i m w a l k i n g d o w n t h e 
M a i n s t r e e t h e k n e w so w e l l , 
c a r r y i n g a w h i t e c a n e o r a s s i s t e d b y 
o n e o f h i s c l o s e f r i e n d s , l i k e L e s 
B o w d e n o r C a r l J o h n s o n . 

N o r t h v i l l e i s c h a n g i n g . S o m e o f 
t h e o l d n a m e s a r e n o t a s f a m i l i a r a s 
t h e y o n c e w e r e . 

B u t t h e y s h o u l d n ' t b e f o r g o t t e n . 

F o r r e a l l y , t h e y ' r e the o n e s 
r e s p o n s i b l e f o r m a k i n g i t t h e k i n d o f 
c o m m u n i t y t h a t h a s a t t r a c t e d s o 
m a n y o f u s n e w c o m e r s . 

S p e a k i n g f o r M y s e l f 

F l u o r i d a t i o n ? 

DR. HARRY DAVIS 

G O O D . . . 

C o n t r o l o f a n y h u m a n d i s e a s e i s b e s t e f f e c t e d w h e n t h e 
d i s e a s e i s p r e v e n t e d r a t h e r t h a n c u r e d , r e g a r d l e s s o f h o w 
e f f e c t i v e t h e c i I r e m a y b e ; the p r e v e n t i o n o f p o l i o b y S a l k 
V a c c i n e i s t h e m o s t d r a m a t i c e x a m p l e of t h i s f a c t . 

D e n t a l d e c a y i s t h e m o s t c o m m o n d i s e a s e t h a t a t t a c k s 
h u m a n h e a l t h a m d m u c h of i t c a n b e p r e v e n t e d b y t h e u s e 
of f l u o r i d e s . I n t h e U n i t e d S t a t e s s o m e 88 m i l l i o n p e o p l e 
l i v i n g i n 7,400 c o m m u n i t i e s n o w h a v e f l u o r i d a t e d w a t e r , 
b u t t h i s r e a c h e s l e s s t h a n h a l f t h e c h i l d r e n i n t h e U n i t e d 
S t a t e s . 

F l u o r i d e i s m o s t e f f e c t i v e w h e n t a k e n d u r i n g t h e 
d e v e l o D i n e v e a r s f r o m b i r t h to t h i r t e e n . F l u o r i d e c a n b e 
g i v e n b y p r e s c r i p t i o n , b y d i r e c t a p p l i c a t i o n to t e e t h i n a 
d e n t a l o f f i c e , i n t h e d e n t r i f i c e , o r i n t h e c o m m u n i t y w a t e r 
s u p p l y . A l l m e t h o d s o f a p p l i c a t i o n a r e s u p p o r t e d b y t h e 
M e d i c a l , D e n t a l , a n d P u b l i c H e a l t h O r g a n i z a t i o n s . 

F l u o r i d a t i o n o f p u b l i c w a t e r s u p p l y r e d u c e s d e c a y b y 62 
p e r c e n t o r b y t w o - t h i r d s . T h e r e i s e x h a u s t i v e a m o u n t s o f 
e v i d e n c e to d o c u m e n t the e f f e c t i v e n e s s a s w e l l a s t h e 
s a f e t y of f l u o r i d a t i n g c o m m u n i t y w a t e r . T h e o t h e r m e a n s 
of a p p l i c a t i o n a r e n o t a s e f f e c t i v e n o r a s a v a i l a b l e to a l l 
r e s i d e n t s a s i s f l u o r i d a t e d w a t e r . I n P h i l a d e l p h l a t h e 
a v e r a g e c o s t w a s 4.7 c e n t s p e r p e r s o n f o r a n e n t i r e y e a r . 

I t i s c l e a r t h a t t h e a m o u n t o f d e n t a l n e e d a n d t h e s t a t u s 
of f l u o r i d a t i o n m a k e i t o b v i o u s t h a t f l u o r i d a t i o n of a l l 
p u b l i c w a t e r i s n e c e s s a r y to c o n t r o l d e n t a l d i s e a s e . 
P r e v e n t i o n i s i m p e r a t i v e a s t h e d e n t a l n e e d s a r e g r e a t e r 
t h a n t h e c a p a c i t y o f t h e p r o f e s s i o n to t r e a t a n d a l m o s t 
i m p o s s i b l e to f i n a n c e . 

D r . H a r r y DaVis , D . D . S . 
B r i g h t o n 

P h o t o g r a p h i c S k e t c h e s . . . 

' 1 

B A D . . . 
CHARLES CLEIVI 

I o p p o s e t h e a d d i t i o n o f f l u o r i d e to o u r w a t e r s y s t e m 
f o r s e v e r a l r e a s o n s . 

F l u o r i d e a f f e c t s a r t h r i t i c s a n d d i a b e t i c s ( e s p e c i a l l y 
o l d e r p e o p l e ) a n d i s a p o i s o n . 

F l u o r i d e w o r k s o n l y o n c h i l d r e n ' s t e e t h i n t h e f o r ­
m a t i v e y e a r s , t h r e e to s e v e n . H o w m a n y c h i l d r e n w o u l d 
t h i s h e l p ? A n a v e r a g e c h i l d d r i n k s l e s s t h a n o n e p i n t o f 
w a t e r e a c h d a y . 

M o s t i m p o r t a n t a r e t h e c o s t s i n v o l v e d to t r e a t a l l c i t y 
w a t e r , a s m u c h a s o n e a n d o n e h a l f m i l l i o n g a l l o n s p e r d a y . 
F l u o r i d a t i o n w o u l d c a u s e t h e c i t y ' s t a x p a y e r s t h o u s a n d s 

of d o l l a r s to b u y a u t o m a t e d e q u i p m e n t a n d to t r e a t t h i s 
w a t e r . T h i s " S o d i u m f l u o r i d e " , w i t h o v e r - t r e a t m e n t , c a n 
d o m o r e h a r m t h a n g o o d . 

W h o w i l l p a y f o r t h i s f l u o r i d a t i o n i n t h e e n d ? A c ­
c o r d i n g to t h e s t a t e ' s l a b o r a t o r y r e p o r t , w e ( S o u t h L y o n ) 
h a v e .4 to .5 p a r t s p e r m i U i o n ( m i l l i g r a m s p e r l i t e r ) o f 
n a t u r a l c a l c i u m f l u o r i d e i n o u r w a t e r w i t h o u t t r e a t m e n t . 
T h e a m o u n t s e t b y M i c h i g a n ' s D e p a r t m e n t o f H e a l t h t o b e 
a d d e d i s " n o t t o e x c e e d o n e p p m ( m g - l ) . 

l s i t w o r t h i t i n S o u t h L y o n ? I d o n ' t t h i n k s o w h e n o u r 
c h i l d r e n d r i n k 50 o f o u r 1,500,000 g a l l o n s p e r d a y . 

C h a r l e s C l e m 
S o u t h L y o n W a t e r a n d S e w e r 

S u p e r i n t e n d e n t 

B y J I M G A L B R A I T H 

• i 

.» --.'> • .Tcj-̂ --

A b s t r a c t J u n k 

A s k O p e n F o r u m o n N e g o t i a t i o n s 

To the Editor: 

Hav ing discussed the 
pending crit ical teacher's vs 
Board of Education situation 
With both sides and having 
been advised that the 
possibility of ateachers strike 
exists in our community, it is 
felt by the writers of this 
letter and other interested 
parents that an open fofTlm be 
called for in the immediate 
future. 

Since the teachers, Board of 
Education and the unknown 
to us a "fact finding com-
mittee"—are purported to be 
evaluating the claims and dis­
claims of the involved parties, 
the parents of those children 
Who have already started 
back to school should be 

considered (not only con­
sidered but have a Voice in the 
matter) just as they are 
asking us to approVe ad­
ditional MiUage When needed. 

When questioning the 
representatives of both sides 
we found a difference of 
opinion as to What the issues 
are. In order to familiarize 
the readers and parents, 
answers lo the fol lowing 
questions are recommended: 

I What is the l972-73 total 
Northville School enrollment? 

II Is it true, as rumored, 
that ten thousand dollars Was 
cut from the athlet ic 
department budget this year? 
If so, what other ext ra 
cu r r i cu l a r ac t iv i t i e s have 

been affected? 
HI How many neW teachers 

were hired in 1972? HoW many 
were recent graduates as 
compared to experienced 

teachers? 
IV HOW many teachers are 

part time-Working three hours 
a day and getting paid for 2 ' -
hours? 

N e e d F i r e P r o t e c t i o n 

To the Editor: 
We need additional fire 

protection in the southeastern 
portion of the township. It is 
obvious that residents of 
NorthViHe Commons, the 
Colony, the King 's M i l l , and 
High land Lakes are ex-
pressing their demands 
regard ing this issue and 
deserve better protection than 
they are now receiving. 

• The F i r e Study Committee 

deserVes our sincere thanks 
for their Work conducted on 
this topic. However, Would 
someone explain how the 
township officials plan to 
raise additional money to 
cover the cost of this project? 
The study figures indicate 
that they p lan to spend 
$600,000 for cap i ta l ex­
penditures, and $524,000 for 

Coilt inued on Next Page 

V Who received sa la ry 
increases last year? How 
much of an increase did they 
reciVe? 

VI Do teachers get a cost of 
living allowance just as most 
factory workers do? 

VII who, from our school 
board, is on Wayne County 
Task Force 28? 

VIII who is on the fact 
finding committee and what 
are their qualifications? 

I X How much did we 
receive in state aid and how 
much Was required? 

X What are the com­
parative teacher's salaries in 
surrounding communities? 

X1 Why doesn't the school 
board hire a professional and 
objective negotiator, thus not 
placing Mr . Spear in an awk­
ward posit ion year after 
year? 

In closing, a refreshing 
thought occurs—the people of 
Nor thv i l l e school d i s t r i c t 
voted an additional one M i l l 
and this should have a great 
bearing on unfulf i l led 
requirements. 

It is our suggestion that this 
proposed open meeting, if 
considered, be held very soon 
and on a night when the school 
board is not in regular 
session. 

Concerned Parents 

B y J A C K W . H O F F M A N 

I t t o o k s o m e d o i n g b u t a d e t e r m i n e d l 8 - y e a r -
o l d S o u t h L y o n g i r l m a y h a v e c r a c k e d t h e s e x 
b a r r i e r a t t h e U n i v e r s i t y o f M i c h i g a n . 

U n l e s s a n o t h e r e x c u s e s p o i l s h e r d r e a m , 
L y n n H a n s e n / d a u g h t e r o f M i r a n d M l f s , C l i f f o r d ? 
H a n s e n , 61761 F a i r l a n d D r i v e , w i l l b e t h e f i r s t 
g i r l i n h i s t o r y to s t e p o f f w i t h U - M ' s M a r c h i n g 
B a n d w h e n i t o p e n s t h e 1972 s e a s o n S a t u r d a y 
a f t e r n o o n . 

L y n n , a 1970 g r a d u a t e o f S o u t h L y o n H i g h 
S c h o o l w h o i s n o w i n h e r s o p h o m o r e y e a r a t U - M , 
h a s b e e n p r a c t i c i n g w i t h t h e b a n d f o r t w o w e e k s 
a n d i t a p p e a r s s h e m a y b e c l o s e to n a i l i n g d o w n a 
b e r t h o n t h e p r e v i o u s l y a l l - m a l e b a n d . 

A l l B a n d D i r e c t o r G e o r g e C a v e n d e r w o u l d 
t e l l m e t h i s w e e k i s t h a t " s h e ( L y n n ) h a s d o n e 
v e r y w e l l s o f a r . " 

A f i n a l d e t e r m i n a t i o n w i l l b e m a d e s h o r t l y 
b e f o r e S a t u r d a y ' s o p e n i n g g a m e b e t w e e n t h e 
W o l v e r i n e s a n d t h e N o r t h w e s t e r n W i l d c a t s , h e 
s a i d . 

E a r l i e r , C a v e n d e r w a s q u o t e d i n a U - M 
b u l l e t i n : 

" I o w e e v e r y q u a l i f i e d s t u d e n t a n op ­
p o r t u n i t y t o p l a y i n t h e b a n d i f h e w a n t s t o . I f w e 
h a v e a g i r l i n t h e b a n d i t w i l l b e b e c a u s e s h e 
p l a y s w e l l . S h e w o n ' t b e a t o k e n . " 

W h i c h s u i t s L y n n j u s t f i n e . 

S h e d o e s n ' t w a n t to b e a t o k e n . . . n e v e r h a s . 

B u t L y n n , w h e t h e r s h e k n o w s i t o r n o t , i s 
b a t t l i n g a t r a d i t i o n t h a t w i l l r e q u i r e m o r e o f h e r 
t h a n i t d o e s of m a l e c o u n t e r p a r t s . 

N e i t h e r U - M o f f i c i a l s , n o r a l u n m i a r e 
e n a m o r e d b y t h e i d e a of g i r l s i n t h e m a r c h i n g 
b a n d . E v e n m y w i f e d i s l i k e s t h e i d e a , o f f e r i n g 
t h e l a m e e x c u s e t h a t " i t ' s l i k e h a v i n g g i r l s o n t h e 
f o o t b a l l t e a m . N e x t y o u ' l l w a n t t h e m a s 
c h e e r l e a d e r s , t o o . " 

Y o u b e t ! 

I r o n i c a l l y , S o u t h L y o n B a n d D i r e c t o r F r a n k 
K o c h a l k o , w h o s h a r e s m y w i f e ' s m i s g i v i n g s 
a b o u t d i s t u r b i n g t h i s a l l - m a l e t r a d i t i o n , i s 
L y n n ' s b i g g e s t b o o s t e r . 

" I f a g i r l i s g o i n g to b e o n t h e U n i v e r s i t y ' s 
b a n d , L y n n i s the g i r l w h o s h o u l d b e t h e f i r s t , " h e 
c o n f i d e d r e c e n t l y . " N o t o n l y i s s h e a n e x c e l l e n t 
m u s i c i a n — a s g o o d o r b e t t e r t h a n m o s t o f t h e 
y o u n g m e n i n t h e U n i v e r s i t y ' s b a n d — s h e h a s t h e 
n e c e s s a r y s t a m i n a r e q u i r e d o f m a r c h i n g 
b a n d s m e n . 

" S h e ' s a v e r y t a l e n t e d g i r l , a n d I ' m e x ­
t r e m e l y p r o u d o f h e r . " 

N o o n e a t t h e U n i v e r s i t y w i l l a d m i t i t , o f 
c o u r s e , b u t L y n n ' s e f f o r t s a n d t h e e f fo r t s o f o t h e r 
g i r l s h a v e b e e n t h w a r t e d m u c h o f t h e w a y . 

C o n t i n u e d o n N e x t Page 
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L a s t y e a r a f t e r l e a r n i n g t h e U n i v e r s i t y h a d 
o f f i c i a l l y l o w e r e d i t s f e m a l e s e x b a r r i e r , so f a r 
a s t h e m a r c h i n g b a n d i s c o n c e r n e d , L y n n t r i e d 
d e s p e r a t e l y to o b t a i n a n a u d i t i o n i n g s c h e d u l e . 

S t r a n g e l y , i t w a s n o t i m m e d i a t e l y a v a i l a b l e . 
A n d b y t h e t i m e s h e f i n a l l y o b t a i n e d i t a n d 
s h o w e d u p f o r a n a u d i t i o n , s h e w a s g i v e n t h e 
e x c u s e t h a t the d e a d l i n e f o r f r e s h m e n h a d 
p a s s e d . 

D i s a p p o i n t e d b u t c e r t a i n l y n o t d i s c o u r a g e d , 
L y n n , a m u s i c m a j o r , v o w e d to t r y a g a i n t h i s 
y e a r . 

T O m a k e c e r t a i n s h e w o u l d n o t m i s s t h e 
a u d i t i o n i n g " d e a d l i n e " t h i s y e a r , L y n n p l a n n e d 
h e r s t r a t e g y e a r l y . S e v e r a l w e e k s a g o s h e 
m a n a g e d to l e a r n w h e n p o t e n t i a l b a n d s m e n 
w o u l d f i r s t m e e t . ( S h e l e a r n e d o f t h e d a t e , i n ­
c i d e n t a l l y , f r o m a m a l e b a n d s m a n w h o s h o w e d 
h e r h i s w r i t t e n i n v i t a t i o n ) . 

S o w h e n t h e m a l e b a n d s m e n g a t h e r e d f o r 
o r i e n t a t i o n , L y n n w a s r i g h t t h e r e a m o n g t h e m , 
r a i s i n g e y e b r o w s a n d g a r n e r i n g w i s e c r a c k s . B u t 
i n v i e w o f t h e w r i t t e n p o l i c y o f l a s t y e a r t h e r e 
w a s l i t t l e t h e y c o u l d d o to s t o p h e r a s s a u l t u p o n 
t h e i r r a n k s . 

S h e ' s b e e n p r a c t i c i n g h a r d e v e r s i n c e , 
s i l r p r i s i n g m a l e c h a u v i n i s t s w h o h o p e d h e r 
p r o v e n m u s i c a l t a l e n t w o u l d n o t b e m a t c h e d b y 
r e q u i r e d p h y s i c a l s t a m i n a . 

B u t , a l a s , t h e y h a d n ' t c o u n t e d o n t h e f a c t 
t h a t L y n n w a s a n o u t s t a n d i n g a t h l e t e i n h i ^ ' 
s c h o o l . 

T h e i r o n y o f a l l t h i s i s t h a t i f L y n n d o e s i n ­
d e e d b e c o m e a m e m b e r o f t h e m a r c h i n g b a n d — 
a n d h e r e ' s h o p i n g s h e d o e s — m o s t f a n s a t 
S a t u r d a y ' s g a m e w o n ' t b e a b l e to d i s t i n g u i s h h e r 
f r o m h e r c o m p a t r i o t s w h a t w i t h a l l t h e l o c k s 
h a n g i n g d o w n o v e r s o m a n y c o l l a r s . 

R e a d e r s S p e a k 

To the Edi tor : 
Stratford. Ontario, in our 

opinion, is one of the most 
beautiful smal l cities we have 

, ever visited anywhere. The 
river Avon flows thru the 
center, and beautiful trees 
l ine the banks and a re 
reflected in the Water. Swans 
glide gracefully along as you 
sit and watch. 

The S t ra t fo rd F e s t i v a l 
Theatre is on a bluff 
overlooking the Water. 

Stratford has many shops 
featuring Water ford I r i sh 
glass, English china, antiques 
and many other foreign items. 

P r o b a b l y the p r i m a r y 
reason most people v i s i t 
S t ra t ford now is to see 
Shakespearean plays por­
trayed by some of the finest 
actors and actresses in the 
World. 

P r o t e c t i o n 
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operat ing expenses, to 
finance the neW fire depart­
ment. Is it possible that they 
are planning to raise your 
millage? 

Dr . L a r r y D . VanderMolen 
1 8 5 9 5 J a m e s t o w n 

It Was our p r iv i l ege 
recently to attend a per­
formance o f " K i n g Lear". 

The sound, lighting effects 
and costumes a re un­
believably realistic. 

Wil l iam Hutt, Who plays 
" K i n g L e a r " i s . 
unquestionably a colossus in 
the acting profession. Also, a 
monumental performance is 
given by Carole Shelley, Who 
plays the part of "Regan", 
one of the evil daughters. In 
fact the entire cast does a 
terrific job. 

In addition to " K i n g Lear," 
they are doing " A s You L i k e 
It" by Shakespeare, and also 
"She Stoops to Conquer" by 
Oliver Goldsmith. 

F o r oVernight ac­
commodations and seats for 
the performances you can 
Write to the Fest ival Theatre 
Box Office, Stratford, On­
tario, Canada. The plays are 
given f rom approx imate ly 
May l5th through October 
lSth. It is advisable to make 
reservations in advance. 

Stratford is about three to 
five hours driving time from 
anywhere Within fifty miles of 
metropolitan Detroit. 

George N.Sei tz 
24461 Willow Lane 

N E W L I F E 

I S S E H B L T I F M D 

P l a e o : M a s o n i c T i m p l e - N o r t h f i l l o 

C o r n a r o f S h a l d o n a n d M a i n S t . 

Se rv ices : S u n d a y S c h o o l 1 0 : 0 0 a . m . 
S u n d a y W o r s h i p 1 1 : 0 0 a . m . 
S u n d a y N i g h t 7 : 0 0 p . m . 

A L L O F T H I S IS Y O U R S I N C H R I S T : 

B o r n A g a i n E x p e r i e n c e ! J o h n 3 : 3 
B a p t i s m i n the H o l y S p i r i t ! A c t s 2 : 4 
Dhf ine H e a l i n g ! 1 Peter 2 : 2 4 

" H a v e y e rece ived t h e H o l y G h o s t 

s ince y e b e l i e v e d ? " A c t s 19 , 

Pas to r : R e v . B o b J o n e s 6 2 4 - 3 8 3 1 

"I am come that yoti might have Life, 
and that...more atMndantly" John 10:10 

U L M E W E L C O M E D 

I n j u r y A c c i d e n t s R i s e 

R I C H A R D T. R A Y M A R C A . F R I T Z 

I n U n i f o r m 

Ai rman Richard T. Ray, 
son of M r . and Mrs . Wil l iam J . 
Ray of Farmington, has been 
assigned to LoWry A F B , 
Colorado, after completing 
A i r Force basic training. 

During his six weeks at the 
A i r T r a i n i n g Command ' s 
Lackland A F B , Texas, he 
studied the A i r Force mission, 
organization and customs and 
received special instruction in 
human relations. 

The a i r m a n has ' been 
assigned to the Technical 
Training Center at Lowry for 
specialized training in the 
munit ions and weapons 
maintenance field. 

A i r m a n R a y is a 1972 
graduate of NoVi High School. 
His wife, L i n d a , is the 
daughter of M r . and Mrs . 
W i l l i a m Towner of 39611 
Burton, Novi. 

Cadet Marc A . Fr i tz , son of 
M r . and Mrs . Donald F . F r i t z 
of 24423 Mil ls t raam Lane, 
Novi , , is one of more than 850 
cadets who have entered their 
senior year at the U.S. A i r 

Force Academy. 
During his three years at 

the academy, Cadet Fr i t z has 
been a member of the Dean's 
List five semesters for his 
o u t s t a n d i n g a c a d e m i c 
achievement. 

This past summer, he 
completed s ix Weeks of 
ground and flight training in 
TAl aircraft to qualify for a 
Federal Aviation private pilot 
license and acceptance into 
U.S. A i r Force pilot training. 

Upon graduation next 
June, he w i l l be c o m ­
missioned a second lieutenant 
and receive his B.S. degree. 

Cadet Fr i t z is a graduate of 
Henry Ford High School. 

The A i r Force is celebrating 
its 25th ann iversa ry this 
month. 

M a r i n e C p l . Dona ld F . 
Bostic, son of M r . and M r s . . 
Thurmel Bostic of 52815 West.' 
12 Mi le Road, Wixom, Was 
promoted to his present rank 
While serving at the Mar ine 
Corps Base, Camp Lejeune, 
North Carolina. 

Injuries sustained in ac­
cidents within the City of 
Northville have increased 77 
percent during the first seven 
months of 1972 when com­
pared with the first seven 
months last year. 

According to a report 
recently issued by the city 
police department's traffic 
division, 64 persons have been 
injured in 156 accidents this 
year. 

Dur ing the f irst seven 
months of 1971, 36 persons 
were hurt in 154 acciijents. 

In July, 1972, 14 persons 
were hurt in a total of 30 ac­
cidents. 

Nine accidents investigated 
in J u l y involved in jur ies , 
eight involved proper ty 
damage and 13 occurred in 
parking lots. 

On-street accidents in ­
cluded 10 involving another 

car. two motorcycles, two 
fixed objects, one pedestrian, 
one parked vehicle and one 
car ran off the road. 

Parking lot accidents in­
cluded 11 two-car collisions. 

one bicycle and one with a 
fixed object. Five parking lot 
accidents were hit and run. 

Police issued a total of 258 
hazardous moving violations. 
72 non-hazardous violations 

N o v i O K ' s S t u d y C e n t e r 

Continued from Novi , 1 

is neglecting development of 
sports opportunities for girls. 

Charging that school of­
f ic ia ls , beiiause of short­
changed sports programs for 
girls, could be labeled male 
c h a u v i n i s t s , W i l k i n s 
reminded the administration 
that his previous advocacy of 
more programs for g i r l s 
apparently had fallen on deaf 
ears. 

The high school principal 
was directed to submit a 
report and recommendations 

to the board, by the first me­
ting in January, on both girls 
interscholastic sports as well 
as intramural sports for both 
girls and boys. 

and 2:!5 parking ticisC'ls 
Hazardous violatio. 'is in 

eluded speeding, im 
proper turn. 49; (ii.sobi.-> in;.-
traffic signal, 21: (ii.so!.)('> in;-
stop sign. 18: impiopcr lunc 
usage, seven; (Jrun.:(!i: 
driving, fail to yield. ini 
proper pass ing. driviiiL-, 
without due care, foui- e:ich; 
following too closely causin^; 
accident, five: driving ufoi i i : 
way on one-way street, ih iec : 
and al l others, nine. 

A l m o s t 1 0 0 Y E A R S o f 

I N S U R A N C E E X P E R I E N C E 
Ed DeWindt Ken Rathert Bill Thics 

G r u b b Q u i t s 

160 E. Main Street Northville 349-1122 

N o v i F i l l s 

V a c a n c i e s 

Appoin tments to the 
Building Authority and the 
P a r k s and Recrea t ion 
Commission were made by 
the Novi city council at its 
Monday session. 

Appointed to the Building 
. Authority was Mrs . Winifred 
Dobek of 12 Mi l e Road. Mrs . 
Sherry Ann Edwards and 
Richard Bingham Were the 
appointees to the Parks and 
Recreation Commission. 

Also appointed to the Parks 
and Recreation Commission 
was Counc i lman W i l l i a m 
O ' B r i e n . O ' B r j e n is the 
council's representative on 
the board. 

M r s . Dobek was one of four 
candidates for the vacancy on 
the B u i l d i n g Au thor i ty 
created by the death of 
Thomas Lawson earlier in the 
summer. Her selection came 
after the council interviewed 
all the candidates last Fr iday . 

Other nominees for the 
. Vacancy were Mrs . Romaine 

Roethel, John M c K a y , and 
Frank Scarlett. 

Mrs . Dobek's husband is a 
member of the city's planning 
board, a fact which drew the 
at tention of C o u n c i l m a n 
Edwin Presnell prior to the 
balloting. 

"I feel that in a city With a 
populat ion of 12,000 i t 

shouldn't be necessary for tWo 
members of the same family 
to serve on different boards in 
the c i ty ," stated Presnell . 
"It's too much of a sacrifice 
from any one family ." ^. ^ .., . , . , j 

Presnell also impl ied ' t i l ^ ? * « * ^ 
" situation could have ., 

J N e e a F l a y e r s 

Continued from NoVi, 1 

far and Wide to find someone 
to fill his shoes." 

City charter, in the event of 
a resignation from a council 
member, calls for council to 
appoint someone to f i l l the 
Vacancy Within 60 days. 

Willis commended Grubb 
for his "dedicated serVice" 
and concurred With Dingeldey 
that a replacement Would be 
difficult to find. 

C o u n c i l m a n G u n n a r 
Mettala suggested the choice 
of a replacement be tabled by 
the council at least until the 
next regular meeting. "This 
comes as Very much a shock 
to all of us. We Were not aWare 
that this Was going to hap­
pen." 

He then made a motion that 
council should "except the 
resignation wi th s inceres t 
regret" and called Grubb a 
"very dedicated individual ." 
M e t a l l a sa id , " W e a l l 
dissagreed at times, but that 
is part of the democratic 
way." 

Council Voted unanimously 
to send Grubb a letter of 
commendation and to meet as 
a committee to discuss the 
choice of a replacement. 

In other action, the council 

public hearing on October 24 
to discuss the reVision of the 
W i x o m bu i ld ing -fees 
schedule. 

R e q u e s t s 

J u r y T r i a l 

Continued from N o v i , 1 

alleged crime and the date of 
a r ra ignment . Judge B o y l e 
sa id 'Tuesday that such 
delays were lega l ly per­
missible proVided they are 
requested by the defendants. 

" I f such a delay is oc­
casioned by the police or court 
however," Boyle continued, 
" i t is grounds for dismissal of 
the charges." 

Boyle's estimate that the 
case Would not be tried until 
December or January Was 
based on the fact that juries 
are summoned only four to 
five times during the course of 
a year. We probably Won't be 
calling another jury until late 
in the year," he said. 

FREE! M i f n l J C i i e i m c a U . 

S W I M M I N G - P O O L 

C L O S I N G 

G U I D E 

Pljy i l 
safe! Get 

your copy of iliis 
Hsy-to-undersiand 

bulletin which tells you 
everything you need to know 

to ciose your pool And jisc 
pick up some 

I r i N T E R G A R D 
to protect your poof water from the growth ot : i 

tit and scum-forminf bacteria during the cold months 

I N T E R S A R D 
w i t h this coupon 

J 1 0 0 0 F F 

Reg. price $6.00 
Gal. of 
Winter Card , 

^ S A X T O N ' S 

G a r d e n C e n t e r 
587 W. Ann Arbor Trail 

453-6250 

such a 
legal ramifications. 

Nevertheless, the council 
approved the selection of M r s . 
Dobek by a "Wide margin ," 
according to Mayor Joseph 
Crupi. 

Another candidate for the 
job, Mrs . Roethel, also has a 
husband on the p lanning 
board. 

In making the appointments 
to the Parks and Recreation 
Commiss ion , the counci l 
passed by Peter Alcala , head 
of the commission. The tWo 
Vacancies Were created by the 
expiration of the terms of 
Alcala and Richard Bingham. 

Both men indicated they 
Would Welcome reap­
pointment, but the council 
accepted other nominations 
for the two openings. Those 
other candidates were 
Timothy Hensel, Mrs . E d -
wards, and Thomas SWope. 

B i n g h a m and M r s . E d -
Wards Were announced as the 
Winners of the council's secret 
ba l lo t ing . They Were ap­
pointed to three year terms. 

The Nor thVi l l e M o t h e r s ' 
Club is in need of more bridge 
p layers for the annual 
M a r a t h o n B r i d g e Tour­
nament. 

There are still openings for 
tWo couples in the evening 
ladies group and one couple in 
the evening mixed group. 

Those Wishing to play in the 
tournament are urged to 
contact M r s . Edward Hodge 
at 349-0192 immediately. 

I 

I 

" i h e T R U T H 

i h a i H E A L S " 

' W Q T E ' 

S U N D A Y 9:45 A . M . 

" S e x a n d M o r a l i t y --
S o m e F r a n k A n s w e r s " 

F R E S H - T I M E L Y - V I T A L 

S c h o o l c r a f t G o l L e g e \ o o i c r a 

presents 

R A L P H N A D E R 

" A Look a t the P a r t y P l a t f o r m s " 

L I V E 
A m e r i c a ' s NO. 1 C o n s u m e r A d v o c a t e w i l l present 
f indings Of his in-depth s tudy of the 1 9 7 2 presi­
dential platforms and w h a t they ho ld for you , the 
consumer . 

8 p . m . S e p t e m b e r 2 1 , 1 9 7 2 

S c h o o l c r a f t C o l l e g e M a i n G y m n a s i u m 
1 8 6 0 0 H a g g e r t y R d . . L i v o n i a . M i c h i g a n 

RALPH NADER 

COMING OCT. 7 - The Don Ellis Orchestra 

Schoolcntt College 
Cultural a PuMic Affiir* Series 
Uvonie. Michigan 48161 
Please send general admission ticltets at $2 each for the Ralph Nader speech on 
September 21. 1972. 
NAlVIE 

S T R E E T .« C I T Y ... 

S T A T E Z I P . 

I enclose a stamped, self-addfessed envelope plus check of money order (payable to 
Schoolcraft College) totaling $ 

W e ' P R O F E S S I O N A L S 

a t S o u t l 7 d o w i > s 

T t i f S < W O V E M B E R 

H a v e y o u b e e n m i s s i n g m o r e t h a n y o u r s h a r e 

o f v o l l e y s l a t e l y , o r d o u b l e f a u l t i n g ? T h e n l e t 

t h e e x p e r i e n c e d p r o f e s s i o n a l t e a c h i n g s t a f f a t 

S o u t h d o w n s h e l p y o u t o i m p r o v e y o u r g a m e . 

R e s e r v e y o u r m e m b e r s h i p a t S o u t h d o w n s b y 

s i m p l y f i l l i n g o u t t h e a p p l i c a t i o n b e l o w a n d 

m a i l i t t o g e t h e r w i t h a c h e c k i n t h e a m o u n t o f 

t h e a p p r o p r i a t e m e m b e r s h i p f e e , p a y a b l e t o 

S o u t h d o w n s T e n n i s C l u b . 

^ ANNUAL 2 
I MEMBERSHIP FEE 

Man $75.00 
Woman . ! $55.00 
Junior .$25.00 
Family $150.00 

Name 

Address 

City State Zip Code 

Phone 

B o b D u e e s e B o b B e n n e t 

MAIL TO: Southdowns Tennis C l u b 
23988 Freeway Park Drive 
Farmington. Michigan 48024 
P H O N E 3 6 3 7 8 6 6 

file:///ooicra
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F I R S T C U S T O M E R — L i v o n i a N a t i o n a l B a n l i o p e n e d a b r a n c h o f f i c e i n 
N o r t h v i l l e t o w n s h i p l a s t W e e k a n d the b a n k ' s n e x t d o o r n e i g h b o r b e c a m e i t s 
f i r s t c u s t o m e r . T h e t e m p o r a r y t r a i l e r - o f f i c e i s l o c a t e d o n F i v e M i l e a t 
H a g g e r t y n e x t to O a s i s G o l f C o u r s e . A p e r m a n e n t f a c i l i t y i s b e i n g c o n ­
s t r u c t e d a t t h e s a m e s i t e a n d s h o u l d b e r e a d y W i t h i n a y e a r , o f f i c i a l s s t a t e d . 
P i c t u r e d a b o v e a t the o p e n i n g c e r e m o n i e s a r e : (1. to r . ) E l v i n D . D o u g h e r t y , 
L i v o n i a N a t i o n a l p r e s i d e n t ; W i l l i a m D i t z h a z y , b u i l d e r o f t h e n e w b a n k ; 
R o b e r t O s b o r n a n d H e n r y H o g a n of O a s i s ; O f f i c e M a n a g e r R o b e r t W a l t e r ; 
a n d T o w n s h i p S u p e r v i s o r G u n n a r S t r o m b e r g a n d D r . L a r r y V a n d e r M o l e n , 
D e m o c r a t i c c a n d i d a t e f o r t o w n s h i p s u p e r v i s o r . 

O K S a l a r y H i k e s 

Continued from Record, 1 

FoJlowing Tuesday 's ap­
proval of the salary increases. 
Schaeffer questioned where 
the money would come from 
to pay the increases. 

Treasure r Straub com­
mented it Would "come from 
the contingency fund you're 
always talking about paying 
extra policeman out of." 

In other action, trustees 
denied approving a letter of 
intent to participate in the 
Wayne County Sani ta t ion 
Authority and agreed to set up 
a special study meeting to 
discuss f inancing mem­
bership in the authority. 

Set up to cover Northville 
c i ty and township and 
Plymouth city and township, 
the authority plans to begin 
trash pick up in January. 

Cur ren t ly the township 
residents arrange for their 
own trash pick up. 

Board members said the 
township had no power to 

force persons to use the 
authority for trash pick up 
and that if a person did not 
want to pay the $2.10 per 
month estimated cost, there 

J u v e n i l e 

C r i m e U p 

Po l i ce cases invo lv ing 
juveniles have increased 
during the first seven months 
of 1972 when compared With 
the same period in l97l . 

Acco rd ing to a report 
recenl ly issued by the Nor­
thville city police depart­
ment's juvenile division, 8l 
cases invo lv ing juveni les 
have been investigated to 
date, up from 68 cases last 
year. 

Ten cases invo lv ing l9 
juveniles were investigated 
by city police in July, l972. Of 
those, five concerned traffic 
offenses. 

would be no way to force him 
to do so. 

Ci ty Manager F r a n k 
Ollendorff, who attended 
Tuesday's meeting, told the 
board that when the authority 
goes out for bids they hope to 
include a l l four municipalities 
Which are involved in the 
study. 

Board members said they 
did not realize. When they 
became involved in the 
authority study, that it would 
begin t rash p ick up in 
January or that the township 
Would have to pay the cost of 
pick up for a guaranteed 
number of households, 
whether or not the households 
paid. 

T e n c o o l w a y s 

t o c u t i t . 

D e m o l i t i o n D e r b y ? 

Continued from Record, 1 

.At Six Mile and Carrie 
roads, two Livonia police cars 
set up a roadblock. Schmidt 
turned into Salem Hills Golf 
Course to avoid the roadblock. 

Lancas te r r a m m e d Sch­
midt's car, but he backed up 
and drove north on Curr'ie. 
t he car was rammed again 
by Lancaster and forced into 
a ditch, but Schmidt pulled 
out and drove south on Currie 
where the two Livonia cars 
were waiting. 

Schmidt's car was rammed 
by the two Livonia cars and 
finally forced to a stop. Both 
Schmidt and Hoffman were 
forceably removed from the 
car after Livonia officers 

broke windows to gain en­
trance to the vehicle. 

Four Livonia officers were 
treated at St. Mary hospital 
for neck, shoulder, head and 
hand injuries sustained 
during the chase. Both 
Livonia cars were damaged, 
as was one of the Northville 
city cars. Plymouth car and 
one Washtenaw County car 
suffered engine damage. 

Schmidt ' s 1968 B u i c k 
convertible ended up with flat 
tires on the driver's side, 
damage to both sides and rear 
and was towed to the police 
station. 

Ten police cars from the 
city and township of North­
ville. Plymouth. Livonia and 
Washtenaw County were 
involved in the chase. 

L e t us he lp y o u get to k n o w y o u r new 
c o m m u n i t y as qu ic lc ly as possible . O u r 
hostess w i l l c a l l o n y o u a n d present y o u 
w i t h gif ts , greetings a n d useful i n f o r m a ­
t i o n . 

C a l l 3 4 9 - 3 1 3 8 

See the complete Ford line 
of lam and garden tractors 
and riding mowers. 

FOUR new lawn and garden 
tractors: 10 to 14-hp. New 
foot-controlled hydrostatic 
transmission on larger mod­
els. Quick-attach equipment 
mounting. Deep-padded, ad­
justable seat. Many attach­
ments, including snow blow­
ers and blades. 
T H R E E lawn tractors: 7 and 
8-hp. Deluxe models provide 
electric starter. Hydrostatic 
speed control standard on 
8-hp. Equip any model with 
34-in. rotary mower or 34-in. 
snow blower. 

T H R E E riding mowers: 5 or 
7-hp. Rear-mounted engine 
provides bettertraction.puts 
heat and noise behind you. 
Adjustable seat. Automotive-
type precision steering. 
Stop in and see cur line of 
Ford lawn and garden equip­
ment today. A l l a v a i l a b l e 
with easy financing. 

B R O Q U E T 

F O R D T R A C T O R 
34600 W. 8 Mile 

Farmington 
476-3500 

P r o t e s t A p a r t m e n t P l a n s 

About 60 township residents 
turned out to voice their ob­
jections to rezoning to build a 
planned apartment complex 
located at B r a d n e r and 
Frankl in roads. 

Appea r ing at a pub l i c 
hearing last Thursday night 
before township planners , 
Edward Rose and Sons Bui ld-
rs of Southfield unveiled plans 
for a 340-500 unit complex to 
be called Lake Phoenix V i l l a . 

Rezoning from s ingle 
family to multiple use is 
sought for the 34.89 acre site. 
Fronting on Bradner, the land 
is bounded on the north by 
Frankl in , on the west by the 
C&O Railroad tracks and on 
the south is about lO acres 
from Phoenix Lake. 

Donald Debar, spoksman 
for the developer, said his 
firm believes the site is un­
suitable for single family 
homes because of its-
p rox imi ty to the r a i l r o a d 
tracks which carry about 20 
trains per day. 

He said apartments would 
be well-suited to the area 
since parking could separate 
the units from the railroad 
and persons would only be 

- renting the units and not 
buying a home or townhouse 
on the site. 

He also commented that the 
site has a 70-foot drop from 
Frankl in Road to the lake 
level which could be utilized 

through design of the apart­
ments but that it would be 
difficult to build single family 
homes on the land. 

T(5wnship Engineer Wi l l i am 
Mosher reminded Dehar the 
topography of the site was not 
originally that steep but that 
mining of sand caused the 
difference. 

Bil l Bart l ing of 15877 Portis 
presented a petition signed by 
350 residents in the area to the 
commission, protesting the 
rezoning to multiple use. 

The pet i t ion asked the 
request be denied because it 
would 

• adversely affect property 
values of homes in the area: 

• constitute spot zoning in 
the middle of a single family 
area: 

• violate the spirit of the 
zoning ordinance and cause 
an injustice for adjacent 
property owners: and 
« . add more traffic to the 

roads which already carry 
heavy t raff ic wh ich is 
hazardous to the safety of 
children in the area. 

Weldon C l a r k of 16201 
Bradner Road told planners 
that the land, if zoned for 
apartments, would be con­
trary to the township's rural 
character. 

John Basilico of Old Bed­
ford Road said he was con­
cerned about the quality of the 
buildings and the people who 

would be renting apartments. 
He said he judged the type of 
people the complex would 
draw from the amount of rent 
that would be charged. 

Township planners tabled 
the rezoning request until the 
October 31 meeting, referring 
it to the engineer and land 
planner for their recom­

mendations. 
At the begimling of the 

hearing, Dehar had requested 
that the decision not be tabled 
for a long period of t ime. 

Hurry! You've only a few days left to be a winner 
in our 1972 Punt Pass & Kick Competition. 
You coulid win qne of 18 local trophies. And, 
you have an opportunity to go aii the way to 
the Nationai PP&K Finals at the Pro Bowl in 

B o y s 8 - 1 3 . . . y O U R 

O P P O R T U n m J F O R 

H l O I B a L L 

s i a R D o m 

Is Here O n S e p t e m b e r 3 0 
at the 

N o r t h v i l l e H i g h S c h o o l P rac t i ce 
F o o t b a l l F i e l d 

Dallas. And, you have a good shot at winning 
because you're competing only against boys 
your own age. So malce your move. Bring your 
parents into our showroom now, sign up and 
receive your free PP&K Tips Bool<.Then practice. 

I T ' S F R E E - S I G N U P W I T H U S N O W 

J o h n M a c h F o r d S a l e s , I n c . 

5 5 0 Seven IVIile R d . 
N o r t h v i l l e P h . 3 4 9 - 1 4 0 0 

N O R T H V I L L E R E C O R D - N O V ! N E W S 

WmESt 
i n t e r T o d a y ! Y o u M o y B e A W i n n e r ! 

$ 
H E R E A R E T H E R U L E S 

Take a plain piece of paper and number down the left hand side from 1 to 
16. 

You will notice that each square below is also numbered from 1 to 16 and 
each contains a football game to be staged this coming weekend. To complete 
your entry you must do the following: 

(1) after each number on your paper write the name of the sponsor of the 
corresponding square. 

(2) following the sponsor's name - write the name of the winning team. 
(3) in addition you must pick a score on the outcome of the game in square 

16. This will be used in the case of a tie and then the contestant whose score is 
closest t o . the actual score will be declared the winner. 

Be sure to write your name, address and phone number plainly on your piece 
of paper (your entry). 

Enter just once a week, but may enter as many weeks as you wish. In case of 
tie, prize money will be split. 

Copies of the contest will be posted at the Northville Record office each 
week. 

Entries should be addressed "Football Contest" and must be postmarked 
or brought to our office no later than 5 p.m. each Friday. 

Employees of The Northville Record-Novi News or sponsoring merchants 
are not eligible. 

Entry forms available without charge in our office. 
Winners announced In paper and posted In office. 

F i r s t P r i z e 

S e c o n d 

T h i r d 

E A C H W E E K ! 

Enjoy Our Gay 90's 

Atmosphere. Steaks on the 

Hearth. Cocktail Hour 4-6. 

3 4 9 - 8 6 8 6 
212 S. Main (Northville Rd.) 

1. N o v i a t N o r t h v i l l e 

Viuunioi ly 

Hunter 0n-The-C»r 

W h e e l B a l a n c i n g  

G j v e T V S t a m p s 

Free BC PlaiMmat wittt 8 GaI. Purchaw 
K E L L E Y T I R E S -

^ £ ¥ £ $ MARAWOH 

4 8 0 W . 7 M i l e 3 4 9 - 4 9 4 0 

5 . I o w a a t O h i o S ta te 

7 2 D O D G E D E A L S 

YEAR END PRICES 

DEPEND ON IT 

G . E . M I L L E R 

NORTHVILLE DODGE 
127Hutton 349-0660 

9. U C L A a t P i t t sburgh 

N O V I 

D R U G 

l ^ n k ^ k 4 3 0 3 5 G r . R i v e r 
M f l ! 5 ® - - N o v i - 3 4 9 - 0 1 2 : 

YOUR PERSONAL PHARMACY 

13 . A r i z o n a S t a t e at H o u s t o n 

O L D M I L L 

R E S T A U R A N T 

Delicious food at your 

downtown convenience 

E A S T M A I N ST. - N O R T H V I L L E 

2 . W y o m i n g a t A i r F o r c e 

A f t e r t h e G a m e T r e a t Y o u r s e l f 

t o the F r i e n d l y H o s p i t a l i t y 

o f t h e 

N O V I I N N 

N o v i R o a d & G r a n d R i v e r 

6 . O h i o U . a t Idaho 

with the Purchase 
of any Pizza at 
Northville's 

1 6 8 M a i n S t . 
3 4 9 - 0 5 5 6 

1 0 . V P I a t V i r g i n i a 

WHOI-ESALE 
RETAIL 

PHONE 
NORTMVIi-LE 

349-1466 

NORTHVILLE. MICHIGAN 
ZiaOO NOVI ROAD 

NORTHVILLE. MICH 48167 

14 . V i l i a n o v a a t K e n t u c k y 

P H I L ' S S E R V I C E 

A A A R O A D S E R V I C E 

T U N E U P S ( M A J O R R E P A I R S 
Brakes. Drum lathes. Tires 

130 W. M A I N Q A Q 9 ^ R n 
W. of Center 0 H 3 - ^ 3 3 V I 

Daily 7-10; Sun. 8-9 

3 . N o r t h w e s t e r n at M i c h i g a n 

ENTER FORD'S PUNT, PASS & 

KICK CONTEST 

JOHN MACH FORD SALES, INC. 

550 Seven Mile Rood 
NORTHVILLE. MICHIGAN 

Phone Fl 91400 

7 . N o r t h C a r o l i n a at M a r y l a n d 

Open for the 99th Season 
P a r m e n t e r ' s 

Nor thv i l l e 

C I D E R M I L L 

Cider -Donuts 
C a r a m e l App les 

714 Base l ine 
1 0 a . m . to8 p . m . 

U . S . C a r o l i n a a t G e o r g i a T e c h . 

L A P H E W 

S T A N D A R D S E R V I C E 

T u n e - U p s - A t l a s T i r e s 
H u n t e r W h e e l B a l a n c i n g 

3 0 2 E . M a i n o j a n g o o 
N o r t h v i l l e 0 4 3 - 3 0 0 0 

1 5 . B a y l o r at G e o r g i a 

HEWOWNBR'S SPBCIAL 
Selected - ^ ^ 
Housewares O F F 

Save $ 2 to $ 4 per gal 
S A L E 

N o v i P r o H a r d w a r e 

46195 Grand River East of Novi Rd. 
Phone: 349-2696 

4 . M i n n e s o t a at Ind iana 

M e a d o w b r o o k A c r e s 

S O D F A R M 

"Sod Is Our Business" 

Complete Sod lnstallation Includes 

Tractor Grading • Hand Grading 

• Fertilizing & Rolling 

3 4 9 - 4 4 1 1 . 

8. Texas A & M at N e b r a s k a 

The Spirit of 76 
Lives Here! 

Your C O N V E N I E N T 
S E R V I C E Station 

A S H E R ' S 7 6 

Rogers & 7 Mile 349-9786 

12 . T o l e d o a t Eas t . M i c h i g a n . 

B R U C E C R A I G 

P o n t i a c 

"Your Neighborhood 

Pontiac Dealer" 

874 W. ANN ARBOR ROAD 

PLYMOUTH 

4 5 3 - 2 5 0 0 
16. Mich, state 

8t lIIirioi* Score. 

T h u r s d a y , S e p t e m b e r 1 4 , 1 9 7 2 T H E N O R T H V I L L E R E C O R D - N O V I N E W S P a g e 1 3 - A 

W i l d c a t s F a v o r e d i n O p e n e r 

V o r t h v i l l e — N o v i R e n e w H o s t i l i t i e s 

Round TWO of the Northville 
versus Novi grid riValry is 
slated to get underway Fin day 
at 8 p.m. With the Wildcats -
heaVy faVorites to make it tWo 
out of two against the 
Mustangs. 

NorthVille last year broke a 
long-standing t radi t ion of 
p laying P l y m o u t h H i g h 
School in its opening game, 
dropping the Rocks from their 
schedule completely. 

At the same time, the seeds 
for a new riValry - potentially 
much more heated than the 
NorthVille-Plymouth game -
Were sewn as the Mustangs 
and Wildcats arriVed at an a-
greement to meet annually in 
the season's opener. 

In the NorthVille-Plymouth 
riValry, the Mustangs Were 
the s m a l l e r school by a 
considerable m a r g i n . The 

Mustangs find themselves on 
the other side in their riValry 
With NoVi, however, being the 
larger of the two schools by a 
significant number. 

Nevertheless , the hard-
nosed Wildcat crew pasted a 
22-7 loss on the Mustangs last 
year in the first meeting 
betWeen the tWo schools and 
are set and ready to repeat 
the performance again this 
year. 

Both teams should be better 
prepared. 

For one thing, it is highly 
conceivable that the 1971 
Mustangs Were guilty of not 
having enough respect for the 
talents of their smaller neigh­
bor to the north. 

No such overconfidence Will 
prevail this year. 

"We knoW What We're up 
aga ins t , " N o r t h v i l l e coach 
Chuck Shonta asserts. "We're 

Well aware (rf how much 
talent they've got in that 
backfield and how well they 
run the wishbone." 

The Wildcats on the other 
hand should also be better 
prepared than they Were for 
the NorthVille game last year. 
When the NoVi gridders to(^ 
the field in the 1971 clash, it 
was their first actual game 
experience With the Wishbone 
and, quite frankly, it took 
quarterback SteVe Lukkar i 
the first half to figure out just 
how to Work it effectiVely. 

GiVing the ball time and 
time again to fullback Gary 
Collins, Lukkar i practically 
ignore(i the outside threat of 
J i m VanWagner and P a t 
Boyer and the Mus tangs 
walked off the field at the half 
holding the lead 7-6. 

At the suggestion of Head 

Coach John Osborne, Lukkar i 
started faking the hand off up 
the middle to Collins and 
pitching Wide to his two 
halfbacks in the second half 
and the effects Were 
significant 

The Wildcats picked up 94 
yard rushing in the third 
quarter alone and by the end 
of the game had gained 203 
yards on the ground, as 
compared With 86 for the 
Mustangs. 

By the end of the season 
Lukkar i Was directing the 
Wishbone offense With 
unerr ing prec is ion . W i t h 
L u k k a r i and the ent i re 
starting 1971 NoVi backfield 
re turning to act ion, the 
Mustangs Will not haVe the 
benefit of a whole half of 
action in which to wear down 
the WUdcats. 

The 1972 clash should be 

F R O N T F I V E — N o r t h v i l l e ' s M u s t a n g s w i l i b e 
c o u n t i n g h e a v i l y o n a b i g f r o n t l i n e n o t o n l y t o 
h e l p t h e m m o v e t h e b a l l o n o f f ense , b u t a l s o t o 
p r e v e n t t h e i r o p p o n e n t s f r o m m o v i n g t h e b a l l . 
T h e f r o n t f i v e a v e r a g e 203 p o u n d s f r o m t a c k l e t o 

^ t a c k l e . C e n t e r i s 2 0 3 - p o u n d R o n A n g o v e , a t t h e 

C o l e L e a d s t h e W a y 

g u a r d s a r e 2 0 0 - p o u n d S t e v e S e r k a i a n a n d I S O -
p o u n d T i m R i c e , t a c k l e s a r e m a n n e d b y 203-
p o u n d J i m P o r t e r f i e l d a n d 215-pound B i l l P o t t e r . 
T h e M u s t a n g s a r e g o i n g to h a v e to t h r o w s o m e o f 
t h a t w e i g h t a r o u n d F r i d a y to a v o i d a s e c o n d 
s t r a i g h t l o s s to t h e N o v i W i l d c a t s . 

C a r r i e r s P o s t 1 s t WW 

Nor thVi l l e cross-country 
coach Ralph Redmond just 
couldn ' t have been too 
displeased with the showing of 
his 1972 team last Week. 

Sure, he Would have liked to 
place a little higher than the 
eighth his runners took at the 
West Bloomfield Invitational 
last Saturday. 

But When the fact that there 
were 23 teams competing in 
the Class B portion of the 
meet and the fact that eight of 
those 23 teams placed in the 
top ten Class B squads in the 
state last year, there is indeed 
soine reason to believe that 
eighth place just isn't a l l that 
bad. 

But the West Bloomfield 
Invitational wasn't the only 
appearance that Redmond's 
runners made in the past 
seven days. Tuesday they got 
their 1972 dual-meet schedule 
underway by swamping 
Dearborn Crestwood 16-39. 

U n d e r c r o s s - c o u n t r y 
scoring, a score of 15 is per­
fect. 

' 'I Was pretty pleased," said 
Redmond. "Par t icular ly With 
the Crestwood meet. 

N o r t h v i l l e ' s h a r r i e r s 
weren't even scheduled to 
compete in the West 
Bloomfield Invitational, but 
received a last minute in­
vitation and R S V P ' d in the 
affirmative. 

" W e had to f inance i t 
ourselves," said the Mustang 
coach. ' "The kids paid the 
entry fee out of their own 
pockets. We decided that it 
would be a valuable ex­
perience for us to get in 
against some big- t ime 
competition." 

Guy Cole was the top North­
ville finisher in the 161-man 
field, as he raced to eighth 
place over the three mile 
cour-se. Tom Coram Was the 
second Mus tang f in isher , 
copping twentieth place to win 
one of the medals awarded to 

the top 25 runners in the meet. 
The Crestwood meet was no 

contest as NorthviUe's run­
ners grabbed first, second, 
third, fourth, and sixth places 
on ' 'The Monster" - Nor­
thville's home course in Cass 
Benton Park . 

Again Guy Cole led the 

Northville runners to the tape 
and again Tom Coram Was 
second. T im Taggart grabbed 
th i rd . While a pa i r of 
sophomores - F red Shipley 
and Robbie Foust - Were 
fourth and sixth in the mee t 

" I think We're fa r ther 

ahead this year than we Were 
last year," declared Red­
mond. "We're getting down 
to the point Where there's only 
a minute betWeen our first 
and fifth finisher and that puts 
us much farther ahead of last 
year's pace When We sti l l had 
a tWo minute l ag . " 

L i t t l e L e a g u e F o o t b a l l 

C o l t s T o p p l e M e t e o r s 

Nor thv i l l e ' s l i t t l e league 
football teams got the 1972 
season off to a relatively 
successful start Saturday by 
winning two of three games 
from the Westland Meteors. 

Two long f i rs t -quarter 
touchdown runs gave the 
Northville Colts' freshman 
team a 14-0 half time lead 
which they maintained in the 
second half to dump the 
Meteor frosh 20-6. 

The lone Colt loss was on the 
junior varsity level where the 
Meteors recorded a 20-8 
triumph. The victors scored 
once in both the first and 

second quarters on long 
drives. The Meteors upped 
their lead to 20-0 With a 78-
yard touchdown run the third 
quarter. 

The NorthVUle six-pointer 
came on a fourth quarter 75-
yard touchdown r u a 

The second Colt victory Was 
registered by the Varsity. 

TWO quick first quarter scores 
gaVe the Colts a 12-0 lead 
Which they held until the half. 

A 25-year touchdown run 
midway through the third 
quarter upped the Colts' lead 
to 18-0. 

The Meteors aver ted a 
shutout with a touchdown in 
the final quarter. 

R U M I i A A G E 

S A L E 

T h e F i r s t U n i t e d 

M e t h o d i s t C h u r c h 

7 7 7 W . 8 M I L E R O A D 

r h u r s d a v S e p t . 2 1 

10 a . m . t o 8 p . m . 

F r i d a y , S e p t e m b e r 2 2 

9 a .m . t o 4 p . m . 

r i L i t t l e 

L a e s a r s 

Newest P i z z a Taste Sensation 

G O U R M E T 

D E E P D I S H S Q U A R E P I Z Z A 

/ ^ E s r P I Z Z A v b u ^ TAsm i 

P H O N E 3 4 9 - 0 5 5 6 

1 6 8 E . M A I N N o r f h v i l l e 

I y rNscoofONGooofo iV | 

on any 
iquare pizza 

I I 5 ^ PHONE 349-0556 
l ^ k i . NORTHVILLE 

••ONE COUPON PER PIZZA 

THiscouroNcoooratV | 

® X * a f Q T . o f P E P S I 
MITH Tits PIWCHMI 

or tat tixtk 
PHONE 349-0SS6 
NORTHVILLE 

1 1 ^ 

• • • • O N E COI ONE COUPON PER PtSZA'! 

interesting in that NoVi is 
strong Where NorthVille is 
Weak and Northville is strong 
where Novi is Weak. The 
outcome should be deter­
mined by the ability of one 
team to flaunt the weakness 
of the other. 

Offensively, the edge has to 
go to NoVi. With the backfield 
chores being handled by 
" J i m m y V a n and the 
T r u c k i n g C o m p a n y , " the 
Wildcats should be able to 
score. A couple of long touch­
down runs by either or both 
VanWagner or Boyer are 
extremely likely. 

Nor thVi l l e ' s hopes in 
stopping the NoVi attack rest 
in the play of the lines. The 
Mustangs are large and ex­
perienced on their forward 
defensive wall , while NoVi's 
blockers are inexperienced 
and small. 

Perhaps the two finest 
players on the Nor thVi l l e 
team are co-captain B i l l 
Norton, who Will line up op­
posite Novi 's center, and -
tackle J i m Po r t e r f i e ld , a 
hard-working, 200 pound 
defensive tackle. Who is both 
quick and strong. 

The other Northville tackle, 
Ron Angove, is another ex­
perienced 190 pounder. The 
two N o v i guards p l ay ing 
opposite Po r t e r f i e ld and" 
Angove weigh 155 pounds 
each. 

The Weakness on Nor­
thville's line lies at the end 
positions - the area most 
frequently under attack by 
the poWer sweeps of the Wish­
bone format ion . The tWo 
Nor thVi l le s tar ters at 
defensive end - Tom Johnson 
and Tom Smith - are both 
starting for the first time this 
year and Will have an op­
portunity to prove the i r 
mettle in the first game by 
trying to stop the sweeps of 
VanWagner and Boyer. 

Another aspect of the NoVi 
attack often overlooked by 
opponents is their passing 
game. "We're a good passing 
t e a m , " declares Osborne, 

. " b u t nobody real izes i t 
' because we never have had to 
pass. A s soon as someone 
succeeds in s topping our 
runners, they'll find out how 
effective we can be in the 
air ." 

The number one N o V i 
receiver is John Pantalone, 
who w i l l in a l l probability be 
the assignment of Northville 
comerback and co-captain 
Steve Griggs. 

Offensively, the Mustangs 
should be able to move the 
baU against Novi 's defense, 
although they wi l l not be able 
to strike With any of the 
suddenness Which charac­
terizes the Novi attack. 

Again Northville's strength 
lies in its line. With .Angove at 
center, T i m Rice (6' 185) and 
Steve .Serkaian? (5'10", 200) 
at the guards, and B i l l Potter 

(5 ' i r ' 210 ) and Porterfield at 
the tackles, the Mustangs wi l l 
again be larger than their 
opponents. 

The Wildcat defensive line 
is considerably stronger than 
its' offensiVe line, however, 
and should be able to 
minimize the size difference. 
Kevin LaFleche has drawn 
the praise of Osborne for his 
Work at defensive tackle and, 
if he's lined up opposite 
Porterfield, could reduce the 
big Mustang's effectiveness 
more than any other lineman. 

The s t rength of N o v i ' s 
defense l ies in its two 
linebackers - VanWagner and 
Dave Brown. Both are hard 
hitters and VanWagner, in 
par t icu la r , accord ing to 
Osborne, blows the l id off a l l 
agility tests. 

The results should be that 
the Mustangs wi l l be able to 
move the ball small distances 
at a time on the ground and 

could conceivably launch a 
couple of long drives against 
the Wildcat defenders. 

The only problem with a 
ball control rffense as com­
pared with Novi's "b ig play" 
offense is that there is more 
margin for error. 

Another weapon which the 
Mustangs might employ ef­
fectively against the Wildcats 
is the forward pass. Last year 
Northville's most effective 
Weapon against Novi Was the 
pass, and With quarterback 
B i l l McDonald starting his 
second year at the helm of the 
Northville attack instead of 
his first game as Was the case 
in 1971, the passing should be 
much crisper. 

Gone is Jeff Moon, Nor­
thville's tough tight end in 
197l, but in SteVe Griggs, John 
Sherman, and Bar t Taylor, 
Shonta w i l l have capable 
receivers on the field. 

One final element that could 

play a role in the game is 
team emotion. The Mustangs 
played listlessly at time in 
stumbling to an 0-7-l season. 
Shonta hopes he has found an 
emotional leader this year in 
Norton. 

Novi has no questions about 
its ability to fire up for a 
game, hoWever. VanWagner . ' 
is a spirited leader, who lends ; 
his hard-nosed brand of play 
to his teammates. He puts out 
100 percent on the field and 
demands the same from his 
teammates. 

Miraculously Osborne has 
his Wildcat gridders going 
into the game thinking they're 
the underdogs. "Northvil le 's 
been practicing a l l summer," • 
said one Novi lineman, "But •-
we're out to show them that it : 
Won't do them any good 
Fr iday," . . 

The Mustangs, on the other ' 
hand, have some avenging to 
do. 

V o r t h v i l l e G o l f L e a g u e 

V a n d e n b e r g T o p s F i e l d 

Decor 

Nelson Schrader 

Psychologists, have for a 
long time been interested 
in the effects of color on our 
personality. And it is a fact 
that the colors you choose 
for a room go a long Way 
toward shaping your 
feelings about the room. 
Warm colors, cool colors, 
.exciting ones, quiet ones-
use them where you think 
they w i l l do the most good. 
Itfake use of colors as you 
would textures: suit the 
choice to the mood and to 
the furniture the room wi l l 
contain. 

When decorating make use 
of our serv ices . 
S C H R A D E R S ' S H O M E 
F U R N I S H I N G S , INC., l l l 
N . Center St.. NorthvUle, 
349-1838 and 825 Penniman, 
Plymouth. 4S3-8220 have a 
fine selection of furniture 
and carpeting for every 
room i n your home. 
K r o e h l e r , H e n r e d o n 
American ii Martinsvil le. 
L a - Z - B o y . St i f fe l and 
Simmons as well as others 
are available. 

H E L P F U L H I N T : 
Strong color fatigues the 
eye more than soft color: 
use it with caution. 

The Northville Golf League, 
one of the oldest in the area, 
brought its twenty-fourth 
season to a close Saturday 
With a tournament at Salem 
Hil ls Golf Club and a banquet 
at the Mayflower Hotel in 
Plymouth. 

The venerable Northville 
Golf League has operated 
continuously since being 
formed in 1948. 

T a k i n g honors i n the 
season-ending tournament 
was Pau l Vandenberg, who 
toured the par-72 Salem Hil ls 
Course in 73 shots to post the 
lowest gross score. 

E d Welch, Oscar Yung, and 
A l Horton shared lowest net 

score honors in the tour­
nament, as each man 
recorded a 65. 

F red Hartt Was closest to 
the pin on the sixth hole. While 
Tom Hughes took closest to 
the pin honors on the four­
teenth hole. B i l l Kinnaird 's 
drive on the seventh hole took 
honors as the longest of the 
day on that hole. 

Winners of awards for the 
season Were announced at the 
banquet by Secre tary-
Treasurer E d Welch. The 
team of P a u l Mack and 
Phelps Hines took first place 
for the season in team-play 
With 111 points, ten more than 
the second place duo of 
Emory Kimba l l and Dick 

N o v i S e t s P P & K 

Novi's Punt, Pass, and Kick 
Contest has been scheduled 
for Saturday, September 30, 
on the high school athletic 
field beginning at 9 a.m. 

As in past years, the contest 
is co-sponsored b'" the Novi 
Jaycees and St rk Hickey 
Ford West in Reoford. 

Participation in the com-
peition is open to boys 8-13 
years of age and registration 
forms are available at any 
Novi elementary school, as 
Well as the Middle School and 
from J a y c e e co-cha i rman 
Doug Thrush. 

There is no entrance fee. 
Boys are judged on the basis 
of distance and accuracy in 

kicking, passing, and punting 
a football. There is no body 
contact in the competition. 

John BroWn, p rog ram 
coordinator f rom Stark 
Hickey Ford , announced that 
N o v i ' s contest has been 
selected by the Ford Motor 
Company as the Tri-county 
area for publicity . Camera 
creWs Will be present to 
record the entirety of the local 
competition. 

Chairing the project for the 
N o v i Jaycees a re John 
Milnichuck and Doug Thrush. 

Shepherd. 
LoW gross score for the 

season Was recorded by 
Roger Duncan; Denny A r ­
mstrong Was the individual 
With the most earned points; 
and Ted Heckler Was named 
most improved player in the 
league. 

The "We tried" aWard Went 
to the team of Bob Bogart and 
Ph i l OgilVie. 

Members also elected of­
ficers for the 1973 season in 
Which the league Wi l l 
celebrate i ts S i l V e r A n ­
niversary. President is Ray 
Spear, Ray Wil l iams is Vice-
president, and E d Welch is 
secretary-treasurer. Denny 
Armstrong Was named to the 
board. 

N0RTHV1LLEG0LF 
LEAGUE 

F1NAL STANDINGS 
Maclt-Hiocs 
KimbaU-Shepherd 
Armstreng-Zhm 
Wolfe-HIeliaiic 
Duncan-R.wmisms 
B.WUiiams-Cibson 
Tischuck-BakkUIa 
Spear-Pctrock 
Vandcnlierg-Prpm 
Hugbei-Yung 
Hartt-Buonecome 
St. L-awrencc-Burkman 
Huff-Welch 
Wlstert-MacDonald 
Johnston-Khmaird 
tong-Heckier 
Woodmansce-Graasden 
Begart-Ogilvie 
..Sharpshoeters for tlie week 
Paul Mack witii a 33. Emory Kl 
with a 39. and Paul Vanden lierg wiUi a 
39. aeaest te the pin on the sixth green 
was Denny Armslreng. 

j' 
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were A, 

By Bob Moorie 

There's one newspaper in 
the world that Views sports 
happenings wi th a dif­
ference. The I R I S H 
T I M E S , on the defeat of 
Nijinsky in the A r c de 
Tr iomphe , wrote, " T o 
many Irish watchers at 
home, as well as those in 
Paris , the shock was like a 
conVulsion of nature and 
most empha t i ca l ly a 
nat ional disaster . Not 
since the death of 
Cuchu la in (a legendary 
Irish hero,), perhaps, has 
there been such a romantic 
tragedy," Now, if a l l the 
world Viewed sport in this 
way, would there be time 
for fighting? 

Now is the time to Visit 
M O O R E ' S M O T O R SPORT 
INC, 2l00l Pontiac Tra i l , 
So Lyon, 437-2688. We are 
an exc lus ive S U Z U K I 
dealership With a complete 
Une of the latest S U Z U K I 
motorcycles, accessoiies, 
parts , j acke ts , helmets, 
gloves, ec. Our service 
department is the finest--
offering fine lubrication; 
tune-ups. brake ad-
justments. Used vehicles 
at reasonable prices. Open 
lO ' t i l 8 Mon thru Sat -- Sun 
12 ' tU 6. 
H E L P F U L HINT: 
A combination tool that w i l l 
perform many workshop 
functions is often the an­
swer to the space problem 
in a crowded do-it-yourself 
area. 

V . F . W . 

P o s t 4 0 1 2 

a n d 

A m e r i c a n L e g i o n 

P o s t 1 4 7 

p r e s e n t 

V e t e r a n s C e m e t e r y 

C o m m i t t e e 

M i l l i o n a i r e ' s 

P a r t y 

F u n a n d P r i z e s ! 

F R I D A Y , S E P T . 1 5 

8 : 0 0 P . M . 

V . F . W. H A L L 

4 3 8 S. M a i n S t . 

N o r t h v i U e 
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C l a s s S e t 

F o r H u n t e r s 

A Hunter Safety program 
open to a l l children l l years 
old and older wil l begin 
Monday . September 18. 
N o r t h v i l l e R e c r e a t i o n 
Depar tment Head Robert 
P r o m announced last week. 

According to a new state 
law, completion of a hunter's 
safety course is required of a l l 
new hunters aged 12-16 before 
a license Will be issued. 

Although the law does not 
apply to previously licensed 
hunters, P r o m encouraged al l 
potential hunters to enroll in 
the course for their own 
betterment. 

Interested parties should 
regis ter at the Scout-
Recreation Building on Cady 
Street Saturday, September 
16, from 8 a.m. until 12 noon. 
Further information wil l be 
available at that time. 

New L o c a t i o n 

Northville Weight Watchers 
has announced that its 
regular meeting place has 
been changed. Classes have 
been moved from the Nursery 
Room of the Northville F i r s t 
Presbyterian Church to the 
church's Music Room. 

Times and days of the 
classes wi l l remain the same. 
Weigh in on Thursdays wi l l be 
at 7 p.m. with the lecture 
beginningat 7:30 On Fr iday 
Weigh in Will be at 9:30 a.m. 
and the lecture at 10 a.m. 

S e n i o r C i t i z e n H o u s i n g 

C i t y M a y B u y P r o p e r t y 

With federal approval of a 
major senior citizen housing 
development apparent ly a 
long Way off, the c i t y ' s 
housing commission and the 
counc i l a re exp lo r ing an 
alternate partial solution. 

F o l l o w i n g the recom­
mendation of the commission, 
the counc i l las t Week 
authorized negotiations for 
purchase of F a i r b r o o k 
property on Which it might 
bu i ld duplexes for senior 
citizens. 

Similar housing may be 
considered later in other parts 
of the c i ty , off ic ia ls 
suggested. 

The property present ly 
being considered is located at 
343 Fai rbro(* , just east of the 
Fa i rb rook Apar tmen t s . A 
house and two garages are 
located on the land. 

Cost of the property has 
been estimated at $25,000, 

although the city is having an 
appra i sa l made before 
making its offer to purchase. 

If the land is purchased, 
plans call for razing of the 
exis t ing bui ldings and 
erection of fac tory-bui l t 
duplexes wh ich reportedly 
would cost about 515,000 per 
unit. 

"We would propose that the 
house also be removed so that 
two duplexes rather than one 
could be built immediately," 
the commiss ion recom­
mended to the council. 

A c c o r d i n g to the com­
mission, the city's application 
for federal aid in development 
of a major project is stil l on 
file. This project, it con­
tended, " is the only way in 
which a large number of units 
can be built. 

"The problem now is that 
we have been unable to obtain 
any commitment as to when 

funds might" be available for 
Northville. We estimate that 
even if we receive funds in the 
near future it would take at 
least 18 months to complete 
the project. 

'"Since the need is urgent we 
have attempted to find a way 
to get started with strictly 
local funds, even if this meant 
just one or two duplexes the 
first year. Besides the needs 
we documented last year, the 
city manager has informed us 
of the need to relocate elderiy 
persons being displaced by 
various city projects." 

In recommending con­
struction of duplexes, the 
commiss ion emphasized, 
however, "that this is only a 
small first step in meeting the 
housing needs for Northville's 
elderly. We still consider a 
larger federa l ly funded 
project our number one 
priority." 

B U I L D I N G R A Z E D — T h e f i r e r u i n e d N o r t h V U l e 
L a u n d r y b u i l d i n g w a s r a z e d t h i s p a s t w e e k , 
l e a V i n g a n e m p t y l o t o n N o r t h C e n t e r S t r e e t , 

n o r t h o f R a n d o l p h . H a r v e y R i t c h i e , t h e o w n e r o f 
t h e b u i l d i n g , w h i c h w a s d e s t r o y e d b y f i r e i n M a y , 
s a y s t h e r e a r e n o p l a n s f o r t h e p r o p e r t y . 
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Anticipated public cri t icism 
was almost totally absent 
Thursday as proposed city 
master plan changes were 
unveiled at a meeting of the 
N o r t h v i l l e P l a n n i n g C o m ­
mission. 

The adver t ised publ ic 
meeting drew only a handful 
of citizens, most of Whom 
came just to listen. 

In presenting the findings of 
the master plan update 
c o m m i t t e e . C h a i r m a n 
Wallace Nichols, Who also is a 
p l a n n i n g c o m m i s s i o n 
member, emphasized that the 
proposed changes a re 
recommendations only and 
not decisions. 

T h e r e c o m m e n d a t i o n s 
concerned three sections of 
the city and, in actuality, 
suggested changes in existing 
zoning as opposed to broad 
conceptual modif icat ions 
suggested later by Planning 
Consultant Ron Nino. 

Specifically, the three areas 
included: 

A r e a I—Located i n the 
Western part of the city 
(excluding that portion West 
of Taft), from Seven Mi le on 
the south to Base Line on the 
north, and from Center on the 
east to the city limits. It ex­
cludes that portion defined in 
Area III but includes the F i sh 
Hatchery property. 

Area II—Located in the 
northeast part of the city, 
bounded by Base L i n e , 
Center, Rayson, the millpond 
and the C&O Railroad. 

Area III—A half-block area 
between Center and Wing and 
between Cady and an ex­
tended line of Wing Court. 

In area I, the committee 
recommends that a l l 
properties presently zoned R-
2 (two family dwellings) be 
changed to a R-1 (single 
family) classification. 

It suggests that a l l R-2 
properties in Area II be 
changed to R-2A (multiples), 
and it suggests that the half-
block Area III be changed to 
central business parking. 

No one offered any ob­
jection to the proposed zoning 
change in Area I, but several 
negative comments were 
made about the changes 
proposed in the other two 
areas. 

Led by Planning Chairman 
Thomas Wheaton, severa l 
persons questioned the 
wisdom of changing the 
zoning in Area II. 

M o r e spec i f i ca l ly , they 
chal lenged Nicho l s ' con­
tention that the proposed 
zoning change represented a 
more restrictive zoning, and 
they appeared to favor in­
stead a change from R-2 to R-
l as is proposed in Area I. 

Nichols conceded an R - l 
zoning might be preferable. 

Nevertheless, he explained 
that the R-2A is seen by the 
commit tee as a Way of 
protecting the character of 
the fine single family homes 
in the area While at the same 
time providing for develop­
ment of controlled apartment 
developments. 

Under R-2 zoning, single 
family homes may be con­
verted to duplex or boarding 
houses which in some cases 
here and in many cases in 
other communities has led to 
neighborhood deterioration, 
he explained. R-2 simply is 
not restrictive enough, he 
argued. 

On the other hand, while R-
2A does permit apartment 
developments, it provides for 
stiff controls. Such apartment 
dwellings could be developed 
as senior citizen housing, he 
suggested. 

Wheaton, who lives in Area 
II, contended R-2A is less 
restrictive in that it permits 
apar tment developments 
which a re not permi t ted 
under R-2. 

Both agreed that their 
major differences appeared 
to be over a hangup in in­
terpretation of the zoning law 
itself. 

Ci ty M a n a g e r F r a n k 
Ollendorff, who indicated he 
preferred R - l zoning for Area 
II, took the position that it 
might be better and easier to 
revise the wording of R-2 
zoning than to switch to R - 2 A . 

Nichols explained that his 
committee had to work within 
the framework of the existing 
zoning laws and therefore did 
not or could not concern itself 
with changes in law. 

Admitting the committee's 
r e c o m m e n d a t i o n s a r e 
phi losophical in nature, 
Nichols emphasized they are 
in keeping with the often 
heard pleas to "preserve the 
historical character" of the 
city. 

R - l in Area I, he said, would 
ensure that preservation. 

Concerning A r e a III , a 
citizen argued that some of 
the residents do not want to 
move no matter how finan­
cially profitable it might be to 
sel l their propert ies for 
parking. 

(The A r e a III r ecom­
mendation follows the pattern 
already envisioned by the city 
council, which is taking steps 

to acquire property south of 
Cady as part of its com­
mitment to provide parking 
for the Northville Square 
development). 

Implementat ion of this 
Area III recommendation was 
seen as a necessity in view of 
the c i t y ' s pa rk ing com­
mitment. 

Not ing this urgency, 
Planner Don Jones urged the 
city to immediately consider 
expanding upward for 
parking instead of expanding 
parking boundaries. 

"I fail to see the advantage 
of parking so far south on 
Wing ," he declared, pointing 
out that few would park and 
walk the proposed distance to 
the commercial area. 

In view of the urgency, it is 
essential that the idea of 
decked parking be considered 

immedia te ly before the 
parking boundaries are ex­
panded south to the Wing 
Court line across to Center, 
Jones said. 

One of the citizens in Area 
III, contended it would be 
illegal for the city to condemn 
property to provide parking 
for a privately owned com­
mercial development. 

However, Ollendorff said 
the proposed parking would 
be publ ic ly owned and 
therefore legal. Pointing out 
that the Northville Square is 
providing $200,000, about half 
the es t imated cost for 
parking, the city manager 
likened the situation to a 
property owner assessed for 
road paving. 

"Because he helped pay for 
the road doesn't permit him 
exclusive use to the road. 

Anybody wi l l be able to park 
in the area, not just customers 
of NorthVille Square," he 
said. 
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E v e r y w h e r e 

Hitting the books this fall 
may not be as popular as in 
past years. 

At least that appears to be 
the case in a number of 
M i c h i g a n colleges and 
univers i t ies , and the 
d e c r e a s i n g e n r o l l m e n t s 
reportedly are occurring in 
many schools throughout the 
nation. 

Community colleges (two 
year institutions) appear to be 
hardest hit . Schoolcraft 
Community College, located 
on the boundary of Northville, 
is one of them. 

" F e w e r students a re 
enrolled this year than Were 
enrolled last fall...It's the first 
time in the history of the 
college that this has hap­
pened," reported Schoolcraft 
President Dr . C. Nelson Grote 
this past week. 

More students are taking 
fewer credit hours than in 
previous years, he noted. 
" F r o m the standpoint of the 
c o m m u n i t y c o l l e g e 
philosophy, it 's good," Grote 
said. " I t shows we are 
reaching a lot of people who 
take one or two classes to 
meet a particular need or 
•interest, be it enrichment or 
for job improvement." 

However, the administrator 
said that financially, it 's a 
disadvantage. " W e are 
reimbursed by the state for 
the actual number of credit 
hours taken, not the total 
number of students enrolled. 

A year and a half ago, 
aVerage credit hours taken by 
each student was 9.3. In the 
spring, aVerage credit hours 
was 8.9, with about 9 credit 
hours or less expected to be 
the aVerage this fall. 

What effect is this having on E m p t y S e a t s W o n ' t b e U n u s u a l i n S o m e C o l l e g e C l a s s e s T h i s F a l l 

Officials at Wayne State 
University say that while it is 
too early to cite concrete 
evidence of decreas ing 
enrollments, it appears that 
the university wi l l experience 
a decrease. 

" T h i s isn ' t something 
unusua l , " expla ined P a u l 
Gullays, assistant registrar. 
"It's happening a l l over the 
country. The Word going 
around is that U - M , and 

' Michigan State are finding the 
same thing." 

G u l l a y s and W S U ad-
missions spokesmen noted 
that While f i r s t t ime ad-
missions appear to be holding 
their own, the number of 
returning students seems to 
be dropping. 

"Students seem to be 
disillusioned With h igher 
educa t ion ," G u l l a y s s a id . 
"Some, unfortunately, a re 
dropping out in their junior 
and senior years. Kids seem 
to be questioned the 
value...and perhaps that is 
because of the job market 
situation. After a l l , there are 
many degree students out on 
the streets Without jobs." 

"Even if We had a decrease 
We Wouldn't admit to i t , " 
laughed a spokesman in the 
admissions office at Eastern 
Michigan University. 

"No, seriously, I 'd tell you 
but it's just too early to say. 
We don't have the figures yet. 
Appl i ca t ions have s tayed 
about the same." 

No decreases a re an-
ticipated at the University of 
Michigan, according to Harr is 
Olson, assistant registrar. 

With classes just beginning, 
he said the university expects 
"about the same" enrollment 
as last year—34,537. No drop 
is expected in either the 
graduate or undergraduate 
schools, he said. 

While some specific fields 
may be down, others are up, 
Olson reported. He c i ted 
engineering as a school Where 
enrollment is down. On the 
other hand, the number of 
nursing school students is up. 
Students seem to be more 

interested in the soc i a l 
sciences today than in the 
hard sciences, he said. 

The university has been 
able to offset some of the 
decreases with additions of 
new programs. He cited a 
five-year degree program in 
medicine as an example of a 
new program this year that 
has generated renewed en­
thusiasm. 

Enrollment figures at U - M 
probably Won't be available 
un t i l October, Olson -
indicated. 

Oakland Community College 
officials predict enrollment 
Will "hold its own this year," 
With between 15,000 and 16,000 
students at O C C ' s four 
campuses and 22 extension 
centers. 

E n r o l l m e n t f i g u r e s , 
reported Betty Setz, director 
of community relations, are 
indefinite. With enrollment 
still in progress. No decrease 
in the number of instructors 
or in the number of hours 
taught is anticipated, she said. 

teachers? 
' 'We haven't laid off any 

of the full time instructors," 
Grote said, noting the college 
is under a contract With its 
teachers, "but fewer classes 
are being offered for teachers 
to instruct on supplemental 
contracts, classes which they 
teach over and above their 
normal class load. 

"Many classes are smaller 
and fewer par t t ime in­
s tructors are being em­
ployed," he continued. 

F u l l time faculty members 
are g iven preference on 
classes over part time in­
structors. 

Why the drop in 
enrollment? 

Grote cited several reasons, 
most hinging on the high 
unemployment rate in the 
metropolitan area. 

" A student who has a job 
is not as likely to give it up and 
come back to school," he said. 
"He can't be that sure he Will 
get as good a job when he's-
done with school as he now 
may have." 

Many students are also 
disenchanted w i t h higher 
education, which may not 
affect the community colleges 
as much as four-year 
colleges. 

"Students see people with 
bachelor degrees walking the 
streets after spending four 
years in college and think, 
' I ' m a l ready w a l k i n g the 
streets'," Grote commented. 

" A B A degree is not the 

magic credit card to em­
ployment that it Was a few 
years ago." 

Grote also cited the "year 
out" wh ich the younger 
generation seems to be taking 
after high school graduation. 

" N o t as many June 
graduates enter college in the 
fall as previously. They Want 
a year to travel. Work, rest 
and to get away from school 
for awhile. They're not ex­
cited or motivated to get into 
college r igh t a w a y , " the 
administrator s a i d 

Many involve themselves in 
public or social service Work 
While they figure out What 
they Want to do, he said. 

The change in the draft law 
has not had as much of an 
effect on enrollment this year 
as last, Grote said, noting 
male student populat ion 
decreased last yea r but 
female student numbers 
increased. 

Grote s a id communi ty 
colleges may not adequately 
be meeting the needs of 
groups of people, " w h i c h 
means modification, deletions 
and additions must be made 
in the program." 

Grote sa id that had 
Schoolcraft offered programs 
in radio logy technology, 
inhalation therapy and 
medical technology 'We would 

have fi l led the classes." 
He said the college has 

"neither the money nor the 
special facilities needed to 
conduct these courses. We 
w i l l have to make ad­
justments within the financial 

s t ructure or have added 
finances i f we are to offer 
these classes." 

To offset the potential 
decrease i n enrol lment , 
colleges have begun a more 
act iVe job of student 

recruitment. Grote said many 
haVe modi f ied entrance 
requirements and worked 
hard in the metropolitan area. 

"Schoolcraft spent more on 
advertising this year than at 
any other time," he said. "We 

hired an advertising f i rm and 
advertised on radio and in 
newspapers. It 's a more 
c o m m e r c i a l basis of 
recruitment than in the past, 
but this is the era in which We 
are l i v ing . " 
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We like doing thoughtful little things for our customers, so they 
enjoy saving with us just a little bit more! That's Why we're the 
first Savings and Loan in Michigan using resealable plastic envelopes 
at our drive-in Windows. They protect your transactions from wind, 
rain or snow, and the zipper top keeps coins from falliilg out. Y o u 
can use it over-and-over again for making deposits, or jiist about 
anything. Yes, "Where you save, does make a difference." 
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L A N S I N G — S o m e p e o p l e j u s t d o n ' t 
k n o w w h e n to t a k e n o f o r a n a n s w e r . 
F o r e x a m p l e , t h e r e ' s t h e M i c h i g a n 
l e g i s l a t u r e . A t p r e s e n t m e m b e r s o f 
t h e l e g i s l a t u r e a r e p r o h i b i t e d f r o m 
r u n n i n g f o r o r b e i n g a p p o i n t e d to a 
s t a t e o r l o c a l o f f i c e i n t h e m i d d l e o f 
t h e i r t e r m i n t h e l e g i s l a t u r e . T h i s 
m e a n s a l e g i s l a t o r c a n n o t r u n f o r a n 
o f f i c e s u c h a s m a y o r i n t h e m i d d l e o f 
h i s t e r m o r b e a p p o i n t e d to h e a d a 
s t a t e d e p a r t m e n t . 

T h e p r o h i b i t i o n w a s w r i t t e n i n t o 
t h e c o n s t i t u t i o n i n a n a t t e m p t to 
m a k e s u r e l a w m a k e r s p a y a t t e n t i o n 
to t h e i r j o b s a n d n o t u s e t h e i r 
l a w m a k i n g j o b to c r e a t e a c u s h y j o b 
f o r t h e m s e l V e s s o m e w h e r e i n s t a t e 
g o v e r n m e n t . 

S O M E L E G I S L A T O R S , u n ­
d e r s t a n d a b l y , d o n ' t t h i n k m u c h o f 
t h e p r o h i b i t i o n . I n 1968 t h e y p u t o n 
t h e b a l l o t a p r o p o s a l to r e p e a l i t . T h e 
p r o p o s a l l o s t . 

T h e y f o l l o w e d a g a i n t h i s y e a r , 
p u t t i n g a r e p e a l e r o n t h e b a l l o t i n t h e 
M a y 16 p r i m a r y . I t l o s t a g a i n . 

W e l l , y o u m i g h t s a y , i t ' s p r e t t y 
c l e a r t h e p e o p l e d o n ' t w a n t to g i v e 
u p t h a t p a r t i c u l a r c o n t r o l o n t h e 

l e g i s l a t u r e . T h e l a w m a k e r s w i l l 
p r o b a b l y w a i t a t l e a s t a f e w m o r e 
y e a r s b e f o r e t r y i n g to d o a n y t h i n g 
a b o u t i t a n y m o r e , r i g h t ? W r o n g . 

T H E B A L L O T S w e r e s c a r c e l y 
c o u n t e d w h e n m e m b e r s o f t h e 
l e g i s l a t i l r e s t a r t e d w o r k i n g o n 
a n o t h e r b a l l o t p r o p o s a l to w i p e o u t 
t h e r e s t r i c t i o n . 

A w a i t i n g a c t i o n w h e n t h e 
l a w m a k e r s c o m e b a c k f o r t h e i r f a l l 

O n e o f V a n d e r L a a n ' s f e l l o w 
R e p u b l i c a n s , W i l l i a m B a l l e n g e r o f 
O v i d , s e e s t h e m a t t e r d i f f e r e n t l y , 
h o w e v e r . 

" I f a n y t h i n g t u r n s o f f t h e v o t e r s , 
t u r n s t h e m a g a i n s t u s , i t i s t h e 
a r r o g a n c e w e d i s p l a y w h e n w e c o m e 
r i g h t b a c k w i t h t h i s a f t e r t h e y 
t u r n e d i t d o w n , " h e s a i d . " W e r e v e a l 
a k i n d o f s e l f i s h i n t e r e s t w h e n w e d o 
t h i s t y p e o f t h i n g . I t o u g h t to b e a 

s e s s i o n i s a p r o p o s e d c o n s t i t u t i o n a l l o n g , l o n g t i m e b e f o r e w e g o to t h e 
a m e n d m e n t w h i c h w o u l d a l l o w t h e m v o t e r s w i t h t h i s a g a i n . " 
to r u n f o r a l l o t h e r o f f i c e s i n t h e 
m i d d l e o f a t e r m , b u t w o u l d n o t l e t 
t h e m b e a p p o i n t e d t o a j o b . I f i t i s 
a p p r o v e d , i t w i l l g o o n t h e N o v e m b e r 
b a l o t . 

A P R I M E B A C K E R o f t h e n e w 
v e r s i o n i s S e n a t e R e p u b l i c a n L e a d e r 
R o b e r t V a n d e r L a a n o f G r a n d 

A D E M O C R A T w h o b a c k e d t h e 
i d e a o f p u t t i n g t h e p r o p o s a l o n t h e 
b a l l o t a g a i n d i d n ' t t h i n k t h e a p ­
p o i n t i v e p a r t o f t h e a m e n d m e n t h a d 
a n y t h i n g to d o w i t h i t s d e f e a t . 

" I t h i n k t h e r e ' s j u s t a n a t t i t u d e 
a b o u t s t a t e l e g i s l a t o r s t h a t p e r ­
v a d e s , " h e s a i d . " V o t e r s j u s t h a v e a 

R a p i d s . H e b e l i e v e s v o t e r s k n o c k e d b a d f e e l i n g a b o u t u s . " 
the p r o p o s a l d o w n i n M a y b e c a u s e o f W H E R E C A N y o u g e t t h e m o s t -
t h e a p p o i n t i v e p r o v i s i o n i n i t . c o u r t e o u s , p r o m p t , e f f i c i e n t s e r v i c e 

" I t h i n k a l o t o f t h e m t h o u g h t t h i s i n s t a t e g o v e r n m e n t ? T h e q u e s t i o n 
m e a n s s o m e l e g i s l a t o r s w o u l d b e m a y b e o p e n to a r g u m e n t , b u t a 

" o n e 
a n d 

i n v o l v e d i n p o l i t i c a l p a y o f f j o b s , " h e 
s a i d r e c e n t l y . V a n d e r L a a n c o n t e n d s 
t h e c u r r e n t l a w i s " j u s t p l a i n 
d i s c r i m i t a t o r y " a g a i n s t l ^ i s l a t o r s . 

g r e a t c a s e c a n b e b u i l t f o r 
p a r t i c u l a r g r o u p : s e c r e t a r i e s 
s t a f f p e o p l e f o r l e g i s l a t o r s . 

F o r t h e m o s t p a r t , t h e s e a r e w e l l 

B a h s o n R e p o r t 

W a g e C o n t r o l s C o o l U n i o n D e m a n d s 

W E L L E S L E Y H I L L S , M a s s . -
T h e f a c t t h a t w a g e - p r i c e c o n t r o l s 
a r e o p e r a t i n g w i t h s o m e d e g r e e of 
s u c c e s s i s h a v i n g a q u i e t i n g e f f e c t o n 
u n i o n - m a n a g e m e n t n e g o t i a t i o n s . 

T h e r e a p p e a r s t o b e l e s s 
a g g r e s s i v e n e s s o n t h e p a r t o f l a b o r 
r e p r e s e n t a t i v e s t h a n a t a n y t i m e i n 
r e c e n t y e a r s . T h i s m a y b e t r a c e d , a t 
l e a s t i n p a r t , to t h e r e a l i z a t i o n t h a t 
b i t t e r s t r i k e s f o r w a g e c o n c e s s i o n s 
g r e a t e r t h a n t he -5 .5 p e r c e n t c e i l i n g 

. a r e . p o i n i t l ^ s s i l i I g e a n y l a r g e r r a i s e s 
w i l l u n ( J o u b t e d l y b e r e j e c t e d ' b y the 
P a y B o a r d o r b y t h e C o n s t r u c t i o n 
I n d u s t r y S t a b i l i z a t i o n C o m m i t t e e . 

A n d t h e r e a r e o t h e r f a c t o r s t h a t 
a r e m a k i n g n e g o t i a t o r s s o m e w h a t 
m o r e c a u t i o u s t h a n u s u a l . F o r o n e 
t h i n g , 1972 i s , a l l i n a l l , a n u n -
d r a m a t i c b a r g a i n i n g y e a r w i t h f e w 
i n d u s t r i e s i n v o l v e d t h a t m i g h t b e 

e x p e c t e d to b l a z e n e w t r a i l s f o r 
o t h e r l i n e s to t r y to f o l l o w . 

T h i s w a s , o f c o u r s e , a n e s p e c i a l l y 
g o o d y e a r f o r a w a g e - c o n t r o l t r y o u t , 
g i v i n g b o t h m a n a g e m e n t a n d l a b o r a 
r e l a t i v e l y s u b d u e d p e r i o d i n w h i c h 
to s e e h o w r e l a t i o n s m i g h t r e s p o n d 
a s c t l r b s t a k e h o l d . 

E V E N i n t h e b u i l d i n g f i e l d , w h e r e 
t h e r e h a v e b e e n s k y r o c k e t i n g p a y 
r a t e s f o r a n u m b e r o f y e a r s , t h e 
s i t u a t i o n i s s h o w i n g f e w e r 
f i r e w o r k s . . D u r i n g t h e f i r s t s i x 
m o n t h s o f 1971, a c c o r d i n g to L a b o r 
D e p a r t m e n t f i g u r e s , f i r s t - y e a r 
r a i s e s i n m u l t i y e a r p a c t s w i t h i n t h e 
c o n s t r u c t i o n i n d u s t r y s h o t u p 13.3 
p e r c e n t o n a v e r a g e . F o r t h e f i r s t s i x 
m o n t h s of t h i s y e a r , t h e r e w a s a f a r 
m o r e r e s t r a i n e d 8 p e r c e n t a d v a n c e . 

C o n t r o l s a r e n o t a l o n e i n e x e r t i n g 
d o w n p r e s s u r e o n w a g e g a i n s i n 

T h e B I G 

S N O 

S H O W 

• 5 t h A n n u a l 

G r e a t e r M i c h i g a n 

S n o w m o b i l e & W i n t e r 

S p o r t s S h o w 

C O B O H A L L 

S E P T . 1 5 - 1 7 

T h e B I G 

S N O 

S H O W • T h e f i r s t a n d l a r g e s t 

s h o w i n t h e U . S . 

H O U R S : F r i i d a y a n i j S a t u r i j a y - N o o n to 11 p.rr i . 

S u n d a y - N o o n to 10 p . m . 
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D u p o n t 5 0 1 N y l o n ^ 

p e a v y N y l o n S h a g s ^ 

P o l y e s t e r S h a g ^ 

c o n s t r u c t i o n . S o f t e n i n g i n t h e -
b u i l d i n g i n d u s t r y f o r s o m e l o c a l i t i e s 
a n d s t i l l h i g h u n e m p l o y m e n t h a v e 
c o n t r i b u t e d . S i n c e r u n a w a y p a y 
r a t e s i n t h e f i e l d h a v e b e c o m e t h e 
r u l e , c o n s u m e r o p p o s i t i o n t o 
e x o r b i t a n t b u i l d i n g c o s t s h a s 
b e c o i i ^ e a p o w e r f u l f o r c e . 

O n e r e s u l t o f t h i s h a s b e e n a r a p i d 
a n d f a r - r a n g i n g m o v e a w a y f r o m 
t h e u s e o f u n i o n l a b o r , p a r t i c u l a r l y 
i n o u t l y i n g s e c t i o n s w h e r e n o n u n i o n 
c o n t r a c t o r s a r e m o r e c o m m o n . T h i s 
c a n , o f c o u r s e , b r i n g s a v i n g s i n 
h o m e b u i l d i n g . 

B E C A U S E o f t h e i m p a c t o f w a g e 
c o n t r o l s a n d t h e g e n e r a l s l o w i n g of-
t h e p a c e o f w a g e i n c r e a s e s , m o r e 
a n d m o r e u n i o n s a r e p l u m p i n g f o r 
s h o r t e r c o n t r a c t s , p r e f e r a b l y f o r 
t h o s e e x t e n d i n g o n l y o n e y e a r . T h e n , 
i f c o n t r o l s a r e s t i l l o n a t e x p i r a t i o n 
t i m e , a n o t h e r s i n g l e - y e a r 
a g r e e m e n t c a n b e s o u g h t t m d e r 
p e r m i s s i b l e c e i l i n g s . 

B u t s h o u l d c o n t r o l s h a v e b e e n 
r e m o v e d - - - o r a b a t e d — b y e x ­
p i r a t i o n , m a k e - u p ' r a i s e s c o u l d b e 
s o u g h t a t o n c e , w i t h o u t w a i t i n g f o r 
a i i o t h e r y e a r o r t w o a s w o u l d b e t h e 
c a s e u n d e r a m u l t i y e a r a g r e e m e n t . 

A l t h o u g h S e n a t o r M c G o v e m h a s 
s t a t e d t h a t h e w i l l r e m o v e c o n t r o l s 
w i t h i n n i n e t y d a y s i f h e i s e l e c t e d , 
m o s t u n i o n a n d m a n a g e m e n t of­
f i c i a l s s e e m to b e g o i n g o n t h e 
a s s u m p t i o n t h a t t h e s i g n i f i c a n t 
n e g o t i a t i o n s o f 1 9 7 3 — i n c l u d i n g t h o s e 
i n t h e e l e c t r i c a l , a u t o , a n d t r u c k i n g 
i n d u s t r i e s — w i l l t a k e p l a c e w i t h 
c u r b s s t i l l i n e f f e c t . 

T h e f a c t i s t h a t t h e y d o n o t e x p e c t 
e i t h e r p a r t y to r e m o v e a n t i - i n f l a t i o n 
b a n s a t t h e s t a r t o f a y e a r t h a t 
p r o m i s e s to s e e s o m u c h a c t i v i t y a t 
b a r g a i n i n g t a b l e s i n p a c e - s e t t i n g 
b u s i n e s s l i n e s . 

L A B O R R E L A T I O N S a r e l i k e l y to 
b e l e s s m i l i t a n t a s l o n g a s c u r b s 
a p p e a r to b e w o r k i n g s u c c e s s f u l l y . 
U n i o n s a n t i c i p a t e g e t t i n g w h a t e v e r 
p a y d e m a n d s a r e p e r m i t t e d u n d e r 
t h e g u i d e l i n e s w i t h o u t t h e n e c e s s i t y 
f o r a k n o c k d o w n b a t t l e . 

I f t h e u n e x p e c t e d h a p p e n s a n d 
c o n t r o l s a r e c o m p l e t e l y w i t h d r a w n , 
l o o k f o r f i r e w o r k s o n t h e l a b o r f r o n t . 

g r o o m e d — o f t e n v e r y p r e t t y -
b r i g h t w o m e n o f a l l a g e s , s i z e , c o l o r 
( a n d p r e s u m a b l y c r e e d s ) , w h o s e j o b 
d e p e n d s o n t h e j o b o f t h e b o s s : a 
S e n a t o r o r R e p r e s e n t a t i v e . . A n d a n 
i m p o r t a n t a s p e c t o f t h e i r j o b i s to 
m a k e t h e p e r s o n t h e y w o r k f o r l o o k 
a s e f f e c t i v e a s p o s s i b l e . 

L E G I S L A T O R S a r e v e r y b u s y 
p e o p l e . B u t t h e y m u s t b e a v a i l a b l e 
•to t h e i r c o n s t i t u e n t s r o r u n t h e r i s k 
of i n c u r r i n g w r a t h w i t h s u b s e q u e n t 
l o s s o f v o t e s . T h e l e g i s l a t o r ' s "staff 
m u s t f i l l i n w h e n t h e l ^ i s l a t o r 
c a n n o t m e e t t h e s e p e o p l e a n d t h i s i s 
m o s t o f t h e t i m e . 

S o t h e s e c r e t a r y m e e t s y o u w i t h a 
s m i l e , e x p l a i n s w h y t h e l e g i s l a t o r i s 
n o t a v a i l a b l e a n d d o e s h e r b e s t to 
h e l p . T h i s m i g h t b e a s s i m p l e a s 
t a k i n g a m e s s a g e . O f t e n i t i s no t . I f 
i n f o r m a t i o n i s r e q u i r e d , s h e w i l l 
s e e k i t , a n d s h e i s e x p e c t e d t o k n o w 
w h e r e m u c h o f i t i s a v a i l a b l e . S h e 
c a n m a k e a p p o i n t m e n t s i f y o u w a n t 
t h e m . S h e i s e x p e c t e d to b e w e l l i n ­
f o r m e d a b o u t m a n y t h i n g s a n d to b e 
a b l e t o d e a l w i t h p e o p l e e f f e c t i v e l y . 
N e a r l y a l l t h e s e c r e t a r i e s w h o h o l d 
j o b s l i k e t h i s f u l f i l l t h e i r d u t i e s 
a d m i r a b l y . 

U N L I K E m o s t s t a t e e m p l o y e s , 
t h e s e a r e n o t c o v e r e d b y c i v i l s e r ­
v i c e . L o g i c a l l y e n o u g h , t h i s r e s u l t s 
f r o m t h e k n o w l e d g e t h a t e a c h 
l e g i s l a t o r s h o u l d h a v e t h e 

p r e r o g a t i v e o f s e l e c t i n g h i s o w n s t a f f 
•people . . A n d s i n c e s o m e l ^ i s l a t o r s 
a r e n o t a r o u n d f o r m a n y y e a r s , t h e 
w a y m u s t b e l e f t o p e n f o r t h o s e w h o 
h o l d o f f i c e . 

W h e n o n e c o m p a r e s t h e e f ­
f i c i e n c i e s a n d c o u r t e s i e s t h e p u b l i c 
r e c e i v e s f r o m t h i s g r o u p , i t i s e a s y t o 
w o n d e r " i f a l l s t a t e g o v e r n r h e n t 
m i g h t b e i m p r o v e d a g r e a t d e a l i f 
t h e r e w e r e m u c h l e s s c i v i l s e r v i c e ; 
o r i f c i v i l s e r v i c e r e g u l a t i o n s l e f t 
m u c h m o r e r o o m f o r l e s s e f f i c i e n t , 
l e s s c o u r t e o u s , l e s s c o n s i d e r a t e 
g o v e r n m e n t e m p l o y e s t o b e 
r e p l a c e d m o r e e a s i l y t h a n a t 
p rese i l t . - ' • • ' - . i - . -
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Three major finds, liliked to 
prehistoric Indians in the 
Upper Peninsula and 17th 
Century Indian and French 
occupations of M a c k i n a c 
Straits area prior to the 
founding of Detroit in 1701, 
resulted from extensiVe ar­
chaeological digs and field 
surveys this summer by 
M i c h i g a n Sta te Un ives i t y 
faculty and students. 

The finds Were: 
—Copper-Working tools, 

found in Ontonag-on County 
of the Upper Peninsula, used 
by p reh i s to r ic Indians to 
shape the legendary Lake 
Superior copper at about 3500 
B . C . about the t ime the 
pharaohs uni ted E g y p t ' s 
Upper and LoWer Kingdoms 
and began bu i ld ing the 
pyramids. 

—The ancient cellar at St. 
Ignace in Which a priest said 
he had found in 1877 the 
remains of the famous Jesuit 
missonary and exp lo re r 
Jacques Marquette, repor­
tedly buried there by his 
Huron Indian parishioners in 
1677. 

—EVidences near the 
Marquette Mission site in St. 
Ignace of a large Huron 
Vil lage shoWn on a 1684 map 
by the French explorer Baron 
de LaHontan. 
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In addition to the major 
finds, the M S U creWs on digs 
and field surveys found ar­
tifacts from the Archaic (1500 
B.C.) and Late Woodland (600 
to 1000 A.D. ) prehistory eras, 
and additional 18th and 19th 
Century artifacts. The finds 
Were made in Emmet, An­
trim, Charlevoix, Leelanau, 
and Cheboygan counties, 
Mackinac Island, and in the 
Waters of Lake Michigan just 
north of F o r t 
Michil imackinac. 

Dr . Charies E . Cleland, 
associate professor of an­
thropology and curator of 
anthropology at the M S U 
Museum, led the field survey 
Which found the ancient tools 
in the Copper County. They 
also surveyed in four other 
counties. 

Dr . L y l e M . Stone, Who 
directed that archaeological 
digs and field surveys on both 
sides of the Mackinac Straits 
and on Mackinac Island, is an 
instructor in anthropology at 
M S U , an anthropology 
research assistant at the M S U 
M u s e u m , and staff ar­
chaeologist for the Mackinac 
Is land Sta te P a r k C o m ­
mission. 

Others participating Were 
M S U anthropology students 
and graduates, volunteers 
f rom the M i c h i g a n A r ­
chaeological Society, the 
Michi l imackinac Historical 
Society of St. Ignace, staff 
members o f the H i s t o r y 
D i v i s i o n of the M i c h i g a n 
Depar tmen t of State, 12 
Det ro i t members of the 
A m e r i c a n S k i n "Divers 
Association, and other in­
dividual volunteers. 

Dr. Cleland said leads from 
Upper Peninsula residents led 
his creW of six persons to 
" d o z e n s " of sites of 
prehistoric Indian mining pits 
in Ontonagon County, near 
Mass and Rockland east of the 
Ontonagon RiVer. 

They found three rounded 
cobble stones. Varying in size 
from that of a potato to bigger 
than a football , Which had 

been used to batter the ra 
copper found in the area. The 
cobbles had grooves around 
them, indicating they had 
been suspended for use. 

C l e l a n d gathered i n ­
formation on each site, in 
order that they can be placed 
on the National Register of 
Historic Sites, and so bi 
preserved. Age of the stone 
tools Was es t imated by 
Cleland at 3500 B . C . to 1000 
B . C . 

Dr . Stone said the evidences 
found at the M a r q u e t t e 
Mission site, north of St. 
Ignace on the north mainlam 
of the Mackinac Straits, Was 
the first f i rm evidence there 
of occupation by Indians and 
French in the 17th Century. 
The tWo restored forts. For t 
M i c h i l i m a c k i n a c i n 
Mackinaw City, and For t 
M a c k i n a c on M a c k i n a c 
Island, are l8 th C e n t u r y ^ ^ 
reproductions. 

Marquette's Bu r i a l Site 
"We have enough evidence 

noW to Warrant p lanning 
major restoration Work, at 
and near the M a r q u e t t e 
Mission site,;; he said. " I am 
confident We have found t h e ^ . , ^ 
ancient c e l l a r i n Which 
Marquette Was buried ac­
cording the Jesuit missionary 
reports and a Written record 
by the priests who dug up the 
bones in 1877. In addition, I 
believe We have found part of 
the old Huron Vil lage W h i c J i ' * ^ 
stood next to Marquette's 
mission. 

Stone Was aided at the 
straits by Dr . James Fi t t ing, 
Who acted as field survey 
director, and director of the 
mission dig, and Who Will j o i n ^ - -
the Michigan History Divisioft 
of the Michigan Department 
of State as staff archaeologist 
in September. 

The Marquette site Was 
almost completely excavated. 
Stone said. Three neW Wall 
trenches Were found Whicji 
appear to belong to a I T t n ^ 
Century structure. The fin-
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A l o n g t h e C a m p a i g n T r a i l 

G i l m o r e 

Wayne County C i r c u i t 
Judge Horace W. Gilmore, 
nominee for the Michigan 
Supreme Cour t , has 
established a new precedent 
for judicial candidates. 

The judge is seeking 
election on a political plat­
form - of 59 Words. 

Gilmore, Who has served on 
the Circuit bench for 16 years, 
announced the platform in his 
acceptance speech after 
Winning the D e m o c r a t i c 
P a r t y nominat ion at the 
G r a n d R a p i d s Convent ion 
(August 27). 

Judge G i l m o r e sa id , in 
part: 

"Candida tes for j u d i c i a l 
office are elected as non­
partisans. That is the law. 
And so be it. But there is 
nothing to prohibit a can­
didate, even for the 
Supreme. Cour t , f rom 
adopting a 'poli t ical plat­
form.' 

" M y platform represents 
neariy 200 years of Amer ican 
history and the studied effort 
of 144 Michigan men and 
Women, •Democra t s , and 
Republicans, Who Worked on 
it for some 11 months. 

"Here is my platform - the 
entire 59 Words. 

" ' A l l political poWer is 
inherent i n the people. 
Government is instituted for 
their equal benefit, security 
and protection. 

" ' No person (and that 
ce r t a in ly means Women) 
shall be denied the equal 
protection of the laWs; nor 
shall any person bedenied the 
enjoyment of his c iv i l , or 

, po l i t i c a l r i gh t s or be 
discriminated against in the 
exercise thereof because of 
re l ig ion , race , color or 
national or igin." 

" I ' m sure you recognize 
those Words - f rom the 
Declaration of Rights of the 
Michigan Constitution of 1963, 
Written by the bi-partisan 
delegates to Con-Con. 

" W i l l I l ive up to that 
platform is electecl? 

" A s a Ju s t i c e of the 
Suprememe Court, I ' l l take an 
oath on i t . " 

Judge G i l m o r e Was 
nominated at the ConVention 
by Secretary of State Richard 
H . A u s t i n . T h e other 
Democratic Supreme Court 
Candidate , nomina ted by 
U A W President Doug Eraser, 
is Recorder's Judge Robert L . 
EVans. 

A Celebrity Celebration for 
Judge Gi lmore , to make his 
nomination, is being held 
Thursday , September 14, 
from 5 to 7 p.m. at the 
SaVoyard C l u b , B u h l 
Building, Detroit. 

Co-chairmen for the affair 
are Michael Ber ry , chairman 
of the Wayne County Road 
Commission and Joseph B . 
S u l l i v a n , Wayne County 
Clerk. 

G r i f f i n 

U . S. Senator Robert P . 
G r i f f i n ( R - M i c h ) has 
reiterated his opposition to 
the proposed abandonment of 

rail car ferry service across 
the Straits o f Mackinac. 

In a letter to George M . 
Stafford, chairman of the 
I n t e r s t a t e C o m m e r c e 
Commission, Senator Griffin 
said the abandonment of the 
line Would result in both short 
and long-term economic 
losses for the surrounding 
region. 

The ICC is considering a 
request from the Mackinac 
Transportation Co., Which is 
jointly owned by the Penn 
Cen t ra l and Soo L i n e 
railroads, for permission to 
discontinue operations. Last 
week an ICC examiner sub­
mitted a report to the Com­
mission recommending ap­
proval of the request. 

Two local area men are 
among the 29 goVernment, 
ciVic, business and religious 
leaders Who haVe accepted 
positions on the (Robert) 
Griffin Club Board intent on 
re-election of the Republican 
Senator. 

They include Wi l l i am F . 
M c L a u g h l i n of N o r t h V i l l e , 
chairman of the Michigan 
Repub l i can State C e n t r a l 
Committee, and State Senator 
Car i Purse l l of Plymouth. 

M c G o v e r n 

F u l l of enthus iasm for 
sweeping out old politics and 
policies and bringing in the 
new, the N o r t h V i l l e a rea 
M c G o v e r n for P r e s i d e n t 
Committee has launched its 
pre-election Work. 

The committee, an official 
arm of the local Democratic 
Party, had a recent meeting 
at the home of ChairWoman 
Annabel Schaupner, in North­
ville ToWnship. 

"The focus of the meeting," 
said Mrs . Schaupner, "Was on 
getting out the vote for 
McGovern. There is a great 
reservoir of people in the 
N o r t h v i l l e a rea Who a re 
unsatisf ied With P r e s i d e n t 
Nixon, but are hesitant to 
back McGovern . We must 
reach these people With 
McGovern's message." 

C o m m i t t e e m e m b e r 
Township Trustee, added, 
"We plan to have a Voter 
registration drive so that as 
many as possible of the new 
people in the area can get out 
and vote. We think McGovern 
Will get a majority of that 
vote." 

Mrs . Schaupner said the 
committee plans to organize 
an aggressive campaign for 
M c G o v e r n , With the f i r m 
belief that he can carry the 
NorthVille area as Well as the 
state if enough Work is done— 
if the message is spread With 
vigor and enthusiasm. 

Among the projects the 
committee plans are these: a 
Voter Registration Dr ive to 
register new voters before the 
October 6 deadline, a fund 
raising ra l ly ; advertising in 
local publications; providing 
speakers to c lubs , c i v i c 
organizat ions and other 
groups; and en l i s t ing 
volunteers to distribute in­
formation and literature. 

Another major function of 
the commit tee , exp la ined 
Mrs . Schaupner, is to support 

local Democratic candidates 
in their fall campaigns. 

" W e think that L a r r y 
Vandermolen has an excellent 
chance to be elected toWnship 
supervisor, and we Will help 
him in that race, " says Mrs . 
Schaupner. "We Will give the 
same support to Tom Curran 
and Gene Guido in the trustee 
race, and to Mike F r i ce for 
toWnship clerk, " she added. 

Persons Wishing to donate 
t ime or money for the 
M c G o v e r n campa ign may 
cal l 349-6459. Letters can be 
addressed to : McGovern 
C o m m i t t e e , G e n e r a l 
Delivery, Northville, 48167. 

Democrat's Wayne Second 
Poli t ical Action Committee of 
750 South M a i n Street, 
Plymouth, because of it's 
cent ra l ized loca t ion , an­
nounced this Week it Will 
cover Northville, Plymouth, 
and Canton area. 

Interested residents of 
Northville ToWnship may also 
contact Mrs . Thomas Curran, 
regard ing toWnship can­
didates, L a r r y VanderMolen, 
Tom Curran, Mike Fr ice , and 
Eugene Guitlo. 

Named as coordinators are 
A n n a b e l S h a u p n e r -
McGovern; Robert Crump-
ton-Stempien and M i l l e r ; and 
Lar ry VanderMolen-toWnship 
candidates. 

P a t t e r s o n 

L . B rooks Pa t te r son , 
Repub l i can candidate for 
Oakland County Prosecutor , 
today charged that his 
Democra t i c opponent " i s 
hatching hasty, McGovem-
like proposals on an almost 
one-a-Week basis to cover his 
poor. performance over the 
past three and one-half 
years." 

Patterson said his cri t icism 
was t r iggered by " m y 
Democratic opponent's an­
nouncement Thursday of a 
crime tax on traffic offenders, 
misdemeanants and felons. 
It's a publicity g immick ." 

S a i d P a ^ r s o n , " In July, he 
suggestedjail penal t ies be 
e l i m i j n a t e d f o r 
misdemeanors, but admitted 
upon questioning that he had 
not considered What Would 
happen if the indigent could 
not pay the fine. NoW he 
suggests adding an additional 
tax to the fine. But s t i l l has not 
considered' the person Who 
cannot or Will not pay. 

' 'Now that the publicity is 
over for the ' n o - j a i l ' 
proposal- is he dropping that 
one in favor of his latest 
campaign program?" 

Pa t te r son c r i t i c i z e d his 
opponent for " h i s phony 
campa ign programs—just 
like in 1968." Two months 
before the election in 1968, he 
proposed a crack '.'felony 
squad" be developed to handle 
the tough felony casds, Pa -
terson sa id . " I t Was 
publ ic i ty stunt pure and 
simple—forgotten after the 
election. Had he carried that 
program through, he Wouldn't 
be losing the important cases 
today." 

Patterson Went on to say, 
" F o r three and one-half years 
We hear nothing from the 
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"The money Would then be 
used by the school district in 
which the defendant is con­
victed, both for increase in the 
quality of education, and in 
the long run. for a decrease in 
cr ime." 

P lunke t t expla ined the 
proposal Will encompass a l l 
those defendants Who are 
given fines or probation. 

O a k l a n d C o u n t y 
P r o s e c u t i n g A t t o r n e y , 
Thomas G. Plunkett, Was 
elected to the board of 
directors of the Prosecuting 
At torneys Assoc ia t ion of 
M i c h i g a n , at the 
A s s o c i a t i o n ' s 45th A n n u a l 
Convention. P A A M Was 
formed in 1928 under spon­
sorship of Attorney General 
Wilber M . Brucker. 

R a y m o n d 

Sensitivity to constituent 
opinions is to be a key to his 
campa ign , E l d o n R . 
R a y m o n d , 19th D i s t r i c t 
Democratic candidate-ior the 
Wayne County B o a r d of 
commissioners, has stated. 

" I believe it is very im­
portant that your county 
commissioner understand the 
needs of not only the people of 

Wayne County, but more im­
portantly he should know the 
feelings of. the citizens of 
Livonia and l Northville and 
What they like and don't l ike 
as its relates to Wayne County 
government and its services.' ' 

Raymond cited an example 

of this sensitivity: 

"Taxpayers of Livonia and 
N o r t h v i l l e , " he declared , 
"are not interested in helping 
finance, through their tax 
dollars, \ a new stadium in 
doWntbWn Det ro i t for 
millionaire Tiger oWner John 
Fetzer." 

He pledged "to keep my 
mind open to the feelings of 
the citizens of this district.. ." 

S t e m p i e n 

A new laW Which Was in­
troduced by the State 
Representative, Marv in R . 
S t e m p i e n ( D - L i V o n i a -
NorthViUe) to expand the 
home-buying market to cover 
al l young adults has been 
signed into laW by the 
Governor. "Although this new 
law Will make a number of 
important and needed 
changes i n the Proba te 
Code," Stempien said, "one of 
its key features is a provision 
Which expands the home-
buying market to cover a l l 
young adults." 

The Stempien laW noW 
makes the same home-buying 
rights available to unmarried 
persons 18 years old and older 
as those formerly limited to 
those 21 and older. Young 
adults under 21 had formerly 
needed spec ia l cour t 
peti t ions, bonds, notices, 
inventories, accountings and 
confirmations in order to 
obtain a home mortgage. The 
legislation enlarges an earlier 
laW, also sponsored by 

Majority Leader Stempien, 
Which opened home buying to 
married persons betWeen 18 
and 21 years of age and 
eliminated the need to hire an 
attorney for P r o b a t e 
proceedings. 

"The Legislature last year 
passed the Age of Majority 
Act, Which 1T1ade young adults 
18 to 21 years of age legal 
adu l t s , " S tempien s tated. 
"This latest legislation brings 
state probate statutes in the 
area of home mortgages into 
conformity With the concept 
of the Age of Majority Act . It 
recognizes that young adults 
are also legally adults When it 
comes to buying a home." He 

added, ' i f these young people 
can vote, serve in the armed 
forces and exercise adult 
rights and responsibilities in 
other areas, they must also 
have the same home-buying 
rights Jtnd poWer as any other 
adult." 

Stempien, a candidate for 
the U.S. Congress in the 
S e c o n d D i s t r i c t , 
acknoWledged that the 
number of unmarried persons 
18 years old and older Who 
Want to and are able to buy 
homes is c o m p a r a t i v e l y 
s m a l l . However," 
he pointed out, "Probate 
Judges have reported that 
there have been many in­
stances in Which persons 
under 21 Were in a position to 
buy a home, yet had difficulty 
in doing so because they Were 
unmarried and not 21 years 
old. M y legislation ends the 
discrimination against these 
young adults." 

Prosecutor's Office. Now, just 
before the election, the in­
cumbent is threshing about 
trying to divert the public's 
attention f rom the poor 
performance of his office in 
the handling of major felony 
cases with a new program or 
task force every Week." 

P l u n k e t t 
. . . . . . . . . . . . . ^.10 

Citing the rising cost of' 
crime and the plight of many 
n e a r - b a n k r u p t s c h o o l , 
d is t r ic ts , O a k l a n d County 
Prosecu tor Thomas G . 
Plunkett is asking the state to 
pass unique legislation im­
posing a tax on convicted 
c r i m i n a l d e f e n d a n t s 
throughout the state. 

Plunkett is to formally 
present his c r ime tax 
proposal to the M i c h i g a n 
Legislature this month: The 
p lan W i l l c a l l for the 
assessment of a predeter­
mined tax on convicted 
defendants. Which then Will be 
returned to neighborhood 
school districts for their use in 

upgrading the education of 
local students. 

"Our studies and ex­
perience have cleariy shoWn 
that the great majority of 
criminals are poorly educated 
or dropouts," Plunkett said. 
"This plan is the shortest path 
in returning needed funds to 
high-cr ime dis t r ic ts a n d . 
a l l ev ia t ing their schools ' 

.fmancial problems while at 
•^piesaiTletlftie,"attacking the 
^cr ime problenii where i t 
usually begins—in the for­
mative educational years." 

P lunket t indica ted the 
proposal Would produce the 
greatest revenue for the 
Detroit school system, an 
area Which has the highest 
crime rate in the state. He 
pointed out that Detroit's 
school system presently is in 

. deep financial trouble. 
"The proposal calls for a 

flat assessment of $1.00 for 
every mov ing traff ic 
v io la t ion , $5.00 for every 
misdemeanor conviction, and 
$100.00 for every convicted 
felon fined or placed on 
probation," Plunkett said. 

H o r s e ' s M o u t h 

Sally Saddle 

This column is open to ilews 
of a l l breeds of horses and 
ponies. Send your questions, 
comments , and horse show 
news to "Horse's Mouth", 
care of South Lyon Herald, 
South Lyon, M i 48178. 

Coughs and Colds 
Some horses Will cough i f 

their feed is too dry, and 
merely dampening the hay 
slightly Will make the c o u ^ 
disappear. However, if the 
coughing is at a l l frequent, if 
it is accompanied by the 
slightest fever, or any 
discharge from the nostrils, 
or even a lackluster ex­
pression, your horse has 
probably caught cold and you 
must watch him carefully. 

Horses a re p a r t i c u l a r l y 
sensitive to drafts and there is 
danger of bronchi t is , in­
fluenza, or pneumonia 
developing i f the first symp­
toms of a cold are not treated 
promptly. 

You should always keep a 
cough remedy in your first-
aid cabinet. Most of them -
have a honey base and can be 
rubbed on the horse's tongue. 

At the first sign of a cold, 
you should isolate the horse, 
keep h i m Warm and out of 
drafts and put h i m on a soft diet 
and put him on a soft diet 

If the cough doesn't 
disappear Within a day or two, 
you should c a l l the 
ve te r ina r ian because an 
untended cold may lead to a 
more serious ailment that can 
permanent ly damage a 
horse's Wind. 

If your horse is unusually 
sensitive to cold, be especially 

careful to d ry h i m off 
thoroughly after exerc ise , 
give him adequate indoor and 
outdoor housing and feed h i m 

, a slightly heatening diet (com 
& grains) during cold Winter 
months. 

C O R R E C T I O N 
In a recent column on 

Weaning foals, it Was stated 
that they should be Weaned at 
three or four Weeks. This Was 
a typographical error and 
shovdd have read, foals may be 
Weaned at three or four 
months. 
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c o u n t i e s , m u n i c i p a l i t i e s , au thor i t i e s o r po l i t i ca l s u b d i v i s i o n s the reof o r of c e r ­
t a in U n i t e d S t a t e s Te r r i t o r i e s o r P o s s e s s i o n s . 

E a c h Uni t r ep re sen t s a $1,000 sha re in the p r i n c i p a l a m o u n t o f the b o n d s in 
the F u n d a n d a f rac t ional u n d i v i d e d interest in the i n c o m e of the F u n d . 
T h e offering p r i c e pe r Uni t is e q u a l to the agg rega t e offer ing p r i c e p e r Uni t 
of the u n d e r l y i n g bonds p l u s a s a l e s c h a r g e . A c c r u e d in teres t to date of 
d e l i v e r y i s a d d e d . 

Copies of the Preliminary Prospectus may be obtained from the undersigned 
in any State where the undersigned may lawfully offer these securities. 

Mail the coupon below for a copy of the Preliminary Prospectus. 

Please send me a Preliminary Prospectus describing the 
IVIICHIGAN FUND TAX-EXEMPT MUNICIPAL INVESTMENT TRUST, FIRST SERIES 

Name_ 

Address-

City -State .Zip Code-

H u t t o n 

E . F . H u t t o n & C o m p a n y I n c . 
15565 Northland Drive, Southfield, Michigan 48075 

Attention: Clarence G. Catallo, Manager 
Telephone (313) 354-0700 

SEE: IN PERSON! 

K A R L W A L L E N D A 

& THE GREAT WALLENDAS HIGH ABOVE THE ICE 
• • • 

Tanan Battling 16 Lions and T^en 

LIVIONICE 

O P E N S 

W E D . , S E P T . 2 0 

T H R U 

S E P T . 2 4 
RMMlniMtr t Vnb E. Ctytt t 

W E D . , THURS. , F R i . , 7 :30 P . M . 
2 S H O W S SAT. 2 :90 A N D 6 :30 P . M . 

2 S H O W S S U N . , 2 : 0 0 A N D 6 :00 P . M . 
PRfCfS U'OO, $5.00, $4.00 

JUNIORS (14 YEARS AND UNDER) AND SENIOR 
CITIZENS 1/2 PRICE FOR ALL PERFORMANCES 

Tickets ofl tale i t Oiy^iia aid i l l J. L Hidsoo md Sean Stem 
FOR G R O U P A R R A N G E M E N T S 

CALL D O N N A M A R T I N , S 9 S - 7 0 0 0 

Ufbted, Feicitf Paikiif fir 2,sn cars adjaccat te M M i i f 
• leMeMtMy 

M A I L O R D I R S P R O M P T L Y F I L L E D 
EndoM Self-Addreued Envelopt. If ordering for Sot. State Atati. or Eve., 
for Sun. Slote 3 or 6>0O P.M. Show. 
ENCIOSED FIND $ HX SEATS AT $ 

ANp._ 
DATE CHOICE lit 
PLEASE PRINT NAME. 
ADDRESS 
CITY 

SEATS AT'-^ PRICE 
..2nd 3rd. 

_aPCODE. 

O L Y M P I A S T A D I U M 

59?0 GRAND RIVER DETROIT. MICHIGAN 48208 

file:///uaoD
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from t l i e 

P a s t o r ' s 

S t u d y 

W h y S o M a n y 

C h u r c h C h a n g e s ? 

A r e a C h u r c h D i r e c t o r y 

Doug Tachett, Minister 
Church of Christ 
Brighton, Michigan 

Many people a1^ asking today Why do we have so many 
changes in the church, why there are so many different 
churches, and how can We be sure we are attending the right 
church. To let us answer these very important questions let 
us consider a few facts. 

Firs t of all , where do the changes in the church come 
from?—Jesus neVer changes. Heb. 13:8, "Jesus Christ the 
same yesterday, and today, and forever"—His word never 
changes...Matt. 24:35, "Heaven and earth shall pass away 
but my word sha11 not pass away." Also read James 1; 17. 

Secondly, why do We have so many different churches?— 
Do we not all have the same bible? Yes. Then what could the 
problem be? Over the last few years man has begun to get 
away from the basic teachings. Writing church creed books 
and articles of faith. Concerning these, if the bible is a l l 
sufficient as it teaches, there is a question as to why we need 
these creed books. 

Notice II Timothy 3:16, 17, " A l l scripture is given by 
inspiration of God, and is profitable for doctrine, for reproof, 
for correction, for instruction in righteousness: that the man 
of God may be perfect, thoroughly furnished unto all good^ 

works." Vet some wil l say the bible cannot be understood by 
ever>-one. therefore, it is necessary that We supplement it 
with what we feel to be necessary for one's salvation. 

The Bible teaches, however, that we are not to add to or 
take away from what has been Written. John Writes in 
lievelation 22:18, 19, " F o r I testify unto every man that 
heareth the words of the propecy of this book, if any man 
shall add unto these things, God shall add unto h im the 
plagues that are written in this book: And i f any man shall 
take away from the Words of the book of this prophecy, God 
shall take away his part out of the book of l ife." 

Again, notorilyare we instructed not to add to, or take 
away from this book but that man Will be cursed i f he does. 
Galatians l :8, 9. Also consider Matthew 15:9, "Bu t in Vain 
they do worship me teaching for doctrine the commandments 
of men" and Acts 5:29, "Then Peter and the other Apostles 
answered and said, we ought to obey God rather than man." 

Not only should We teach the bible because it alone is 
infalable but because we Will be judged by it. John 12:48: Are 
we teaching what the bible is teaching? If not, let us get back 
to the bible today. 

Sarvlval 
Medieval knights felt inVincible When 

they strode forth to battle in a suit of 
armor. Unfortunately, more protection 
meant less mobility. Finally armor be­
came so cumbersome that it Was rele­
gated to museums—the useless antique 
was discarded—not the man under the 
metal coverall. He had to adapt to the 
change! 

HoW many of our Ideas and customs 
have become useless? The World is not 
static and even some Values change. 
What we cherish must be genuine. That 
goes for Faith, too. A shallow faith can­
not survive the twentieth century—or any 
era for that matter. But the Christian 
faith is not superficial, or outmodedl It 
survives, and continues to reach millions 
each Sunday-proof that Christianity is 
not destined for the museum. 

Sunday 
Tlieuaionians 

5:1-11 
• 

Wedneidoy 
I TIieualoniant 

3:1-5 

Monday Tuesday 
Psolnu Luke 
66:8-20 22:31-38 

• • thunday Friday 
KIebrem I Peier 
4:14-16 3:12-18 

e 
Saturday 1 Peter 

4:1-7 
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T h i s R e l i g i o u s M e s s a g e S p o n s o r e d B y T h e s e B u s i n e s s F i r m s 

A L L E N M O N U M E N T S &-VAULTS 
580 S. Main 

Northviiie— 349-0770 

C. H A R O L D BLOOM A G E N C Y . INC. 
108 W. Main 

Northville —349-1252 

B R A D E R S D E P A R T M E N T STORE 
141 East Main 

Northviiie 

D & C STORES, INC. 
139 East Main 

Northville 

D & D FLOOR C O V E R I N G , INC. 
106 East Dunlap 

Northville —349-4490 

THE L I T T L E P E O P L E S H O P P E 
103 E. Main 

Northviiie —349-0613 

L O R E N Z R E X A L L P H A R M A C Y 
R. Douglas Lorenz 

102 E . Main 
Northville —349 1550 

H . R . N O D E R ' S J E W E L E R S 
Main & Center 

Northviiie—349-0171 

N O R T H V I L L E D R U G C O M P A N Y 
A . G . Laux, Reg. Pharmacist 

349-0850 

N O R T H V I L L E R E A L T Y 
Stan Johnston, Realtor 

349-1515 

OLD M I L L R E S T A U R A N T 
130 East Main 
"Good Food" 

PHIL 'S '76 S E R V I C E 
A A A — A i r conditioning service 

130 W. Main 
Northviiie —349-2550 

SALON R E N E 
Creative hairstyling & wig shop 

1059 Nov! Rd. 
349-0064 

W E B B E R P H O T O G R A P H I C STUDIO 
200 South Main Street 

349-0105 

H A R O L D ' S F R A M E SHOP, INC. 
Wheel Alignment & BraWe Service 

44170 Grand River Ave. 
Novi — 349.7550 

NEW HUDSON L U M B E R CO. 
56601 Grand River 

437-1423 

A S H L A N D O I L 
410 Petibone 

Phone 437-3122 
South Lyon 

M I C H I G A N S E A M L E S S T U B E CO. 
South Lyon, Michigan 

SCOTTY & FRITZ S E R V I C E 
333 S. Lafayette 

South Lyon 

P H I L L I P S T R A V E L S E R V I C E 
110 North Lafayette 

South Lyon — 437-1733 

SOUTH L Y O N L U M B E R 8, F A R M C E N T E R 
415 E. Lake 

South Lyon, Michigan 

SOUTH L Y O N P H A R M A C Y 
Let Us Be Your Personal Pharmacist 

437-2071 

S P E N C E R R E X A L L D R U G 
112 East Lake St. 

South Lyon — 437-1775 

S T A T E SAVINGS B A N K 
South Lyon — New Hudson 

Member F.D.I .C. 

DON T A P P ' S S T A N D A R D S E R V I C E 
128 South Lafayette 

South Lyon —437-3066 

WILSON FORD & M E R C U R Y 
Brighton's Largest Ford 8. Mercury Dealer 

8704 W. Grand River 
227-1171 

A D V A N C E S T A M P I N G CO. 
815 Second St. 

Brighton — 227-1281 

BOB & CORINNE'S 
L I T T L E S K I P P E R DRIVE-IN 

10720 E . Grand River 
Brighton — 229-2884 

B I T T E N S H E L L S E R V I C E 
Brighton — 229-9946 

THE BRIGHTON STATE BANK 
300 West North Street 

Brighton —229-9531 

C L O R E ' S FLORIST 
9956 E . Grand River 
Brighton — 227-7331 

C O L E ' S S T A N D A R D S E R V I C E 
600 E . Grand River 
Brighton — 229-9934 

FISHER A B R A S I V E PRODUCTS COR P. 
Brighton 

G. D. V A N C A M P S A L E S , S E R V I C E , INC. 
603 W. Grand River 
Brighton —229-9541 

Chevy — Olds 

B r i g h t o n 

BRIGHTON C0NGRE(;ATI0N 
OF J EHOVAH'S WITNESSES 

Presiding Minister; 
JanriesP. Sazsma 

Kingdom i4sli 
801 Chestnut street 
Sunday9:30a.m. 

Public Talk 
Sunday 10:30a.m. 
Watchtower Study 

ST. JOHN 
Sunday MassesB:00,9;30a.nfi. 
Confessions before the Man 

Sat. Atoss. 6:30p.m. 
Holy Day Mass «:30 p.m. 

CHURCH 0(= CHRIST 
602«RickcttRd. Brighton 

Doug Tactsett, Minister 
BibleSchoonO:00a.m, 

WorshipServicella.m. 
Wed. Eve.Service7;30p.m. 

TRI LAKES BAPTIST CHURCH 
9100 Lee Road 

Rev. Bruce Stine, Pastor 
Parsonage 9120 Lee Road, 

Phone 229-9402 
Sunday School9:50a.m. 
Morning Worship 11 a.m. 
Youth Fellowship 6 p.m. 
Evening Service? p.m. 

BRIGHTON ASSEMBLY 
OFGODCHURCH 

7364 west Grand River 
Rev. Stanley G.HicKs 
Sunday School 10a.m. 

Morning Worship 11 a.m. 
Evening Evangelistic 7 p.m. 
Royal Rangers, Wed. 7 p.m. 
Missionettes, Wed. 7 p.m. 
Youth Serv. Fri. Evening 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
6235 RlcKeif Rd. 

Rev. Clarence Porter 
Sunday School 10 a.m. 

WorshipServicella.m. 
Evening Worship 7 p.m. 

Phone 227-7702 
CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 

5291 Ethel 
Rev. Collins E. Thornton 
Sunday School 10 a.m. 

Sunday Worship 11 a.m. 
Sun. Eve. Service?p.m. 

Wed. Eve. Prayer Service 
7:30 p.m. 

FAITH TEMPLE CHU RCH 
2130 Hacker Rd., Brighton 

Pastor Rev. J. Ervin 
Sunday School lOa.m. 

Sunday Eve. Serv.7 p.m. 

ST. JAMESA.M.E. 
4530 s. US-23 

Rev. Ralph E. Hargrave 
Pastor 

Sunday School 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11 a.m. 

ST. GEORGE LUTHERAN 
803 West Main Street 

Rev. Richard A. Anderson 
Worship Service 10a.m. 
Sunday School 11 a.m. 

For all ages 
Catechism classes 

6:30 p.m. Wed. 
Nursery Services Provided 
Communion First Sunday 

BRIGHTON WESLEYAN 
228 S. Fourth St., Brighton 

Rev. T. D. Bowditch 
9:45a.m. BlbleSchool 

ll:00a.m. Morning Worship 
6:30 p.m. Wesleyan Youth Service 

7 p.m., Evening Evangel Hr. 

ST. PAUL'S EPISCOPALCHURCH 
Rev. Ralph G. McGimpsey 
Rectory—Phone 229-6433 

Sunday Services8:00a.m. 
8:00 Holy Communion 
9:30 Holy Communion 

1st 8,3rd Sun. 
Morning Prayer 

2nd. 4th & 5th Sun. 
10:15 Sunday School & Nursery 

ST. PATRICK CHURCH 
211 Rlckett Road 

Father Raymond J. Klauke, Pastor 
Saturday Evening 7:30 P.M. 
Sunday Morning 6:30, 8:00; 
10:00 & 12 Noon. 

FIRST UNITED 
PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 

224 E.Grand River 

Early Morning Worship 9:00 a.m. 
ChurchSchool9:45tolO:45a.m. 
LafeMorning Worship 11:00a.m. 

Child care provided. 

FIRST UNITEDMETHODIST 
CHURCH 

400 East Grand River 
Rev. W.Herbert Glenn 

Church School. 9:30 a.m. 
Worship Services: 8:30 8.10 a.m. 

COMMUNITY BAPTIST 
Rev. DonKlrkland 

6815 W. Grand River 
Sunday School—iO:00a.m. 
Morning Worship—11 a.m. 

Sunday Eve. Worship—7 p.m. 
Mid Week Serv. Wed. 7 p.m. 

LORDOF LIFE COMMUNITY 
(Lutheran Church in America) 

Worship—9:30a.m. 
Miller Elementary School 

850 Spencer Rd. 
Nursery Provided. 

Dave Kruger, Pastor 

BRIGHTON BAPTIST CHURCH 
525 Flint Road 

Rev. George H. Cliffe, Pastor 
Morning Worship 10 A.M. 
Sunday School 10:30 A.M. 
Prayer Service 11A.M. 

Phone 227-6403 

G r e e n O a k 

FREE METHODIST CHURCH 
US-23,2 miles north of 

Whitmore Lake 
R.J. Shoaff Pastor 

Sunday School 10 a.m. 
Sunday Morning Worship 11 a.m. 
Sunday Evening Service7:30 p.m. 
Wed. Evening Prayer Servlce7:30 

H a m b u r g 

ST. PAUL'S 
LUTHERAN CHURCH 

7701 E.M36 
Rev. Carl F. Welser, Pastor 

Home and Church Phone 229-9744 
Worship S'ervlce9Ji 10:30 a.m. 

Sunday School 9 a.m. 
Communion Service 

First & Third Sundays 

HIAWATHA BEACH CHURCH 
Interim Pastor Marvin Potter 

229-4319 
Sunday School 9:45a.m. 

Worship Service 11 :Ma.m. 
Evening Service6:4Sp.m. 

Weonesday Evening Prayer Meeting 
7:30p.m. 

BETHEL BAPTIST CHURCH 
DuaneErtle, Pastor 

4060 Swarthout Rd., Howell 
878-6715 

Worship Servlceand 
Sun. School io A 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7 p.m. 

HAMBURG BAPTIST CHAPEL 
7252 Stone Rd., Hamburg 

(Second Floor) 
10 a.m. Sunday School 

11 a.m. Church Services 
ST. STEPHENS'S 

EPISCOPALCHURCH 
Rev. Leslie F. Harding, Rector 

Office: 349-1175, 
Home: 349 2292 

9 a.m. Holy Eucharist 
1st 8,3rd Sunday 
Morning Prayer 
2nd & 4th Sunday 

9 a.m. Church School 
(Every Sun.) 

H o w e l l 

PRINCEOF PEACE 
LUTHERAN CHURCH 

Wisconsin Synod 
546-5265 

Pastor Richard Warnke 
Services held at 

Howell Rec. Center 
925 W. Grand River 

Church Servlce9:00a.m. 
Sunday School 10 a.m. 

SALVATION ARMY 
221 N. Michigan 

Lt. JesseeF. Knight 
Sunday School 10 a.m. 

AAorning Worship 11 a.m. 
Youth Meeting 6 p.m. 

Salvation Meeting 7:30 p.m. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
1290 Byron Road 

Sunday School 10 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11 a.m. 
Evening Worship6p.m. 

ST. JOHN'S EPISCOPAL CHURCH 
Sibley at Walnut 

Rev. Chas Sturm Rector 
Sunday Servlceand 

Holy Communion S a.m. 
Morning Prayer Service 10 a.m. 

Flrstand Third Sunday 
Holy Communion at 10 a.m. 

ST. JOSEPH CATHOLIC CHURCH 
440 E.Washington 

Father Gilbert 0. Rahrig, Pastor 
Saturday Mass 6:30 

Sunday Masses7:30,9:30& 11:30p.m. 
Sat. Confessions: 

3:30tO4:30,7;301o8:30p.m. 
Weekday AAass: Mon-Sat.8a.m. 

FIRST CHURCH OF CHRIST SCI EN-
TIST 

114 South Walnut St. 
Sunday School 10:30a.m. 

Worship Service 10:30 a.m. 

FIRST UNITEDMETHODIST 
CHURCH 

1230 Bower Rd. 
Rev. Allan Gray, Minister 
Worship Service at 10 a.m. 

Sunday School 11 a.m. 
HARDY UNITED 

METHODIST CHURCH 
W.J. Rosemurgy, Pastor 
Divine Worship 10 a.m. 
Church School 11 a.m. 

M.Y.F.6p.m. 

GRACE LUTHERAN CHURCH 
312 Prospect 

Sunday Worship 9:30 a.m. 
CHURCH OF GOD 
3940 Pinckney Road 

Rev. Allan Hancock, Pastor 
Sunday Morning Worship 10a.m. 

Sunday School 11 a.m. 
Sunday Evening Service, 7:00 p.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
210 Church Street 

Rev. Donald E.Williams 
Sunday School9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship l l a.m. 
Evening Service7:30 p.m. 

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
422 McCarthy Street 

Rev. H. L. Harris, Pastor 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 

CHURCH OF JESUS CHRIST 
LATTER DAY SAINTS 

910 S.Michigan 
Priesthood 9:15 to 10 a.m. 
Sunday School 10:45 to 12_, 

SEVENTH DAY ADVENTISTCHURCH 
Marlon Township Hall 

JohnW. Clarkson 
Saturday9:00,10:00 a.m. 

L i v o n i a 
PILGRIM UNITEOC. <CH 
OF CHRIST (Congregational) 

476-2080 
36075 W. Seven Mile Road 

Livonia 
James W. Schaefer, Mln. 

Service at9;30a.m. 
Church School at 9:30 a.m. 

V e w H u d s o n 
NEW HUDSON 

UNITEDMETHODIST CHURCH 
56807 Grand River 

437-6367 
Rev. R. A.Mltchlnson 

Sunday Worship 9 & 11 a. m. 
Church School: 9:45a.m. 

NEWHIJDSON 
BAPTIST MISSION 

Pastor B. DeWayne Hallmark 
All-Purpose Room, New Hudson 

Elementary School 
NEW HUDSON 

BAPTISTMISSION 
Pastor B. DeWayne Hallmark 

All-Purpose Room, New Hudson 
Elementary School 

Sunday School 10:05 a.m. 
Sun. Morning Worship 11 a.m. 
Sun. Evening Worship 7 p.m. 

Mid-Weed Service 
Thursday 7 p.m. 
at Pastor's Home 
240 Traverse Rd. 

N o r t h v i l l e 
FIRST PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 

200 E. Main 
349-0911 and 349-2262 

Rev. Lloyd G. Brasure, Pastor 
Worship Service and Sunday School 

at9:30 8.1ia.m. 
OUR LADY OF VICTORY 

770 Thayer Blvd. 
349-2621 

Rev- Father John Wittstock 
Associate Pastor 
Rev. John Wyskiel 
Sunday Masses: 

7:00,9:00 8,10:30 a.m., 12:15 p.m. 
Confession Schedule. Saturday: 

lOtolla.m. 
5p.m. to5:SS p.m. 
6:45 p.m. toSp.m. 

Thursday, before Isf Fridays 
andEveof Holydays: 

4:30 to5:00 p.m. 
8,7:30 to8:00 p.m. 

EVANGELICAL LUTHERAN CHURCH 
OF THE EPIPHANY 

Rev. Frederick Prerioso, Pastor 
GL 3-8807 0rGL3-1191 

Worshipping at 41390 Five Mile 
Sunday Worship, 10 a.m. 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
OF NORTHVILLE 

Rev. Cedric Whitcomb 
FI9.1080 

Res. 209 N. Wing Street 
Sunday Worship, 11 a.m. 17:30 p.m. 

Sunday School, 9:45a.m. 

ORCHARD HILLS BAPTIST 
CHURCH SBC 
23455 Novi Rd. 

Church Phone FI 9.5665 
Sunday Worship, 11a.m. & 7 p.m. 

Sunday School,9:45a.m. 
Training Unlon,6p.m. 

TRINITY CHURCH BAPTIST 
38840 W. Six Mile near Haggerty 

GA 1.2356 
Rev. Norman Mathlas, Pastor 

Sunday Worship, 11 a.m. 
Sunday School9:30a.m. 

FULL SALVATION UNION 
51630 W.EightMile Rd. 

James F. Andrew, Gen. Pas. 
349.0056 

Saturday Worship: 8 p.m. 
Sunday Worship, 3:30 8.8 p.m. 

Sunday School, 2:30 p.m. 
ST. PAUL'S EVANGELICAL 

LUTHERAN CHURCH 
Corner High and Elm Streets 
Rev. Charles Boerger, Pastor 

Church, Fl 9 3140 
Parsonage 349.1557 

Sunday Worship, 9 8,10:30a.m. 
Sunday School, 9:15 a.m. 

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

777 Eight Mileat Taft, Northville 
G. C. Branstner, Pastor 

Office FI9.1144, Res. FI9.1143 
Worship & Church School 9:30 am 

Adult Church School 10:35-11:10 am 
Second Worship 11:15 am 
Youth Groups 6:30 am 

REORGANIZED CHURCH OF 
JESUS CHRISTOF LATTER DAY 

SAINTS . 
31670 Schoolcraft at Bradner, Plymouth 

Ray AAaedel, Pastor 
Gerald Fitch, Associate Pastor 

Sunday Worship: 11 a.m. 8,7 p.m. 
Sunday School, 9:4Sa.m. 

PLYMOUTH ASSEMBLY OF GOO 
42021 Ann Arbor Trail '• 
Robin R. Clair 453-4530 

SundaySchool,9:45a.m. 
Sunday Services 11 a.m. 8.7 p.m.' 

PLYMOUTH WESLEYAN 
METHODIST CHURCH 

42290 Five Mite Road 
Keith Somers, Pastor, 
453.1572 or 453-0279 

Sunday School. 9:45.a.m. 
Morning Worship, 11:00a.m. 

Evening Fellowship.7:00p.m. 

F a r m i n g t o n 
UNIVERSALIST UNITARIAN 
CHURCH OF FARMINGTON 

25301 Halstead Road 
Rev. Richard Neff 

474-7272 
Sunday 10 to 12 

S a l e m 

N o v i 
LIVING LORD 

LUTHERAN CHURCH 
40700 Ten Mile Road 

Novi—477-6296 
Sunday 10 a.m. 

THE HOLY CROSS 
EPISCOPAL MISSION 
42600 W. Ten Mile Rd. 

Office: 349-1175 
Rectory: 349-2292 

Rev. Leslie F. Harding, vicar 
7:30a.m. Holy Eucharist 
n:15a.m. Holy Eucharist 

(1st 8,3rd Sundays) 
Morning Prayer 

(2nd 8.4fh Sundays) 
11:15a.m. Church School 

Every Sunday 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
OF NOVI 

Eleven Mile 8. Tail Roads 
Church Phone: F19-3477 

Rev. Arnold B. Cook 
Sunday Worship, 11a.m. 8.7 p.m. 

Sunday School, 9:45 a.m. 
NOVI UNITED 

METHODIST CHURCH 
41671 W. Ten Mile Rd. 

Rev. PhilipM. Seymour 
349-2552—476-0626 

New Summer Hours: 
Worship, Sunday School 8, Nursery 

9:30a.m. 

FIRST CHURCH OF CHRIST ••' 
SCIENTIST . . . . 

33825Grand River. Farmington 
Sunday Worship, 11a.m. 
Sunday School, 11 a.m. 

ST. JOHN'S AMERICAN 
LUTHERAN CHURCH 

Rev. C. Fox 
23225Gill Road — GR 4-0584 

Sunday Worship, 8:30& 11 a.m. 
Sunday School, 9:40a.m. 

CALVARY MISSIONARY 
BAPTISTCHURCH 

53195 Ten Mile Rd., Northville 
Rev. Carmen R. Hayes 
Sunday School, 10 a.m. 

Sunday Service 118,7 p.m. 
Prayer Meeting Every Thursday 

7:00 p.m. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
43489 Grand River 

(rear of River Road Nursery) 
Rev. W. J. Vassey - 453-5805 

Sun. School: 9:30a.m. 
Morning Worship: 10;30a.m. 
Evening Worship: 7:00 p.m. 

P i n c k n e y 
PEOPLE'SCHURCH 
385 Unadilla Street 
Pastor Ross Winters 

Morning Worship 11 a.m. 
Sunday School9:45a.m. 

Evening Hour 7 p.m. 
ST. MARY CHURCH 
Rev. Hugh F. Conklln 

Sunday Masses: 
8:00 and 11:00 a.m. 

Confessions: Saturday4:30to5:30 
8.7:30 to9:00 p.m. 
PORTAGE LAKE 

GALILEAN BAPTISTCHURCH 
9700 McGregor Road 

Rev. Roland C. Crosby 
PINCKNEY COMMUNITY 

CONGREGATIONAL CHURCH 

Pastor Reinewald 
Morning Worship9 8,10:30a.m. 

Sunday School 9 a.m. 
Coffee Hour after Both Services 

Nursery Service 10:30 
CALVARYMENNONITE CHURCH 

Putnam St., Pinckney 
Pastor: IrvinYoder 

Sunday School 10:00a.m. 
Worship Service 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service7:30p.m. 

Firstand third Sunday 

P l y m o u t h 
ST. JOHN'S EPISCOPAL CHURCH 

Sunday 8:00 a.m. 
Holy Communion 

10:00 a.m. Family Worship 
(Church school classes - nursery to 6th 

grade) 
10:00 a.m. Holy Communion' 

Wednesday 
10:00 a.m. Church school 

3:30 p.m. 7 and 8 grade class 
4:30 p.m. 9fh grade class 
6:00 p.m. Supper (.50) 

6:30 p.m. 10-12 grade class 
PLYMOUTH CHURCH OF CHRIST 

9301 Sheldon Road 
Plymouth, Michigan 

Sunday Worship; 
10;30a.m. 8,6p.m. 

Sunday School, 9:30 p.m. 

FIRST CHURCH OF 
CHRIST SCIENTIST 

1100W. Ann Arbor Trail 
Plymouth, Michigan 

Sunday Worship, 10:30a.m. 
Sunday Worship, 10:30 a.m. 
Sunday School, l0:30a..m 

Wednesday Meeting, 8 p.m. 

PLYMOUTH SEVENTH DAY 
ADVENTISTCHURCH 

4295 Napier Rd. lust North 
ot Warren Rd., Plymouth, Ml. 

William Dennis, pastor 
437-1537 -

Saturday Worship9:30a.m. 
Sabbath School, 10:45 a.m. 

TRI COUNTY BAPTISTCHURCH 
81100 Chubb Rd., Salem 

239 7130 
Jim Wheeler, Pastor 

Sunday Worship, 11a.m. 8.7 p.m. ^ 
Sunday School, 10 a.m. 

Wed. eve. Prayer Meeting 7:30p.m. 

SALEMBIBLE CHURCH 
Ivan E. Speight. Pastor 
9481 W. Six Mile, Salem 

Office FI 9 0674 
Sunday Worship: 

11:00a.m.8.7:00p.m. 
Sunday School: 10:00a.m. 

CHRISTIAN 
SALEM CONGREGATIONAL 

7961 Dickerson, Salem 
Phone 349.5162 

Pastor, William Nottenkamper 
Sunday Worship: 10 a.m. 8.7 p.m. 

Sunday School, 11 a.m. 
Prayer Meeting, Wed. 7:30 p.m. 

CHRfSTTEMPLE 
8257 McFadden Street, Salem 

Pastor R. L. Sijemore 
Sunday Worship: ^ 
11:30a.m. 8.8p.m. 

Sunday School, 9:45 a.m. 

S o u t h L y o n 
FIRST BAPTIST 

Robert Beddlngtleld 
Sunday Worship, 11 a.m. 8,7:15 p.m. 

Sunday School9:45a.m. 
Wednesday Evening Prayer 

Meeting.7:00p.m. 
IMMANUEL EV. LUTHERAN 

CHURCH 
330 East Liberty, South Lyon 

Pastor Geo. Tiefel. Jr. 
Divine Service9a.m. 

Sunday School, 10:15 a.m. 

FIRST United' ' 
METHODIST Ci4URCH . ' 

, , ---640 S. Lafayette St. , 
Rev. f}onaldMcLellan 

11 a.m. —Church school 
Family Worship-9:45 a.rii. 

8 a.m. Communion— 
2&4thSund«t& . . 

Office Phone 437-0760 
Parsonage Phone 437-1227 

ST. JOSEPH'S CATHOLIC CHURCl 
Fr. Gerald Nltoski, Pastor 

Massesat 7:30,9:00,11:15a.m. 
KINGDOM HALL OF 

J EHOVAH'S WITN ESSES 
22024 Pontiac Trail 

Victor Szalma, Minister 
Sunday Address 9:30 a.m. 

Watchtower Study 10:30a.m. 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

22820 Valerie St. Corn. Lillian 
Sunday Worship, 11 a.m. 8,6 p.m. 

Sunday School, ID a.m. 
CHURCH OF GOD 
OF PROPHECY 

12760 W. 10 Mile Rd. 
Rev. James H. Green 
Sunday School 10 a.m. 

Sunday Worship 11 a.m. 
Sunday Ev. Serv 7:00 p.m. 

Wed. —Young people meeting, 7:30 

ASSEMBLY OF GOD 
62345 W.EightMile 
Phone 437-1472 

Rev. James Shaffer 
Sunday School 10a.m. 
Sunday Service 11 a.m. 

Sunday Eve. Serv. 7 p.m. 
Thursday, Bible Study 8. Prayer 7:30 

W a l l e d L a k e 
ST. WILLIAM'S 

CATHOLIC CHURCH 
Father Edward J. Hurley 

Assistant. Father James Mayvnjrn 
Masses: Saturday ev. 6 p.m. 

Sunday: 
7:30,9:00,11:00 a.m. 8.12:30 p.m. 

W h i t m o r e L a k e 
ST. JOHN'S EVANGELICAL. 
LUTHERAN NORTHFIELD 
2945 E. Northfield Ctiurch Rd.. 

Edward Pinchoff, Pastor " v , ^ 
663-1669'-: ^ 

Divine Service, 10:30a.m. -
Sunday School: 9:30a.m. 

CALVARY BAPTISTCHURCH 
279 Dartmoor Drive 

Whitmore Lake, Mich. HI 9-2342 
Bill Joe Hayes, Pastor 

485-0336 
Assoc. Pastor, Wm A. Laudermllch 
Sunday Worship, 11 a.m. 8.7 p.m. 

Sunday School, 9:45 a.m. 

ST. PATRICK'S CATHOLIC 
Fr. Patrick Jackson, Pastor -

Whitmore Lake Rd. at 
Northfield Church Rd. .-

Phone NO 3-0029 
Saturday 4:30p.m.. 

Sunday7:30and 10:30a.m. ' 

WESLEY UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 
9318 AAain St.—Whitmore • 
Rev. Robert Strobridge 

Sunday Worship, 10:30a.m. 
Sunday School,9:15a.m. 

FELLOWSHIP BAPTIST 
Pastor Walter DeBoer 

4492582 
10774 NlneMile Road ^ 

Sunday Worship, 11 a.m., 7 p.m. 
Sunday School, 10 a.m. 

Wednesday evening service, 7:30 

W i x o m 

FIRST BAPTISTCHURCH . 
620 N. Wlxom Rd., Wixom ' v . 

Phone: «4-3a23 
Robert V. Warren, Pastor 
GeorgeMackey Jr., Asst. 

Family-Sunday School: 9:4Sa.m. 
Morning Family Worship; 11:00 a.m. 

Wed . -Thur s . , S e p t e m b e r 1 3 - 1 4 , 1 9 7 2 T H E N O R T H V I L L E R E C O R D - N O V l N E W S - B R I G H T O I M A R G U S - S O U T H L Y O N H E R A L D Page 5 - B 

T H E r t S O U T H L Y O N 

H E R A L D ^ ' B r i g h t o n A r g u s 

THE N O V I m i s 

A D V E R T I S l N G 

IT T A K E S O N L Y O N E C A L L 

TO P L A C E A W A N T A D I N T H E 

R E C O R D - N E W S - H E R A L D A N D A R G U S 

P H O N E 3 4 9 - 1 7 0 0 - 4 3 7 - 2 0 1 1 - 2 2 7 - 6 1 0 1 

1-2 S p e c i a l N o t i c e s 2-1 Houses F o r Sa le 

i am not responsible for -
any debts other than my 
own. 

Leon B. Barron Sr. 

atf 

BIG John and 0 & K. 
Welcome home from 
"The Club" and Phil iy. 

D. C. Inc. and Phil 

M I K E and June, 
Happy 2Sth 

Margie and Gail 
H37 

H A P P I N E S S is—friends 
giving you a surprise 
housewarming. Thanks to 
ai i . 

Mabei 
H.37 

S E P T E M B E R 14 is the 
grandest day to wish the 
happiest of birthdays to 
the bestest Dad 
anywhere. 

Your Firstborn 

S.S. 
You did a good job of 
filling my shoes but it's 
nice to have them back 
on. Thanks a bunch. 

Size6'/2AA 

Mike, 
Welcome! 

'The Staff 

R I D E to Ann A r b o r , 
West side. I\̂ on thru 

F r i d a y . There by 8:30 
a.m. from • wi thin 
Brighton city limits. Will 
pay gas. 229 4550 

A-24 

1-3 C a r d O f T h a n k s 

To the Gang Left Behind: 
May the meetings be 
long, the calls crank, the 
dummies loose and may 
the bird of paradise leave 
the a lewives at your 
doorstep this time! Have 
'a ball y 'a l l . 

Hot Bod 

JB 
NO, NO, NO—keep your 
track shoes on—I like 
having you on my team! 

DW 

- F. & S. B., 
Very 
Active 
Couple 
Are 
Traveling 
In 
Our 
Nation 

Have fun, be careful—try 
to do both. 

1^2 S p e c i a l N o t i c e s 

G E N E R A L Craft classes. 
Starting date Sept. 21, 
1972. Teacher Caro l 
Guerard. Fee S12. plus 

' materiais. Tole painting 
class. Starting date Sept. 
19, 1972. Teacher Kathy 
Toole. Fee $15 plus 
m a t e r i a l s . R e g i s t e r 
today! Mostly Cerannics, 
673 S. Main , Plymouth, 
Mich . _ 

F A L L enrollment now for 
Miss M i l l y ' s School of 
Dance, ballet, tap, baton, 
iazz, toe. Age 4 and up. 
Please cal l : 349-2215, 349-
0350, 455-1464. Classes 
start after Labor Day. 

21 
" T H E F I S H " (FSrmerly 
Project He lp ) . Non-
financia-i emergency 
assistance 24 hours a day 
for those in need in the 
Northviile-Noviarea. Call 
349-4350. A l l calls con­
fidential. 

39TF 

G O L F E R S come to Par 1 
Golf Range and Pro Shop. 
Most complete Pro Shop 
in county. On M-59,1 mile 
East of U.S. 23. 1-313 632-
7494. 

A T F 

1-7 M a i l B o x 

M a i l aWalting pick-up 
at local newspaper 
offlce boxes. 

The Northvil le Record 

522 

The South L y o n Herald 

N O N E 

The Brighton Argus 
K150 
157 

WEwould liketothank all 
of our friends, neighbors, 
and family for their gifts 
and kindness during our 
time of need when our 
home was destroyed by 
fire. 

Genopal Henderson and 
Children 

H-37 

1-5 L o s t 

CALICO cat. Answers to 
"Taffy". Area of 9 Mile 
and Pontiac Trai l . 437-
3186 

H37 

R E W A R D 
Lost One female 
Shepherd-husky, brown 
and white, answers to 
"Bajou". 662-2386 

H38 

W H I T E dog, Sunday, 
brown spots, female, part 
beagle, 6 mo. old. Beach 
Lake. Brighton 227-6726 

a24 

M A L E Beagle , mostly 
brown & white, some 
black. Wear ing col lar 
with tags bearing Detroit 
information. Answers to 
" B e n n y " . Rewara if 
found. 477 0162. 

Female Siamese, may 
have been dropped. My 
boys have been crying. 
Please call with any In­
formation 349-3043. 

1-6 F o u n d 

BAG of softbalis with 
keys. Left at Fireman's 
Field, 546-3724 (517) 

A24 

R E A L E S T A T E 

FOR S A L E 

2-1 H o u s e s F o r S a l e 

3 bdrm. home on Vj acre, 
close to schools. Car­
p e t e d , b a s e m e n t , 
recreation rm. , formal 
dining rm. , kitchen has 
built-ins, gas heat, near I-
96 and 23 interchange, 
Brighton 227-6730 

atf 

M E A D O W B R O O K Lake, 
Novi, by owner. 4 or 5 
bedroom tri-level, 4̂ acre 
treed lot on iake. Built-
Ins, carpeting, draperies, 
large family room with 
f i r e p l a c e . 349-3589. 
_S56,000. 

N O R T H V I L L E , 4 
bedroom colonial. Family 
room with fireplace. Bath 
and 12, 2 car garage, 
patio. Fenced lot backed 
by woods Walk ing 
distance to all schools. 
Immediate occupancy 
possible. 543,500. By 
owner . 349-4273. 

H A R T L A N D 632-7427 

N e w 3 b e d r o o m 
C h a l e t in M i l f o r d 
Townsh ip , 1300 sq . 
feet, of w e l l , p lanned 
l i v i n g a r e a . F r a n k l i n 
f i r e p l a c e in l i v i n g 
room nice locat ion 
over look ing Huron 
R i v e r . 529,900. 
N e w e r 3 b e d r o o m 
h o m e in D e e r f i e l d 
Townsh ip on 10 acres 
of b e a u t i f u l l a n d , 
qua l i t y throughout . 
New 4 stal l horse 
ba rn , $41,900. 
M i l f o r d , convenient 
for shopping yet in a 
n i c e q u i e t n e i g h ­
borhood wi th paved 
street . Is this two 
b e d r o o m , f u l l 
b a s e m e n t , i d e a l 
s t a r t e r f o r y o u n g 
f a m i l y , si9,900. 
H a r t l a n d n e w 3 
b e d r o o m c o u n t r y 
r anch , p r iv i l eges on 
W a l l a c e L a k e . 
Comple te ly carpeted 
and ready for oc­
c u p a n c y a t o n l y 
$22,900. 

New 3 bedroom face 
r a n c h in H a r t l a n d 
i n c l u d e s l a k e 
p r iv i l eges and 2 ca r 
a t t a c h e d g a r a g e , 
$24,900. 
We h a v e a n i c e 
select ion of bu i ld ing 
s i t e s a n d a c r e a g e . 
Ca l l for i n fo rma t ion . 

E N G L A N D 

R E A L E S T A T E 
Hartland Office 
12316 Highland Rd. 

632-7427 
Union I^ke Office 
3063 Union Lk. Rd. 

363-7117 

Three B d r m . R a n c h home, con v . to x -ways , 
close to town. Low d n . p y m t . $19,500.00. 

Count ry home on 160' x 160' lot. Two b d r m s . , 
garage , basement , ga rden spot. $19,500.00. 

Brand new 3 b d r m . R a n c h home. P i c k your 
own ca rpe t ing . B i r c h doors a n d other qua l i t y 
features. Do your own p a i n t i n g . $26,900.00. 

Ready to m o v e in . . .Ma in t enance free 3 b d r m . 
Ranch home w i t h l ake p r iv i l eges . E x t r a 
l a rge coun t ry k i t chen . C a r p e t i n g . O n l y 
$23,500.00. 

Help the B u i l d e r ! ! ! Y o u r se lect ion of car ­
peting a n d t i le w i l l m a k e th is three b d r m . 
Ranch a t r u l y qua l i t y home. A l l the ex t ras 
inc lud ing ful l basement , att. 2 ca r ga rage , 
and f i r ep lace . Ju s t for good measu re we w i l l 
throw i n L a k e p r iv i l eges . $38,500.00. 

L a k e of the P ines . . .Three b d r m . lakefront 
home. Tota l e l ec t r i c home insula ted to 
spec i f ica t ions . Good beach a r e a , exce l len t 
f i sh ing . $47,900.00. 

E x e c u t i v e home in qua l i t y subd iv i s ion close 
to B r i g h t o n . L a r g e 120' x 240' lot su r rounds 
this cus tom home w i t h features too numerous 
to men t ion . Owner t r ans fe red . I m m . oc­
cupancy . Reduced to $55,200.00 

R e a l coun t ry l i v i n g on th is 2 a c r e t rac t w i t h 3 
b d r m . mod i f i ed t r i - l eve l home. 20' x 30' b a r n , 
frui t a n d shade trees, b e r r y bushes, ga rden 
spot. J u s t tas te the water...$37,500.00. 

K e n S h u l t z A g e n c y 

9 9 0 9 E . G r a n d R i v e r 
B r i g h t o n , M i c h i g a n 

(313) 2 2 9 - 6 1 5 8 

15 H I L L A P A R T M E N T S , E a s t of Br igh ton , 
I w i th 3 B . R . home, Th i s va luab le proper ty is 
I on 2V2 ac res , 200 ft. f rontage on G r a n d R i v e r . 
; $78,000, $20,000 D o w n , 6 percent Interest. 

O R E L A K E T R I - L E V E L 84 x 240 lot, 2 baths, 
I f a m i l y r o o m , f i r ep lace , 8 rooms , excel lent 
i condi t ion , beaut i fu l ly l andscaped , 2V2 c a r 
' ga rage . $42,500. $12,000 D o w n . 

C I T Y O F B R I G H T O N , 2 B . R . home, gas heat, 
ga rage , a t Br igh ton L a k e . $22,500 

AC-7-2271 
AC-9-7841 

W A N T - A D C L A S S I F I C A T I O N S 

Acreage For Sale 2-4 Farm AnimaIs 5-3 Mobile Homes 2-3 
AnimaIs 5-1 Farm Equipment 4-4A Mobile Home Sites 3-5 
Animals, Farm 5-3 Farm Products 4-4 Motercycles 7-1 
Animal Services 5-4 Farms 2-4 Musical Instruments 4-3 
Antiques 4-1 Found 1-6 Personals 1-2 
Apartments For Rent 3-2 Garage SaIes 4-1B Pets 5-1 
Auction Sales 4-1A Happy Ads 1-1 Poultry 5-3 

Auto Parts 7-5 Help Wanted 6-1 Professional Services 6-3 

Autos For Sale 7-8 Homes For Rent 3-1 Real Estate Wanted 2-8 

Auto Service 7-5 Homes For Sale 2-1 Rooms For Rent 3-3 

Autos Wanted 7-6 Horses & Equipment 5-2 Rummage Sales 4-1B 

Boats & Equipment 7-3 Household Goods 4-2 Situations Wanted 6-2 

Business Opportunities 6-4 Household p Snowmobiles 7-2 

Business Services 6-3 Household Pets 5-1 Sporting Goods 4-3 

Campers 7-4 Industrial 2-7 Townhouses For Rent 3-4 

Card Of Thanks 1-3 In Memorium 1-4 Townhouses For Sale 2-2 

commercial 2-7 Lake Property 2-5 Trailers 7-4 

condominiums Livestock 5-3 Trucks 7-7 

For Rent 3-4 Lost 1-5 Vacation Rentals 3-7 
condominiums Lots For Sale 2-6 Wanted Miscellaneous 4-5 

For Sale 2-2 Mail Box 1-7 Wanted To Rent 3-8 

Want Ads may be placed until 4 p.m. Monday for that week's Edition. Read 
your advertisement the first time It appears, and report any error immediately. 
The Sliger Publications, Inc. will not issue Credit for errors in ads after the first 
incorrect Insertion. No cancellations accepted after 2 p.m. Monday. 

N O R T H V I L L E R E C O R D - N O V l NEWS 349-1700 
Serving: N O R T H V I L L E — N O R T H V I L L E TOWNSHIP — NOVI 

NOVI TOWNSHIP — WIXOM 
SOUTH L Y O N H E R A L D 437-2011 

Serving: SOUTH L Y O N - L Y O N TOWNSHIP — S A L E M TOWNSHIP 
G R E E N OAK TOWNSHIP — NEW HU DSON — WH ITMORE L A K E 

• N O R T H F I E L D TOWNSHIP 
BRIGHTON A R G U S 227-6101 

Serving: BRIGHTON — BRIGHTON TOWNSHIP — H A R T L A N D 
H A M B U R G TOWNSHIP — G R E E N OAK TOWNSHIP 

G E N O A TOWNSHIP 

2-1 Houses F o r Sa l e 

3 Bedroom, '2 acre lot, 
close to schools. Brighton 
227.6730. 

A T F 

SOUTH Lyon 3 bedroom 
brick ranch, garage at­
tached. Two baths, 
carpeting, one acre. By 
owner, immedia te oc 
cupancy. 437.1851 

H37 

SOUTH Lyon area. By 
owner 3 bedroom 
colonial on 5 acres. 349-
0764 

H37 

SOUTH Lyon • By owner 
3 bedroom brick ranch, 
paneled, full basement, 
1'2 car garage, patio, 
carpeting, ceramic bath, 
lots of shade trees and 
evergreens, large lot, 437-
0712 

H37 

SOUTH Lyon Area • 3 
bedroom br ick ranch, 
large l iv ing room, 
fireplace and dining 
room. 2 car attached 
garage. Over 1 acre lot. 
334,900 437-6602 

H38 

2-1 Houses F o r Sa l e 2-,1 H o u s e s F o r Sa le 2-1 Houses F o r Sa l e 

B R I G H T O N - cus tom 
colonial home, 10 rooms, 
2'2 baths, f i rep lace , 
basement, garage, treed 
lot, lake. 358,500. 229-9443 

324 

N O R T H V I L L E school 
d is t r ic t . Excep t iona l 2 
acres with hi l l and 
s tream. Custom br ick 
ranch. Beautifully land­
scaped. 2 bedrooms, 
family room, 2 fireplaces, 
country kitchen. 348,000. 
349-6112. 

C U S T O M B U I L T R A N C H H O M E S 
C O M P L E T E L Y F INISHED $19,300 On Y o u r Lot 

'3 Bedroom r a n c h , full basement , c e r a m i c 
t i le , F o r m i c a tops, ha rdwood f loors , in­
sulated wa l l s and ce i l ings , b i r c h cabinets , 
doors, panel ing a n d comple te pa in t ing . 
M o d e l : 28425 Pon t i ac T r a i l . 2 M i l e s N . 10 M i . 
South L y o n . 
On C r a w l Space - $17,500 

G E 7-2014 

C O B B H O M E S 

E A R L K E I M 

R E A L T Y 

R E A L T O R S 

N O R T H V I L L E 

F I R S T O F F E R I N G - Love ly 3 bedroom r a n c h 
on half a c r e lot , offers 2 ful l baths, d i n i n g 
room, k i tchen w i t h bui l t - ins , la rge patio a n d 2 
car ga rage . $31,900 

G R E A T V A L U E - Spacious 3 bedroom b r i c k 
ranch in C i ty of N o r t h v i l l e offers l a rge 
bedrooms, count ry k i tchen w i t h buil t- ins, ful l 
t i led basement and 2 c a r ga rage . $33,900 

C A P E C O D - 4 bedrooms, 2 baths, d in ing 
room, r e c . room and 2 ca r ga rage , w a l k to a l l 
schools . $39,900 

F A R M S T Y L E C O L O N I A L IN N O R ­
T H V I L L E T W P . - on 4.5 ac res , has 4 l a rge 
bedrooms, 2 baths, l a rge d in ing room, ki t ­
chen w i t h bui l t - ins , 2 c a r g a r a g e . Remode led 
in 1966. $55,900 

1 
6 A C R E E S T A T E - l a rge 3 bedroom home 
bui l t in 1970 - 3 baths , basement, f a m i l y r o o m 
and ga rage , 4 s t a l l horse barn and c o r r a l -
only $79,900 

3 4 9 - 5 6 0 0 

3 3 0 N . C E N T E R M O R T H W L U 

Offices a lso i n : 
Dearborn P l y m o u t h 
Wes t land L ivon ia 
T a y l o r F a r m i n g t o n 
Detroi t Ann A r b o r 

O P E N H O U S E 

S a t . - S u n . 2 - 5 p . m . 

5 3 5 6 V a n W i n k l e - B r i g h t o n 

3 Bedroom B r i c k R a n c h , F u l l Basement , 
Forced Hot A i r , F o r m i c a Cabinets and Top, 
Carpe t ing . 

4 9 , 9 0 0 . 0 0 u p - o n y o u r l o t 

0 W N E R 5 P A R T I C I P A T I N G W E L C O I W E 

D O D G E C O N S T R U C T I O N 

2 2 7 - 6 8 2 9 

R A L P H L B A N F I E L D 

R E A L E S T A T E 

Y e a r ' R o u n d On L a k e Chemung 
This la rge 1 b e d r m . has 12 x 30 l i v ing r o o m . 
A l l new k i t chen , new 2 car garage . W i t h 
a l u m i n u m s id ing , n ' " ^ we l l , septic t ank , 8. 
f ie ld . E x t r a l a r o ' c p V , landscaped w i t h nice 
l awn . 7 X 30 w_.dssed-in porch . E x c e l l e n t 
repa i r throughout . Land contract t e r m s 
ava i l ab l e . Shown by appointment on ly . 

3 Bedroom H o m e now being comple ted , IV2 
baths, Co lon ia l L i v i n o "^oom. Count ry K i t ­
chen, F a m i l y R o o ' - j J ? .h f i replace , 2 ca r 
a t tached ga rage « P j A c r e Wooded Site, 
approx . 31/2 rhiles f rom H o w e l l . $37,500. 

21 R O L L I N G A C R E S near Br igh ton . Th i s 
wooded pa rce l has s e v e r a l spots for a home 
si te . N a t u r a l hole for a pond or s m a l l l ake . 142 
ft. frontage on b lack top road, less than 3 
mi l e s to X - w a y s . Lots of p r i v a c y . C a l l for 
pr iva te s h o w i n g . 

Immedia te occupancy . C i t y of H o w e l l . E a s y 
w a l k i n g d is tance to s tores, churches and 
schools. T h i s o lder 2 s to ry house has 3 l a rge 
bd rms . and room for four th . P r i va t e d i n i n g 
a rea , 12x11 k i t chen , gas heat, w a l k - i n closets , 
IV2 car ga rage , n ice neighborhood. G o o d 
shape. Low twent ies . Appo in tmen t o n l y . 

Br ighton A r e a , near 1-96, two mi le s down­
town. Th i s 2 b d r m . b r i c k home has f ive e x t r a 
lots inc luded . N e w ki tchen wi th ca rpe t ing , 
large l i v ing room w i t h carpe t ing and na tu ra l 
f i rep lace . 2 ca r ga rage , gas heat, beautiful 
v i e w . Owner m o v i n g . Appo in tmen t on ly . 

Th ink ing of Se l l ing or B u y i n g — G i v e us a c a l l 
517-546-4180 

300 S. Hughes R d . , Howel l 

R O B E R T G . P E L K E Y F L O Y D M c - C L I N T O C K 

229-9192 546-1868 

J . R . H a y n e r 

I n s u r a n c e & R e d E s t a t e 

408 West 
Main Street 
B R I G H T O N 

Open Every Day 9 to 6 p.m. 
Any Evening By Appt . 

2-1 H o u s e s F o r Sa l e 2-1 H o u s e s F o r Sa l e 

C i t y o f B r i g h t o n 

^ 3 0 0 

T w y k i n g h a m new Broad F ron t 
3 & 4 bedroom ranches - some w i t h full 
basements , a l u m , s i d i n g , c i ty water and 
publ ic sewers , gas heat and hot wa te r . Im­
media te occupancy . T w y k i n g h a m Sub. is 
located % mi l e W. of O l d G r a n d R i v e r on 
Br igh ton L a k e R d . 

2 2 7 - 6 7 3 9 

H O W E L L : 3 b d r m . ranch wi th 2 ca r ga rage 
in walk-out basement . Acces s to Thompson 
L a k e . 1 yea r old $32,900.00. 9-38 

H A R T L A N D : 3 B e d r m . r anch , 2 c a r . att. 
ga rage w i t h access to Long L a k e . $24,500.00. 
1-42 

10 acres w i t h near ly comple ted 3 b e d r m . 
r anch . $34,900.00. 10-41 

Phone 1-517-546-3120 

3477 Grand River 
Between 

Howell & Brighton 

N O R T H V I L L E 

R E A L T Y 

Wes t l and 
2043 L i n v i l l e - 3 B e d r m . R a n c h . F u l l 
basement - 2 ca rga rag i e . € tean & sha rp . V . A . 
A p p r o v e d - 21,900 - - - ^ 

Lot in Townsh ip — A p p r o x . 1 a c r e - C o r n e r 
V a l e n c i a & 7 m i l e . $10,900 

20910 E . Chigwidden- N o r t h v i l l e Es ta tes . 4 
bedroom ranch - sharp a n d c lean - 2'/2 baths -
F i n i s h e d basement - F a m i l y room - f i r ep lace 
- f i r s t f loor l a u n d r y - sc reened a n d ca rpe ted 
patio porch - beaut i fu l ly landscaped V2 A . lot. 
- $55,500 

544 Lang f i e ld — 4 B d r m . B i - L e v e l . F a m . r m . 
W " f . p . D i n . R m . , 2 Baths- 2 c a r garage-
N i c e l y landscaped - F e n c e d . $38,500 

20330 Lex ing ton B l v d . Cus tom 4 b e d r m . 
R a n c h -1 ac re lot - 2V2 baths - F a m i l y room w-
F . P . Comple te K i t c h e n . Bui l t - ins - F o r m a l 
Din ing r o o m - full Basemen t - 18 x 36 in 
G r o u n d G u n n i t e S w i m Pool w-Cabana . N e w 
carpe t ing & drapes - W a l k - i n pan t ry 2V2 
garage . H o m e bui l t in 1967 $75,900 

8770 R i v e r s i d e D r i v e - th i s year a round h o m e 
fronts on Ore L a k e - 3 bedrooms - gas heat -
IV2 ca r g a r . N e a r 23 and 1-96 

20 ac res on Nap ie r - V2 m i l e north of 8 m i l e -
330 x 2640 $39,500 

Rushton Road - S o u ^ Q . y o n area - 3 b e d r m . 
home on nice 5 i S f t s . 

P l y m o u t h 
9264 M o r r i s o n - Beaut i fu l ly main ta ined 3 
bedroom r a n c h on % a c r e treed lot - Cen t ra l 
a i r - IV2 baths f a m i l y room - wet p las ter 
$44,500 

Lot on C lemen t Road . 60 x 180. $7900 

S A L E S B Y 
K a y Keeganr Rose M a r i e M o u l d s 
Anne L a n g M y r t l e Fe rguson 
P a t r i c i a Herter K e n M o r s e 
Ron Roberts John Hlohen ic 
P a u l Condon V i r g i n i a P a u l i 

Stan Johnston, Rea l to r 
Office — Corner M a i n a n d Center . 

Nor thVi l l e ' s Oldest Rea l Esta te 
Office 

349-1515 

Open Sundays 1 to 5 p . m . 

1 A C R E L A K E F R O N T S I T E on beautiful b i g 
c rooked , 2 k i tchens , 1V2 baths, f a m i l y r o o m , 
wa lkou t basement , ga rage . $37,500. cash 

M O B I L E H O M E 12 x 60 V A L I A N T on your 
own 60 x 150 lot, l ake p r i v i l e g e s . $14,500 easy 
t e rms . 

A T T R A C T I V E 3 B . R . home, excep t iona l ly 
fine loca t ion , 100 F t . frontage on beautiful 
Winans L a k e , Br igh ton a r e a . $45,500. 



P a g e 6 - B T H E N O R T H V I L L E R E C O R D - N O V I N E W S - B R I G H T O N A R G U S - S O U T H L Y O N H E R A L D Wed. , -Thurs . , S e p t e m b e r 1 3 - 1 4 , 1 9 7 2 

2-1 H o u s e s F o r S a l e 2-1 H o u s e s F o r Sa l e [ | 2-1 H o u s e s F o r S a l e 2-1 H o u s e s F o r Sa l e I 2-1 Houses F o r S a l e | | 2-1 H o u s e s F o r S a l e " | 2-1 H o u s e s F o r S a l e 

r 
TWO S T O R Y C O L O N I A L 

B r i c k afid a l u m i n u m , full basement, a t tached 
2-car garage, V.'i baths, insula ted windows 
and screens, paneled, carpeted, f a m i l y room 
w i t h f i rep lace . B u i l t on your l and . Comple te ly 
f inished. $30,900 
M o d e l : 28425 Pont iac T r a i l . 

2 M i l e s N . 10 M i l e 
South Lyon 

437-2014 

C O B B H O M E S 

8 9 3 W . A n n A r b o r T r a i l 

P l y m o u t h 

4 5 3 - 1 0 2 0 

M u l t i - L i s t Se rv i ce 

N O R T H V I L L E A R E A 

8340 Rushton R d . (between 6 & 7 M i l e . ) Horse 
F a r m - ( c u r r e n t l y , M o r g a n s ) . lOVz acres . 
AAagnificent new pole b a r n . Shingle and 
p lywood roof. 17 s ta l l s . 60x120 a rena . Deluxe 
Observa t ion R o o m . 10 more ac res a v a i l a b l e . 
Ca l l for appointment . P r i c e d for p r o m p t sale . 

N O R T H V I L L E - 2 ac r e s . Nap ie r R o a d . F ine 
level pas ture . Some trees . Exce l l en t c o r r a l 
$12,400 

Nice 3 bedroom home fu l ly carpe ted , e x t r a 
large f a m i l y room wi th large b r i ck f i r ep lace , 
T/2 baths, 2 ca r ga rage , workshop, new 32x50, 
pole ba rn , 5 s ta l ls 

3 bedroom t r i - leve l on Va a c r e lot, 2 c a r 
garage, carpeted a n d newly decora ted 
$35,000 

5 bedroom home in South L y o n , l a rge 2 c a r 
garage , corner lot. $35,000 l and cont rac t 

4 bedroom home in South L y o n , co rne r lot 
$19,000 

2 bedroom home on 85 x 150 count ry lot $8,500 

Vacan t 
1 ac r e $5,500 
2 ac res $7,000 
6 ac res w i t h s t r e a m $14,000 

A T C H I S O N R E A L T Y 

Corner 7 Mile and Pontiac Trail 
Phone 437-2111 437-6344 

B R I G H T O N 

C R O O K E D L A K E - Comple te ly furnished 2 
bedroom cottage - N i c e sandy beach and boat 
dock $21,-00 

C I T Y O F B R I G H T O N - B i g t reed lot - W a l k to 
schools a n d shopping - Comple te ly carpe ted -
Walk out basement - 2 ca r garage $27,500 

IN T H E C O U N T R Y - On a h i l l - A l m o s t new 
ranch on over ac re - Tasteful ly decorated -
easy a s sump ' :on $32,500 

H O W E L L - Sharp 3 bedroom t r i - leve l -
Ca thedra l ce i l i ng - Sun room - A t t ached 
ga rage - M i n u t e s to X - W a y $37,500 

H O W E L L - Cus tom 3 bedroom ranch on 
a lmos t 1 a c r e - Jus t 2 y e a r s old - Comple te ly 
carpeted - basement - ga rage $37,500 

B R I G H T O N - B r a n d new 3 bedroom ranch 
w i t h mas t e r bath - f a m i l y room w i t h f i rep lace 

large Va a c r e lot in Fores t V i e w Sub $43,500 

J U S T R E D U C E D - Wan t horses? Th i s is i t ! 
Custom 3 bedroom home on 5V2 acres - 200 ft. 
frontage on p r i v a t e l ake - C a l l for comple te 
list of ex t ras $69,900 

M T . B R I G H T O N S U B - 5 bedroom AAansard 
roof colonia l offers - 20 x 40 mas te r su i te -
sunken f a m i l y room - f o r m a l d in ing r o o m -
carpeted thru-out - owner w i l l help f inance 
$72,500 

V A C A N T - O v e r 1 ac re w i t h frontage on 
spr ing fed lake - paved road - beautiful 
bu i ld ing s i te $4,900 

10 A C R E S - G r e a t inves tment can be d iv ided -
lots of t rees - easy land contract t e r m s 
a v a i l a b l e • on ly $20,500 

2 2 7 - 1 3 1 1 

B R I G H T O N 
OFFICE 

201 E Grand River 

Multi-List 

Sharp 3 bedroom home in M i l f o r d , f a m i l y 
r oom, f i rep lace , l'/2 baths, d i n i n g r o o m , 
fenced y a r d in beautiful F a i r v i e w H i l l s . 
Immedia te occupancy , $26,900.00 

C A L L A N R E A L E S T A T E 

R E A L T O R S 

6 2 0 N . M I L F O R D R D . 

M I L F O R D , M I C H . 6 8 4 4 2 8 5 

We are also sales agents for Hubbard Homes Inc.-
complete custom design and new home building 
service available. 

R E A L T Y ^ 

(IT'S EASIER TO MO VE NOW) 

New (8 months old) 3 bedroom Ranch. Aii cai^ted. 1 
mile from iHoweil. Immediate occupancy with an excell­
ent anumptlon. 

3 Bedroom, NE. section of Howell. Remodeled with 
full basement and gas heat. Pleasant neighborhood. 
Only »19.500. 

Acreage-Several size parcels to choose from—7-X0-»0-
60 and 95 acres, wooded or clear l and fa l l Now. 

Open Monday thru Friday 9-8 Saturday 10-« 
Sun 1-6 

2426 E . G r a n d R i v e r 

H o w e l l , M i c h . 

( 5 1 3 ) 5 4 6 - 6 4 5 0 

3 bedroom y e l l o w b r i c k home w i t h i n 2 b locks 
f rom center of town, stone fireplace, life-
t i m e g r a v e l roof, beautiful e x t r a la rge corne r 
lot, fenced in y a r d , p lenty of shade trees. 
SLS58 

C O U N T R Y L I V I N G - 3 0 a c r e s - 3 m i l e s Nor th ­
west of Howe l l - A l s o w i l i Sp l i t . V A 3 5 9 

Olde r 2 s tory count ry s ty le house on la rge 
corne r c i t y lot w i th m a n y ex t ras . Th i s home 
mus t be seen to app rec i a t e i ts ful l potent ia ls . 
P r i c e d for qu i ck sa le a t $29,900. S L 205 

C O U N T R Y H O M E - A l m o s t 1 a c r e . N e w 
Hudson on Pon t i ac T r a i l . 1 m i l e nor th of 
exp re s sway . 2 bedrooms . O n l y $22,900. A d ­
d i t iona l 6 ac r e s a v a i l a b l e . C O 280 

2 bedroom bunga low on 1 a c r e in Br igh ton 
a r ea . AAany ex t r a s . P r i c e d for qu ick sa le . 
Only $22,400. C0461 

L a r g e 3 bedroom cape cod in the coun t ry . IV2 
ca r garage . .39 ac res . Br igh ton a r e a . Close to 
shopping. P r i c e d to S e l l . C O 282 

New 3 bedroom ranch home with family room 
a n d full basement . 1 c a r a t t ached ga rage . 
B r a n d new. B r i c k F ron t . N i c e a r e a . A l l 
ca rpe ted . South L y o n . C O 202 

New 3 Bedroom ranch home. F u l l basement . 
2 c a r a t tached ga rage . B r a n d New. B r i c k 
front . Nice a r ea . A l l ca rpe ted . South L y o n . 
C O 203 

55 ac r e s on b lacktop road (M-36) . A good 
inves tment buy. V A 9961 

5 vacan t ac res - F ron t 3/4 wooded , r e a r 4 c l e a r 
a n d leve l • L a k e Shannon a r e a , count ry 
l i v i n g . O n l y 23/4 mi l e s off U S 23. C a l l for t e r m s 
of sa le on this beautiful bu i ld ing s i te . V A 273 

Older 2 s to ry 3 bedroom home . South L y o n . 
W i t h i n w a l k i n g dis tance to t own . 2 c a r 
garage . L a r g e double lot p len ty of shade 
trees. S L 

3 bedroom b r i c k r anch w i t h basement . A t ­
tached 2 c a r ga r age . 100 X 180 lot. South L y o n . 
N e w m a n F a r m s . C O 239 

wgAi- esTATt. iNauRANcel 

.ecKSMo.MOBiLe liOMca ^ 
S O U T H L Y O N 4 3 7 - 1 7 2 9 

125 3. Lafayette St. 
Brighton Line 227-7775 

H O W E L L - 2 houses, 
close to schools: 2 story, 4 
b d r m . r e m o d e l e d 
d o w n s t a i r s , g a r a g e , 
corner lot, S18,900. Term-
s; 4 bdrm. redecorated, 
new carpets, furnace, etc. 
large lot, $23,500. Terms. 
(517) 546-4415, or 546.5536. 

A-24 

L A K E F R O N T cottage, 
Brighton, full bath, heat 
for year round living, 
high view of lake, sand 
beach, excellent fishing, 
closed lake , $18,400. 
Landmark Real Estate, 
9947 E . Grand River, . 
Brighton 229-2945. 

A-24 

2-1 H o u s e s F o r Sa le 2-1 H o u s e s F o r Sa l e 

N O R T H V I L L E 

E x c e p t i o n a l l y love ly 4 b e d r m . h o m e on 
p r o f e s s i o n a l l y l a n d s c a p e d l o t . C u s t o m 
features thruout. L u x u r i o u s ca rpe t i ng , 1 s t 
f loor l aundry , l a rge foyer . Unde rg round 
s p r i n k l i n g s y s t e m . One of N O R T H V I L L E ' S 
finest a reas . $58,900. 

" f l H O M P S O M R O W N 
Residential Resalie Oiviston 

41120W. Five Mile , Plymoiith 

C A L L 4 5 5 - 2 7 0 0 
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W e c a n 
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f i n d a 

p l a c e t o 

h i b e r n a t e 

b e f o r e 

w i n t e r . 

Immedia te occupancy on this b r a n d new 5 
bedroom on 2 ac res . F u l l basement , f a m i l y 
room a n d comple te ca rpe t ing , a t t ached 
garage, . $59,500. Loca ted a t 47460 T e n M i l e 
R o a d between M i l f o r d R o a d and /Wartindale 
R o a d . 

Peace and quiet on a p r i v a t e no t ra f f i c street . 
Basement w i t h rec . r o o m , 4th bedroom, and 
outside ent rance . C a r p e t e d k i t chen . AAany 
m a t u r e trees on this 100 x 142 sec luded lot. 
Loca ted a t 860 Scot t off O r c h a r d D r i v e , 
behween M a i n a n d 7 M i l e . 

Spacious a n d w e l l cons t ruc ted b r i c k house. 
F o u r bedrooms, 2o f w h i c h a r e 17x21 a n d 14 x 
21! F i r e p l a c e In l i v i n g r o o m . Other features 
inc lude : Pane l l ed basement w i t h outside 
entrance, sc reened s ide po rch , ha rdwood 
floors, garage , and double lot 140 x 142 w i t h 
m a n y t rees . Loca ted a t 110 AAaplewood a t 
Center . $57,500. 

H O W E L L 

F i v e bedroom b r i c k house p rov ides 2 
f i replaces , f o r m a l d in ing room 15 x 20 (ad­
jacent to newly r e m o d e l e d ful ly equ ipped 
ki tchen.) 15 x 28 l i v i n g r o o m 3/4 a c r e lot. 
La rge ga rage w i t h w o r k shop . Loca ted a t 419 
M i c h i g a n , H o w e l l . $67,500. 

J O H N S O N 

R E A L E S T A T E 

349-3470 

125 E A S T M A I N N O R T H V I L L E 

Essie Nirider, Harry Draper, Dick L y o n , Nelda Hosier 

B R I G H T O N W e s t 
Elementary School area, 
Medi te r ranean style 3 
bedroom, lVi bath ranch, 
with 2 car attached 
garage. Full basement, 
gas heat. Beamed dining 
and ki tchen. Bui l t in 
range, dishwasher and 
garbage disposer. Shag 
carpet throughout. Paved 
street and drive. $38,900. 
227.7361 or 1-475.2729. 

atf 

SOUTH Lyon - By owner -
3 bedroom ranch, large 
ioL full basement, IV2 car 
garage, newly decorated 
and landscaped. Built in 
1970. $28,900 437-0712 

HTF 

S M A L L modern home in 
Brighton with extra large 
lot; and low taxes. By 
owner. $8,750. 227-5859 
Brighton. 

atf 
CITY of Brighton: one of 

• Brighton's older homes in 
lovely area of the city. 
This 4 bdrm. home is full 
brick construction with 
natural fireplace in living 
room, corner lot. Many 
plus features you will 
marvel at. Land Mark 
Real Estate, 9947 E . 
Grand River, Brighton. 
229.2945. 

^74 
AT Rush Lake: Lovely 3 
bedroom home on 2 lots, 
iv:! car garage, high Pine 
trees, lake and golf 
course privileges. Priced 
to sell at $23,900. Robert 
Herndon Rea l ty Co. 
Brighton Office : 3303 
East M-36,878-315/. Sat. & 
Sun. only. Maifi Office: 
1100 North Telegraph Rd. 
Dearborn, Mich . 1.278-
4020 daily. 

A-24 

F O W L E R V I L L E , 1 year 
old, 3 bedroom home with 
full basement, kitchen, 
dining area, and living 
room, also IVj baths. 517-
223-8420 Fowlerville. 

A24 

B R I G H T O N - L A K E 
M O R I N A 
Two new 3 bedroom 
C u s t o m R a n c h e s , 
Dishwasher , 
f i r e p l a c e , f u l l y 
carpeted. 10 minutes 
f rom G e n e r a l Motors 
P rov ing G r o u n d & 2V2 
m i l e s f r o m 1-96. 
R e s t r i c t e d S u b ­
d i v i s i o n w i t h l a k e 
p r i v i l e g e s . I m ­
mediate Occupancy . 
$39,700 

H I G H L A N D 
New three bedrooin bi-
IevBl. Ail carpeted, garage, 
future bath, bedroom and 
family room on lower le­
vel. Imed. occupancy. 

O N L Y $29,700 

H A R T L A N D 
New three bedroom start­
er home. A l l carpeted, 
with utility room. 8 0 x ' 
140 foot wooded lot. 

O N L Y $21,950 

New three bedroom and 
living room all carpeted, 
full basement, 75x200 
foot lot. 30 day occupancy. 

O N L Y $23,700 

F O R I N F O R M A T I O N 

STOP O R C A L L 
B U I L D E R S , F U R N I S H E D 

S A L E S M O D E L 
Mon. thru Sat. 9-6 

Sundays l-S 
I077W.HIghIand Rd. 

(IVI-S9) 
I mi. W. of H/lllford Rd. 

887-1001 887-1002 

A D L E R 

H O M E S , I N C 

L a k e of the P i n e s , B r igh ton - cu s tom bui l t 3 
bedroom b r i c k r a n c h on comple te ly wooded 
lot. En joy the p r i v a c y and peace of a dead 
end street. Heated 2 c a r a t t ached . 

j ' gBr^ . fdnr t l lyyroora , tV2?ba,ths,': vyalkoufct^:.- -
b a s e m e n t / d i s h w a s h e r , built-Ins,- a l so l a k e 
p r iv i l eges , $43,000 227-7626 

B R I G H T O N C I T Y — c h a r m i n g 3 B R cape cod, 
f a m . r m . p lus ful l basement . L o v e l y la rge 
shady lot w i t h i n w a l k i n g to schools, churches , 
shopping . B 515 

B R I G H T O N A R E A — 3 B R r a n c h , good l i v i n g . 
Fenced In back y a r d , room for g a r d e n . M o v e 
r igh t In. R e d u c e d for qu ick sa le . $19,000. 
C0423 

H A R T L A N D A R E A — T r e e s m a k e a love ly 
set t ing for this 3 y r . o l d 3 B R ranch w i t h ful l 
basement . 2 c a r de tached ga r age & a 
playhouse inc luded In th is p r i ce of $27,900. 
Won ' t last. C O 513 

T O V 7 ^ N # s C X > ^ l J i N 

mi f l U T E • I t l E l l P I I I 

. 1 

102 E . Grand River 
Brighton, Mich. 

I I I 1 I I I I I 9 I I I E I I I E I 

P H O N E : 227-1111 

call collect 
O P E N S U N D A Y 10-4 

B R I G H T O N 

106 P L E A S A N T 
V A L L E Y . Save on 
heat ing th i s w i n t e r 
w i t h n a t u r a l 
f i rep lace w i t h r a i s e d 
hearth offered in this 
3 bedroom home w i t h 
f a m i l y r o o m , u t i l i t y 
room, basement , 2 
ca r a t t ached ga r age 
and over an a c r e . 
C a l l 684-1065 

• • • • 

U N A D I L L A 

18374 W A S S O N . 10 
ac re m i n i horse f a r m 
offering 4 bedroom 
home w i t h 2 barns , 
u t i l i t y r o o m , 
b a s e m e n t , n e w 
c a r p e t i n g , 2 c a r 
g a r a g e a n d m u c h 
more . C a l l 684-1065 

R O S E C E N T E R 

B L U E W A T E R . L a k e p r iv i l eges a re but one 
of the m a n y features offered w i t h this new 3 
bedroom home w i t h basement , f a m i l y r o o m , 
ga rage and m a n y other options a l l on one 
t h i rd ac re . C a l l 684-1065 

C O M I V I E R C E 

5V2 acres of r o l l i n g 
c o u n t r y s i d e w i t h 
apple trees, map le s , 
and w i l l o w s can be 
yours when y o u o w n 
this 3 bedroom home 
wth ga rden , u t i l i t y 
room, carpe t ing th ru ­
out, and 2 c a r ga rage . 
$45,900. C a l l 684-1065 

• • • • 

H A R T L A N D 

1114 L A K E V I E W F i e l d s t o n e a n d b r i ck f a m i l y 
home offering. 3 bedrooms; basement , u t i l i t y 
r o o m , f i r ep lace , t e r r ace , a n d 2 car ga rge . 
C a l l 684-1065 ( P a l a c e G u a r d ) 

O n i . 

H I G H L A N D 

2929 C E N T R A L . 
Serve the boss d inne r 
tonight in the d in ing 
r o o m of t h i s 
a l u m i n u m 3 bedroom 
h o m e w i t h l a k e 

privileges, fencing 
and u t i l i ty r o o m . C a l l 
684-1065 

N E A R B r i g h t o n 
e l e m e n t a r y s c h o o l . 
Nearly completed 3 
bedroom ranch. Built-in 
dishwasher and range, 
carpeted throughout. Ful l 
basement and 2 car 
garage attached. $38,900. 
Chelsea 475-2729 

atf 

3 U I L D I N G ? Let us 
g i v e y o u a f ree 
e s t i m a t e on y o u r 
plans or select a p lan 
f rom our l a rge file.. 

Howel l T o w n & 
Count ry , Inc. 

125 South Lafayet te 
South L y o n 

437-1729 227-7775 

C U S T O M B U I L T 

R A N C H , 

C O L O N I A L S 

C O M P L E T E L Y 

F I N I S H E D 

' 1 8 , 6 0 0 

O n Y o u r L o t 

3 b e d r o o m , b r i c k 
ranch 40' w ide , ful l 
bsmt.over 1000 sq.ft . 
I n s u l a t i o n w a l l s & 
ce i l ing — ha rdwood 
f l o o r s . W i l l ! : ; i l d 
w i th in 30 mi le . , of 
Detroi t . M o d e l a n d 0-
f f i c e a t 23623 W . 
M c N i c h o l s , 2 b i k s 
eas t of T e l e g r a p h . 
Owner P a r t i c i p a t i o n 
W e l c o m e . 

C & L H O M E S 

KE-7-3640 KE-7-2699 

340 N.: CentM- 34940S0 
Northville 

16903 N O R T H V I L L E R D . 
E x c e p t i o n a l l y nice 2 
bedroom home w i t h 
enclosed p o r c h , 2 ca r 
garage , e x t r a s torage 
shed on t reed lot. 
Ideal for the young 
f a m i l y or re t i rees . 

; ~- i f ra i7 ,LiND£Nd 
- 3 - b e d r o o m , ' 2 s to ry 

home, double l a v . in 
b a t h , f i n i s h e d r e c . 
room in basement , 
close to schools and 
s h o p p i n g , one c a r . 
ga rage . 

1020 A L L E N D R I V E 
Tas tefu l ly decora ted 
3 b e d r o o m b r i c k 
ranch w i t h f in ished 
w a l k out basement on 
to n i c e l y t e r r a c e d 
l a w n , 2 c a r garage . 
Quick occupancy . 

21482 S U M M E R S I D E 
Superbly landscaped 
one a c r e lot w i t h 
O l y m p i c s i z e poo l 
wi th patio designed 
fo r e n t e r t a i n i n g . 
Poo l , lounging and < 
c h a n g i n g r o o m , , 
f a m i l y room w i t h wet 
bar and re f r igera tor , 
2V2 baths, r ec r o o m , 
ex t r a s torage rooms , 
cedar c loset , la rge 
ki tchen-dinet te a r ea 
w i t h a l l b u l l t - i n s . 
Ca threda l ce i l ings in 
l i v i n g r o o m a n d 
d i n i n g a r e a w i t h 
large stone f i r ep l ace , 
4 bedroom comple te 
this love ly home w i t h 
r e d w o o d d e c k of f 
master bed room. 

402 N O R T H C E N T E R 
4 b e d r o o m f r a m e 
h o u s e , s e p a r a t e 
d i n i n g r o o m , f i r s t 
floor l aundry , ea t ing 
a rea in k i t c h e n , close 
to hear t of t own . 

541 L A N G F I E L D 
4 bedroom b r i c k a n d 
a l u m i n u m C o l o n i a l 
w i t h l a r g e f a m i l y 
r o o m , f i r e p l a c e In 
l i v i n g r o o m , IV2 
baths, ful l basement , 
at tached ga r age , gas 
b a r b e q u e i n b a c k 
y a r d . I m m e d i a t e 
occupancy . 

21285 S U M M E R S I D E 
3 bedroom cus tom 
buil t b r i c k r a n c h , we t 

.plaster , w i t h f a m i l y , 
room and f i r ep lace , 2 
f u l l b a t h s , f u l l 
f inished basement 
wi th bar , 2 a t t ached 
g a r a g e w i t h 
a u t o m a t i c d o o r 
opener, on beautiful 
V2 a c r e lot. 
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FOUR bedroom ranch, 
family room & full 
basement. Occupancy 30 
days with 1-5 acres. 
Owner 437-2441. 

HOUSE and Fun Golf 
course on 2 acres. 266 foot 
of Grand River frontage. 
227-3501. Brighton. 

a-24 

C I T Y P R O P E R T Y 
3 bedroom r a n c h , features a l a rge k i tchen , 
l i v ing r o o m , d in ing a rea , w a l k out to pat io , 
and p a r t i a l l y fenced y a r d . L O W D O W N to 
qua l i f i ed buyer . P r i c e d at $20,500.00. 

3 bedroom r a n c h featur ing a l a rge l i v i n g 
room, k i t chen , full bath, ca rpor t . P r i c e d a t 
only $17,500.00. 

C O U N T R Y L I V I N G 
4 acres w i t h a Pond , love ly 3 bedroom a l l 
b r i ck r a n c h featur ing a cus tom k i tchen , l a rge 
l iv ing r o o m , d in ing a r e a , f i re place, ful l 
basement , 32 x 64 barn w i t h cement f loor , 
addi t ional ac reage a v a i l a b l e . P r i c e d at 
$58,000.00. 

4 bedroom Colon ia l s i tuated on 1 ac re , on ly 1 
mi l e f rom 1-96. Fea tures a cus tom k i tchen 
wi th bui l t - ins , d in ing a rea , l a rge f a m i l y room 
wi th f i re place and wa lkou t , b r i c k & A l u m , 
ex ter ior , wet p las ter , 2 ca r a t tached garage , 
paved d r i v e , ful l basement , I M M E D I A T E 
O C C U P A N C Y . P r i c e d at $45,900.00. 

L A K E P R O P E R T Y 
Exce l l en t cottage or y e a r round home 
features 1 l a rge bedroom w i t h addi t iona l 
bedroom poss ib i l i ty , n ice k i t chen , f a m i l y 
r o o m w i t h f i r e p l a c e , a t t a c h e d g a r a g e , 
a l u m i n u m s id ing . P r i c e d at $29,000.00 

3 bedroom lake front, a l l b r i ck r anch , 
features a cus tom k i tchen la rge f a m i l y r o o m , 
2 f i rep laces , ca rpe t ing , s p r i n k l e r sy s t em, 
d i shwasher , r ange & d i sposa l . P r i c e d at on iy 
$38,900.00 

4 bedroom a l l b r i c k ranch w i t h frontage on 
beautiful Coon L a k e . This home features a 
cus tom k i t chen w i t h bul l t - ins . Including a 
s i d e - b y - s l d e r e f . , s t o v e & d i s h w a s h e r , 
plastered w a l l s , paneled f a m i l y r o o m , 2 
f i replaces , cove red pat io , 2V2 baths, un­
derground s p r i n k l e r s y s t e m , fantast ic land­
scaping a n d m a n y m o r e features. T r u l y a n 
execut ive home. P r i c e d to sel l a t on ly 
$68,000.00 

4 bedroom sp l i t l eve l w i t h over 2500 sq . ft. of 
l iv ing space , fea tur ing a cus tom ki tchen w i t h 
self c l ean ing oven a n d d i shwasher , l a rge 
f a m i l y r o o m w i t h f i rep lace and bul l t - ln 
b a r B Q , f o r m a l d in ing r o o m , l i v i n g room, 
cus tom drapes , c a rpe t i ng , beamed ce i l ings , 
IV2 c e r a m i c baths, good beach , n ice ly land-
scaped . P r i c e d at only $56,900.00. 

F A R M S 
P R I C E R E D U C E D S P E C I A L - 44 ac res w i t h 
a l u m , s ided house, la rge ba rn , 4 other out 
buirdihgs,!firbhtage op blacktdp,^6tfly 2:m'lt^s^-' 
f r om 1-96, 2 porids on 'proper ty , ' some^ woods, 
excel lent inves tment . $106,000.00 

40 to 80 ac r e s w i t h 3 bedroom home a n d 
barns, zoned for dog kennels , land c u r r e n t l y 
In soi l bank , exce l len t inves tment . On ly 1 
m i l e f rom exis t ing golf course a n d close to 
m a i n h ighways . P r i c e d f rom $78,000.00 

New 3 bedroom bi - leve l s i tuated on 25 acres 
w i t h a 24 x 32 barn and a s p r i n g fed pond, 
features a cu s tom k i t chen , large l i v i n g r o o m , 
d in ing r o o m , ful l basement , u t i l i t y r o o m , 
f i r ep lace , c a r p e t i n g . T r u l y a beautiful set-
t ing . P r i c e d a t on ly $83,500.00. 

V A C A N T L A N D 
7 acres on b lacktop road c lose to 1-96. Only 
$1,500.00 per a c r e . 

4 acres on b lacktop road c lose to 1-96. Only 
$9,500.00. 

63/4 ac res on ly 2 m i l e s f rom 1-96. P r i c e d a t 
$11,500.00. 

nV4 acres only V* m i l e f rom M-59. O n l y 
$16,500.00 

Bu i ld ing s i tes , paved roads , underground 
w i r i n g , na tu ra l gas . L a n d con t rac t t e rms 
a v a i l . 

O P E N H O U S E S A T . 8< S U N . 1-5 P . M . 
6 bedroom a l l b r i ck r anch w i t h s w i m m i n g 
pool , s i tua ted on a % a c r e count ry set t ing, 
only % m i l e s f rom 1-96. Fea tures a cus tom 
ki tchen w i t h bui l t - ins , la rge l i v i n g room, 
fo rmal d i n i n g r o o m , 2V2 baths, f i rep lace , ful l 
basement, 2 c a r a t tached garage , paved 
d r i v e , l a rge t rees cen t r a l v a c u u m s y s t e m , a i r 
condi t ion ing , i n t e r c o m and m a n y m o r e ex-
t ras . P r i c e d at $55,000.00. 

** 
n Muon Rd. 
X 

15^ OPEN HOUSE 

iff Norton Rd. 

S E R V I N G A L L O F 
L I V I N G S T O N 

C O U N T Y 

C O U N T R Y R A N C H 
H O M E 

Between Br igh ton & 
A n n A r b o r 

Landscaped 1 and 1-5 
acres , garden space 
p l u s f r u i t t r e e s . 
L a r g e l i v i n g r o o m 
w i t h f i r e p l a c e , IV2 
b a t h s , s p a c i o u s 
c o u n t r y k i t c h e n , 
enclosed porch , 2-car 
ga rage . Low taxes . 
Owner 227-4418 

L A K E 8, R I V E R 

L A K E C H E M U N G -
Older sunnmer home 
on l a rge beautiful ly 
wooded lot. Safe s and 
beach , ga rage , v e r y 
w e l l k e p t . $22,950 
T e r m s . 

W i n a n s L a k e , 
spacious Cape Cod 
wi th a l l custom ex­
tras, 4 b d r m s . , 3 ful l 
b a t h s , c a r p e t i n g , 
drapes , k i tchen built-
i n s , r e f r i g e r a t o r , 
washer , d r y e r . 2,400 
sq . ft. of l uxu ry plus 
1,000 s q . f t . s e m i 
f in ished over garage 
and f a m i l y r o o m . On 
ro l l i ng wooded ac r e . 
$67,500 

Howel l - Beautiful a l l 
b r i c k 1600 ft. cus tom 
ranch on V2 ac re , 
c e n t r a l a i r c o n d . . 
Insulated windows , 
gas i nc ine ra to r , f a m . 
r m . f i r ep l ace , pat io, 
V4 m i l e off G r a n d 
R i v e r o n p r i v a t e 
d r i v e . Reduced to sel l 
$38,500 

C O M M E R C I A L 
V A C A N T 
B R I G H T O N 
Over an ac re w i t h 316 
feet on O l d 23 visible 
from 196 exp res sway . 
E x c e l l e n t s i t e . 
T e r m s . 

191 feet on Grrand 
R i v e r , 20a ft; deep, 

,calmer/!Wot*betMi(ieert • 
- ^ B f i i g h t o n ' - M a i l - " & 

downtown Br igh ton . 
A p a r t m e n t complex 
a p p r o v e d d i r e c t l y 
b e h i n d t h i s s i t e . 
$68,000 T e r m s . 

H O W E L L 
500 feet on G r a n d 
R i v e r 600 feet deep. 
A l m o s t 7 a c r e s 
$150,000 T e r m s . A l s o 
up to 120 adjoining 
acres a v a i l a b l e w i t h 
l a k e f r o n t a g e a n d 
wooded h i l l . 

2 a c r e B u i l d i n g si te 
close to Br igh ton a n d 
X - w a y e n t r a n c e . 
Good for walk ou t . 
Water , some trees. 
C A N B E S P L I T . 
$7,900 Not m a n y l ike 
this left c lose to town. 

10 ac res off 196 and 
AA59. R o l l i n g , some 
t r e e s a n d p o n d 
p o t e n t i a l a t r e a r . 
$25,000 T e r m s 

L I V I N G S T O N 
R E A L E S T A T E 

A s k for 
D i c k e r A / ^ r g e Sel leck 

Br igh ton 229-2976 
1-800-552-0316 

A N D C O N S T R U C T I O N 

Licensed Home Builders 

2 6 4 9 E . G R A N D R I V E R , H O W E L L 

( 5 1 7 ) 5 4 6 - 5 6 1 0 

B R I G H T O N , By Owner: 4 
bedroom brick colonial, 
all electric, landscaped, 
fenced, fireplace, fuiiy 
carpeted, full basement. 
1'/2 baths, excellent 
condit ion. 535,900. 227-
3281 or 229-6717 Brighton. 

A T F 

B R I G H T O N : 4 Artiles 
South. Completing large 
multi-featured ranches, 
on beautiful V* acre lots. 
Go West off route 23 on 
Winans Lake Rd . to 
Hamburg double arrow. 
Then right over Huron 
River to Winans View 
Sub. Follow signs or call 
229-2925 or 313-464-0127 
L i v o n i a . E x c e l i e n t 
central location on ex­
pressways to Lans ing , 
Flint, Detroit and Ann 
Arbor. 

F o r c o m p l e t e r e a l 
estate needs, c a l l 
G E O R G E V A N B O N N 

H A R T F O R D R E A L 
E S T A T E 

437-1951 
New or used homes, 
b u i l d i n g 
C o m m e r c i 
Business . 
M e m b e r 
U N R A 

2-3 M o b i l e H o m e s 

'67AAarelle, 12x63, 7x 13 
expando, carpeted, air 
conditioned, ref. stove & 
shed. May stay on lot. 
$5600. or best offer. 
Brighton 229-8043. 

a-24 

1965 parkwood, 12 x 52, 
very good cond. partly 
f u r n i s h e d , $2 ,950 . 
Brighton 229-2630 

a24 

R i C H A R D S O N , 8 x 32. 
S850. excellent condition. 
313-545-6517 

a24 

l4x 65, many extras. Best 
offer. Brighton 229-8976 

a 24 

1970 P M C , 12 x 60, 2 
b e d r o o m , c a r p e t i n g , 
central a i r , 10 x 28 
awning, skirting, 2 car 
parking space, 7 x 10 
shed, lake privileges. Call 
after.Sp.m. Brighton 227-
7588 

: ," .a24-: 

L I V E L I K E A 
M I L L I O N A I R E 

Choice si tes ava i l ab l e 
w i t h p u r c h a s e of 
mobi le home in our 
b e a u t i f u l m o b i l e 
h o m e c o m m u n i t y 
wi th s w i m m i n g pool 
and Recrea t ion H a l l . 
New & L a t e model 
m o b i l e h o m e s , 
f e a t u r i n g O x f o r d , 
C h a m p i o n , B a y v i e w , 
H i l l c r e s t & M a n s i o n . 

58220 W . 8 M i l e R d . 
Open D a i l y 9-7, Sun . 

1-6 
437-2046 

C O U N T R Y E S T A T E S 

S A L E S & P A R K 

NEW and U S E D Mobile 
Homes. We have many 
models to choose from at 

:big savings to you and 
>high trade-in allowances 
for your present home, if 
you're planning on a 

"Mobile Home, see us 
before closing your deal, 
we feature Delta, Sylvan, 
London and Somerset and , 
we have choice modern' 
lots to choose from. West-
Highland Mobile Home 
Park, 2760 South Hickory 
Ridge Road , M i l f o r d , 
(313) 685-1959. 

A T F 

L I V E beside a lake, 
brand new 12 x 50 
Champion, $4495., 10987 
Silver Lake Rd. 229-6679 
Brighton. 

atf 

L o o k i n g for a 
Doub lewide? Save 
$600.00 on a 1972 
D i s p l a y M o d e l 

D A R L I N G 
M O B I L E H O M E 

24' x 6Q' 3 ,Bedrooms, 
2 baths, f a m i l y room, 
fu l ly carpeted and 
f u r n i s h e d . P L U S : 
C e n t r a l A i r , 
F i r e p l a c e , sk i r t i ng , 
s t e p s , d e l i v e r e d & 
set-up. 

M - F 10-8 
Sat 10-6 
Sun 1-5 

NoviRd.(1 Blocks, of G.R.) 
NOVI . 349-1047 

L A T E model. New Moon, 
10 X 50, furnished, ex­
cellent condition may 
stay on lot. $2695, 517-685-
1959. 

a-24 

A L L M'OBILE Homes to 
-be sold at big discounts. 
Buy now and save, ex­
cellent terms, immediate 
occupancy. 9 models to 
choose from $4495.00 up. 
F e a t u r i n g M a r l e t t e - . 
Delta and Homette. Live 
in* our new deluxe park 
with a l l modern facilities 
and low rent. Cedar River 
Mobile Home Park and 
Sales, 1 quarter mi le 
north of 1-96 at Fowler-
viiie exit. 517-223-8500. 

A T F 

12 X 65 Park Estate, ex­
cellent condition. Must 
sell. Skirting and shed. 
May stay on lot. Hartland 
632-7288. 

a-24 

14 W I D E S 
O N D I S P L A Y 

12 W I D E S T O O 
E x c i t i n g N e w 
AAarlette, Champions 
a n d P a r k E s t a t e . 
B r i g h t o n - V i l l a g e , 

7500 G r a n d R i v e r , 10 
a . m . t o 8 p . m . Sunday 
by a p p t . 1-313-229-
6679. 

L A K E F R O N T home, 
water skiing lake, county 
road, extra large yard. 
Ready for expansion into 
attic. Just off X-way at 
Brighton $34,500. Land­
mark Real Estate, 9947 E . 
Grand River, Brighton 
229-2945. 

A24 

140 N . Center 34»-»0«C 
Northville 

Lake lot over look ing 
L a k e C h e m u n g . 
La rge trees. 

2-6 V a c a n t P r o p e r t y 

PINE treed lot, approx. 
90 X 198. $9000. Lake of the 
Pines, Brighton 229-9443. 

.a24 

ONE acre lot, Northville, 
d e s i r a b l e l o c a t i o n , 
Meadowbrook Country 
Club area, 349-3252. 

C O T T A G E 

W H I T M O R E L A K E 
Y e a r r o u n d 2 
bedroom home, ove r 
200 ft. wa te r fron­
tage, l a rge lot, fur­
ni ture inc luded , 
ca l l E a r l K e i m Rea l t y 

Y p s i l a n t i , M i c h . 

(313) 485-8700 

340 N . Center' 349-40SC 
Northville 

4 ac res on p r i v a t e 
d r i v e on Glenda off 
Pont iac T r a i l c lose to 
196. 

L Y O N T O W N S H I P 
2 ac res on Pon t i ac 
T r a i l , horses a l l o w e d . 

10x60 Great Lakes, fur­
nished, excellent con­
dition, mtjst sell, may 
stay on lot. P r i ce 
negot!able:Call after 7:30 

W I L L I A M S B U r ' g , 12x60, 
patio, awnings, skirting. 

S A L E M T O W N S H I P 
7.88 ac res on Chubb 
R o a d . 500 pine t rees , 
r ea r 3 ac res h e a v i l y 
wooded. 

Con^n i i^c j i a l 

shed, in Sylvan Glen 
Park. Moving must Sell. 
227-7288 Brighton. 

A-24 

Y E A R E N D 
. C L E A R A N C E . While, 
they last. A brand new 
12x50 Sylvan, $4,349. A 
brand new 12x60 P . M . C . 
$5,149. and other similar 
deals. These are loaded 
with extras and price 
includes set up on lot. 313-
685-1959. West Highland 
Mobile Homes. 2760 South 
Hickory Ridge R d . , 
Milford. 

A-24 

1971 Champion, deluxe, 12 
x 60, 2 bdrms., wall to 
wall carpeting, drapes, 
partially furnished, TV 
antenna, skirting, double 
wide off street parking. 
Located Sy lvan Glen 
E s t a t e s , B r i g h t o n . 
Available Oct. 1 227-6695. 
if no answer Pinckney 
878-3892. 

A-25 

STORE, 800 sq. ft. on 
Center Street, NorthviIle. 
Ideal for commercial or 
professional use, 349-5175. 

1 B E D R O O M apartment, 
downtown Brighton, No 
children or pets, call after 
7:00, 227-7167 Brighton. 

A24 

N O R T H V I L L E , un­
furnished 6 room upper, 
stove, refrigerator, heat 
included. Paved parking, 
space for washer and 
dryer. Newly decorated. 
Adults only. Immediate 
occupancy. $160 per 
month plus securi ty 
deposit. 255-4854 

Two bedroom duplex, 
carpeted throughout, 
range, refrigerator, air 
conditioned, carport, $165 
per month plus security 
deposit, Hartland 1-632-
7508. 

atf 

One room efficiency 
apartment, phone 437-
2410. 

htf 

BRIGHTON: near Free­
w a y , 2 bedroom fur­
nished apartment on 
private lake. Beautiful 
view. NO! Pets. $150 
monthly. 1-971-4176 Ann 
Arbor. 
a24 

NEW duplex Apt. near 
Mal l , 2 bedroom, car­
peting, deck. Open 
basement 8. garage. $210 
a mo. Brighton 229-4225 

atf 

ONE bedroom furnished 
8i carpeted, no children or 
pets, secur i ty deposit. 
Brighton 229-6029 

For rent : apartment , 
56808 Grand River, up­
stairs , unfurnished, 3 
room, $130. per month 
Pius utilities. 464-3371. 

B R I G H T O N : 2 bedroom 
apartment, no pets, 
adults only. A v a i l a b l e 
Oct. 1. 474-4649. 

B A R N apartment, l 
b e d r o o m , c o u p l e 
preferred. No smoking, 
drugs, or alcohol. Rent 8t 
utilities S60. per month 
plus 3 hrs. per week 
maintenance help. 349-
2495. 

S H A R P 2 bedroom, 
carpeted, appl iances , 
fireplace, $200. monthly 
with heat. A v a i l a b l e 
October 1st. 229-9430 
Brighton. 

A-24 

F U R N I S H E D l bedroom 
apartment. $135. mon­
thly. 229-2525 Brighton. 

A-24 

MODERN one bedroom 

"^rei^lgeratoTv 
--df^apes-: Woohf-ftji^sh-for' 

bachelor. $135. Security 
and Lease R E Q U I R E D . 
229.6672 Brighton. 

A-24 

3-1 H o u s e s 

2-4 F a r m s , A c r e a g e 

P R I V A T E . P a r t y in­
terested in buying 10 or 15 
acres in South Lyon area. 
425-5252. 
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2-5 L a k e P r o p e r t y 
BRIGHTON - Fonda Lake 
Frontage - 2 bedroom 
cottage, natural gas, new 
Franklin fireplace, 2 car 
garage, $15,500 cash. 474-
3575 

H:»7 

E Y E ­

C A T C H I N G 

Quality Built Homes by Carrigan 

Y o u haven't found that home you've been looking for? Look no farther 
than our Brighton office. If we haven't built your home ye t -we w i l l . 

C A R R I G A N 
Qual i ty Homes Inc. 

201 E - G r a n d R i v e r - Br igh ton 
227-6914 227-6450 

Check our quality at any of our models at Pleasant View Estates on Rickett 

M o d e l s open 3-6 d a l l y - Sunday 1-6 

B R I G H T O N area, 2 
bedroom furnished. No 
pets, references, i> 
secur i ty . Immediate 
possession. 229-2283. 

H A M B U R G - near Buck 
Lake - 2 bedroom home, 
garage. Phone South 
Lyon 437-6232 after 6 p.m., 
S175 month, deposit , 
references. 

H37 

SOUTH Lyon - 3 bedroom 
tri-level, al l appliances, 
fireplace, family room, 2 
car garage, immediate 
occupancy. $275 a month. 
First and last months 
rent. Secur i ty deposit. 
437-6258 

H37 

T w o Bedroom duplex, 
near Pinckney, stove and 
refrigerator furnished, 
$185. monthly, plus 
deposit (313) l-426-4098. 

A-24 

W O O D L A N D L a k e : 
Execut ive 3 bedroom 
brick. Carpeting, drapes, 
refrigerator and stove. 
S250. with utilities and 
Security deposit. 229-6731 
Brighton. 

A T F 

B R I G H T O N : House, 4 
room, bath, basement, 
references. Call evenings, 
Saturday and Sunday 
afternoon. 1-435-2431 
Clawson. 

A-24 

S I N G L E person. Fur -
nished cottage, gas and 
lights incIuded $35. 
weekly, IsIand L a k e , 
Brighton Area. 1-313-474-
5377 Farmington. 

A-24 

FIRST Of October ti l l end 
of June. $185. monthly, lst 
& last months rent. $130. 
securi ty deposit. Com-
pletely furnished. 227-7864 
or 1-313-274-4783 Dear-
born. 

A-24 

N O R T H V I L L E 
G R E E N 

D e l u x e 1 a n d 2 
bedroom. Immedia te 
o c c u p a n c y . R e n t 
f rom $185. Includes 
a l l app l iances , d ish-
w a s h e r , b a l c o n y 
p o r c h , c a r p e t i n g , 
central a i r c o n ­
d i t i o n i n g , s t o r a g e 
locker , and laundry 
fac i l i t i e s . 
On E i g h t M i l e a t 
R a n d o l p h Vi M i l e 
west of Sheldon 349-
7743 

t f 

3-2 A p a r t m e n t s 

D U P L E X Apts . , near 
Mal l , 2 bedroom, car-
peting, stove & 
refrigerator. $170 a mo. 
Brighton 229-4225 

A T F 

ONE bedroom furnished 
;year round Apt. No 
children or pets. 6517 
Edgewood Dr. Brighton 

a19 
A21 
A24 

New E x p e r i e n c e | n 
Coun t ry L i v i n g 
sound proofed, 

stove, re f r igera tor , 
d i shwasher & a i r 

condi t ion ing , 
fu l ly ca rpe ted . 

T w o 2 bedroom $183 
A d u l t s o n l y . A l l 
u t i l i t i e s e x c e p t 
e l ec t r i c i t y . 

5942S10Mile 
a p p r o x . Vi m i l e 
E . o f South L y o n ' 

437-0026 M l 2-5739 

W h y B u y ? 

Welcome t o new modem 

P o n - T r a i l A p t i . 

Y O U NOW C A N E N J O Y 

Modern Estate Living 

• I S S t o M T S 

1 & 2 Bedroom Apts . 
Price Includes: 

•Heat & AIr Cond. 
*Oven & Range 
*R«fri9erator-Cvpetln9 

Enloy Urge Mich. Woods 
Nature Trail 

-Comniunity BIdg. 

V Pong* 

silver U t 

Pontiac Tr. ' 

5 - « . -

South Lyon—2 bedroom 
apartment. Adults only. 
$145 Heat and air in-
eluded. $100 security. 437-
1680. 

h-36 

ONE and two bedroom 
apartments, chi ldren 
w e l c o m e , $l50-$165. 
Bonadeo Builders, 437-
3759 

HTF 

3-3 R o o m s 

TWO room furnished 
a p a r t m e n t . U t i l i t i e s 
furnished. Centra l to 
town. Adult only. Call 
after 2 p.m. Phone 349-
3449. 

3-5 M o b i l e H o m e 
S K e s 

ONE permanent site for 
travel trailer in park 
beside Silver Lake. 10987 
Silver Lake Rd. 313-437-
6211. 

atf 

C I T Y O F ' 

S O U T H L Y O N 

New Park-No Entry Fee 
Choice sites now 
available in the city of 
South Lyon. Quiet, safe. 
Walk ing distance to 
shopping, churches, 
schools. AM iots feature 
large patios 8. private 
side drives. City sewer, 
water & gas. Follow 
Pontiac Trail to city of 
South Lyon. Park en­
trance 200 ft. south of 
Kroger Supermarket. 

South Lyon Woods 
505 S. Lafayette 

(Pontiac Trail) 

4 3 7 - 0 6 7 6 

3-6 S p a c e 

3 -7 V a c a t i o n R e n t a l s 

6 M O D E R N lake front 
c o t t a g e s , b a t h i n g , 
boating, fishing, hunting 
and snowmobiling. Beach 
Grove Resort, Zone 30, 
H o u g h t o n L a k e , 
Michigan, 1.517-422-5344, 
M r . and M r s . J i m 
Lecyour hosts. 

HTF 

3-8 W a n t e d T o R e n t 

F A M I L Y Of three would 
Uke..to.rjMi.t:aof 3.bedroom 

ABr.faMon» r-Sftumt. L y o n , 
New Hudson area. Phone 
1-685-8167 

H37 

R E S P O N S I B L E man 
would like 3 or 4 bedroom 
home with basement. To 
rent or with option to buy. 
227-6828 Brighton. 

A-24 

C O T T A G E or mobile 
home, stove and 
refrigerator necessary. 
Whitmore Lake vicinity 
preferred. $125. range. 
Retired coupie. Van 313-
878-6854. Pinckney. 

A-24 

W O R K I N G couple wants 
2 bedroom apartment or 
flat. Reasonably priced. 
After 4:30-836-4056. 

S T A T E Pol ice Officer 
wishes 2 or 3 bedroom 
home in Northville. 349-
1447. 

H O U S E H O L D 

4-1 A n t i q u e s 

G R A N D F A T H E R Clock, 
b o w e d g i a s s c h i n a 
cabinet, 1869 pine trunk, 8 
pc. dining suites, hanging 
lamps, secretary, rolled 
top, s lant top desks, 
commodes, washseu 
round tables, cha i r s , 
rockers , htboy chest, 
bel ls , spinningwheels , 
lanterns, kerosene lamps, 
churns, china, glassware. 
Refrigerator. 517-546-0686 

a24 

A N T I Q U E S 
M A R K E T 

A n n A r b o r , Sunday 
Sept. 17, (Beautiful 
N e w L o c a t i o n ) 
W a s h t e n a w F a r m 
Counc i l Grounds 5055 
S a l i n e A n n A r b o r 
Road , E x i t 175,1-94, 
Sou th 3 m i l e s , 11 
a . m . - 5 p . m . . F r e e 
A d m i s s i o n , 50 a c r e s 
f r ee p a r k i n g o n 
p r emi se s . 

4 - 1 B - G a r a g e a n d > 
R u m m a g e Sa les 

P o n - T r a i l A p t s . 

399-8282 437-3303 

G A R A G E SALE-1S749 
Portis-off Bradner 8i 5 
Mile . Sept. 14,15, & 16. 14' 
boat, motor 8< trailer. 
Mini-bike, beds, bicycles, 
household items & 
clothing, ping pong table. 

G A R A G E SALE—Sat. , 
Sept. 16, 10 to 5 p.m. 
T e l e v i s i o n , m a n g l e 
ironer, books, toys, tligh 
c h a i r , a n t i q u e s , 
household items. No early 
sales. 466105 Stratford Ct., 
Northville off w. Main . 

AUCTION 
HOUSEHOLD 

ANTIQUE 8.MISC. 
Having sold the property 
we will sell the following 
at public auction at 42201 
12 Mile Rd., Novi, M-
chigan. Located '2 mile 
east of Novi Road 

S U N D A Y , S E P T . 17,at 
1:00 p.m. 
French Prov. Couch 8, 
Chair, Leather Recliner, 
Rocker 8. Ot toman, 
modern Couch 8. Chair, 
lamp Table, Oak Chlf 
ferobe, 3pc. Bedroom set. 
Swivel Rocker , Ducan 
Phyfe Drop Leaf Table, 6 
Oak Chairs, Old Dresser, 
Corner k inckknack shelf 
4 pole lamps, cherry end 
table, several pictures, 
old records, en-
cyclopedias, kitchen table 
— 4 chairs, old bedroom 
set, bunk bed, several end 
tables, odd chairs, small 
chest of drawers, high 
cha i r , typewri ter and 
stand, 2 cribs, old desk, 
oak table, 8 track tape 
player, 5 dining room 
chairs, many fine antique 
d i s h e s . B e a u t i f u l 
Mahogany china cabinet, 
3 old ships, 3 pc. Love seat 
set, Oak step comode, old 
round pedestal table, old 
car horn. 

Inboard boat & trailer, 
dodge power wagon with 
boom 81 wench, 9N Ford 
tractor - 52 with front 8. 
rear blade (front blade 
power up 8. down), stell 
welding table, v ise , 
grinder, hammers, wreh-
ches, 4 way truck lug 
wrench, cable cutter , 
chisels , ut i l i ty t r a i l e r , 
several good truck 8. car 
tires. 

O W N E R : L E O 
R U S S E L L 
Lloyd R. Braun AnnArbor 
665-9646 
Jerry L. Helmer 
P l y m o u t h 453-4 109 

A U C T I O N E E R S 
L U N C H ON G R O U N D S 

C E M E N T block building. 
28 X 56 ft. Whitmore Lake 
area. Securi ty deposit 
required. 437-2526 

H37 

4 - 1 B - G a r a g e a n d 
R u m m a g e Sa les 

OLD School bench, new 
wood burning stove, new 
attic stairway, furniture, 
c l o t h e s , m u c h 
m i s c e l l a n e o u s , Sep­
tember l4-l6, 10:00 to 
5:00, 9840 Blue Water Dr., 
Brighton. 227-6656. 

A-24 

F R I D A Y - S a t u r d a y -
Sunday. Sept. 15,16,17. 
L ike New womans 
clothes, mostly sizes 12 
and 18. Electric range, 
hand made needle point, 
miscellaneous. 216 South 
2nd. street, Brighton. 

A-24 

HOUSEHOLD furniture, 

/•hOit&fc. .hdat..j3nfftf,ar. n 
cyclopedias and many 
other ar t ic les . Lake 
Chemung Apartments, 
517-546-1780 Howell. 

A.24 

B A R N S A L E : September 
16 8< 17. Brass Bed, nails, 
antiques, miscellaneous, 
household. 5080 Pleasant 
Valley Rd., Brighton. 

A-24 

S E P T E M B E R 14 81 15. 
F u r n i t u r e , c l o t h i n g , 
housewares, plumbing 
f ix tures , misc . F r e n c h 
windows, rugs. 8:00 a.m. 
till sold. 3924 Highcrest 
Dr. Little Crooked Lake, 
Brighton. 

A-24 

SEPT . 7 thru 11 and Sept. 
14 thru 18. 10 a.m. to 6 
p.m. 10640 Sharon Dr. 
Island Lake, Brighton. 

A-24 

F R I G I D A R E Electric 
stove, good condition. $50. 
920 West state St., 
Brighton. 227-7664. 

A-24 

G A R A G E S A L E : Young 
Jr. 's clothes—sizes 7 to 
11. Honda 305 8. parts. 
Dishes, towels, men's 
clothing, refrigerat(3r 8. 
lamps, misc. Fri.-Sun., 
Sept. 15-17. 10 a.m. to 6 
p.m. 519 Horton. 

G A R A G E SALE—Ant­
iques, 81 Misc . F r i . 8. Sat., 
Sept. 15 8. 16. After 11 
a.m. 8700 Napier Rd. 

2 F A M I L Y yard sale. If it 
rains—forget it until you 
see our ad again. Baby 
items—car seat, prop-a-
seat, maybe more. Swag 
lamps, bed table lamps, 
cast iron roaster, mixer, 
lots 8. lots of odds 8. ends. 
35 Meadowbrook Lane, 
Country Estates Mobile 
Home Community, 8 Mi le 
at Tower Rd. , Sat., Sept. 
16—10 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

G A R A G E Sale, 5 f a m i l y -
clothing, furniture, sports 
equipment, dishes, etc. 
42061 9 M i l e between 
Meadowbrook 81 Nov i 
Rd., F r i . & Sat., Sept. 15 & 
16, 9 to 6. 

R U M M A G E 8. yard sale. 
Sept. 16 & 17, 9 a.m. ti l l 
dark. 26460 Novi Rd. , at 
196. 

G A R A G E S A L E : Sept. 
13-15. Children's 8. adults 
clothes. Toys , power 
mower, furniture, sports 

equipment 8. household 
items. 41046 Fenmore 
way. Village Oaks Sub., 
Novi. 

G A R A G E sale: Saturday, 
Sept. 16. 9-5 p.m. Clothes, 
windows, much more. 573 
Langfield, Northville. 

G A R A G E sale-Thursday, 
F r iday and Saturday. 
Tools and misc. 40733 
Apollo, Northville. 
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DEADLINE IS 
5 p.m. FRIDAY 

H O U S E H O L D S E R V I C E A N D B U Y E R S D I R E C T O R Y 

DEADLINE IS 
5 p.m. FRIDAY 

Air Conditioning 

T H I N K cool, clean & 
. healtfiy with central air 

conditioning, electronic 
cleaners & gas furnaces. 
New or existing homes. 
Builders welcome. Free 
estimates, call anytime 
227-6074 Brighton. atf 

Brick. Block. Cement 

S T E E L Rounds, Flats, 
. Channels, Angle Irons, 
) Galvanized Sheets. C. G. 

Rolison Hardware, 111 W. 
Main, Brighton 229-841 1. 

A T F 

B R i C K — B L O C K -
C E M E N T W O R K — 
T R E N C H i N G E X -
C A V A T I N G — SEPTIC 
T A N K F I E L D . Phone 229-
2787 Brighton. A T F 

H O R N E T 

; C O N C R E T E C O . 

>»EADY lMIX C O N C R E T E 
SEPTIC T A N K S 
D R Y W E L L S 

299 N . lVlill St. 
South Lyon 

Phone 437-1383 

- C E M E N T wori<, custom 
patios, driveways, garage 
floors, footing, rat walls, 
low price, all work done 
myself. John - 474-8078; 
Glen 474-1980 
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A L L T Y P E S OF 
M A S O N R Y . Brick, Block, 
Stone, Cement Work. New 

• w o r k , a d d i t i o n s , 
alterations. Commercial 
and Res ident ia l . Also 

; repai rs . Cal l 229-2878 
Briahton. 

A & B , I N C . 
C U S T O M CEIVIENT 

W O R K , Sidewall<s 
• Pat ios 
• Ga rage F l o o r s 
• D r i v e w a y s 
O F F I C E P H O N E 
437-1281-437-1474 

-lfnmediate Service on 
any size Jot>—  

C E M E N T Work , a l l 
types, garage f loors, 
porches, drive ways. 449-
2896. ATF 

Biilding & Remodeling 

C O M P L E T E B I d g . 
Service, Resident ia l -
Commercia l -Homes-
Offices-Store Fronts-
Steel-Masonry-Pole 
BIdgs. Briahton 

229 • 8027 a^' 

B e a c o n B u i l d i n g 

C o m p a n y 

- General Contractors -
Residential - Commercial 
Building and Alterations 

Estimates - Your Plans 
or Ours 

We Handle A l l T r a d e s -
One Call Does It A l l 

•Complete Homes 
* Additions 
'Kitchens 
* Aluminum and 

Stone Siding 
'Roof ing and Gutters 
* Porches 
• Cement Work 

PHONE 437-0158 

M O R I A R T Y 

B U I L D I N G S 

F O R F A R M 

A N D I N D U S T R Y 

•Clear Span Construction 
• Colored Steel Siding 
•Quality at Low Cost 
• Planning Service Available 

Caii Us Toaay 

1517} 851-4530 

STOCKBRIDGE. MiCHIGAN 

SUBSiDIABYOFTHE 
WiCKES CORP. 

CEILINGS—suspended, 
priced r ight , free 
estimate, 437-6794. 

HTF 

Building & RemocMing 

A U D I I l O N b 
F A M l L Y ROOAAS 

P A T I O S - G A R A G E S 
C H E C K O U R P R I C E S 

A N D S A V E 
R A L P H A P R I L L 

517-546-4941 

G A R A G E 5 
20x20—TO I N C L U D E 

C L E A R S I D l N G 
A L L C O N C R E T E 

16x7 S T E E L D O O R 
2 B S W l N D 0 W S 

$1,600 
R A L P H A P R l L L 

517-546-4941 

I R V H A Y E S 

Modern iza t ion 
Cont rac tor 

+ A l u m i n u m Sid ing 
and A w n i n g s 

- i -Room Addi t ions 

- f E x p e r t Cement 
Work 

+ G a r a g e s 
Free E s t i m a t e s 

Sat isfact ion 
Guaran teed 

522-7480 L i v o n i a 

G A R A G E D O O R S 

Repaired or Replaced, 

Electric Operator installed 
(313) 425-8437 

BjIldozing & Excaviting 

E X C A \ / A T I N G 

Fi l l Dirt 
Gravel-Grading 

Septic Tanks and 
Drain Fields 

R o n C a m p b e l l 

437-0014 

L E W I S B O G E T T A 
E X C A V A T I N G A N D 

T R U C K I N G 
Sand and G r a v e l 

Water -Sewer-Sept ic 
Sys tems 

B u l l d o z i n g , Backhoe 
Se rv ice 

349-5624 

K O C I A N 

E X C A V A T I N G 

SEWER and W A T E R 

3 4 9 - 5 Q 9 Q 
Livingston 

Excavators Bulldozing 
Back-Hoe Service 

Trucking - Sand & 
Gravel 

Jim Stratford 
632-7212 626-9133 

G R A V E L ' , sand, topsoil, 
etc. S7 up per load. Will 
haul anything. 437-1024 

htf 

L A K E 

D R E D G I N G 

& P O N D S 

B U L L D O Z I N G 

B A S E M E N T S 

D R A G L I N E S 

up to 2 Yd. cap or 100' boom 
F i n a n c i n g A v a i l a b l e 

C A L L C O L L E C T 

3 4 9 - 2 6 5 6 

L E W D O N A L D S O N 

, Carpentry 

C A R P b N T R Y 
B Y J E R R Y 

Add i t i ons , Remode l ing , 
A l u m i n u m s id ing 

349-1728 
F R E E E S T I M A T E S 

Carpentry Landscaping 

C A R P E N T R Y 
.New Homes, Additions, 
A l u m . S i d i n g , 
Remodeling, Any Type of 
Building. 

P I N C K N E Y 
878-3720 

A 27 

Carpet Cleaning 

BOB'S Carpet C lean ing -
Renew the beauty of your 
carpet. 349.5618. 

C A R P E T , F U R N I T U R E 
and Wall Cleaning, by 
Service JViaster, free 
estimates. Rose Service 
Master Cleaning. Howell 
517-546-4560. A F T 

Disposal Service 

W O L F F ' S 
S A N I T A R Y R E M O V A L 

Residential 
Commercial 

437-2335 

Electrical 

E lec t r i c Serv ice . Con­
tract, T . M . , Trouble. Day 
or Night. 24 hr. 517 546-
5926. 

A24 

L 'ESPERANCS-"Elec t r i c , 
Residential, -frtdustrial. 
Commercial, (licensed) 
(313)534-2058.-

H37 

QUALITtI w e S P E C I A L I Z E 

W o r k L i n 

D R Y W A L L Work , 
reasonable. No iob to 
s m a l l . 517-546-1 343 
Howell. 

atf 

Bulldozing & Excavating 

H A T F I E L D 
E X C A V A T I N G 

Basements , Sept ic 
F ie lds , Sewers and 
T r u c k i n g 437-0040 

after 6 p .m. 

DRIVEWAYS 
PARKING LOTS 
ATHLETIC 
COURTS 
RESURFACING 
SEAL COATING 

' E C T O U R W O R K A N D C O M P A R E O U R PRICE 

C O M M E R C I A L R E S I D E N T l A L 

C A L L C O L L E C T 

B R I G H T O N 227-3301 
P I N C K N E Y 878-6755 

Free Estimates Financing Available 
L l C E N S E D & B O N D E D 

C A R P E N T E I T W D T T K 
C A B I N E T S & 

C O U N T E R T O P S 
Also P l u m b i n g Work 

I R W I N E . K I N N E 
9227 P o n t i a c South L y o n 

C a l l 437-2277 Evenings^ 

L I C E N S E D 
C A R P E N T E R 

Licensed carpenter 
needs w o r k . K i t ­
c h e n s , f o r m i c a , 
addi t ions , rec rooms, 
a l u m i n i u m s id ing , 
s to rms , doors, and 
g e n e r a l m o d e r ­
n i z a t i o n . 422-3286 
after 6:00. 

H u n k o ' s E l e c t r i c 
Residential, Commercial 

& Industrial 
Licensed Electrical 

Contractor 
349:4271  

Fenotng 

BOOTH Fencing En­
terprises—do not buy 
your fence until you can 
compare our pr ices , 
resident ial and com­
mercial 437-3391 or 685-
2702. 

HTF 

Floor Service 

F L O O R S A N D I K i e 
F l o o r S a n d i n g & 
F i n i s h i n g , » l d a n d 
new f loors . 

H . B A R S U H N 
437-6522, if no answer , 
EL-6S762 co l l ec t . 

Janitorial 

M A S T E R S Janitorial and 
Maintenance Service . 
Offices c leaned, floors 
washed and waxed. 24 
hour se rv ice . Work 
guaranteed. 878-3547 
Pinckney;.' 

-• .' A TC 

La/idicaping 

TOP—SOIL delivered, 
S17. a load. Fi l l dirt, sand, 
g rave l , beach sand, 
R E A S O N A B L E . Brighton 
227.7562 

ATF 

TOP soil—stone all sizes, 
crushed fieidstone and 
gravel. 349-4296 ^ ^ 

C H E C K T H E S E G O O D V A L U E S A T 

D E X T E R D I S C O U N T P L Y W O O D 

Open Sunday 11:00-3:00 
Creosoted railroad ties • Hurry! Hurry! 

Llmi»efl.SuPply :S3.95 
— K I T C H E N C A B I N E T S , UP T O 40% O F F . • 

Kitchen Carpetln9...Reg. *4.95 This Week Only $3.95 
4' X 8' Mahogany preflnlshed panels «2.99 Ea. 
24'' X 48" Plain White Suspended 

Ceiling Tile 99c Ea. 
32" X 84" Mahogany Preflnlshed 

Paneis $1.99 Ea. 

Large selection of paneling. Prices from $1.99 to 
$12.95 
Large selection of floor tile, carpets, hardware and 
tools for do-it-yourselfers. 

T E C U M S E H P L Y W O O D D E X T E R P L Y W O O D 
2800 W. Chicago Blvd. 7444 Ann Arbor St. 
Tecunlseh, Mich. 423-7761 Dexter. Mich. 426-4738 

H O U R S : Mon . thru Sat. 8:30-5:30 - Sun. 11-3 

J L H 

J . L i . H u c l s € m 

P o l e B u i l d i n g : C k > e 

W e w e l c o m e you to check our mal jy 
different sizes. 

We do have some new '72 colored 

steel and a l u m i n u m s id ings . 

Horse B a r n s — F a r m Storage 
C o m m e r c i a l Pole Bu i ld ing 

479 M a i n St. 
(313) 453-2210 

P l y m o u t h , M i c h . 48170 
(313) 429-4812 

M A T H E R 

S u p p l y C o . 

Sand 8( Gravel 
•Crushed Stone* Fill Dirt 'Topsoil 
*Road Gravel 'CrushetJ Concrete 
'Crushed Limestone 'Crushed 
Field Stone 'Pool 8( Play Sand 

'Landscape Boulders 

"We're customizing sand and gravel senrice" 

— W o J o b T o o Small— 

Pick UP or Delivery 
8294 W . Grand River (at 1-96) Brighton 

B r i g h t o n - N o r t h v f l l e -

2 2 9 - 4 4 1 2 3 4 9 4 4 6 6 

photography 

E L E C T R I C S E R V I C E , 
contract, T . M . Trouble. 
Dayornight , 24 hrs. 1-517-
546-5926. 

a-25 

Wedding Photography-
Vivid color in padded 
a lbum. Pajot Photo 
Graphics 437.1374. 

htf 

Painting & Cfccorating 

Pa in t ing and 
Decora t ing Reasonable 
Rates F ree Es t ima tes 
A n y t i m e 

C a l l Lou at 
349-1558  

I N T E R I O R A N D E X ­
T E R I O R p a i n t i n g . 
C e i l i n g s p a i n t e d 
professionally. SIO and 
up. John Doyle 437-2674. 

tf 
M I L L S Brothers painting, 
exter ior , interior , free 
estimates Brighton 227-
6591 and 878 5519 Pin-
ckney. 

atf 

C U S T O M wal lpaper , 
Dave Pegg, 538 9079, 
c o m m e r c i a l a n d 
residential is 

Piano Tuning 

J i m Ste inkraus 
T e c h n i c i a n 

P i a n o Tu rne r 
Gene ra l R e p a i r 

229-9470 Br igh ton 

, , PlAN0'JJ.JNlNj3i, . , 

Uprights, Grands 8t Players 

L O R E N S A N N E S 

437-1238 

G e o r g e L o c k h a r t 

Member of the Piano 
Technicians Guild 

Servicing Fine Pianos in 
This Area for 30 Years 

Total Rebuilding 
If Required 

3 4 9 - 1 9 4 5 

Plumbing & Heating 

P L U M B I N G 
Repair- Replacement 

Modern iza t ion 
E l e c t r i c Sewer C lean ing 

L O N G ' S 

P L U M B I N G A N D F A N C Y 

B A T H B O U T I Q U E 

116 E . Dunlap 

Nor thvi l le 349-0373 
.(. 

Pool Senfice 

L iv ings ton 
P O O L S & S U P P L I E S 

Do- i t -Yourse l f 
Doughboy Pools 

Above &> In-Ground 
Pools 

Pool Ki t s 
Sun C h e m i c a l s 

746-6796 
546-6796 o r 229-8697 

Roofing & Siding 

O K E R S T R O M 
R O O F I N G 

Buil t U p Roofs 
Reroofs 

N e w W o r k 
A l l w o r k 

G u a r a n t e e d 
Free E s t i m a t e s 

Br ighton 229-6233 

— A N C H O R M A I N -
T E N A N C E I N C 

R O O F I N G + 
S H E E T M E T A L W O R K 

C O M M E R C I A L 
R E S I D E N T l A L 

I N D U S T R I A L 
F R E E E S T l M A T E S 
E a v e s t r o u g h - s i d i n g 
New Roofs - R e p a i r s 

Insurance W o r k 
Brighton 227-1391 
7662 H a m b u r g R d . 

22LX3Sn 

Roofing & Siding Septic Tanks 

S O D 
S y c a m o r e F a r m s is 
Cut t ing M e r i o n 42000 
W a r r e n R o a d Bet ­
ween Hagger ty and 
L i l l e y . 

453-0723 

Music Instruction 

Schnute 

M u s i c Studios 

P iano-Organ-St r ings 

120 Walnu t 349-0580 

G R A D U A T E p i a n o 
teacher, any grade, 
taught in Detroit schools. 
Mollie Kar l 437.3430. 

HTF 

G A L E 

W H I T F O R D 

R O O F I N G & 

S I D I N G 

23283 Currie Rd . 
G E 7-2446 

A l u m i n u m S i d i n g 

A l u m i n u m T r i m 

Guaranteed 30 Years 

R O O F I N G - A L L K I N D S 

R O O F I N G - R E P A I R S 

A L U M I N U M S T O R M 
WINDOWS 

G E 7 - 24-46 

S a w * Sha rpened 

A L L Kinds of Saws, 
h o u s e s h e a r s , k n i v e s 
sharpened, Lawnmowers 
repa i red , smal l gas 
motors, tune up and 
repair, McLa in Saw Shop, 
415 S. Fleming St. Howell, 
517.546 3590 

A F T 

Septic Tanks 

R a y ' s S e p t i c T a n k 

C L E A N I N G 

S E R V I C E 

Wixom, Michigan 

6 2 4 - 1 9 0 5 

No extra charge for 
Sundays, Holidays or Eves. 

S T Y E S Septic Tank 
Service, installations and 
repair , tile fields-
perktests-water lines. 1-
538-7597. 

H37 

Tattoo Service 

T A T T O O I N G by ap-
poinlment. Call 349-29y8. 

27tf 

W h e n y o u p l a c e y o u r " d o n ' t 
n e e d " i t ems f o r sale w i t h a 
c lass i f ied W a n t - A d . I t 's easy 
. . . i f s fast . J u s t c a l l o u r 
o f f i ce a n d w e ' l l d o t h e rest. 

N o r t h v i l l e - N o v i 3 4 9 - 1 7 0 0 

S o u t h L y o n 4 3 7 - 2 0 1 1 

B r i g h t o n 2 2 7 - 6 1 0 1 

Tree service 

R E A G A N ' S T R E E 
S E R V I C E T R I M M I N G 

& R E M O V A L 
I N S U R E D 

F R E E E S T I M A T E S 
437-0514  

Welding 

LIVINGSTON Welders— 
We go anywhere, call 
a n y t i m e , p o r t a b l e 
welding service . A l i c e 
Arnot, 128 W. North St., 
Brighton (313) 229-2527. 

A T F 

Window Services 

WE R E P L A C E glass-in 
aluminum, wood or steel 
sash, C . G . Rol ison 
Hardware, i l l w. Main , 
Brighton 229-841 1. 

A T F 
Window Senfice 

V I K I N G G L A S S 
A N D M I R R O R 

120 W. Main 
19 years experience, 
commercial, residen-
tial, storms, streei.s, 
auto. 

349-4880 

V I L L A G E G L A S S C O . 
22926 P O N T I A C T R A I L 
S O U T H L Y O N ' , M I C H . 

COMMERCIAL, 
RESIDENTIAL 

AUTO-MIRRORS 
SHOWER S T U B 
ENCLOSURES 

STORMS 8i SCREENS 
437-2727 

' T h e s e S e r v i c e s 

A r e J u s t A 

P h o n e C a l l A w a y 

D & D F l o o r C o v e r i n g , I n c . i 
Featuring Sales and Installation of: * turing 
Frjrr-niCJ Counleri 
Kenlilc 
Airnsliong Products 
Piaslic Wall Tile 
AleK-inder Smitii 
Carpets and Rugs 
D O N B I N G H A r v . 

A t 106 East Dunlap St. 
D O N S T E V E N S 

Phone 349-4480 

\ 
B A G G E T T 

R O O F I N G & S I D I N G 

HOT ASPHALT - BUILT-UP ROOFS 
SHilMGLE ROOFS • ALUMINUM GUTTERS AND 
DOWNSPOUTS - ALUMINUM SIDING AND TRIM 

N O R T H V I L L E 349-3110 

^ F O R D 
Count on our skill and X 
experience to save you I 
time, trouble and money X 

"Your Local Ford Dealer" 1. 

J o h n M a c h F o r d S a l e s , I n c . 5 

550 Seven Mi l e 
Northvi l le 

349-1400 
A S K F O R S E R V I C E 

S E R R A ' S C u s t o m U p h o l s t e r y 

Furniture - Autos - Cushions - Boats 
A l l Your Upholstery Needs • Free Estimates 

F O A M R U B B E R C U T TO SIZE 
F A S T S E R V I C E 

3 4 9 - 1 8 3 0 

J I M S E R R A 17071 Northville Road 

P R I N T I N G 
OFFSET and LETTERPRESS 

•Expert Layout Help 
•Quality Workmanship 
•Prompt Service 

NORTHVILLE RECORD 349.6660 

SOUTH LYON HERALD 
437-2011 

BRIGHTON ARGUS 
227-6101 

R E Y N O L D S S E W E R 

S E R V I C E 

We c lean S e w e r s - K i t c h e n S inks 

a n d B a t h t u b s . 

P h o n e Co l l ec t 

6 6 2 - 5 2 7 7 

1 9 3 H i s c o c k 

A n n Arbor , M i c h i g a n 

E X T E R M I N A T I N G T E R M I T E I N S P E C T I O N S 

P r o m p t S e r v i c e 
Dinniiuf>r nc • nAts. MfcE. roaches. MftEs. ants 
KlUuANbt Ur • WASPS. BEES AND OTHER PESTS 

MOTH P/iOOf/NC SnCIALISTS 
C h e m i c a l P e s t 

C o n t r o l C o . 
Residential - Commercial - Industrial 

Modest Rates - Free Estimates 
No Vacating Necessary 

19714 Ingram, Livonia f ^ f 8 * 1 0 5 0 

EVERYTHING E D ' S 
FOR THE BRIDE 

S U N O C O invitations S U N O C O 
Announcements ' 

S E R V I C E Napkins S E R V I C E 
Informals 

Thank You Cards K E L L Y -
See our selection at 

S P R I N G F I E L D 

T I R E S 

Complete New Line 
of Truck Tires 

57017 Grand River 
Northvilie Record 

349-1700 New Hudson 
South Lyon Herald 

437-2011 437-2971 

COMPLETE SERVICE 

f ^ l G R E E N R I D G E N U R S E R Y 

" ' " ^ G R E E N R I D G E T R E E S E R V I C E 

8600 Napier Road Northville 349-1111 

I 

I 

I 

I For LUMBER, HARDWARE, PAINT ond a 

complete line of Building Motefiols - Il's I 

N E W H U D S O N L U M B E R I N C 

Open Weekdays 8 to 5, Sal. 8 to 4 
56601 Grantj River-New Hudson-437-1423 

Best seller lists change from time to time, but some things never seem to lose their 
appeal to the buying public. The ten best sellers shown here are typical of such 
i t e m s . . . and when they're advertised for sale in C la s s i f i ed . . . they sell fast. 

lf you have any of these items which you'd lilte to exchange for cash, just dial any 
of our offices to place a result-getting Want-Ad. 

And if the item you'd like to sell isn't in the top ten, offer it for sale anyviray. 
Classified has a way of turning most items into best sellers. 

N O R T H V I L L E - N O V I 

3 4 9 - 1 7 0 0 

S O U T H L Y O N . 

4 3 7 - 2 0 1 1 

B R I G H T O N 

2 2 7 - 6 1 0 1 

Wed . -Thur s . , S e p t e m b e r 1 3 - 1 4 , 1 9 7 2 
T H E N O R T H V I L L E R E C O R D - N O V I N E W S - B R I G H T O N A R G U S - S O U T H L Y O N H E R A L D Page 9 - B 

4 -1B-Garage a n d 
R u m m a g e Sa les 

4 - 1 B - G a r a g e a n d 
R u m m a g e Sales 

4-2 H o u s e h o l d G o o d s 4 -3 M i s c e l l a n y 4 -3 M i s c e l l a n y 4-3 M i s c e l l a n y 4-3 M i s c e l l a n y 5-1 H o u s e h o l d Pets 5-2 Horses , E q u i p . 

MOVING everything 
mus t g o - e l e c t r o n i c 
components, furniture, 
etc. 9.17.72. 400 Orchard 
Ridge, South Lyon. 

. h-37 

YA.IRD saie-antiques, 
decorative items, picture 
frames, household goods-

. i n t e r io r d e c o r a t o r ' s 
estate salevvide pr ice 
range. September 15 and 
16 10.4 p.m. 6681 Six Mi le 
Rd.- . 

h-37 

• E V E R Y T H I N G yoes 
rummage sale. Sat. Sept. 
16 only-10:00 a.m.-5:00 
p.m. 55221 Nine Mi le , 
(first driveway west of 

" Ci/rrfe Rd.) 
h-37 

'i Y A R D sale. Sat. 8. 
Sunday, Sept. 16 & 17. 
Chairs , tables, wagon 
wheels, fencing , old barn 
type lumber, misc. items. 
8520 Bishop Rd. Brighton. 

a-24 

BIG garage sale: Sep-
tember 15-17 furniture, 
clothing, toys, dishes, 
T.V. and baby items. Lots 
of odds and ends, (10765 
Sharon Drive) furn off 
Grand River at Little 
Skipper Drive-ln. First 
house . 

a-24 

TWO family garage sale. 
10293 Colonial Court , 

.. corner of V i l l a g e Sq. 
Colonial V i l l a g e Sub. 
Brighton. Sept. 12, 14, 15. 

' Tole lamp, baby things, 
many other items. 227-

. 7575 
a-24 

G - A R A G E sa le : 10500 
Kenrich Dr. 3 families, 
F r iday and Saturday 
September 15 S> 16. 
Brighton. 

a-24 

R U M M A G E sale. An­
tiques, living room fur­
niture, gas engine golf 
cart excellent condition, 
reese hitch with sway bar 
335. P r a m a luminum 
boat, 5 gallon gas can, 
tools, gas engine, a i i 
kinds of junk & treasures. 
Wed. Sept. 13 thru Sept. 
17. 8 a.m. to 8 p.m. 1315 
Elmhurst off Hughes Rd. 
on Lake Chemung. 

a-24 

22 Automatic Rifle $40., 
free b icyc le , 15 h.p. 
outboard S35. gas dryer 
SIO., electric guitar S50. 
large cement mixer and 
wheelborrow S75. car top 
carrier S5. Also transit. 
Reducer, lot of antiques 
and misceilaneous items 
for sale cheap. T.V. and 
stand S40. Color T.V. S95., 
stroller S9. 'A mile East of 
23 on M-S9 and look for 
Big^PK5»i«^q|^*gij'^igns. -

G A R A ( 3 E sale: 2 
locations, 5223 and 5188 
Old Hickory, South off 
Brighton Rd., Brighton. 
Boys clothes, sizes 7-12, 

shousehoid goods, sport 
equipment, a i r con­
ditioner, 8,000 B T U , hand 
tractor. F r i d a y and 
Saturday, September 15 
and 16, 9:00 to 5:00. 

a-24 

Y A R D sale Thurs., F r i . & 
Sat. Sept. 14, 15 & 16, 9 
a.m. to 5 p.m. 2627 Hunter 
Rd. Knick-nacks, dishes, 
clothes & household 
items. 

a-24 

Y A R D sale-Sept. 23 & 24-
Furniture, small tools, 
antiques, misc. 4630 
Seven Mile , Rd. South 
Lyon. 

h-38 

BIG rummage sale, 7650 
West Seven Mile Road, 
every day. 

h-39 

NEW Apt. size stove, S35. 
walnut console black & 
white TV, S25. Brighton 
229-8613. 

A-24 

M A T C H I N G Whirlpool 
washer and dryer. Olive 
green, 1 year old. ex-
cellent condit ion. S250. 
227-4241 Brighton. 

A-24 

G A R A G E sale-Sept. 13-
16, 10 to 6 p.m.-Redwood 
bark chips, snow tires, 
foo tba l l e q u i p m e n t , 
clothes, toys, baby fur-_, 
niture, and equipment, 
etc. 3800 Five Mile (west 
of Earhart) South Lyon. 

h-37 

G A R A G E sale-Sept. 13-
17th.Restaurant booth, 
air conditioners, two old 
pony saddles, girl 's bike, 
skies, lots of clothes (all 
ages), misc. items. Cheap 
prices. 53799 Nine Mile 
(between Curr ie and 
Chubb) South Lyon. 

h-37 

Y A R D sale: Friday and 
Saturday, September 15 & 
16. 10:00 a.m. t i l l . . . 3895 
Flint Rd. , Brighton. 

a-24 

G A R A G E sale: 672 
Thayer B l v d . F r i d a y , 
September 15th only. 
F u r n i t u r e , c l o t h i n g , 
a n t i q u e s , t o y s , 
misceilaneous items. 

M A G N O V O X E a r l y 
American combination 
colored TV 8. stereo, 
Coronado side by side 
refrigerator freezer, 
coppertone. Brighton 229-
8366. 

a-24 

P O R T A B L E Kenmore 
dishwasher, excellent 
cond. S75. Brighton 227. 
5436. 

a-24 

E M P I R E marble top 
chest of drawers. S80. also 
Walnut dresser. 632-7688 
Hartland. 

a-24 

M O V I N G - m u s t s e l l . 
Frigidaire refrigerator, 
good condition 330:3 pc. 
blond bedroom set, needs 
repair, best offer. 437-3588 

h-37 

A L U M I N U M Siding first 
grade, 319.95 per square, 
with backer 325, seconds 
317 white or colored, wood 
grain 319.50, double four 
322. 10 ft. corner post 
33.50. Special pr ice 
shutters & trim, heavy 
aluminum gutter 30 cents 
ft., down pipe $2. GArf ield 
7-3309. 

HTF 

HORIZONTAL Skirting, 
white, for 12 x 52 ft. 
mobile home. Good 
condition. 360 437-3365 

h-38 

DO IT Y O U R S E L F 
Aluminum trailer skir­
ting A-1 mater ia l , 
coverage trailer 12'x60' x 
30" high $208.50 437-2446, 
23283 Currie South Lyon 

HTF 

G O L F E R S : Here's an 
excellent buy on a set of 
three woods—driver, 
number three & four. 
P G A pro-shop models, 
good shape, only $40 for 
set. Call 349-0581. 

tf 

M A C H I N E tools for sale 
349-3534. 1 18" X to Lodge 
and Shipley Lathe with 3 
Jaw Chuck, 4 Jaw Chuck, 
and steady seat. Good 
Condition —S750.00 
1 20" Powermatic Band 
saw with heavy duty 
welder. New 1971 31,450.00 
1 hp. Bridgeport Mil l ing 
Machine with J head and 
chrome ways and Bejuir 
oiler. Excellent condition 
31,800.00 

4 -2 H o u s e h o l d G o o d s 

A D M I R A L coior TV, 4 
yrs. old, 3250. Brighton 
72/ 7601.. A T F 

K I R B Y vacuum sales 
and service-New, used, 
rebuil ts . F rom $39.95. 
Call evenings. 685-1877 

htf 

WINDOW Shades 
size up to 72" 
Gambles , South 
437-1565 

cut to 
wide, 

L y o n . 

H34 

E X C E L L E N T u s e d 
automatic washer and 
dryer. Gambles, South 
Lyon, 437-1565 

H34 

B E D , dresser , stove, 
refrigerator, misc. items, 
23948 E . LeBost, Novi. 
474-8580. 

R A T T A N furniture, 3 
piece sectional daven­
port, 2 chairs, and end 
table in good condition, 
3175.; An Eureka vacuum 
cleaner, cannister type 
and attachments, l ike 
new, 330. 46320 10 Mile Rd. 
Northville, 349-2385. 

D U O - t h e r m s p a c e 
heaters, o i l and gas, 
delivery and instailatJon 
a v a i l a b l e , M a r t i n ' s 
Hardware, South Lyon, 
437-0600. 

h-37 

DINING room furniture, 
bunk bed, old bed and 
dresser, 453-4053 Mor ­
nings. 

h-37 

E L E C T R I C Stove, 4 
burner, full size oven, $20. 
229-6220 Brighton. 

A-24 

S E W i N G machines $25. 
Colonial desk $20. recliner 
$10. Standel ampl i f ie r 
head. $100. 227-6235 
Brighton. 

A-25 

4 - 3 M i s c e l l a n y 

2 W E E K S O N L Y ! 

C u A t O f f l / D A Q f & U ) 

S A L t 

2 0 * 0 F F 

F A B R I C 

L A B O R 

PRICES INCLUDE; 

Messuring/Fabrie/Tailoring/lnsMlled. on your rods 
Prices atari M low «3 S1.76 per yard 

S E P T E M B E R 

4 t h t o 1 8 t h 

Only twice each year will ihe msnuiaciurer permit dis­
counts on the full range of our luxurious fabrics. Oon't 
delay, come down now to get a free esiimaie. or call, 
and we will bring fabrics to your home. Remember, dis-
counl applies to FABRIC and 1>B0R. 

A P O L L O D R A P E R Y C E N T E R 

390 S. Lafayette St. 
South Lyon, lVlich. 

437-6018 or 437-0953 

E V E R G R E E N S , $2.50. 
Closing out. Bring shovel 
and basket. 8840 
Evergreen . Brighton. 
Turn on Silver Lake Rd. 
at US 23 (Log Cabin 
Nursery) 

atf 

D R I V E W A Y C U L V ' E R t S 
6 feet to 22 feet. South 
Lyon Lumber & Farm 
Center, 415 E . Lake 437-

HTF 

6ft.x8 tt.x4 ft. waterproof 
crates, made of marine 
plywood. Great for 
portable sheds, bus stops, 
or changing houses. Only 
$30. Call collect 833-9100. 

A T F 

R E D U C E excess fluids 
with Fluidex, $1.69 - Lose 
weight safely with Dex-A-
Diet, 98 cents at Spencer 
Drugs, South Lyon. 

H40 

S O U T H L Y O N 
K I W A N I S C L U B 

W i l l p i c k up a l l 
saleable a r t i c les for 
our R u m m a g e Sale . 
437-6197 or 437-2410. 

ONE antiquecorn husker, 
one small deep-freezer, 
one antique Westinghouse 
refrigerator -)- 2 ton of 
corn. 437-3310 

H37 

RAIL Fencing, spiit or 
round, cedar or oak. 
Specia l iz ing in horse 
fencing. F a i l rates. 
Rustic Rails, Box 172, 
Sterling, M i . 48659. 1-517-
654-2533. 

A26 

R E M O V A L 

S A L E 
Flowering Shrubs. Trees 

Evergreens. 
Quality Stock at 
Reduced Prices, also. 

B L U E 

S P R U C E 
39940 Grand River 

Novi 
Bet. Haggerty & Seely Rd . 

J & J P O L E B U I L D I N G C O . 

* Horse Barns, Metal or Wood 
* Hay and Grain Storage 
* Tack Rooms, Box Stalls 
* Dutch Doors, Welded Bar Fronts 
* Also Uti l i ty . Storage, Machinery Buildings 

W e w / 7 / d o o n y , a l l o r p a r t 

o f y o u r b u i l d i n g . 

30187 Travis Lane 
New Hudson 

F R E E E S T I M A T E S 

Call A . M . - P . M . 

1 - 4 3 7 - 1 3 8 7 

B E D , dresser, stove, 
refrigerator, misc. items, 
23948 E. LeB 

C O U C H , beige color . 
Very good cond. 455-7463. 

WASHER & gas dryer. 
General E l e c t r i c , cop­
pertone. 3120 for pr. 349-
4957. 

BRAND new 27" drop-in 
General Electric range. 
3139. Brighton 229-8092. 

a-24 

F R I G I D A I R E D R Y E R , 
Maytag washer, norge 
refrigerator, all in good 
condit ion, also boys 
trousers, waist size 29-32. 
Brighton 229-6063 after 5 
p.m. 

a-24 

B R A N D new (in box) 
Electric Cocina (electric 
charcoal broiler) costs 
359.50, sell for 340. 349-
1700. 

tf 

C E R A M I C t i r i n g . 
Brighton 229-7064 

a-27 

F R E E SHOES incur Shoe 
Club Plan. Shoe Hut, 113 
N . Lafayette, South Lyon, 
437-0700. HTF 

W E L L Points and pipe IV4 
in. and 2 in., use our well 
driver and pitcher pump 
free with purchase. 
M a r t i n ' s H a r d w a r e , 
South Lyon. 437-0600. 

h-36 

P L U M B I N G Supplies, 
Myer's pumps, Bruner 
water softeners, Artesian 
water softeners, a 
complete line of plumbing 
supplies—Martin's 
Hardware, South Lyon. 
437-0600. 

h-36 

A T T E N T i O N L a d i e s -
Sell Toys & Gifts now thru 
December with the oldest 
Toy Party Plan in the 
Country. Highest com­
missions, no cash outlay. 
Call or write "Santa's 
Pa r t i e s " , Avon , Conn. 
06001. Tel 1(203)673-3455 . 
Also Booking Parties. 

h.39 

A good buy. . .give it a 
t ry. Blue Lus t re , 
America's favorite carpet 
shampoo. Gambles, South 
Lyon. 

h-39 

FIREWOOD by the cord. 
320. Delivered $30. 349-
4486. 

h-37 

E V E R G R E E N S a i e -
2,000 evergreens must be 
sold. Dig your choice of 
nursery; 25 var ie t ies , 
33.00 each. Red .Barn 
Nursery, 4500 Duck Lake 
Rd., (Vi mile south of 
Commerce Rd.) Milford. 
Phone 684.7671. Open 
Thursday thru Sunday 
only. 9:00 to 5:00 p.m. 

h-37 

SHOP Dancers for shoes 
for all the family. 120 E . 
Lake St., South Lyon. 437-

;i740 
HtF 

C O M P L E T E cus tom 
picture framing service. 
Goiden Gallery, 121 West 
North Street, Brighton. 

atf 

PICK UP COVERS. Buy 
direct from $149. up. 8976 
Seven M i l e Road at 
C u r r i e . N o r t h v i l l e . 
General Trailer. 349-4470. 

tf 

ROOFING self sealing 
shingles, white and black 
$10.95 per sq., colors 
$11.95 per sq. Accessories 
available 437-2446, 23283 
Currie, South Lyon. 

HTF 

R E Y N O L D S A - 1 
Aluminum siding. White. 
$22.50 per sq. ; colors 
$23.50 per sq. insulated 
white $28.00 per sq, in­
sulated vertical $29.95 per 
sq., 4" white aluminum 
siding $25.95 per sq. , 
complete line of ac­
cessories. Aluminum 
trim bent to your order. 
Call on prices 437-2446, 
23283 Currie South Lyon 

HTF 

F a l l enro l lment now 
tor M i s s M i l l y ' s 
S c h o o l ot D a n c e . 
B a l l e t , t a p , b a t o n , 
jazz, toe. A g e 4 and 
up. P lease cal l 349-
2215, 349-0350, 455-
1464 Classes s t a r t 
after Labo r Day 

C O M P L E T E LINE OF' 
P O L E barn materiai. 
Good prices. Buiid it 
yourself and save. South 
Lyon Lumber & Farm 
Center 437-1751 

HTF 

AUTO GONE? Rent a 
new Ford. As low as $7 
per day, 7 cents a mile 
includes gas. Wilson 
Ford, Brighton 227-1171. 

A T F 

F R E E firewood for the 
cutting. Corner of Pontiac 
Trail and Lottie St., South 
Lyon. 437-1777 

h-37 

A U T O M A T I C 
softner. $40. 
Hartland. 

w a t e r 
632-7713 

a-24 

M A C H I N E T O O L S 
F O R S A L E 

349-3535 
1. 18"x50" Lodge & 
Shipley La the w i t h 3 
J a w C h u c k , 4 J a w 
Chuck , a n d s teady 
seat, good condi t ion 
$750. 

2. One 20" P o w e r 
AAatic B a n d Saw w i t h 
Heavy Duty Welde r . 
New 1971. $1450. 

3. O n e H . P . 
Br idgepor t M i l l i n g 
M a c h i n e w i t h J . Head 
and ch rome w a y s a n d 
Be ju i r O i l e r exce l len t 
condit ion $1800. 

C H I L D ' S rolltop desk, 
play pen, valet chair, 
desk, cobblers bench, 
coffee table, bullet in 
board, decor«itive items. 
Brighton 227-7905. 

32 ft. extension ladder, 12 
volt s i ren, white oak 
dinette set, 4 chairs & 
buffet. Brighton 229-2222 

a-24 

L O U V E R cabinet $15. 
glider with cushions $10. 
wringer washer $10. baby 
crib with mattress $15. 
door table $10. portable 
crib $3. boat cover, ladder 
7 skies, etc. Brighton 227-
6355 

a-24 

36 hp VW engine $75. lOfL 
pick up camper $850. 
Pallet Truck $50. power 
mower like new, $20. 2 
small work benches $5. 
Brighton 229-6826 after 6 
p.m. 

a-24 

P E A R L S , paper tole, 
decoupage, Styra foam, 
trims, candle & flower 
making supplies, wreath 
forms. Hobby Center, 206 
S. M i c h i g a n , Howel l , 
Mich. 

a-30 

HUNTING licenses now 
in at Martin's Hardware, 
South Lyon 437.0600. 

h-37 

F L O O R Sander and 
Edger for rent, Gambles, 
South Lyon, 437-1565. 

h-37 

BOY'S 5 speed bicycle, 
like new. $80 437-0892 

htf 

H O R S E B A C K R I D I N G 

H i c k o r y R i d g e R a n c h f o r m e r l y of M i l f o r d 
Now located in Br igh ton Recrea t ion A r e a . 

Chi lson R o a d a t B ishop L a k e Road , Ajacen t 
to P a r k Headquar te r s 

W e e d a y s - R e g u l a r R a t e s $ 2 . 5 0 

S a t u r d a y s & S u n d a y s : $ 3 . 0 0 

spec ia l Rates for G r o u p s and Organ iza l ions 

10 M i i e s Wes t of U . S . 23 at M-36 E x i t . 
6 M i l e s South of 96 E x p r e s s - W a y at Spencer 
Road E x i t . 

M a n a g e r : J a y W r o t e n 2 2 7 - 5 2 5 6 

B r i g h t o n , M i c h . 

S T E A M carpet cleaners-
no scrubbing, soil and 
shampoo are extracted. 
685-3808. 

htf 

5 h.p. rototiller, P 8. W. 
437 0855 

h-37 

ANTIQUES—brass beds, 
china cabinets, matched 
kitchen cha i rs , buggy 
wheel tables, oil lamps, 
antique-engines, wood ice 
box, bookcase, buggys, 
wagons and cutters, iron 
stoves, wood wa l l 
telephone, water bowl 
sets, picture frames, 
many misc . W i n d m i l l 
Antiques, 28900 Pontiac 
Trai l , South Lyon. 437-
0586 Call before coming. 

h-37 

FOR Sale or Trade, John 
Deere H Tractor, single 
bottom plow. PTO 
electric starter 8, lights. 
3475, Brighton 229-9364. 

A-24 

P U P P I E S A L L B R E E D S . 
Stud service and boarding 
information availab'e by 
your Livingston County 
Kennel Club. 313-887-5117 

A T F 

W E S T E R N and English 
saddles, bridles, new and 
used, 44100 W. 12 M i l e , 
349-1904. 

START your day with a 
real lift with Astro 
Automatic garage door 
opener. Brighton 227 4861 
or 227-7233. 

A-27 

IRISH Setter, Golden 
Retriever, Free to good 
home, 2 years old. 229-
8029 Brighton. 

A-24 

J A C O B S E N 7 h.p. Snow 
thrower. Electric start, 
chains, book. O.K. First 
hundred bucks cash. 437-
6263 after 6:00 p.m. 

h-37 

F O R sa le— P i a n o s -
players and uprights, 
repaired and tuned. 385 
and up. 437 0586 or 437-
1238 

h-37 

C O M M E R C I A L carpet 
cleaning equipment for 
sale. One c o m m e r c i a l 
scrubber, two com-
m e r c i a l v a c u u m 
cleaners. Brushes and 
fluid included. 437-3343 

h-38 

W E L L kept carpets show 
theresultsof regular Blue 
Lustre spot c leaning. 
Rent electric shampooer 
31. Dancers, South Lyon. 

h-37 

M I N I - B I K E , 3V2 hp. with 
t o r q u e converter 
sacrifice, 365. 349-7864. 

R U P P go-carts; 2 at $100. 
each, 349-1904. 

WOOD wheel wagon, corn 
sheilers, bob s le igh , 
walking plows, cultivator, 
shovel plow, Whipple 
trees, rake, corn crib, 
white refr igerator , & 
misc. 349-2724 or 21521 
Chubb Rd. , north of Eight 
Mile . 

L I K E N E W football 
shoes, size 9'/2, $10; 
helmet, large, $7; 2 pr. 
Bauer hockey skates, size 
8 8. 9, $5 pr.; hockey 
uniform, 35; 349-6883. 

M O V I E Camera 8 M M 
Bell & Howell zoomatic, 
eleceye, wide angle, 
normal, telphoto, 5 reels 
of f i lm 8< kodak, 
p r o j e c t o r , f o r w a r d , 
reverse, st i l l . A l l for 3100. 
Brighton 229-9467. 

A-24 

M O V I N G Sale : Satur­
day—September 16, 10 
a.m. to-afp.m. "4410 Van 
Amberg Rd. — Brighton, 
or ca l l 229-9473. Ap­
p l i a n c e s , d e e r s k i n , 
s e r v i n g d i s h e s , 
humidifier-vaporizer, 
silver pieces, table cloths, 
radios, clocks, drapes, 
guns, ice skates, suit­
cases, ski equipment. 

A-24 

G L I D E R 325. dinette set 
with buffet $50., single 
bed and mattress $40. 229-
6731 Brighton. 

A-24 

50 P E R C E N T O F F . New 
furnaces with warehouse 
dents, fully guaranteed. 
Installation ava i l ab le . 
227-6074 Brighton. 

A-27 

1973 S E L E C T 0 STITCH 
$46.50. Sew machine still 
in original factory carton 
Sews stretch material No 
attachments needed as all 
controls are built-in sew 
with one or two needles 
makes buttonholes, sew 
on buttons monograms 
and makes fancy stitches. 
Comes with a beautiful 
walnut sew Table Ful l 
cash price $46.50 Cash or 
Terms available Trade-
ins accpted Call Howell 
Collect 546-3962 9 a.m. to 9 
p.m. Electro Grand. 

A L L wood console 1972 
Stereo, audio sys tem, 
solid state, 4 speed 
changer, never picked up. 
$136. or payments. 517-
546-2717. 

A-24 

SICK S E W M A C H I N E 
W e - F i x - E m . E x p e r t 
sewing machine repair. 
Clean Oi l and adjust 
tension only $4.99. Call 
Howell Collect 546-3962 9 
a.m. to 9 p.m. 

A-24 

ONE round oak table, $50. 
One space heater, (gas) 
35000 B T U . $40. One 
electric range S5. .Cal l 
after 5 p .m . 229-6914 
Brighton. 

A-26 

POINT 22 "Single S ix" 
r e v o l v e r . E x c e l l e n t 
C o n d i t i o n . 227-643 1 
Brighton. 

A-24 

F R E E Z E R beef corn fed 
steers on our own farm, Vi 
mile south of M-59 on 
Pleasant Va l l ey R d . 
Giegler & Son, 887-2117. 

A.31 

K I R B Y C L E A N E R 
338.50. With Power Buffer 
polisher and Cleaning 
tools ava i lab le to 
responsible party for only 
338.50 Cash or Terms Call 
Howell Collect 546-3962 9 
a.m. to 9 p.m. Electro 
Grand. 

A.24 

B E A T E N down carpet 
paths go when Blue 
Lustre a r r ives . Rent 
electric shampooer, $1.00, 
at Ratz Hardware, 331 
West M a i n Street, 
Brighton. 

A-24 

P U P P I E S for 
Bishop R d . 
Brighton. 

Sale: 
Lot 

7175 
28 

A-24 

4 4 F a r m P r o d u c t s 

4 - 4 A - F a r m 
E q u i p m e n t 

1960 F A R M A L L 450diesel 
tractor, 480 John Deere 
M o w e r " c o n d i t i o n e r , 
McCormick 46 Hay 
Baler: 363-1739. 

19 

W A N T E D : Ford tractor 
rim for 8N or 9N. Call 
mornings 437.6051 

H-37 

MASSEY-Ferguson, 
Model 202 tractor 81 disc. 
Good cond., 349-7422. 

4 -5 W a n t e d T o B u y 

1 BOOK TO C O M P L E T E 
A SET by Bess Streeter 
Aldrich, published in the 
30's. "The Rim Of The 
P r a i r i e . " Cal l 437-2929 
after 5:30 p.m. or 
weekends. 

tf 

NOW buying wholesale 
seasoned hardwood. Call 
1 -3 1 3-474-691 4 F a r ­
mington. 

A25 

W A N T E D 1000 be '« of 
horse hay. 227 5256 
Brighton. 

A-24 

NON F E R R O U S scrap 
metal wanted; copper, 
b r a s s , b a t t e r i e s , 
radiators, a l uminum, 
lead, stainless steel, 
d i e c a s t , s t a r t e r s , 
generators, scrap cast 
iron. Regal Scrap, 
Howell. 199 Lucy Road. 1-
517-546-3820. 

A T F 

P A R A K E E T S — babies, 
and breeders. Northville, 
349-7411. 

tf 

A K C German Shepherds. 
$25. up. Zeusberg Kennels 
call after 6 p.m.. Stud 
Service. 349-4539. 2I 

FOUR Adorable kittens, 2 
female, 2 male. Free to 
good home. 227-2791 
Brighton after 6:00. 

A-24 

N O R W E G I A N Elkhound 
Puppies, A K C 350. 
Greyhounds, A K C 375. 
517-546-5260. 

A-24 

7 year old chestnut 
gelding, between 13 and 
14 hands, gentle tor 
ch i ld ren . C a l l 437-0068 
after 7:30 p.m. 

A u t h o r i z e d Dea le r 
Rus t l e r Horse Trai lers . 

N e w & Used 
New T r a i l e r s A l w a y s 

In Stock 
S O U T H L Y O N 

M O T O R S 
215 S. Lafayet te 

437-1177 

5-3 F a r m A n i m a l s 

A n n o u n c i n g 

the opening of our new 

C i d e r I V I i l l 

F o r e m a n O r c h a r d s 
50050 W . Seven M i l e Road 

N o r t h v i l l e , M i . 

F re sh c i d e r and home m a d e doughnuts 
App le s , pears , p l u m s a v a i l a b l e in our sa les 
room. 

P I C K Y O U R O W N 
September 15th M c i n t o s h apples 

F R E E , black 8. white 
puppies. Call after 6 p.m. 
Brighton 229-7828. 

A-24 

11 R A B B I T S , New 
Zealand Whites and 
Checkerboard Gian t s , 
with coop'330. complete. 
449.4294, can be seen 
anytime Bil l Slyfieid, 7374 
Sutton Road, South Lyon. 

H-37 
A K C registered Siberian 
Husky male, 2 years. Best 
reasonable offer. Good 
with chi ldren 227 6267 
Brighton. 

A-24 

B E A G L E puppies. Male 
and female. A K C . 7 weeks 
old. Rob Reed 437-0721 

h-37 

17 H E N S , 3 roosters, 
each. 437 0855 

31 

H37 

5-4 A n i m a l .Services 

P I C K L I N G cucumbers, 
all sizes, phone 437 0686. 

h-37 

S P i C E R ' S Hartland Fruit 
Market. Apples, pears 8. 
plums, all varieties in 
season. Take US 23, 3 
miles north of M-59 to 
Clyde Rd. exit, east '/a 
mile. Open daily 8.Sunday 
9 to 6 p.m. 

a-24 

PICK your own at 
Spicer 's Brighton Or­
chard. Mackintosh now 
ready (1 week only) 
Stanley prune plums, 
large size, top quality. 2V2 
miles south of M.59 on old 
US 23, 6 miles north of 
Brighton. Open daily 8. 
Sunday 9 to 6. 

a-24 

C L O R E S O R C H A R D S 
Now open 

P i c k i n g Harves t Apples 
o p e n 9 to 6 p . m . 

9912 E . G r a n d R i v e r 
Br igh ton 

F R E E kittens, cute and 
cuddly. 349 2659 

3 Siamese cats looking for 
good home. Male cat 2V2 
years, neutered and 
declawed. Female cats 6 
and 7 years, spayed and 
declawed. Son has 
developed allergy. 1-449-
2457 

a-24 

FR EE-kittens, fluffy with 
spots, litter trained. 517-
546-3073 after 5:30. 

a-24 

F R E E puppy, female, 12 
wks. black, half poodle. 
Brighton 227-5448 

a-24 

F R E E , 5 month puppy, 
male, Brighton 229-9127 
Between 12-5 p.m. 

F R E E male german 
shepard, 11 months old. 
Has a i l shots. Very 
Obedient. 437-0897 

h-37 

G E R M A N s h e p h a r d 
pups, A K C , 12 weeks, $40. 
Also older pups, cheap. 
437-1024 

h-38 

TWO parakeets, b i rd-
cage, wal lhanger , and 
extras; $10.-437-3505 

h-37 

FRE'E''>iealth'y''k'ittens, 7 
weeks, 2 tigers, 2 fluffy 
lions. Litter trained. 437-
2583 

h-37 

5 -2 Horses , E q u i p . 

H O R S E S b o a r d e d . 
Wagon Wheel F a r m s , 
Nor thv i l l e . Exce l len t 
care. Horse shows all 
summer. $45. month. 349-
6415. 

tf 

W A N T E D , used 2 horse 
trailer, good condition. 
517-546-2800 or 517-546-
4272 Howell. 

A-24 

R E G I S T E R E D Quarter 
Horse. 9 year old Bay 
Gelding. 16-1 hands, has 
been jumped, contested, 
raced on Official track. 
Experienced rider only. 
632-7245 Hartland. 

A-24 

R E G . Pinto gelding, 7 
years, show qua l i ty , 
gentle, sui table for 
woman, saddle and all 
tack included, $375. 
Boarded in South Lyon. 
South Lyon no. 437-0113 or 
Detroit no. 1-846-8119 

h-37 

B E A U T I F U L P i n t o 
gelding, nine years, well 
broke, 15 hands. 437-1558 

h-38 

M A R E , 12 years old, very 
gentle, wi th saddle, 
bridle, $75. 437 0967 

h-37 

9 year old mare, must 
sell, going to school, 229-
4439 

5 month old colt, very 
t a m e , r e a s o n a b l e . 
Brighton 227-5179 

a-24 

R E G I S T E R E D Morgans-
11 year old mare, in foal 
for 1973, filly sold by side; 
9 year old stallion. Both 
adult horses trained for 
e x p e r i e n c e d r i d e r s . 
Phone J im Mair , 437-2824 
evenings. 

h-37 

R E G I S T E R E D quarter-
horse, gelded, age 13, 453-
4053 mornings. 

h-37 

3 nice r id ing horses, 
reasonable, 437-6794, 
after 4 p.m. 

h-37 

B E A U T I F U L reg. 3 year 
old App. stud. Leo quarter 
horse breeding. Dark bay 
with loud blanket. 
Starting behind withers. 
Definetely show quality. 
$1500.00 349-5483 

h-37 

P O N Y ' ' s a d d l e , blanket 
and bridle, like new, 349-
3007. 

TOY Poodle pups for sale. 
E i i i e ' s Poddie Salon. 
Complete grooming. Also 
stud. Brighton 229-2793. 

A T P 

BOW WOW Poodle 
Salon—Compiete 
grooming in your home 
$10. Mrs . Hull, Brighton 
227-4271. 

A T F 

A L L B R E E D 
P R O F E S S I O N A L 
D O G G R O O M I N G 

Specializing in Old English 
Sheep Dogs 

By A p p o i n t m e n t 
349-4829 

5-5 P e t S u p p l i e s 

P O R T A B L E Dog pens -
chain link dog runs. Ted 
Davids Fence Specialist, 
437-1675 

HTF 

E M P L O Y M E N T 

6-1 H e l p W a n t e d 

COIN Laundry attendant, 
over 35. Retirees in­
terviewed. Full or part 
t ime. Norgetown Coin 
Laundry, 1067 Novi Road, 
Northville, 349-9816 

tf 

o w 

Youth g roups—Boy 
S c o u t s , C h u r c h 
Groups a n d so for th 
wi th supe rv i s ion to 
d e l i v e r H o u s e to 
House adve r t i s i ng 
N O R G E T O W N C O I N 
L A U N D R Y 
349-9816 

tf 

Has the s u m m e r of 
72 m a d e y o u r income 
fa l l? 

.Maybe it's time . for a 
change. So, in a few 
l ines, here is some of 
wha t we offer to those 
who qua l i fy : 
The mos t m o d e r n , 
a d v a n c e d , a n d 
c o m p l e t e t r a i n i n g 
p r o g r a m in r e a l 
estate. 
M o r e se rv ices a n d 
more properties to 
offer to people than 
anyone in the m i d ­
west . 
M o d e r n , convenient 
fac i l i t i es throughout 
the m e t r o p o l i t a n 
a rea . 
A n d , f r e e , no 
o b l i g a t i o n C a r e e r 
S e m i n a r s in y o u r 
neighborhood so that 
you can look us ove r 
and see for yourse l f 
just wha t R e a l Es ta te 
One. is a l l about. 
Fo r Informat ion on 
t h e n e x t C a r e e r 
S e m i n a r in y o u r 
a r ea , c a l l your loca l 
office l i s ted be low: 

M i l f o r d 1-684-1065 

Rea l Es ta te One . 

I M M E D I A T E openings 
for women, light 
assembly and factory 
work, day and night 
shifts. Aden Industries 
Inc., 43700 Aden Blvd. , 
NoVi. (196 and Novi Rd). 

T O O L R O O M 

A P P R E N T I C E 

M A C H I N E 

O P E R A T O R S 

A p p l y S. M . C. 800 
Junc t ion P l y m o u t h , 
M i c h . (Nea r Sheldon 
Rd.) 

tf. 
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C L E A N I N G lady wantefl 
for 1 day every otfier 
weei^. Call after 5 p.m. 
3.J9 5523. 
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PART time—Short time, 
ladies to sell toys, gifts, 
Christmas decorations. 
NOW to December. No 
cash investment. No 
delivering or collecting. 
Car needed. 1 533.1991. 

CS. B T O Y S h a v e c o m e t o 
town. Now interviewing 
for demonstrations for 
toys, gifts & Christmas 
Decorations on the home 
party plan. No investing, 
collecting or delivering! 
We mai^e it possible for 
you to earn the Sl25 l̂ it 
free the first night. Call 1 
255 6668 Or 3-19.3192. 

tf 

X I?ay Technician 
Registered 

Immediate opening now 
available for a full time 
r e g i s t e r e d X . R a y 
Technician. Competitive 
wage and benefit 
p rogram. Apply M c -
P h e r s o n C o m m u n i t y 
Health Center, 620 Byron 
Rd., Howell. 

A-25 

C A R E T A K E R couple 
caretaker position for 
older couple, general 
apartment maintenance. 
Must have mechanical 
experience. Call .(37.3303 
or 399 8282 

HTF 

P R O D U C T I O N A N D 
A S S E M B L Y 

W O R K E R S 
We are now tak ing 
appl ica t ions : A p p l y : h t f 
P a t t e r s o n L a k e 

N E E D E X T R A 
M O N E Y ? ? 
Even busy Mothers earn 
S25.00 per evening 
demonstrating Gifts 8. 
Toys with " S A N D R A 
P A R T I E S ' ' . N o 
del ivering —No collec­
ting. Weekly pay checks 
& Top Value Coupons. 
Start NOW and earn a 
F R E E S120.00 Kit. Call 
Lucy 338-2661 or write 
7207 E . M c N i c h o l s , 
Detroit, Michigan 48212. 

H-38 

B R O I L E R M a n , ex-
perienced, 40 hour wk,, 
union 8. insurance 
benefits. App ly Chef 
LaVeque, Canopy Hotel, 
Brighton 229-6013. 

A-2.i 

Products 1600 Pat­
terson L a k e Roa i i , 
P inckney , M i . 

N E E D e x p e r i e n c e d 
siding man with truck and 
equipment, good working 
condition, old re l iable 
company, No2-3288 

H38 

Attendants—1 
midnight shift, 1 day 
shift, sa la ry & com­
mission, 229-8319 or 60999 
Grand R i v e r , New 
Hudson. 

A-24 

W A R N E R S W A S E Y 
A A A C H l N E S T 

2-3-4 &5. Expe r i enced 
or semi-exper ienced . 
E x c e l l e n t o p ­
p o r t u n i t y t r a i n i n g 
p rog ram ava i l ab le . 
F u l l Blue Cross paid 
& h o l i d a y s . 12053 
L e v a n , n o r t h of 
P l y m o u t h R d . 
L i v o n i a , 4 m i l e s south 
of 1-96. 

T U I T I O N B I L L S got 
you down? A v o n c a n 
help you get out f rom 
under ! E a r n e x t r a 
cash for your ch i ld ' s 
c o l l e g e " e x t r a s " 
d u r i n g y o u r f r ee 
h o u r s , w i t h o u t up­
s e t t i n g f a m i l y 
r o u t i n e . C a l l f o r 
de ta i l s : 476-2082 

C A R H O P S 

I N S I D E H E L P 

D a y s or Nights 
A p p l y in person 

B O B & C O R l N N E ' S 

Li t t le Sk ipper D r i v e In 

10720 E G r a n d R i v e r 
Br ighton 

WAITRESSES. Wanted, 
must be experienced 
Apply in person. Pat's 
Restaurant, 9930 E . 
Grand River, Brighton. 

A T F 

R O O F E R S w a n t e d : 
Experience preferred. 
Gale Whitford Roofing 
and Siding. 23283 Currie 
Rd., South Lyon. 437-2446. 

H-37 

AUTO M E C H A N I C , G . M . 
experience necessary, do 
not apply unles your over 
30. No phone caiis, please. 
Clayton Cad i l l ac Old-
smobiie Inc. 2321 E . 
Grand River, Howeii.. 

A T F 

A P P L I C A T I O N S being 
taken for Waitress • Fu l l 
and Part Time Dining 
Room & Coffee Shop. 
Dish washer • afternoon 
shift, 3-11 p.m. Cooks -
Full & part time. Pat's 
Restaurant, 9836 E . 
Grand River, Brigtiton. 

A T F 

M A L E A N D 
F E M A L E 
P r o d u c t i o n a n d 

A s s e m b l e r s 
W e a r e t a k i n g a p ­

p l i c a t i o n s . 
A p p l y 

S t a h l M a n u f a c t u r i n g 
800 J u n c t i o n 

P l y m o u t h , M l . 
( E a s t of S h e l d o n R o a d ) 

P R O F E S S I O N A L 
Technica l or Business 
men, most be ambitious, 
desire new income. Phone 
449-8821 or 227-6495. 

A T F 

We're celebrating—it's 
ourbirthday! Housewives 
earn 20 percent of party 
sales by having a C & B 
TOY P A R T Y , o r even just 
for tak ing catalogue 
orders. Call 1 255-6668 or 
349 3192. 

tf 

R N - L P N , 
part t ime, 
perienced 
perienced, 
t r a i n i n g 
Continuing 
Whitmore 

full and 
aides ex-
or inex-

all shifts, 
p r o g r a m , 

in service . 
Lake Con-

valescent 
4431. 

TRUCK Driver and yard 
man. Gale Whitford 
Roofing and Siding. 23283 
Currie Rd., South Lyon. 
437.2446. 

H-37 

S E L L for the biggest. 
Playhouse Toy Co. now 
h i r ing . A i i new saies 
program. For details call 
455-0198 or 453-3541. 

28 

SHORT order cook. 5 or 6 
days. Will train with some 
experience. Located at 
Wixom Road and 196. 

tf 

L I T T L E Red Schoolhouse 
Nursery opening in 
Northville in September. 
P r iva te and Co-op 
classes. 349-5020 or 455-
5554. 

21 

W A I T R E S S 
A N D 

B A R M A I D 

B O B - O - L I N K 
golf c lub 
349-2723 

WANTED—Cleaning 
woman. 1 day every other 
week. References and 
own transportation. Call 
349-8072. 

W O M A N or g i r l to 
babysit . My home, 5 
hours on Tuesday. 
References. 349-6458. 

B E A U T I C I A N wanted. 
S o m e e x p e r i e n c e , 
T u e s d a y t h r o u g h 
Saturday. Mary C Salon, 
41370 W. Ten Mile Road, 
Novi. 477-6041. After 6:00 
call 349-5232. 

B A B Y S I T T E R needed. 
Monday , Wednesday, 
Friday. 2-7 p.m. 2 girls. 
Six, Mile , Bradner Road 
area. 349-8415. 

M A T U R E 
telephone 
2784. 

woman to 
survey. 349-

T E L E P H O N E solicitors. 
5 : 3 0 - 9 : 3 0 p . m . 
weeknights, pleasant 
w o r k i n g c o n d i t i o n s . 
Starting salary Si.75 per 
hour. Call 349-8406 after 
4:00. 

P U B L I C relations. Car 
necessary. No di rec t 
selling. Wage and com­
miss ion. Ca l l 349-8406 
after 4:00. 

E X P E R I E N C E D 
saleman for 10 man steel 
fabricating shop. Prefer 
experience in calling on 

automobile manufac­
tures. Send resume to Box 
523, c-o The Northville 
Record , 104 W. M a i n 
Street, Nor thv i l l e , M i . 
48167. 

O P P O R T U N I T Y for 
ambitious man with some 
experience with f inish 
grading tractor . After 
6:00 437-2441 

M E N and women wanted 
for general cleaning of 
club house, sales office, 
and model apartments. 6 
days per week. Northville 
area. Call 642-0722. 

HIGH school Senior g i r l . 
Part time after schooi. 
349-9797. 

N E A T appearing young 
man over 18 to learn tool 
and die business. Nor­
thwest Gage and 
Engineering, 26200 Novi 
Road. 

Y O U N G man to perform 
a variety of tasks for a 
home bui lder . T ran­
s p o r t a t i o n r e q u i r e d . 
Woodcraft Construction 
Inc. 227-6622 Brighton. 

A-24 

MUST be 18 years or 
older, night & weekend 
work available. Apply at 
Stop 8. Go Foods, 212 E . 
Grand River, Brighton. 

A24 

N E E D E D — f u l l or part 
time hairdressers. Apply 
in person. Blue Wig 
Beauty Salon, Brighton 
Mal l , Brighton. 

A-24 

W A N T E D ! Real Estate 
salesmen or saleslady, 
experience preferred , 
drawing account if 
wanted. An excel lent 
opportunity for anyone -
Well established Real 
Estate office in Brighton 
area. Phone 227 5179 for 
appt. 

A19 

T A K I N G applications for 
lathe 8i bench helper. 
Apply Industra Products 
inc . , 11801 E . Grand 
River, Brighton. 

A24 

G E N E R A L office & 
t y p i n g , b o o k k e e p i n g 
preferable. Hamburg 229-
9554. 

A24 

Center, 1-449-

a-24 

B A B Y S I T T E R wanted in 
my home. 227-6613 after 6 
p.m. Brighton. 

A-24 

MOTOR R O U T E Driver 
to deliver Detroit News, 
Brighton & Howeii area. 
Commiss ion & car 
aiiowance. Call Detroit 
News Agent, Brighton 
229-6587 between 2 8. 3. 

A-24 

AMBITIOUS C O U P L E 
looking for more income. 
Unusual opportunity for 
good earnings for both. 
Work together. Part time 
or full time. Call 1-449-
4133. 

A-24 

W A I T R E S S E S , ex ­
perienced, days. Apply 
Brass Lantern, Brighton. 

A24 

WANTED—Par t s Man, 
must be exper ienced. 
Bullard Pontiac, 227-1761 
Brighton. 

A T F 

M E C H A N I C wanted— 
Must be experienced. 227-
1761 Brighton. 

A T F 

A T T R A C T I V E $50toS90 a 
week job, for mothers. 
Exciting career. Choose 
your own hours. 229-9448 
Brighton. 

A-24 

M A N for gas station. 
Exper ienced 349-7420 
Mobil Station Seven Mile 
8. Northville Rd. Nor­
thville 

B A R T E N D E R , nights, 
permanent, dependable. 
Golden Knight , 8475 
Whitmore Lake Road, 
after 6 p.m. in person. 

H38 

M A T U R E adults to train 
as managers and 
assistant managers in 
retail grocery store. Ful l 
or part time positions 

available Please call 
342-8811 for appointment. 

H38 

D E P E N D A B L E person to 
sit in our home evenings -
some light housework, 
approximately 9 hours, 5 
days week. South Lyon 
area, for details call 437-
6456 daily before 2 p.m. 

H37 

A U T O M O B I L E b i l l e r , 
experienced in dealership 
procedure. A p p l y in 
person to M r s . Fay , 
Clayton Cadillac Old's, 
2321 E. Grand River, 
Howell, Michigan 

a 24 

Y O U N G men willing to 
learn for outdoor position, 
requires mechanica l 
appifude, flexible hours, 
willing to travel. 6 ft. 
200lbs minimum. Call for 
appt. 517-546-3981 

a 24 

M E N wanted to form car 
pool from Brighton to 
Lansing, Working hours 
8:30a.m. to 5:00 p.m. Call 
227.6324 Brighton 

A24 

WOMAN full 
knowledge of 
wall paper, 
person, G. 8. 

time with 
paint and 
App ly in 
G. Paint 

Developers. 4030 East 
Grand River, Howell 517-
546-9300. 

a 24 

U R G E N T 
woman for full time light 
housekeeping to help 
semi-invaiid mother with 
3 school age children and 
4th on way - live-in or ? 
437-2213. 

H37 

W A N T E D : Housekeeper 
2 or 3 days a week. 
Dependable. 437-6981 

H37 

P A R T time help wanted. 
Must be 18 or over. Must 
have val id d r ive r s 
license. Four hours a 
night. App ly News 
Printing, 560 S. Main , 
Northville. 

tf 

HIGH school boy to do 
lawn work. Call 349-1956 
after 5:00 p.m. 

E X P E R E I N C E D land­
scape men wanted only, 
over 18, 349.4950 

DOMESTIC, 2 days a 
week, experienced, own 
transporIanon. 
References requ i red , 
S2.50 per hour. 349.4283. 

H E L P wanted - male or 
female. Pizzeria located 
in Wixom. Call for ap­
pointment, 476-3062 or 349-
2790. 

H O U S E K E E P E R , live in. 
Motherless home. 2 
children 12 and 13. Novi 
349-2067 

JANITORS, male, part-
time evenings, must be 
dependable and have 
transportation, 535-6108 

H38 

T R A N S P O R T A T I O N 
7-1 M o t o r c y c l e s 

7-1 M o t o r c y c l e s 

1972 lOOcc Kawasaki , 2500 
mi les . E x c e l l e n t con­
dition. 437-3567 

H38 

6-2 S i t u a t i o n s W a n t e d 

B O O K K E E P E R , good 
typist, to work for general 
contractor in City of 
B r i g h t o n , 227-1681 
Brighton. 

A-24 

Y O U N G M A N out of 
school or retired gentlem­
an for kitchen help. Full 
time. 227-6121 Brighton. 

A-24 

G E N E R A L 
wi l l do 
d r y w a l l , 
a luminum 
roofing. No 

Handy man 
carpent ry , 
p l u m b i n g , 

s id ing and 
iob to big no 

iob to small. For estimate 
call Ron. 517-546-5985 

A T F 

H A V E an opening for any 
age child in my licensed 
day care home. 437-2330. 

H37 

M O T H E R in Tanqueray 
Hills will babysit for one 
pre-schooler in my home. 
437-6065. 

H37 

WOULD like to care for 
preschool ch i ld as 
playmate for my four-
year old. Fenced in yard, 
Lyon Gardens. 437-6079 

H37 

ROOFING - Garages -
Carpentry e lec t r ic 
Work- Odd Jobs. Brighton 
227-5319 

a26 

WILL babysit, my home. 
St. Mary Hospital area. 
427-9749 

CHILD care in my home 
week days. 227-6328 
Pinckney 

a 24 

L E G A L s e c r e t a r y , 
graduate of Oakland 
C o m m u n i t y C o l l e g e , 
wants full time work. 878-
3541 Howeii. 

.a24 

R E G I S T E R E D nurse 
wants part time v/ork 
evenings. Brighton 227-
5436 

a 24 

M A S O N A R Y - Brick 8< 
Block work. Brighton 229-
2335 after 3 p.m. 

a24 

W A S H I N G S 8, i roning 
done in my tiome, 
reasonable, also baby 
sitting anytime. Brighton 
227-7901 

a24 

WILL do babysitting in 
my home, reliable, have 
references. 437-3505. 

H37 

R E G I S T E R E D nurse 
would l ike par t t ime 
w o r k . M i d n i g h t s 
preferred. Call after 3 
p.m. 437-0302 

H37 

S P E C I A L d e c o r a t e d 
cakes, for weddings, 
birthdays, any < occasion. 
" D o l l cakes" . 227-7898 
Brighton. 

a-24 

WILL do babysitting in 
my home. Located 
Hacker Rd. and M-59. 
Hartland Schools. 517-546-
5682 Howell. 

a-24 

6-3 Business a n d P r o -
fess ional Se rv i ces 

Living Lord 
Chiidren's World 
Day Care Center 

and Nursery 
Full or part time 

programs 
477-6296 

O R G A N lessons for 
beginners. Your home or 
mine S3.50 each lesson. 
Call after 4 p.m. 349-2888 
or 349.1389 

S P E C I A L fal l sewing 
machine service in your 
home. Scissors shar­
pened. 453-1291 

22 

Q U A L I T Y upholstery, 
many fabrics to choose 
from. 1-517-546-1981 or 
4725 Green Rd. , Howell. 

A 25 

DOG Obedience classes. 
Fall session, indoors. 1-
498-2213 Gregory. 

A24 

P H O T O G R A P H Y — 
Singles to a brochure full. 
Color or black and white. 
Paiot Photo-Graphics. 
437-1374. 

htf 
I M M E D I A T E openings 
for women, light 
assembly and factory 
work, day and night 
shifts. Adeil industries 
inc., 43700 Adeii Bivd. , 
Novi. (196 and Novi Rd.) 

WORK W A N T E D : Small 
iobs, carpent ry , roof 
repair,' 8< odd iobs. 
References. 349-5182. 

tf 

H O N D A SOcc, good 
running cond , S75. Call 
after 5 p.m 229-4958 
Brighton. 

A24 

H O N D A — The Best Deai, 
Larges t selection of 
parts, touring and custom 
accessories. Sport Cycle 
Inc. 227-6128. 

A T F 

'71 SUZUKI 185, excellent 
condit ion. South L y o n . 
437-3380 

H37 

1971 SL350 H O N D A . Best 
offer over S500. 455-7239 

7-2 S n o w m o b i l e s 

I am 13 and would like to 
work with horses. Have 
had exper ience. Nor­
thville area 349-1389. Ask 
for Sue. 

B A B Y S I T T I N G in my 
home, 5 days a ,week. 
Brighton 229-6287 

a.tf 

T Y P I N G in my home, 
IBM Seiectric typewriter, 
changeable type. South 
Lyon 437-3222. 

HTF 

1972 Y a m a h a , 125MX, 
excellent condition. S500. 
Call 356-2890. 

1972 Suzuki 90 S350. or 1972 
Suzuki 125 S400. 349-2687. 

1972 Honda 70 with 
helmet. S290. 349-2144 

S U Z U K I 
S U P E R S A V I N G S 

1972 M O D E L S 
M o o r e ' s Moto r Spor t 
21001 Pon ta ic T r a i l 

a t E i g h t M i l e 
South Lyon 

437-2688 
Open 7 days a week 

1971 H O N D A CL 350, 
Excellent condition. Must 
sel l . S550.* 229-6028 
Brighton 

A24 

1969 HONDA S90, Ex-
ceiient condition. 517-546-
5425 Howell. 

a 24 

1971 HONDA,350 CL , 4000 
miles. Pay off balance 
Brighton 229-9456 

324 

M I N I - B I K E fram S25; 3 
h.p. Mini-bike S50; 3Vi 
h.p. Mini-bike S80; 1971 
Rupp 3V2 h.p. Mini-bike 
S125; 1971 65 CC Benelli 
trail bike $60; Custom 
Fun Machines Inc. 5776 
Grand River, Howell 517-
546-3658 

a 24 

5 H.P. 3 wheel ATV 1972; 
S200. Custom Fun 
Mach ines Inc. 517-546-
3658 Howell. 

A24 

SUZUKI 500CC Road Bike 
$660; 1971 Suzuki 250 CC 6 
speed Road Bike $425; 
1972 Kawasaki 250 CC 
Tra i l , 1,000 miles $600; 
1972 Suzuki 125 CC 

Scramble r S350; 1972 
Suzuki 125 Duster S425; 
Custom Fun Machines 
Inc. 5776 Grand River, 
Howell 517-546-3658 

____a24 

1972 SUZtjrtV I&.T^.^ 'TSt), : 
Water Cooled Road. Bike, . 
1,000 mi les . Demon­
strator $1,300. See it -
Ride it, at Custom Fun 
Mach ines , Inc. 5776 
Grand River Howell, 517-
546-3658 

a 24 

1972 HONDA C L , 350, Low 
miles, very good con­
dition. 227-7371 Brighton 

a 24 

1970 HONDA C L . 350, 
needs trans repair, $400. 
Caii Mark 437-1259 

H37 

SUZUKI T500. 1972, Mint 
c o n d i t i o n . U n d e r 
warranty. Cali after 5:00 
p.m. 437.6921 

h37 

SUZUKI Snowmobiles— 
1972 models now on sale 
at reduced prices —1973 
models now on display, 
Moore ' s Motor Sport, 
South Lyon 437-2688. 

H-39 

TWO new 1972 Auto-Ski 
snowmobiles. 440 twin, 
$825., 292 twin , $625. 
L i fe t ime war r an ty , on 
tracks. Brighton 229-8909. 

A-24 

7-3 B o a t s a n d 
E q u i p m e n t 

14' Fiberglass Crestliner 
with 50 h.p. Mercury. 
Tank, battery, controls 
aii inciuded. $600. 229-9032 
after 6. 

A-24 

12 ft. BOAT plus 5 h.p. 
Johnson motor, $90 or wiii 
sell separate, $45 each. 
Brighton 229-8359. 

A24 

15 ft. Tri-haul with 55 
Chrysler outboard motor, 
2 yrs. old. Like new. 
Brighton 229-8440. 

A25 

19 ft. Cruisers Inc. boet. 
with 95 h.p. Mercury and 
t ra i i e r . Sell cheap or 
trade for car or pick-up, 
in $1,000 range. 632-7688 
Hartland. 

a-24 

E X C E L L E N T coho boat, 
18ft. fiberglass, dorsett 
cabin c ru i se , 70 h.p. 
M e r c u r y motor , t i i t 
t r a i l e r , canvas cover . 
S1300. 517-546-3655 also 
camper top, fits any 
Chevy truck. 

a-25 

35 h.p. Johnson outboard, 
electric starter 8, short 
shank. Brighton 229-2730 

a-24 

15ft. Fiberglass runabout 
with outboard. 1971. 60 hp 
Johnson, under 100 miles 
use. In mint condition. 
Call 663-7728 between 4 
and 7 p.m. 

h-37 

16' wooden boat, needs 
painting, 44100 W. 12Miie, 
349-1904. 

7-4 C a m p e r s . T r a i l e r s 
: a i i d E c j u i p m e n t 

WINNEBAGO 8'/2 ft. 
1971, like new. Self con­
tained, sleeps 5 $1200.00 
349-1268 

C A M P E R C u s h i o n s 
r e u p h o l s t e r e d . F a s t 
s e r v i c e , S e r r a ' s 
Upholstery. 349-1830. 

T F 

C A M P I N G equipment, 
tent, cook stove, etc., like 
new. 437-6079 

h-37 

T R A V E L trailer, 13 foot, 
can sleep 4, self con­
tained, spare wheel and 
tire, Brighton 227-4948. 

a-24 

T R A V E L 

S P O R T S 

C E N T E R 

B R I G H T O N , M I C H . 4 8 1 1 6 

8 2 9 4 W. Grand River (at 1-96) 

( 3 1 3 ) 2 2 7 7 8 2 4 

' 7 2 C L E A R A N C E 

' S A L E 

• C e n t u r y 5 t h W h e e l * 

• C R E E T r a v e l T r a i l e r * 

* S t a r c r a f t T e n t C a m p e r s * 

*, B l a z o n T r a v e l T r a i l e r s * 

C R U I S E A I R M o t o r H o m e 

E V E R Y T H I N G 

P R I C E D T O 

N O W l 

R e m e m b e r 

W e ' r e y o u r T r a i l e r e r 

W i n t e r i z i n g Headquar t e r s 

W I N T E R G A R D 

f o r y o u r 

p l u m b i n g 

K O O L 

S E A L 

R o o f - C o a t i n g 

Q t . 2 -3-5 G a l . C a n t 

7-4 C a m p e r s , T ra i l e r s 
a n d E q u i p m e n t 

7 - 7 A T r u c k s f o r 
R e n t 

7-8 A u t o s 

CROWN camper. Sleeps 
8. Used twice, like new, 
many extras. Must sell. 
SI,395. F i r m . 349-3043 

U Haul trucks and traileis. 
Need time to locate them. 
349.7420 

'66 Mustang, ht., 289 V8, 
automatic, p.s., p.b., $295. 
437 0892 

htf 

7-6 A u t o s W a n t e d 
7-8 A u t o s 

1964 Falcon for parts and 
tires. $45.00 Cali 437-2602 
after 5:00 p.m. 

T E A C H E R needs reliable 
car with low mileage. 
$1,600. Available. 229-2428 
Brighton 

a-24 

C H E V R O L E T 283 engine, 
complete drive-train, also 
1955 Chevrolet parts , 
Milford 685-1946. 

h-37 

'69 Cougar, P.S., P .B. air, 
stereo, low mileage, 437-
3705. 

h-37 

'66 Olds Delta 88, good 
condition. $450. 437-6715 

h-37 

1966 Chevel le , good 
transportation $225.00. 
Call 437-2606 after 5:00 
p.m. 

'65 Mercury, 390 engine, 
nearly new tires, needs 
some body work, 349.1904. 

7-7 T r u c k s 

MUST sell 1959 Ford, 1 
ton, 292 V-8, 7' Steel Bed, 
437-0190. 

h-38 

1970 Viton Ford pick-up, 
360 engine with overdrive, 
good condition. Brighton 
229-2227 

a-24 

1969 Austin-Heaiy Sprite. 
Low mi leage . S700. 
Brighton 229-9604 

a-24 

'62 Ford Tandem, 2500 
gallon vacuum tank with 
pump and motor. Good 
condition, 349-7480. . 

'65 Pontiac Catalina, 2 dr. 
ht, good trans. $150. 
Brighton 229-6644 

a-24 

M E C H A N I C ' S a u t o 
supply. Your best place to 
buy parts. Brighton 229-
9529 

a-35 

' 7 2 C L O S E O U T S A L E ! 

^ay Lioyd 
_Sales Supervisor 

S E P T . 1 4 - 1 5 - 1 6 

F R E E 

P O R T A B L E T V 
with the purchase of 
Plymouth - Chrysler 

or Satellite 
C h r y s l e r - P l y m o u t h 

W a l l e d L a k e 

6 2 4 - 1 5 5 0 U t a 

Y o u ' l l c o u n t t h e s a v i n g s 

a s w e c o u n t o f f t h e 

l a s t o f t h e ' 7 2 P o n t i a c s 

B U L L A R D P O N T I A C 

' W e wi/l not be undersold. Tell us if we are" 

9 7 9 7 E . G r a n d R i v e r , B r i g h t o n , 2 2 7 - 1 7 6 1 

U L I _ / \ n D 

U P A N D D O W N T H E S T R E E T 

W E A R E T H E O N E T O B E A T 

L O O K F O R Y O U R S E L F . . . 

N E W ' 7 2 

F U R Y 

« 2 6 4 7 
INCLUDES 

AutomaHc trgntmliflonf 
power itoerins, power 
disc brokos and full fac­
tory equipment. 

N E W ' 7 2 

C H R Y S L E R 

« 3 f 7 4 
I N a U M S 

AHteiiMric troniminioiit 
power fNorlng, p o w e r 
4iK braket,and full fac-
-tory equipmem. 

"A Name You Can Trust" DOM MARINO'S \ 

C O L O N Y - C H R Y S L E R - P L Y M O U r H 

i n A N N A R B O R R O A D , P L Y M O U T H 

4 5 3 - 2 2 5 5 c l x > s e d S a t u r d a y W O 2 - 5 8 3 0 

I J 

S a l e s 

D r i v e 

i s @ N ! 

a n d 

A L L 

R e m a i n i n g 

' 7 2 

C h e v y s 

a n d 

O l d s 

s o S T O P I N , 

D R I V E O N E O U T ! 

1 9 T 2 C h a v t l l * M a l i b u S p a r t C a a p a 

' 2 8 3 5 

6 C y l i n d e r , P o w e r S t ee r ing , 

B e l t e d W h i t e S t r i p e d T i r e s 

1 9 6 8 B u i c k E l e c t r a 

1 9 6 8 C h e v e l l e - $ 1 0 9 5 

1 9 6 5 D e l t a 8 8 O l d s m o b i l e 

1 9 7 0 M e r c u r y $ 1 8 9 5 

7 1 F o r d T o r i n o 

S h a r p 4 - D o o r 

' 6 9 B u i c k 4 - D o o r H a r d t o p 

P o w e r S t e e r i n g & B r a k e s 

V i n y l T o p - F a c t o r y A i r 

N e w T i r e s • $ 1 7 9 5 

' 6 8 C h e v e l l e S p o r t C p e . 

' 7 0 C h e v y B i s c a y n e - $ 1 8 9 5 

G . D s V A N C A M P 

C h e v r o l e t - O l d s m o b i l e 

S a l t s • S t r f i e t -k P a r t s 

6 0 3 W . G r a n d R i v e r • B r i g h t o n 2 2 9 - 9 5 4 1 

W e d . - T h u r s . , S e p t e m b e r 1 3 - 1 4 , 1 9 7 2 
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7-8 A u t o s 7-8 A u t o s 7-8 A u t o s 

1971 P L Y M O U T H Scamp, 
good condit ion, low 
mileage. 437-0812 between 
6-8 p.m. for information. 

H-37 

7-8 A u t o s 

1968 VW. Must sell, 4,000 
miles, on engine excellent 
car , S975. 227-5789 
Brighton. 

a-24 

1969 Pontiac Ca ta l ina , 
P.S. and P .B . , am radio, 
tape deck, S1,250. 227-6029 
Brighton. 

a 24 

FOR sale-Dune Buggy 
with Porche engine. 229-
8086 

h-37 

1969 Charger S E , V T . auto 
rans, 383 cu. in. engine, ps 
& pb. S1300. 1967 Olds 
Delmont, Ht. VT, auto 
trans. Ps & pb, 425 cu. in. 
engine. S800. Brighton 
227-7140 

a-24 

1 9 7 2 B U I C K 

a n d O P E L 

S E L L - O U T 

A L S O 

D E M O S 

M U S T B E S O L D 

T A K I N G O R D E R S F O R 

1 9 7 3 ' s N O W ! 

J A C K S E L L E 

B U I C K & O P E L 

2 0 0 A n n A r b o r R o a d , 

P l y m o u t h 4 5 3 ^ 1 1 

O P E N M O N . T H U R S . - T I L 9 P . M . 

IN good condition, 1968 
impaia S825. Also 1966 
Ford Pici<up, S600. 229-
8560 

a-24 

73 
' $ H E R E N O I N ! 

* GREMLIN • AMX 
* Ar»/IBASSAtX)R 
* J A V E L i N • HORNET 
» MATADOR ' JEEP 

F i e s t a A m e r i c a n 

n A M C - n J e e p 

1205 Afnn Arbor Rd . Plymouth, 4 5 3 - 3 6 0 0 

M l A C 

T R A l L 

S M I L E R l i 

F I N A L C L E A R A N C E 

7 2 M O D E L S 

B U Y r i o W A l ^ b i A V ^ 

P I N T O 2 0 0 0 E n g i n e , A u t o m a t i c , 

W S W , R a d i o , A c c e n t G r o u p . $ 2 1 9 0 

0 R A N T O R I N O 4 D r . , D e m o , 

V - 8 , A u t o m a t i c , P o w e r S t e e r i n g , 

R a d i o , W S W . $ 2 7 9 0 

N O W T A K I N G ORDERS 

O N 7 3 FORDS 

—EARLY DELIVERY— 

A l l t h e t h i n g s t h a t m a d e 

u s N o . 1 . . . a n d m o r e . 
It's the all new Datsim Pielcup. Neweat version of the Detmm 

U ' l HusUer. America's No. 1 selling hnport truclt. WeVe kept 
all the goodies that put us first, and added a lot of new things 
to sweeten the deal. 
There's a roomier, full-vinyl cab with contoured bench seat. 

Restyled histruments. New power-flow ventiUtion There's a 
new two-stage suspension designed to deliver an incomparable 
ride whether full or empty. There are new power-esdst brakes 
And an all-new look on the outside. 

As for the features that made us No. 1. they're all here. too. 
Overhead cam engine tliat delivers up to 26 miles per gallon. 
6-f0ot all-steel load bed with tie-down hooks. Ftilly- synchr-
onized 4-speed transmission. 6-ply-rated whitevroUs, 5 includ­
ing spare. Much more. 

Datsun's new L i l Htutler. As you might expect, it's some 
kind of little truclc 

O ' I H A R A D A T S U N 
FROM NISSAN WITH PRIDE 

Nolsody Imows smctll trucks lilce D a t s u n 
349SS Plymouth Rd. at Wayne Rd. a a e fljA f 4 
Sales-Service and Parts mXi'M I I 

M A R K 

W I L S O N 

F o r d ' s 

L A T B 

^ O N 

LASSO A NEW 

M U S T A N G 

OR P I N T O 

OR PICK FROM A 

CORRAL — FUL 

OF ' 7 2 FORDS 

A N D MERCURY S 

EASY TO DRIVE TO 

EASY TO DEAL WITH 

4 3 7 - 1 7 6 3 

F O R D 

M E R C U R Y 

W I L S O N F O R D & 
¥ ¥ l k 9 W n , ^ E R C U R Y S A L E S 

B R I G H T O N 

7-8 A u t o s 7-8 A u t o s 

Before b u y i n g a 

U S E D C A R see 

S O U T H L Y O N 

M O T O R S 

105 S. ijfayette-South Lyon 
Phone 437-1177 

Cised Cars Bought & Sold 

1965 Mercury, 4 door, V.8, 
excellent running, new 
tires. S350. Brighton 229 
6280 

a-24 

'64 Ctievy, 327 engine. 
Brighton 227-7380 

a-24 

1962 /WG Midget, 2 tops, 
body excellent. S480. Call 
356 2890. 

'68 Chevy Nova . 4 
c y l i n d e r a u t o m a t i c . 
Excellent condition, also 
snow tires. Low miles. 
Best offer. 349-1322. 

'66 Ford Bronctio, 4 wheel 
drive, snow tires, snow 
blade. Call after 5 p.m. 
Brighton 229-2424 

a-24 

GOOD 1959 Ford Galaxie, 
working cond. Best offer. 

•229-8167 Brighton. 
A24 

1967 C U T L E S S , V-8 
automatic, must sell, call 
after 7:30. 517-546-3948 
Howell. 

A 24 

'67 AAustang. Vinyl top, 
automatic. A i r con­
di t ioning, r ad ia l s . 349-
8295. 

'69 Charger SE, power 
steering, power brakes. 
Automat ic , air con­
ditioned, cruise control. 
Leather in ter ior , and 
vinyl roof. Si,900. 349-
7337. 

1972 Pontiac Catalina. 4 
door hardtop. Vinyl roof, 
power s teer ing, power 
brakes. Ciean. 349-7057. 

F R E E 
5 0 G A L S . 

O F G A S 

F O R Y O U R N E W C A R O R T R U C K 

Y O U I V I U S T A S K F O R 

J O H N S U L L I V A N - 4 7 4 - 0 5 0 0 

R O G E R P E C K C H E V R O L E T 
on Grand River 
Just west of Middiebeit 

Oaliy til 6 p.m. 
Mon. & Thurs. til 9 

M A R K 

SERVICE DEPT. 

N O W OPEN 

THURSDAY 

EVENINGS 

TIL 8 FOR YOUR 

CONVENIENCE 

4 3 7 - 1 7 6 3 

T r y O u t a F o r d 

a t V o l k s w a g e n . 

Try out any of the cars people trade in for new VWs.' 
Wegetall l(!nds. 

But we don't sell them again just like that. We checic 
theiTi out first. Give them the 16-point inspeaion. Fix 
.whatever rj^ed^-. fixing., Then guarantee the repair or 
replacemertfof every major working pat%* 100% for 
30 days or iOOO miles. Whichever comes first. 

Incidentally, the guarantee comes with all our used 
cars. 

Even the Volkswagens, 
engine* transmission* rear axle* front axle 
assemblies • brake system* electrical system 

I O V E R 1 0 0 C A R S T O C H O O S E F R O M 

1 9 6 9 F O R D V2 T O N ^ 1 4 9 7 
Pickup, standard trans, new rubber. 

' 6 8 N O V A S S ' 1 2 9 7 
V-8 Automatic Power Steering, Vinyl Top. 

Air Conditioning. 

7 1 T R I U M P H S P I T F I R E U 6 9 7 
Red with Black Top. Excellent condition 
low mileage. 

T Q M s u m V A N 

V O L K S W A G B I 

2 5 4 0 0 W . 8 M i l e 3 5 3 - 6 9 0 0 

® SERVICE HOURS 
7 a.m. - 9 p.m. 

Saturday 7 a.m. - 7 p.m. ® 

O V E R S T O C 

1 9 7 2 C h r y s l e r s 

1 9 7 2 P l y m o u t h s 

a n d w e ' v e g o t t a 

g e t o u r l o t c l e a r e d 

f o r t h e ' 7 3 s 

" Y o u d o t h e d e a l i n g 

w e ' l l d o t h e l i s t e n i n g 

eee 

CHRYSLKR 

Vlymoutfi 

"WRITE YOURSELF A REASONABLE DEAL - WE'LL SIGN IT. 

B i l l T e a s l e y 

C h r y s l e r - P l y m o u t h 

9 8 2 7 E . G R A N D R I V E R , B R I G H T O N 2 2 9 - 6 6 9 2 

H U R R Y ! 

M o d e l c l o s e o u t D I S C O U N T S 

S T I L L A G O O D S E L E C T I O N 
L T D - G R A N T O R I N O - P I N T O - M A V E R l C K 
l V I E R C U R Y - M O N T E G O - C O l V I E T - W A G O N S 

F O R O T R U C K S •RANCHERO • ' S T A K E BO Of VVANS •CAMPER SPECIALS 
I I 

B r i n g U s Y o u r B e s t D e a l . . . 

W e ' l l M a k e I f B e t t e r ! " 

O P E N M O N . & T H U R S . E V E TIL 9 

1 3 0 S . M i l f o r d 

M i l f o r d 

6 8 4 - 1 7 1 5 

W O - 3 - 7 6 5 4 

7-8 A u t o s 

S t a t e B o a s t s 

O l d T a v e r n s 

Inns or taverns Were a 
f a m i l i a r s igh t i n pioneer 
Michigan's stagecoach days 
and several of these refuges 
for the Weary traveler remain 
today along What were once 
the main roads, according to 
Automobile Club of Michigan. 

The inns sprang up at short 
interVals a long the poor, 
rough roads because of delays 
in traVel and also because 
only smal l distances could be 
coVered at a time. Some inils 
that still exist are along What 
were main routes between 
Detroit and Chicago. 

To traVelers of a century 
ago, the Botsford Inn, at 
Grand Rive r and Eight Mile , 
Farmington, Was a favorite 
rest stop. In 1841, Stephen 
Jennings, Who then owned 
the house, opened it as a 
tavern. It became a main 
stopping place for farmers 
and drovers on their way to 
the Detroit markets. In later 
years, Lansing stagecoaches 
stopped there. 

Mil ton Botsford, Who gave 
the inn its name, took over in 
1860 and the property 
remained in the Botsford 
fami ly un t i l automotive 
pioneer H e n r y F o r d pur­
chased it in l924, retaining 
possession until the l940s. 

The Bo t s fo rd Inn, noW 
enlarged and With modem 
conveniences, is stil l in the 
hotel-restaurant business. It 
is open for breakfast from 7 to 
11:30 a.m., lunch from 11:30 
a.m. to 3 p .m. and dinner, 3 
p.m. to 10 p.m. It also is open 
Sundays for brunch from 10 
a.m. to 2 p.m. and dinner from 
1 to 8 p.m. 

On the route betWeen 
Detroit and Chicago, three 
inns are Within a five-mile 
radius in the scenic Irish 
Hills . 

The first, Bauer Manor, is 
on US-12, seven miles West of 
Clinton, across the road from 
EVans L a k e . S t i l l a 
restaurant, it is open daily 
both for transient guests and 
specia l par t ies . With l iVe 
entertainment on Saturdays. 
Bl i i l t about 1840, it was first 
used as a stagecoach stop and 
later as a hotel. 

Springville Inn is six miles 
West of Tipton on M-50. It was 
named Springville because of 
the many flowing wells there. 
This former inn, which also 
dates from about 1840, also 
was used by pioneers of 
Cambridge and the Irish Hil ls 
area for political, social and 
public gatherings. Privately 
owned, it is now an antique 
shop. 

Four miles away is famous 
Walke r T a v e r n , at the 
Western edge of the Irish Hills 
in Cambridge Junction. The 
site Was once the junction of 
Michigan's old Chicago and 
Monroe turnpikes. 

Built in 1832, notable guests 
who once stopped there in­
cluded statesman Dan ie l 
Webster, Harriet Martineau 
(the E n g l i s h wr i t e r ) and 
James Fenimore Cooper, A m -
merican novelist.Cooper spent 
considerable time here and 
the locale appears in some of 
his books. One room is known 
as the "murder room" and is 
said to be the scene of the 
murder of an unidentified 
traveler. 

W a l k e r Tave rn is un-" 
dergoing restoration for a 
second year under state 
supervision and at present is 
closed to the public. NoW a 
National Historic Site, it is 
scheduled to resume its 
former role as a museum in 
the near future. 

Clinton Inn, dating from 
1832, Was once a famous 
overnight stop in Clinton on 
the Detroit-Chicago journey. 
It was purchased by Henry 
F o r d and restored in 
Greenfield Vil lage in 1928. 
The back portion of the inn 
has been enlarged and serves 
as a cafeteria for visitors. The 
front section is furnished like 
a typical tavern of its time. It, 
too, was v i s i t ed by 
dis t inguished persons, in­
c luding Pres ident J a m e s 
Polk, Webster and Cooper. 

Other early inns or taverns, 
most of them not as Well 
known, are scattered 
throughout M i c h i g a n , but 
some have been turned into 
private residences. 

3 W i n i n H o r s e S h o w 

Three area young people 
Were among the top winners 
of the State 4-H Horse Show 
held recently at Michigan 
State University. 

J i m L o v e of Whi tmore 
L a k e , r i d i n g h is Quar ter 
Horse, Won bronze medlas for 
stock seat equi ta t ion and 
Western pleasure (member 15 
years old). 

Nancy Collier of Pinckney 

received a gold medal in the 
saddle seat division, fitting 
and shoWing (16 years old). 
She also took a bronze medal 
in saddle seat equitation and a 
silver in bridle pat hack 
(English pleasure saddle). 

ShoWing in the pony class 
Diane Straton of Brighton (12 
years old) Won a gold medal 
for equitat ion Western 
equipment. 

C o l o r S p l a s h N e a r 

Color i f ic ap t ly describes 
Michigan's autumnal face. 
Mother Nature literally runs 
rampant , sp lash ing color 
indiscriminately throughout 
both peninsulas. 

Beginning at the tip of the 
KeWeenaW Peninsula in mid 
to late September and moving 
southward, the Upper 
Peninsula is ablaze With a 
spectacular myr i ad of hues. 
The red and bright gold d the 
maples, the yellow aspens. 

scarlet sumac and burnished 
golden oaks are resplendent 
amid the cool green o f neigh­
boring pines. 

This is the time of year 
When nature becomes the 
ringmaster for the "greatest 
shoW on earth", according to 
the Michigan Tourist Council. 

For additional information 
on f a l l color tours in 
M i c h i g a n , Write to the 
M i c h i g a n Tour i s t Counc i l , 
Lansing 48926. 

7-8 A u t o s 7-8 A u t o s 

1968 Dodge Coronet 440, 
V8, P.S., good condition. 
Call 437-0136 after 5:00 
p.m. or Weekends. 

h-37 

1971 Pofitlac Ventura II, 
automatic, many extras. 
663-0093 

h-37 

1970 M A V E R I C K , 6 cyl . , 
.automatic, radio, heater, 
trailer hitch, 5 new tires 
plus 2 snow tires with 
wheels. Good cond. , 
clean. SI,150. By owner. 
349-2530 after 5. 

1970 Mercury Cyclone, 
power steering and 
brakes, stereo, 2 snow 
tires. 27,000 miles. Call 
349-3988 after 7 p.m. 

'70 Nova . 6 cy l inder . 
Excellent condition. Stick 
on the floor. New tires, 
vinyl top, rally wheels. 
$1,650. 624-5815 

'71 Chevrolet Concorse 
wagon. Power steering, 
power brakes, automatic. 
Air conditioning, radio. 
S2,650. or best offer. Novi 
349-6165. 

1962 Falcon, one owner. 
F a m i l y ' s second car , 
actual milage—40,000. 
Exce l len t mechanica l 
condition. $95. 349-4294. 

1970 C H R Y S L E R 
Newport, 2 dr., ps, pb, 
automatic, air, 229-4933 
Brighton. 

A25 

1969 V.W. LOW miles, 
automatic, best offer. 229-
8446 Brighton. 

A24 

t J I A O l i S , 

. O F 

'65 VW Bus, new rebuilt 
e n g i n e , c a r p e t e d 
throughout, $500. 517-546-
6938. 

A24 

'69 BUICK Electra, 225, 2 
dr. hardtop coupe, air 
conditioning, under $2000. 
Brighton 229.9467. 

A24 

1971 M A V E R I C K , ex­
cellent cond., ext ras , 
standard shift. $1,550. 229-
"6921 Brighton. 

A24 

1963 V O L V O , $150, 
6619 Brighton. 

227-

A25 

1968 F O R D L . T . D . , 2 dr., 
vinyl top, air cond., PB & 
PS, clean, good cond. 229-
2392 Brighton. 

A24 

1965 P O N T I A C Bon­
neville, 4 dr., H.T., new 
brakes, tires, alternator 
& starter. Exceptionally 
clean, 229-8970 Brighton. 

A 24 
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ding of the basement appeal^ 
to confirm the account of l877 
by Father Edward Jadcer 
Who wrote to a friend in New 
York. Jacker said he had 
acted on details in the 'Jesuit 
Relat ions," now a 
multivolume account of the 
missonaries' work among the 
Indians, that Marquette 's 
body had been moved in l677 
from present-day Ludington 
Where he died in 1675 to his 
mission on the north side of 
Mackinac Straits. 

Jacker had found two bones 
and a feliow Worker had found 
about 30 more in the ancient 
cellar. 

Also at the mission site. 
Stone said, they found a 
complete wine bottle, hand-
blown and dark green of about 
six inches at its widest and 
seven to eight inches tall, in 
European style. Rarely is an 
old bottle found intact. The 
one found compares with the 
1660-1680 ones Which have 
been found in colonial sites in 
the eastern United States. 

Also found were beads 
which predate those found in 
the Lasanen'Site burial pit 
finds of 1967 south of St. 
Ignace, and any found in the 
Fort Michi l imackinac ex­
cavations on the south 
mainland. The French 
military moved their fort 
from the north mainland to 
the south mainland in 1715. 

Most of the pewter 
porringer, about four inches 
in diameter. With writing and 
drawings on the inside, also 
Was found. 

Evidences of structures 
were the three new wall 
trenches of What appears to 
have been a I7th Century 
structure, and the Marquette 
burial basement. 

Old Huron Village 
The other major find in the 

St. Ignace area, Stone said, is 
What "seems to be the outer 
walls of a part of the old 
Huron Village." 

Midway through the 
summer they found the start 
of two Walls Which cornered. 
They, followed one along 65 to 
70 feet Without coming to 
another turn, and the second 
they followed about 40 feet 
without reaching a turn. 

"We found a double row of 
posts, two to three inches in 
diameter, as the Wall 
structures," he said. "It is 
probable that they wove 
materials between the two 
rows to create their walls." 

Time and money con­
straints prohibited the further 
digging of the Huron Village 
structure, but it is expected 
the Work will resume next 
summer. 

Artifacts found there were 
early historic Indian pottery, 
flint chipplngs. arrowheads, 
projectile points, and a trash 
pit full of fish bones. Only 
limited disturbance from 
subsequent occupations were 
found, and not enough to 
create serious problems in 
archaeological examination. 

The 17th Century map of 
present-day St. Ignace, done 
by the French explorer de 
L.aHontan, showed a French 
Village, the Jesuits House, the 
Huron Village, the Fields of 
the Savages, a Vi11age of the 
Ottawas. 

Father Claude Dabon spent 
the Winter of l670-7l on 
Mackinac Islanij, in What was 
the first recorded missionary 
to visit the area. Marquette 
following in the spring of 1671 
and settled first on the island, 
re-establishing his parish at a 
new mission in SL Ignace 
later that year. 

In 1673 Marquette and 
Jolliet began from St. Ignace 
their exploratory Voyage 
through the northern portion 
of the Miss iss ippi RiVer 
drainage system. Marguette 
died en route home inl675. 

The M i c h i l i m a c k i n a c 
Historical Society of St. 
Ignace has been hopeful over 
the years that firm evidence 
of Marquette's burial there 
could be confirmed. 

In 1689, the French erected 
Fort de Buade at what is now 
St. Ignace. In 1695, Antolne de 
L a Mothe Cadillac became 
commandant, but abandoned 
the fort in l 698, and moved to 
today's Detroit, there 
establishing Fort Font-
chartrain in 1701. The Jesuits, 
abandoned by the Indians, 
burned their mission and 
returned to Montreal. The 
French re-established their 
fort at the straits about 1715, 
but on the south mainland. 
The British took oVer the fort 
in 1761 and' moved to 
Mackinac Island in 1780 in the 
early days of the American 
ReVolution. 
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t972 NOVI WILOCATS 

W I L D C A T S — F r o n t R o w ( l e f t t o r i g h t ) R e i d 
H a r p s t e r , S e a n O ' B r i e n , D a v e W a r n e k e , M i l i e 
H o l r o y d e , B o b B r o w n , T o m F o r d , T o m C e l a n i , 
G a r y F o r d , C o a c h J o h n O s b o r n e , V i n c e F r i t z , 
E r i c H a n s o r , S t e v e L u k k a r i , T i m A s s e m a n y . B i l l . 
R o s s , D a n K a r d e l , IVI ike R i l e y . B a c k R o w . J o h n 

W i t h e r s , K e n J o n e s , R o n B u c k , D a v e W a r d , P a t 
B o y e r , G a r y C o l l i n s , J o h n P a n t a l o n e , J i m 
V a n W a g n e r , S t e v e F e a r , R o g e r P e l c h a t , D a v e 
B r o w n , K e v i n L a F l e c h e , D o n J a c k s o n , J e r r y 
C o c k r e l l , D a v e S i n a c o l a . 

v^t,;:i 
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S C H E D U L E 

September 15 A t NorthviUe 8 p m 
September 2 2 M i l a n 7 :30 
September 29 South L y o n 7 :30 
October 6 A t Dexter 7 :30 
October 13 A t Chelsea 7 :30 
October 2 0 A t Saline 7 :30 
October 27 Dimdee 7 :30 
November 3 A t L i n c o l n 7 :30 
November 10 Dearborn Crestv^ood 7:30 
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W i l d e a t s 

T H I S M E S S A G E B R O U G H T 

N O V I R E X A L L D R U G 
43035 G r a n d River - 3 4 9 - 0 1 2 2 

N O V I A U T O P A R T S 
43131 Grand River - 3 4 9 - 2 8 0 0 

N O V I I N N 
43379 Grand River 

C O U N T R Y B U I L D I N G S U P P L I E S 
43755 Grand R i v e r - 349-7310 

S P A R T A N C O N C R E T E . Inc. 
44922 Grand R i v e r - 3 4 9 - 3 5 0 0 

T O Y O U W I T H T H E B E S T W I S H E S O F T H E F O L L O W I N G W I L D C A T R O O T E R S : 

J . R . B A R N E S C o . . Inc. 
2 5 8 0 0 N o v i R o a d - 5 2 2 - 1 6 1 4 

O D Y S S E Y M E T A L P R O D U C T S 
25800 N o v i R o a d - 3 4 9 - 0 1 8 0 

K M H E Q U I P M E N T C o . 
25460 Nov i R o a d - 3 4 9 - 0 7 0 0 

M O B A R A K R E A L T O R 
25869 Nov i R o a d - 3 4 9 - 4 4 1 1 

F R A Z E R W . S T A M A N I N S U R A N C E 
25939 Nov i R o a d - 3 4 0 - 2 1 8 8 

H E R B ' S S A L E S & S E R V I C E 
43325 W . 12 M i l e R o a d - 3 4 9 - 1 1 6 4 

V I C E T E D I E & E N G I N E E R I N G C o , Inc. 
45241 Grand R i v e r - 3 4 9 - 3 2 3 0 

P O R T E C . Inc.. Paragon Div i s ion 
4 4 0 0 0 Grand R ive r -349 -2451 

T H O M P S O N S T R A V E L C E N T E R 
4 2 9 7 0 Grand R i v e r - 3 4 9 - 5 4 5 0 

H A R O L D ' S F R A M E S H O P 
4 4 1 7 0 Grand R i v e r - 3 4 9 - 7 5 5 0 

D E T R O I T C O N C R E T E P R O D U C T S 
Maclnn is Bros. Asphal t Paving 
4 4 3 0 0 Grand R i v e r - 3 4 9 - 4 4 4 0 
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c o n t e n t s 

P a g e 3 - C 

0 W a t e r f o r d M o t t a n d L i v o n i a C h u r c h i l l a r e l i k e l y 
s u c c e s s o r s t o F a r m i n g t o n H a r r i s o n ' s t h r o n e i n W e s t e r n 
S i x C o n f e r e n c e 3 - C 

% B o l s t e r e d b y g o o d t e a m s p e e d a n d n e w y e a r - r o u n d 
c o n d i t i o n i n g p r o g r a m , a s m a l l b u t f l e e t B r i g h t o n t e a m 
h o p e s f o r i m p r o v e d s e a s o n 5 - C 

# C h e l s e a ' s s t r o n g a g a i n , b u t e n t i r e S E C f i g u r e s t o b e 
t o u g h t h i s s e a s o n 6 - C 

0 W h i t m o r e L a k e e y e s i m p r o v e m e n t w h i l e p i n n i n g 
h o p e s o n A . J . G i l l e s p i e ' s c o n v e r s i o n t o r u n n i n g b a c k ; 
P i n c k n e y a p p r o a c h e s s e a s o n w i t h y o u n g b u t o p t i m i s t i c 
t e a m ; a n d H a r t l a n d f a c e s a r e b u i l d i n g y e a r u n d e r a n e w 
c o a c h 7 - C 

0 S o u t h L y o n h a s t h e n u m b e r s , s e e k s q u a l i t y r u n n i n g 
b a c k s i n i t s b i d t o i m p r o v e 1 1 - C 

% N o r t h v i l l e h o p e s e x p e r i e n c e g a i n e d b y a c r e w o f 
s o p h o m o r e s l a s t y e a r i n d i s h e a r t e n i n g 0-7-1 s e a s o n w i l l 
p a v e r o u t e t o a .500 m a r k i n t h i s ' 72 s e a s o n 1 3 - C 

A n i m p r o v e d d e f e n s e w i l l h e l p , b u t k e y t o N o v i ' s g r i d 
f o r t u n e s i s a w e s o m e r u n n i n g a t t a c k t h a t w i l l p i l e u p p o i n t 
a f t e r p o i n t a s W i l d c a t s g o g u n n i n g f o r a n u n d e f e a t e d 
s e a s o n a n d S E C c h a m p i o n s h i p 1 5 - C 

I n W e s t e r n S i x 

M a t t y C h u r c h i l l 

B a t t l e f o r T i t l e 

one thing most coaches in the 
Western Six Conference agree on is that 
F a r m i n g t o n l I a r r i son w i l l not repeat as 
league champions. 

" T h e y ' v e lost too m u c h to be able to 
come bacl t ," sa id one coach. " D a v e 
Man(» Was ttleir Whole t eam and he's 
gone and so are a lot of other people 
Who Were important to t hem." 

Rep lac ing Har r i son , most Western 
Six coaches agree. Wi l l be either 
Waterford IVlott or L i V o n i a C h u r c h i l l . 

In fact, three of the four coaches 
interVieWed - Wal l ed L a k e Western 
Coach M i k e M a n c i n i is neW and un­
fami l i a r With the league - saW the race 
as a two-way b r a w l t^elween the 
Chargers from C h u r c h i l l and Mot t ' s 
Corsai rs . 

The only coach Who d i d not see the 
race as a tWo-team affair Was K e n 
Kaestner , coach of the L iVon ia Chur­
ch i l l squad. 

' ' F a rming ton Har r i son has eight 
starters coming back," he said , ' 'but 
Mott has everybody returning. Nobiody 
is even going to come close to them. 
They 've got T i m S imon (quarterback) 
on offense a n d G o r d o n S h e l d o n 
(lineljacker) on defense. T h e y ' l l haVe 
one of the top teams in Oakland County 
this year. Nobody is going to beat 
them." 

Kaestner is probably correct. Mot t 
should finish on top With C h u r c h i l l 
second, folloWed by Har r i son , Wal l ed 
L a k e Western, and Nor thVi l le . 

E V e r y coach in the league expects his 
defense to be tough tliis year, but the 
only squad Wllich boasts a potentially 
potent offense 1sMot t .Ti1n 
Si1non a 5 ' lO", 160 pounder. Won A l l -
Conference honoi-s last year as a junior 
and is back to direct the M o l t attack. 

" H e ' s the b i g reason We decided to 
sWitch to the Wishbone this yea r , " 
reported P e r r y . Excep t iona l ly fast, he 
does the 40 y a r d dash i n 4.8 seconds i n 
full uniform, S imon Wil l haVe plenty of 
backfield running help. 

G r e g A l d r i c h , 6 '1", l85, is a fullback 
Who does the 40 in 5.0 seconds and P e r r y 
says he has s ix good running backs 
headed by 170 pound D a l e Romeo (4.9 
for the 40) and l85 pound B r u c e LoVet t 
(5.0 for the 40). 

Heading tlie Corsa i r s ' defense Will be 
Gordon Sheldon, an A l l - O a k l a n d County 
and Al l -Suburban selection last year as 
a junior and a bonafide All-State 
prospect i n 1972. 

" H e ' s 6'3", Weighs 235, and does the 
loo in 9.5 seconds," says NorthVil le 
coach Chuck Shonta. in explaining 
Gordon's appearance on the field. 
Ac tua l ly , Sheldon is only 5 ' l J " , 235, and 
does the 40 in 5.2 seconds in full 
uniform. B i g difference. 

M o t t Coach George P e r r y saw the 
race as a battle betWeen his own team 
and Church i l l , but p icked the Chargers 
on top. " T h e i r jayvees Were undefeated 
unti l their last game ," says P e r r y , 
fai l ing to mention that they lost their 
last game to his oWn jayvee squad. 

C h u r c h i l l C o a c h K e n Kaestner 
picked his own tealrl to finish t lurd 
behind Mot t and Harr i son . "1 knoW a lot 
of people are pointing the finger at us, 
l)Ut We just haven't got that m u c h , " he 
asserted. 

The Church i l l team Will pit its hopes 
on its defense. "We ' r e smal le r than 
past C h u r c h i i l teams," sa id Kaestner , 
"but We have gofxl speed and gofMI 

Cont inued on Page 6-C 
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4 t h D r e a m T e a m 

T o C l i m a x S e a s o n 

N O m a t t e r h o w s u c c e s s f u l Or u n s u c c e s s f u l a n i n d i v i d u a l t e a m 
m i g h t b e w h e n t h e 1972 s e a s o n d r a w s t o a c l o s e i t ' s a c e r t a i n t y t h a t 
o n e o r m o r e f o o t b a l l p l a y e r s w i l l h a v e g i v e n t h e e x t r a o u n c e o f 
e f f o r t t h a t s p e l l s " o u t s t a n d i n g . " 

A n d i n r e c o g n i t i o n o f t h a t e x t r a e f f o r t , t h e S l i g e r n e w s p a p e r 
f a m i l y w i l l a g a i n s e l e c t a n a l l - s t a r t e a m i n N o v e m b e r c o m p o s e d 
o f p l a y e r s w h o h a v e d i s t i n g u i s h e d t h e m s e l v e s o n t h e g r i d i r o n 
d u r i n g t h e ' 72 s e a s o n . 

A c c o r d i n g to J a c k H o f f m a n , a s s i s t a n t to t h e p u b l i s h e r , t h i s 
f o u r t h a n n u a l a l l - s t a r t e a m w i l l b e p i c k e d f r o m s e v e n h i g h s c h o o l s 
w i t h i n t h e c i r c u l a t i o n a r e a o f t h e w e e k l y c h a i n o f S l i g e r 
n e w s p a p e r s i n N o r t h v i l l e , N o V i , S o u t h L y o n a n d B r i g h t o n . 

T h e h i g h s c h o o l s r e g u l a r l y c o v e r e d b y t h e s e n e w s p a p e r s i n c l u d e 
N o r t h V i l l e , N o v i , S o u t h L y o n , B r i g h t o n , W h i t m o r e L . a k e , H a r t l a n d 
a n d P i n c k n e y . 

P l a y e r s s e l e c t e d f o r t h i s " d r e a m t e a m " w i l l r e c e i v e m e d a l s 
c o m m e n o r a t i n g t h e i r s e l e c t i o n . 

I n a d d i t i o n , a c o v e t e d t r a v e l i n g t e a m - o f - t h e - y e a r t r o p h y w i l l b e 
p r e s e n t e d t o t h e i n d i v i d u a l h i g h s c h o o l c o n s i d e r e d t o h a v e h a d t h e 
b e s t o v e r a l l s e a s o n . 

P r e s e n t l y , t h e t r o p h y i s h e l d b y N o v i , t h e s c h o o l t h a t p r o d u c e d 
t h e b e s t 1971 t e a m . T h e 1969 w i n n e r w a s S o u t h L y o n . I n 1970— a 
y e a r w h e n a l l s e v e n t e a m s h a d a l o s i n g s e a s o n — t h e t e a m t r o p h y 
w a s n o t a w a r d e d . 

A l s o , t h e S l i g e r n e w s p a p e r s w i l l h o n o r a F o o t b a l l C o a c h - o f - t h e -
Y e a r b a s e d o n h i s c o n t r i b u t i o n s t o h i s s c h o o l a n d c o m m u n i t y . 
L a s t y e a r ' s w i n n e r w a s J o h n O s b o r n e , N o V i h e a d c o a c h . 

S t i l l a n o t h e r s p e c i a l s e l e c t i o n w i l l b e t h e M o s t V a l u a b l e 
P l a y e r — a n h o n o r t h a t l a s t y e a r w e n t t o N o V i ' s q u a r t e r b a c k , S t e V e 
L u k k a r i . 

T h e 1971 A l l - S t a r T e a m w a s d o m i n a t e d b y t h e N o V i W i l d c a t s , 
w h o e a r n e d s e v e n p o s i t i o n s o n t h e m y t h i c a l 2 2 - p l a y e r s q u a d . 
B e s i d e s L u k k a r i , W i l d c a t s s e l e c t e d i n c l u d e d o n o f f e n s e C e n t e r 
K e v i n S c h i n g e c k , G u a r d P a t F o r d , a n d B a c k J i m V a n W a g n e r ; 
a n d o n d e f e n s e , E n d P a t B o y e r , T a c k l e B o b P i s h a , a n d B a c k D a v e 
B r o w n . 

O t h e r o f f e n s i v e t e a m s e l e c t i o n s i n c l u d e d : 
G u a r d B o b H i n e s , B r i g h t o n ; T a c k l e B o b R e y n o l d s , P i n c k n e y ; 

T a c k l e R i c k P e r k i n s , H a r t l a n d ; E n d J e f f M O O n , N o r t h v i l l e ; E n d 
J o e S t e p h e n s , S o u t h L y o n ; B a c k T e r r y T r u m b u l l , P i n c k n e y ; a n d 
B a c k K e n S k o r u p s k i , W a l l e d L a k e W e s t e r n . 

D e f e n s i v e t e a m s e l e c t i o n s : 
E n d S c o t t T o w s l e y , P i n c k n e y ; T a c k l e M i k e G r e e n l e e , W a l l e d 

L a k e ; G u a r d J o e C l a r k , H a r t l a n d ; L i n e b a c k e r s D u a n e C o r n e l l , o f 
B r i g h t o n , A . J . G i l l e s p i e o f W h i t m o r e L a k e , a n d R u s s B u e l l o f 
H a r t l a n d ; a n d B a c k s L a r r y T a t r o o f S o u t h L y o n a n d J o h n S h e r ­
m a n o f N o r t h v i l l e . 

T h i s y e a r , a s i n t h e p a s t t h r e e y e a r s , t h e n u m b e r o f p l a y e r 
s e l e c t i o n s w i l l b e i n p r o p o r t i o n t o t h e c r o p o f e x c e p t i o n a l l y 
t a l e n t e d p l a y e r s . T h u s , t h e n u m b e r c o u l d r a n g e f r o m 11 to 22 
p l a y e r s , e x p l a i n e d H o f f m a n . 

S e l e c t i o n o f t h e t o p p l a y e r s w i l l b e m a d e b y r e p o r t e r s a n d 
p h o t o g r a p h e r s f r o m t h e S l i g e r n e w s p a p e r s , b a s e d o n t h e i r p e r ­
s o n a l o b s e r v a t i o n s a n d t h e n o m i n a t i o n s b y t h e c o a c h e s . 

Chelsea's faVored to Win tlie -
S o u t h e a s t e r n Confe rence f o o t b a l l 
championship this year. 

Surprised? F e w should be as P h i l 
Bare is ' Bul ldogs have Won the c rown in 
each of the last four years and have lost 
but two league games over that span. 

The biggest surprise is, perlIaps, that 
no one seems to expect Chelsea to run 
away With things this year. 

Why? 
"Sal ine ' s got so many le t terman back 

that Ihey ' le choice this t ime around," 
says South L y o n Coach Bob Keezer , 
" B u t 1 Won't discount Chelsea and l 
expect L inco ln Wil l be right in there. No 
one's going through this season un­
defeated." 

Keezer added that, despite Novi ' s 
l iavi i ig to i ebu i ld its line, the Wildcats 
must be coiisidered strong again and 

"We ' l l stay in there With most of them, 
ourselves." 

John Osborne of Novi cal ls Clielsea 
"The champion unt i l some one proves 
o lhc iw i se " , but concedes that his 
squad, a long w i t h M i l a n and L i i i c o l u 
"and general improvement in a l l the 
other teams" w i l l produce a much 
better S E C balance this year. 

Nov i and South L y o n are exa in incd in 
detail elsewhere in this section. 

What are the other coaches saying 
about their teams and the conference in 
general? 

Bareis , who looks for everyone to be 
tough this year, cal ls the coming season 
" a tough way to go—aiiyone can beat 
anyone else on a given night". 

Chelsea is green, but has a solid 

Cont inued on Page 6-C 
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m i B R i m O H BUU006S 

M U S T A N G F O R W A R D W A L L - - N o r t h v i U e * s o f f e n s i v e b a c k s w i l l 
b e o p e r a t i n g b e h i n d w h a t C o a c h C h u c k S h o n t a b e l i e v e s w i l l b e o n e 
o f t h e M u s t a n g s ' b e s t l i n e s i n r e c e n t y e a r s . C o m b i n i n g e x ­
p e r i e n c e d p e r f o r m e r s w i t h r e l a t i v e n e w c o m e r s , t h e i n t e r i o r l i n e 

h a s o n e c o m m o n f a c t o r — a l l i t s m e m b e r s a r e b i g . F r o m l e f t t o 
r i g h t a r e t i g h t e n d T o m J o h n s o n , t a c k l e J i m P o r t e r f i e l d , g u a r d 
S t e v e S e r k a i a n , c e n t e r R o n A n g o v e , g u a r d T i m R i c e , t a c k l e B i l l 
P o t t e r , a n d s p l i t e n d J o h n S h e r m a n . 

M u s t a n g s L o o k t o E x p e r i e n c e 

B U L L D O G S — L e f t t o r i g h t , f i r s t r o w : J . 
B a u d i n o . D . B r i g g s . J . B o g o s . J . G a u n t . C . 
W a g n e r . J . W a l l , K . C a r l s o n , D . S h o s e y . T . 
M c l n t y r e . M . F o u l k s . S e c o n d r o w : J . C a m p b e l l . 
J . B i t t e n . R . N o e k e r . S . B a z l e y , B . K l e i n . M . 
M c N u l t y . T . M c M a c k e n , B . D o n o v a n . J . W e l c h , 
S . M e n k e . T h i r d r o w : D . L e w A l l e n . D . D a n i e l s , 

M . G i b s o n , M . D u n d a s , B . L e a c h , J . J o h n s o n , G . 
L o y , G . P e t e r s o n , D . S e i g l e , K , P e a c h , J . L e w r y . 
C h e e r l e a d e r s , l e f t t o r i g h t : D e b b i e F e l d e r , D a w n 
M a s s e y . K i m P e t e r s b u r g , B e c k y N o w e l s . S u e 
C l a u s n i t z e r . J e a n B e t h e a . A b s e n t w h e n p i c t u r e 
w a s t a k e n : H . J o n e s , D . T r u h n , M . D a r n e y . 

September 15 
Septe1Tiber 22 
Septemtjer 29 
October 6 
Octol>er 13 
October 21 
October 27 
NoVeml>er 3 
NoVember 10 

S C H E D U L E 

A t South L y o n 
M i l f o r d 
Imlay C i t y 
Y a l e 

7 :30 
8 :00 
8:00 
8:00 

A t Tei1lperance Bedfo rd (DST)8 :00 
M o i u o e Jefferson 2 :00 
NorthVil le 8:00 
A t Clarenceville 8 :00 
A t M i l a n 7 :30 

T H I S M E S S A G E B R O U G H T T O Y O U W I T H T H E B E S T W I S H E S O F T H E F O L L O W I N G B U L L D O G R O O T E R S : 

A D V A N C E STAIV1P1NG - B R I G H T O N D I V I S I O N 
815 Second St., Brightofi 227-1281 

B R I G H T O N T R A V E L S E R V I C E 
142 W. Maif i , Brighton 229-2935 

C L O R E ' S F L O R I S T 
9956 E . Grand River, Brighton 227-7331 

C O O P E R ' S J E W E L R Y 
105 W. M a i n , Brighton 227-2221 

J A R V I S S T O R E 
205 W. M a i n , Brighton 229-4260 

K E E H N F U N E R A L H O M E 
706 W. M a i n , Brighton 229-9871 

L E L A N D S R E X A L L D R U G 
201 W. Main , Brighton 229-9772 

D & C S T O R E 
314 W. Main , Brighton 229-9944 

M A R Y J O S H O P P E 
203 W . M a i n , Brighton 227-3871 

H O B B Y V I L L E 
334 W. M a i n , Brighton 227-7728 

R E F R I G E R A T I O N R E S E A R C H 
525 N . F i f t h , Brighton 227-1151 

S H O W C A S E D R E S S S H O P 
322 W. Main , Brighton 229-6718 

V R / W E S S O N 
1279 Ricket t R d . , Brighton 227-1871 

B R I G H T O N A R E A C H A M B E R O F C O M M E R C E 
142 W . M a i n , Br ighton 229-6527 

L A K E S D R I V E IN T H E A T R E 
Br igh ton , M i c h . 

M A R V ' S B A K E R Y 
10730 E . Grand River . Brighton 229-4510 

B R I G H T O N A U T O P A R T S 
110 E . Grand River, Br ighton 229-2981 

C O L T P A R K I N S U R A N C E A G E N C Y 
Main Street, Brighton 

H I - W A Y T I R E C O M P A N Y 
7991 W. Grand River, Brighton 229-7005 

B O B & C O R I N N E ' S L I T T L E S K I P P E R 
10720 E . Grand River, Brighton 229-2884 
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E x p e r i e n c e . 
I t ' s a k e y w o r d i n t h e 

v o c a b u l a r y o f C h u c k S h o i I t a 
t h i s f a l l . 

E n t e r i n g h i s s e c o n d y e a r a s 
h e a d o f N o r t h v i l l e H i g h 
S c h o o l ' s f o o t b a l l p r o g r a m , h e i s 
c o u n t i n g o n i t h e a v i l y t o m a k e 
t h e 1972 s e a s o n a s u c c e s s f u l 
o n e . 

S h o n t a ' s f i r s t y e a r a s 
M u s t a n g c o a c h w a s s o m e t h i n g 

less t han spec ­
tacular. P a p e r t h i n to 
b e g i n w i t h , the 
Nor thv i l l e gr idders 
Were beset With a 
disproportionate 
s h a r e of c r i p p l i n g 
injuries a n d hobbled 
to an atrocious 0-7-1 
record. 

It was not the type of 
s e a s o n N o r t h V i l l e 
fans, or Shonta, a re 
used to. 

" A f t e r the t h i r d 
game I sat down wi th 
m y coaching staff 
and we decided that 
we w e r e n ' t g o i n g 
anywhere ," Shonta 
r e c a l l e d , " s o w e 
decided the best way 
to salvage the season 
was to start bui lding 
for the future. We 
decided to go wi th 
our underclassmen. 
We took our lumps, 
ljut we expected to. 
This year We hope We 
c a n s t a r t r e a p i n g 
some benefits f rom 
the experience our 
k i d s g a i n e d u n d e r 
fire las t yea r . " 

B y the t ime the 
Mustangs took the 
field against M i l f o r d 
i n the season's finale, 
S h o n t a ' s " y o u t h 
movement" Was at a 
peak . T h e e n t i r e 
s tar t ing defensive 
unit and 16 of the 22 
starters on offense 
a n d defense Were 
underclassmen. 

The 1972 edit ion of 
the Nor thv i l l e team 
W i l l s t i l l be a 
predominantly 
young team, but this 
year they ' l l have had 
Ihe added benefit of 
game experience. 

The Mustangs w i l l be a team of key 
players this year. Shonta is counting 
heavily on cer ta in key individuals and 
their ab i l i ty to per form exceptionally 
w i l l determine just how w e l l Nor thv i l l e 
w i l l do. 

One of those key players is quar­
terback B i l l M c D o n a l d . The 6 '2" jun ior 
s igna l ca l l e r was one of the p layers at 
the fore of the youth movement . Before 
the l97 l season even started, Shonta 
handed the slender sophomore the ba l l 
and sa id you ' re m y quar terback. 

A s might be expected of an inex­
perienced sophomore p lay ing behind a 
p a t c h - w o r k l i n e , M c D o n a l d ' s 1971 

standout l inebacker last year , was 
switched to the position and three other 
athletes who have neVer p layed football 
before - R o d Crane , B i l l Pet t i t , J i m 
O ' B r i e n - suddenly appeared on the 
pract ice f ie ld and before Shonta knew 
it, he had himself more capable running 
backs than he had d reamed of having. 

Nor ton w i l l s tar t at the fullback slot, 
whi le Crane , one of the fastest men on 
the team, O ' B r i e n , and B a r t T a y l o r w i l l 
al ternate at the other running back 
position. 

• 'We won ' t break many long runs ," 
says Shonta i n assessing his backfield, 
but we should be able to move the ba l l 

' . . . t i 7 e h o p e w e c a n s t a r t r e a p i n g s o m e 

b e n e f i t s fi'om t h e e x p e r i e n c e o u r 

k i d s g a i n e d u n d e r fire l a s t y e a r . ' 

performance was er ra t ic . H e had his 
bad nights, but he a lso h a d his good 
nights. A n d against league champion 
F a r m i n g t o n H a r r i s o n , M c D o n a l d 
connected on 17 of 23 passes. 

' 'There ' s no question i n m y mind 
about M c d o n a l d ' s a b i l i t y , " s a y s 
Shonta. " H e throws we l l , he thinks wel l , 
he executes w e l l and I thought he 
s h o w e d e x c e p t i o n a l po i se for a 
sophomore quarterback last yea r . " 

' ' I f we ' re going to w i n i n 1972, B i l l ' s 
going tobe theone to do it for us . " 

Wi th M c o n a l d at the quarterback 
slot, the Mustangs w i l l do a good share 
of passing this year. ' ' W e won't be 
af ra id to pass from anywhere on the 
field at any t ime , " says Shonta. 

Running back figured to be a weak 
spot on the Nor thv i l le t eam this year, 
but Shonta says that it has suddenly 
become one of the team's strengths. 
When Dale Gr i f f i th graduated last 
spr ing, the Mustangs were left without 
a running back in sight. 

B i l l Norton, l 1972 co-captain and a 
consistently on the ground. We 've got 
good, tough, short-yardage backs . " 

O n the rece iv ing end of M c D o n a l d ' s 
passes w i l l be flankers Steve Gr iggs , 
Who shares co-captain honors wi th 
Norton, and T a y l o r at the flankers and 
John She rman and P h i l P a l a r c h i o at 
split end. 

The "s leeper" in the group could w e l l 
be Sherman. Pe r fo rming a t 5 ' 5 " a n d 140 
pounds as a sophomore safe tyman last 
year, She rman p icked off nine passes -
a scliool record. 

' ' John's extremely quie t ," Shonta 
reports. ' ' I ' ve heard h i m speak maybe 

four or five t imes so far this year . B u t 
he's a terr i f ic athlete. He ' s a r ea l 
" m o n e y " k i n d of ba l lp layer . 

The backs w i l l be operating behind 
one of the ljetter offensive l ines Nor­
thville has had in recent years . F r o m 
tackle to tackle, the Mus tang l inemen 
average i n excess of 190 pounds, and at 
least three of the inter ior l inemen have 
all-conference potential. 

Anchor ing the Mus tang l ine w i l l be 
190 pound center R o n Angove. Together 

r 

C O A C H C H U C K S H O N T A 

wi th guard Steve Se rka i an and tackle 
J i m Por ter f ie ld , Angove should make 
the right side of the Nor thv i l l e l ine 
prosperous running terr i tory for North­
v i l le backs . 

Serka ian and Por ter f ie ld a re both 
juniors and both weigh in the neigh­
borhood of 200 pounds. Se rka ian was a 
starter last year and also saw vars i ty 
action as a freshman. Perhaps the 
finest of the Mus tang l inemen is P o r ­
terfield. A ha rd worker , Por te r f i e ld has 
amaz ing quickness for a n athlete his 
size. 

O n the left side of the offensive l ine 
w i l l be T i m R i c e (5'IO", 180) at gua rd 
and B i l l Po t te r (5'10", 210) a t tackle. 
R i c e served oa the jun ior vars i ty last 
year as a sophomore. Po t te r has been a 
pleasant surpr ise for Shonta. A big 
sophomore out for football for the f i rs t 
t ime, he has learned qu i ck ly and has 
fine potential. 

T o m Johnson (6', 170) w U l be the tight 
end a n d has shown w e l l i n pract ices so 
far. 

Defensively, the Mustangs w i l l be 
counting on much the same people. 

" T h e keys to otu- defense w i l l be 
P o r t e r f i e l d a n d N o r t o n , " Shon ta 
reports. " I f they c a n do as w e l l as we 
think they c a n w e should be a l l set." 

N o r t o n W i l l m o v e f r o m his 
l ine l iacking spot last y e a r up to nose 
guard and Shonta comments fondly on 
his quickness. E v e n more impress ive is 
Por ter f ie ld . " W e Watched a l l the game 
f i lms over the Winter ," reports the 
Nor thv i l le coach, " a n d there Was only 
one person a l l year long Who Was able to 
handle Por ter f ie ld . Th i s year he's 
bigger a n d a lot stronger. H e could have 
an outstanding yea r for us . " 

Angove Wil l handle the other tackle 
spot, wh i l e Johson and T o m S m i t h w i l l 
be at the defensive ends. 

Se rka ian and R i c e Will f i l l the 
l inebacker positio11s. 

A l l ' L e a g u e selection J o h n Sherman 
w i l l hold the defensive backf ie ld in 
place f rom his safety position, whi le 
Steve G r i g g s and eighter B a r t T a y l o r or 
T o m Marzon ie Wil l be at the corner 
backs. R o d Crane is set at rover back. 

" O u r first s t r ing should be strong, ' ' 
says Shonta, "but I ' m af ra id We're 
going to have the same problem We d id 
last year and that 's depth. After our 
first team, our talent falls off rapid ly . 
We're just going to have to hope We c a n 
stay healthy. ' ' 

H i s goals for the 1972 season are 
modes t , but W i t h the M u s t a n g s ' 
schedule f i l led With s ignif icant ly larger 
schools, they Won't ba easi ly ac-
complsihed. 

" W e ' d l ike to have a !500 season," 
says the Mus t ang mentor. " A n d I 'd 
real ly l ike to see us in th i rd place in the 
Western S i x Conference." 
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P H I L D A V I D S O N 

The 1972 edition of tlie P inckney 
P i ra tes is approaching the coming 
season With a feeling someWhat neW for 
a P i n c k n e y squad—quiet, self-assured 
opt imism. 

A t first glance, this year Would seem 
to be something of a re-building year 
for 01e P i ra tes . A l l l l ough tlley have one 
side of the of fensiVe l ine back, tliey lost 
a l l but one backf ie ld member to 
graduation, and also lost the services of 
seVeral l inemen. 

But last season's fine jayvee squad. 
Which drop|>ed but one game, i s ex­
pected to provide quite a boost to the 
returning talent. A n d consequently. 
C o a c h W i l s o n , h is a s s i s t a n t J o h n 
Sturock and the boys are ai lxiously 
aWaiting the opening kickoff. 

Wi l son says P e r r y "has to be" the 
team to beat in the tough Ingham 
County loop this season, but he's quick 
to add tliat FoWlerVi l l e Wi l l p ro lMbly be 
strong, too. 

The P i r a t e s Wi l l approach the yea r 
With the same basic s tyle they 've 
employed the last three seasons, but 
Wilson i s hoping the R e d and B l a c k ' s 
defense Wi l l be more of an asset this 
season than it has been i n the past. 

Anchor ing the 5-4 defense Wi l l be 
senior noseman D a n I i e n r y ( 5 ' 9 " 140 
lb.) , tackles F l o y d M a c K e n z i e (6', 185-
Ib. junior) and M i k e Surgenor (5*9", 
l80-lb. senior), and ends K e v i n Douglas 
( 6 ' l " , l90-lb. junior) and Dave M a r s h a l l 
(6*, 165-lb. senior). 

Senior K e n Regi t s (5'10", 170-lb.) and 
junior L.ance K u h n (6', l80-lb.) Wi l l 
handle the l inebacking chores. Regi ts is 
an experienced defender Who came 
t h r o u ^ Well late last season for the 
Pi ra tes , While K u h n is a promis ing 
prospect up from the jayVee squad. 

The monster m a n of the P inckney 
defense ( termed the ' P i r a t e ' by Coach 
Wilson) Wi l l l>e senior B o b ToWles 
( 5 ' l l " , l50-lb.) . Who is also an out­
standing Wrestler. 

H e ' l l be backed up by defensive backs 
Jeff H a l e (6 '1", 165-lb. senior) and 
George Reynolds (5 ' lO" , l45-lb. junior) 
and safety Jesse Stevenson (5'9", 150-
Ib. senior) . Of the defensive backs , only 
Stevenson has any p r io r va r s i ty ex­
perience. 

The P i r a t e offense i s expected to 
move through both the a i r and ground 
routes this season. With the re turn of 
quarterback Steve Bishop ( 6 ' l " , l60-]b. 
junior) after a year ' s experience. 

The rest of the P inckney backf ie ld 
Will t>e new this year. Gone are M . V . P . 
B i l l Bishop and A l l - A r e a speedster 
Te r ry T r u m b u l l , a n d also departed i s 
breakaWay threat Dennis Douglas. 

Replac ing them Will be the backs Who 
Were the nucleus of the' P J r a t e^ayVee ' 
attack last year . Senior E r n i e C h a n y i 

H i g h school football is largely a 
mixture of unknowns balanced against 
op t imism and spir i t . 

FeW knoW this better than P h i l 
Davidson, head coach at Whi tmore 
L a k e . O p t i m i s m and spir i t have both 
been h igh i n fa l l d r i l l s as they look 
toWard tomorroW's opener at M o r r i c e , 
but many unknoWns are present. 

F o r example , the Trojans face a 
schedule of several teams they have 
never p layed before in this, their f inal 
season as an independent. Never have 
Davidson and his assistants. Bob E l l i s 
and B i l l Schuster (both back from l97l ) 
seen Cathol ic League l l ' s Dearborn St. 
Alphonsus or H a m t r a m c k St. F l o r i a n or 

tradit ionally rugged M i c h i g a n School 
for the Deaf on the gr id i ron lyefore. 

To add to possible problems, Whit­
more is going With a brand-neW offense, 
the suddenly popular Wishbone-T. Only 
the quarterback, senior R o d Douglas, 
returns to the regular backf ie ld Which 
must implement the attack. 

To replace the graduates, Doug 
Bennett and J i m Haynes, Davidson has 
sWitched Trojan War horse A . J . 
Gil lespie (6'3", 215) to a running back. 
Gi l lespie , seeking his fourth vars i ty 
letter in the sport. Wil l aiso anclior a 
solid l inebacking corps. 

Running With Gi l lesp ie Wil l be let-

l b I 

<5'10", 170) Wil l get the nod at ful lback, 
senior D o n CourdWay (5'11", 165) Wil l 

T O M W I L S O N 

go at one halfback; and junior George 
Reynolds Wil l man the other halfback 
slot. 

Anchor ing the P i ra tes ' front Wall Will 
l1e le t terman Steve Duchane ( 6 ' l " , 204-
Ib. junior) at center. H e ' l l be flanked by 
returnee J i m Henry ( 5 ' l l " , l45-lb. 
senior) and neWcomer K e v i n Douglas 
at the guards. 

The tackles Wil l be F l o y d M a c K e n z i e , 
neW on the line, and senior J i m Pos le r 
(6', 160), Who is back f rom last year . A t 
the ends Will be le t terman J i m Y o u n g 
(6', 160-lb. senior) and senior Je f f Hale , 
new to the vars i ty offense. 

The P i ra tes , who boast 30 players on 
the vars i ty and 110 in grades nine 
through 12 (on the frosh, jayvee and 
varsi ty squads) w i l l open their season 
on the road September 15, against 
tradit ional rival Dexter . 

terman M a r k Dockett , sophomore Don 
Reed or junior Dave Haynes. Bob 
Carter t>acks Douglas at quarter and 
Fu l lback D a v e P o w e l l moves back 
from the line to that spot. B a r r y 
Freder ickson w i l l press P o w e l l . 

M i s s i n g on the l ine are G a l e Nielsen 
(T) and T o m D e a k i n ( E ) , but co-
captain (With Gil lespie) L e e C a r r is 
back at center and guards G a r y B a k e r 
and H a r o l d B r a u n (supported by D a l e 
Bennett and G a r y Turnblom) return as 
wel l . 

Ends J i m R o m i n c and T o m M u r p h y , 
along wi th J i m Gordenier , w i l l receive 
Douglas ' aerials whi le C lyde Meade, 
M i k e Wilson, Dave Cameron , Dave 
Vickers and Wes CoWden vie at the 
tackles. B i l l Hoeft supports C a r r at 
center. 

Romine, Meade and Hoeft Work at 
defensive ends wi th Powe l l and the 
offensive tackles battl ing to round out 
the line i n Davidson 's 4-4-3 defense. 

With Gi l lesp ie at the linebackers are 
C a r r , B a k e r and B r a u n w i t h 
F r e d e r i c k s o n , R e e d , Benne t t a n d 
Douglas listed behind them. 

The e n t i r e de fens ive s e c o n d a r y 
graduated, but Car t e r .Murphy , Gor­
denier, Dockett and Haynes w i l l be 
counted on to f i l l that gap. 

So, Trojans w i l l field their typical ly 
sma l l squad (22 athletes) against a 
lough, basical ly unknown, schedule. 

DaVidson looks for improvement over 
last fal l ' s winless season. W i t h Gi l lesp ie 
lugging the pigskin and the team sol id 
in the middle of the offense and in 
linebacking, things may tie looking up 
for the Trojans. 

E a g l e s F a c e R e b u i l d i n g T a s k 

F r a n k l y , it could l>e a long season for 
the H a r U a n d Eag le s and their new head 
coach, Ted M a c . B u t on the other hand, 
the B l u e and Go ld m a y j e l l Well enough 
to improve upon last year ' s 4-4-l 
record. 

One of the K e y factors in determining 
the E a g l e s ' success—or lack of i t—Wil l 
be the amount of injuries the squad 
sustains. 

If Hart land ' can rema in re la t ively 
healthy, chances are the Eag les could 
enjoy a fa i r ly successful season i n the 
F l i n t Suburban C League. Bu t injuries 
Will take an especial ly heavy toll on the 
club this year , since only 21 candidates 
have turned out for the A^arsity sport. 

" O u r first 11 is not a bad ba l l c lub at 
a l l , " says first-year mentor Ted M a c , 
former coach at St. M a r t i n DePer re s in 
Detroit . " B u t after them. We have a lot 
of inexperience." 

Ha r t l and lost a number of key 
players , inc luding A l l - A r e a selections 
Russ B u e l l , R i c k Pe rk ins and Joe 
Cla rk , v i a graduation. A n d another s ix 
l e t t e r m a n d e c i d e d to fo rego the 
gr id i ron sport this year. 

But there is talent in the squad Which 
has assembled this season. A n d there is 
also some experience. 

Senior M a r k L a r s o n (6-J, 180), Who 
shared the s ignal-cal l ing duties last 
year With R o d P i e ron , Wi l l be l>ack to 
handle the quarterback 's job this year. 

La r son brings a year ' s experience 
and plenty of abi l i ty With h i m , and 
should prove to be a so l id play cal ler . 

Another holdover f rom last year ' s , 
squad Wi l l be i n the ' t iMkfibId ' 'With '^ 
L a r s o n , as s e n i o r f u l l b a c k M i k e 

Nunham (6,190) starts his third y e a r at 
that position. 

' ' N u n h a m is an excellent back ," 
Coach M a c says. " H e ' s got quickness, 
and he runs With authori ty ." 

F l a n k i n g N u n h a m Wil l be senior 
slotback B r a d M e l v i n (5-8,150), Who 
saW some action late last season, and 
sophomore setback T o m Germund , a 
neW face in the E a g l e backfield. 

Quarterback L a r s o n Will be a i m i n g at 
least some aer ia ls in the direct ion of his 
former center tliis year, as M a c has 
converted senior B i l l H a m w a y (6-3,190) 
to a tight end. 

H a m w a y , w h o p l a y s cen t e r i n 
basketball and center field in baseball . 

T E D M A C 

has deceptive speed and good hands, 
and could prove to be one of the 
league's strongest tight ends. 

He may also f ind himself at tackle, 
though, ccording to M a c . "There may 
be t imes when w e ' l l need that size at the 
tackle spot,"the coach says. " A n d then 
We'll have to shift h i m . " 

Sophomore M a r k R a y m o n d Will be 
another target for L.arson aer ia ls . H e ' l l 
get the s tar t ing nod at split end. 

The line is Where M a c faces his 
bigges t r e b u i l d i n g p i roblems, a n d 
consequently, it w i l l have a new look 
this year. 

Tentat ively slated to start on the 
forward w a l l for the Eag le s in their 
September 15 home opener With NeW 
Lothrop are : John Eggenberger at 
center; Randy Banf ie ld and John Scott 
at the guards; and K e n Stanowski and 
Duane Estep at the tackles. 

The E a g l e s Wi l l be confronting league 
opponents wi th a somewhat different 
offense this year, as they ' l l move f rom 
the pro-style Slot T or I formations. 

" W e may use the full house backfie ld 
s o m e t i m e s , t oo , " M a c says . ' ' I ' d 
especially l ike to use i t When We're in 
close, for short yardage. ' ' 

The mentor readi ly admits he ' l l be 
heading into most of the games at 
something of a loss because he is -
unfami l ia r With the Suburan C loop. B u t 
he doesn't think improv ing upon last 
year 's record is out of the question. 

' 'We ' re going to Work on i t , " M a c 
states. ' 'We 've got an extremely young 
team i n many Ways, and a lack of 
deptll, but We're fa i r ly quick, and the 
boys haVe^ be^to- <\V6rking':4?xtMm*V 
ha t t l . " 

file:////ifA
file:///11ox
file:///i/s/


£ 2 
to ^ 

> CO 

7r fn 

r 
c 

03 
m 
: » 
O 
O 

> 
z 

w m 
O OJ 

5 z 

2 > 

- fn 

n o 
5 - 2 

3 . ' " 
2 > 

7^ 

QtD-O 

2-- > 

o 

(S 

CO 

i 

l O 
I d 
£. N 
..— fn 

2 2 

.=•2 

g 5 9 c 

OS 
° i 

CO 
c > 
Z 
o 
m 
o 
O 

i 

CD H 
I S 

u X 

H 
<P CO 

a 
r 
D) X" 
a 

2 i 

< > 

5 

S 3 ) 

I I 

n 
3 CD 
Ti C 
g ^ 

1 ^ 

ro 
<p 
ro 
(O 
O) 
00 

3 a 
o < 

P 
" ID 
3 C 
™ 3 

O 
00 fn 
» n 
§ 1 
m 2 
o 

S i 

Tj m 

3 
< 
00 

« 
CO 
00 

N- lO K> — W K) 

> > > Q > a o n z 

^MOeOeOOOe OeOBOe 

^ s s s s i s i s 

«Tja*ft O B 

o J - > i ^ -> i - J -4 X4 
ee «« *a •* •* •• 
e e e e e o e e . e 

f 

t<J M M (O K) M 
M e (*> 0> >0 N> Wt 

TJ 
0) 
•s 
00 
6 

•n 
O 

5 

-0 
3D 
m 
< 
m 

CO 

53 
IS) 

< m 
00 VJ 00 

i 

£ . 2 

3 CO 

S > 
I S 
00 
00 
k 
Cd 
o 

p 

| m 
C CO 

- 3 > 

.°-<o 

i s 

l < 
ro f71 
CO CO CJl 
a> 

•0 
, „ "1 

1 ° 2 a 
« o 

I C O 

CO 3 

00 m 
a 
o 
o 
m 
a 
-< 

2 o 
5) ^ w m 

_ 2 ^ 

^ -= 2 

1 1 
? a tB m 
f- > 

CO 

i i 
WCD 
I C 
m a 

B> 2 

ta 
ro 
ro 
CO 
6) 
CO CO 

e S e o e e o o 
•O "O "O "O •«-O "O 
3 3 3 S 3 3 S 3 

S3 
cD-n 

a 
fTl 

3 2 

I s 

01-n 00, 
c 
2 

2 
Q 

^ 
Ol H 

o 
3 
ro 
N3 
CO 
o> 
O) 
Ol 

- . 1 - 1 f 

P i . 2 . 

.̂.vw,̂ -;-.-::-̂ -̂. .v.. 

CD 

e 

• ^ 4 

3 » 

•5 • ^ S ' 

^ 1 1 

1 

B9 

B — ft ^ 

l i f t 

» 2 - 0 

S fB ?r 

3 • a 

a a § r ' 

1 | 3 

* « , 

» N O V I 

S E R V I N G T H E C I T Y O F N O V I A N D T H E C I T Y O F W I X O M 

V o l . 17 , N o . 1 9 , T h r e e S e c t i o n s , 4 2 Pages e T h u r s d a y , S e p t e m b e r 2 1 , 1 9 7 2 - - N o v i , IVIIchigan . 15c Per C o p y , $ 6 Per Y e a r In A d v a n c e 

S e e k s F u n d s 

F o r S e w a g e P l a n t 

I IS L U C K Y D A Y — E v e r d r e a m o f w a l k i n g d o w n t h e s t r e e t a n d s u d d e n l y 
H n d i n g $500 l y i n g a t y o u r fee t . T h a t ' s w h a t h a p p e n e d t o a 1 3 - y e a r o l d N o v i 
y o u t h t h e o t h e r d a y . T i m K o c a j , a n e i g h t h g r a d e r a t P o w e r J u n i o r H i g h 
S c h o o l i n F a r m i n g t o n , w a s w a l k m g d o w n N i n e M i l e R o a d w h e n h e f o u n d a 
l a r g e s u m o f m o n e y i n s i d e a l e a t h e r p o u c h t h a t h a d b e e n l y i n g i n t h e m i d d l e 
o f t h e r o a d . A l l t o l d , t h e p u r s e c m i t a i n e d $216.48 i n c a s h a n d a c h e c k f o r $337, 

[ t o t a l o f $553.48. T i m . i u m e d . t h e m o n e y o v e r to N o v i p o l i c e , w h o a r e l o o k i n g 
f o r i t s o w n e r . C h i e f L e e B e G t r f e c o n g r a t u l a t e d tiie y o u t h f o r h i s h o n e s t y . 
T i m i s t h e s o n o f M r . a n d M r s . B e r n a r d K o c a j o f 38640 N i n e M i l e R o a d . 

O f W i x o m C h a r t e r 

V e t o 4 R e v i s i o n s 

Three proposed amend­
ments to the Wixom city 
charter sent to the offices of 
Governor Wi l l i am G. MiJIiken 
and State Attorney General 
Frank Kel ly Were sent back 
unapproved. While four others 
Were approved for placement 
on the November ballot. 

Discussion of the amend­
ments by the council took 
place in a special Wixom Ci ty 
C o u n c i l meet ing Monday 
night. 

Council Voted four to two to 
send only the amendments 
approved, back to the 
Governor for final approval. 
CouncilWoman Mary Pa rvu 
and C o u n c i l m a n V a l 
Vangieson cast the dissenting 
votes. 

Dr. Vangieson then moved 
that the remaining three be 
discussed further and sent to 
Lansing for approval at a 
later date. The motion Was 
unanimously carried. 

S t a b b i n g B r i n g s 

M u r d e r C h a r g e 

An l8-year old Union L a k e 
man Was taken into custody 
by Novi police Friday and 
charged With at tempted 
murder as a result of a 
stabbing Which occurred that 
evening at a Novi Party. 

Arrested Was John Sch-
Weier of Union Lake. 

A c c o r d i n g to Detec t ive 
Lieutenant Richard Faulkner 
of the Novi Police Depart­
ment, Schweier Was arrested 
at the scene of the crime and 
charged With assault With 
intent to commit murder. 

He Was arraigned before 
52nd District Court Judge 
Mart in Boyle, Who set a $5,000 
cash or surety bond and set 
he examina t ion date for 

September 25. 
Vic t im of the assault Was 25-

year old Lee Thram of Union 
I^ke. Thram, suffering from 
knife Wounds. Was t ran­
sported by ambulance to 
Pon t iac G e n e r a l Hop i t a l 
where he received four units 
of blood before an operation 
could be performed, 
Faulkner reported. 

.As of Wednesday morning 
Thram Was sti l l in the in­
tensive care unit, but listed in 
fair condition. 

If he hadn't lived, Faulkner 
said , SchWeier Would be 
facing first degree murder 
charges. 

According to police reports. 

the stabbing took place at a 
party at the Gerald Weaver 
resilience at 42479 13 M i l e 
Road. A t approximately 10:45 
p.m. an arguinent broke cut 
betWeen SchWeier and a 
second party. When Thram 
attempted to break up the 
altercation, SchWeier began 
fighting With him. 

Witnesses told police that in 
the midst of the fight Sch­
weier pulled a knife and 
liegan stabbing Thram. 

The Weapon, pol ice 
reported. Was a pocket knife 
less than six inches long and 
With a tWo and one-quarter 
inch blade. 

" T h a t ' s probably What 
saVed Thram's l ife," stated 
Faulkner. " I f SchWeier had 
had a longer knife, Thram 
Wtxlld probably be dead." 

Due to the seriousness of the 
offense and the fact that it 
Was uncertain Friday night as 
to Whether or not Thram 
Would live, the Michigan State 
Police crime lab Was called to 
the scene to make a thorough 
i n v e s t i g a t i o n , F a u l k n e r 
reported. 

Their investigation began at 
l l p.m. and wasn't completed 
until 8:30 a.m. Saturday. 

Continued on Page 18-A 

Assistant Attorney General 
Mrs . Maxine Boord Virtue, 
the only state at torney 
assi^ned^ to c i t y char ter 
revisions by the Attorney 

General's office, notified the 
city council of the approved 
and rejected ammeniiments 
in a letter dated September! 1 
1972. 

A letter from GoVemor 
Mil l iken concurring With her 
opinions accompanied M r s . 
Virtue's letter. 

City Attorney Gene Schnelz 
explained the urgency for 
council action on the matter. 
He said that because the 
coming election is a state and 
nat ional one, the ba l lo t 
proposals had to be ready and 
approved for the ballot by 
September 19 so they could be 
placed on absentee ballots 
Which Will be ready Sep­
tember 26. 

Schnelz told council it could 
discuss further the unap­
proved amendments and 
supplement the absentee 
ballots, or decide to keep the 
three amendments back for 
another election. 

"These cou ld a l l be 
argued," Schnelz said,"but 
Mrs . Virtue is the only person 
Who can approve or deny 
them and she Will be aWay on 
vacation until September 26 
Which is past the due date." 

He Went on to say that Mrs . 
Virtue Was "bending over 
backWards to be extremely 
careful." 

One of the amendments not 
approved Was one regarding 
residency requirements for 
appointed c i ty depar tment 
heads. It Was disallowed by 
the attorney general's office 
as "a condition of dubiety." 

According to Schnelz, Mrs . 
Virtue "missed the point. She 
is wrong. It is not dubious 
because this does not concern 
employees, it is for depart­
ment heads." 

The matter of J i l l i n g a 
Vacancy on the city coincil 
also went unapproved. In her 
letter, M r s . V i r t u e sa id , 
"Approval of this amendment 
cannot be recommended for 

Continued on Page 6-A 

Plans to construct a sewage 
treatment plant somewhere in 
the southern section of the 
city were made a little more 
definite Monday as the Novi 
city council sought means of 
financing the project. 

Specifically, the city council 
passed a resolut ion 
authoriz ing Ci ty M a n a g e r 
George Athas to apply for 
state and federal funds to 
construct the plant. 

The resolut ion was ap­
proved by a 6-1 margin With 
Councilman Raymond Evans 
casting the dissenting ballot. 

Basis of Evans ' objection 
was citteen reaction to the 
project. 

"Before We do anything on 
this seWage treatment plant 
we should make the public 
well aware of What We are up 
to," said Evans. " I don't feel 
that there 's been proper 
publication of our intent to 
build a treatment plant. If 
people all of a sudden find out 
that We're planning to put a 
seWer plant near their 
property We're going to get a 
lot of abuse." 

"Unt i l such time as a public 
hearing is called on this 
matter," he concluded, " I 'm 
going to have to vote in the 
negative." 

The city estimates that cost 
of construction of the plant 
would be in the neighborhood 
of $6 mil l ion, Athas reported. 
If approved, the grant Would 
provide a sizable portion (7.'̂  
percent) of the funds. 

Under the present plan for 
financing the treatment plant, 
$2,726,000 Would come from 
the federa l goVernment, 
$1,363,000 f rom the state 
goVernment, With the 
r ema in ing $1,509,000 being 
picked up by the city. 

The grant request for Which 
NoVi has applied Would be for 
the 1973-74 fiscal year. 

" A l l We're really doing by 
applying noW," Athas.told the 
council, "is getting in line for 
the time When it is decided 
Which requests should be 
honored. When the Water 
R e s o u r c e s C o m m i s s i o n 
receiVes our application they 
Will assign us a number. 
Then, next Ju ly When they 
start considering the Various 
applications. We Will ah-eady 
be in line and Waiting." 

The need to construct a 
seWage treatment plant is 
brought on by tWo factors. 

First , the increasing number 
of requests by deVelopers for 
sewer taps in the southern 
section of the city so they can 
begin developments. A n d , 
secondly, the fact that Novi 
has exhausted its capacity in 
the Detroit Water Treatment 
System. 

B y construct ion the 
treatment plant, the city Will 
be able to supply sewage 

capacity to developers so they tending a line through Livonia 
can proceed With their projects along Haggerty Road that 
rather than take them outside would be able to service the 
NoVi. 

When construction of the 
t reatment plant in the 
southern section of the city 
was first proposed, no ad­
ditional capacity from Detroit 
was seen in the near future. 
There is presently some talk 
in Detroit, however, of ex-

southeastern portion of Novi , 
the E igh t M i l e - H a g g e r t y 
Road area. 

Regardless of Whether or 
not that line is constructed, 
city officials wil l probably 
proceed with plans to con­
struct a sewage treatment 
plant. The question that would 

be solved by the Livonia-
Haggerty Road line would be 
where the Novi treatment 
plant should be constructed. 

Although talks of con­
structing a plant are in purely 
preliminary stages two ap­
proximate locations have 
been discussed. One of those 
locations is in the Nine Mile-
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F o r N e w N o v i Q t y M a n a g e r 

C o u n c i l B e g i n s S e a r c h 

The res ignat ion of Ci ty 
Manager George Athas was 
officially accepted by the 
Novi city council Monday and 
the search for a replacement 
was set in motion. 

According to the city char­
ter, the council has a week in 
which to act on the city 
manager's resignation. Citing 
a lucrative offer from private 
industry, Athas submitted his 
written resignation to the 
council a week ago Monday. 

Placed on Monday's agenda 
for action, the resignation was 
unanimous ly , but " R e l u c ­
tantly", accepted. 

A t the same time the 
council was accepting Athas' 
resignation, plans for hiring a 
replacement were discussed. 

During the times where 
there is no city manager, the 
city charter calls for his 
responsibilities to be borne by 
the Mayor. 

"We've tried this in the 

past," Mayor Joseph Crupi 
told the council Monday, "but 
due to the increased size and 
complexity of the municipal 
government, I don't feel the 
job can be handled in a part-
time fashion any more." 

Crupi then proposed that 
DPW Head E d Kr iewal l be 
named acting city manager 
unt i l such t ime as a 
replacement is found. 

The counc i l , however , 
requested to meet w i t h 

F o r N o v i T r a f f i c D i v i s i o n 

S t a t e A w a r d s G r a n t 

Novi has been awarded a 
state grant that Will enable 
the city to set up a traffic 
services bureau and add three 
men to the police department. 

News that the grant had 
been received Was given the 
city council Monday by City 
Manager George Athas. 

" I ' m shocked that our 
request for funds Was granted 
as fast as it Was," said the 

city manager. "I 've never 
heard of a grant being ap­
proved in less than six months 
and this Was approved in a 
mat ter of tWo to three 
weeks." 

Athas Went on to say that 
the rapid action of the Office 
of H i g h w a y Safety and 
Planning in making the funds 
available was an indication 

that they must have felt the 
need for a traffic services 
bureau in Novi was great. 

The city council has not yet 
taken action on accepting the 
grant. Terms of the grant 
were given them Monday and 
they wi l l have a week to study 
them before deciding whether 
to accept or reject the grant. 

Funds are made available 
through the federal Crime 
B i l l , but are dispensed by a 
state agency - the Office of 
Highway Safety and Plan­
ning. 

If the council agrees to the 
terms of the grant NoVi wi l l 
receiVe $35,000 to set up a 
traffic services bureau. The 
grant stipulates that existing 
officers must be used to staff 

the bureau and that the city 
Will put match funds on a SO-
SO basis. 

Presently the city has only 
one man permanent ly 
assigned to the t raff ic 
division. The three additional 
members would have to be 
taken from the road patrol, 
but the resulting vacancies on 
the road patrol could be filled 
with new men. 

Novi wil l receive $35,000 
for one year. In the second 
year they wi l l receiVe 70 
percent of that figure and in 
the th i rd y e a r they Wi l l 
receive 40-percent. After the 
third year the city must 
assume ful l f i nanc i a l 
responsiblity for maintaining 
the traffic services bureau. 

Kriewal l before making any 
appointments and a meeting 
was set up for Fr iday, Sep­
tember 22. 

The council also directed 
Athas to draw up an ad­
vertisement for a new city 
manager and to place it in the 
Michigan Municipal Review. 

Crupi told the council he 
had already received a ca l l 
from a planning consultant in 
Grand Blanc inquiring about 
the job. 

A suggestion by Coun-
oilman Donald Young that the 
city Wait a couple Weeks 
before advertising for a new 
man Was squelched by 
Councilman Edwin Presnell 
and Athas. 

"It would be unfair to ad-
vertise for a new man i f We 
have no intentions of hiring 
anyone else," said Young, 
referring to the possibility 
that K r i e W a l l ' s t emporary 
position might conceivably 
become a permanent one. 

Presnell said that such a 
situation could prove em­
barrassing to KrieWall if the 
city should decide in a couple 
of Weeks to go ahead and 
place the ad. 

Athas pointed out that he 
had originally been hired on a 
temporary basis With the 
understanding that he could 
submit an application for the 
Job i f he wanted at the time a 
permanent city manager Was 
being hired. 

T E N N I S A N Y O N E --- N e w e s t a d d i t i o n to t h e N o v i H i g h S c h o o l 
f a c i l i t i e s i s t h e t e n n i s c o u r t s l o c a t e d j u s t n o r t h o f t h e h i g h s c h o o l 
g y m n a s i u m . T h e t h r e e n e w c o u r t s a r e c o n s t r u c t e d of t h e m o s t 
m o d e r n m a t e r i a l s . T h e B o a r d o f E d u c a t i o n , w h i c h h a s a h - e a d y 
v o t e d t o a d d o n e n e w s p o r t i n c r o s s - c o u n t r y , m u s t n o w d e c i d e 

w h e t h e r o r n o t to a d d t e n n i s to t h e s c h o o l ' s s p o r t s c u r r i c u l u m i n 
t h e s p r i n g . B u t w h e t h e r o r n o t t e n n i s i s a d d e d t h i s y e a r o r a t 
s o m e t i m e i n t h e f u t u r e , t h e s c h o o l b o a r d d o e s n o t n e e d t o w o r r y 
a b o u t p r o p e r u t i l i z a t i o n o f t h e f a c i l i t y . T h e c o u r t s a r e a l r e a d y 
g e t t i n g p l e n t y o f u s e f r o m h i g h s c h o o l a n d c o m m u n i t y n a t t e r s . 
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